

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 21, 2023 For: BESD Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks 6100016888 JDLR			Local	Local	Local
			Bruckner Truck Sales Inc. 4562IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 210-666-7139	Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC 8700 IH 10 East Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373	Cavender Ford Motor Company LTD 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219
Item	Description	Quantity			
1	37K lbs. GVWR Brush Collection Grapppler Truck Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	\$284,744.00 \$284,744.00 2025 Freightliner M2-106 Plus Cummins L9 330 HP Allison 3000 RDS 2 Years - Unlimited Miles Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC 8700 IH 10 East Converse, TX 78109 300 - 600 Days 10/31/2023 10/31/2023 No	No Bid
2	52K lbs. GVWR, 12 Cubic Yard Dump Truck Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	\$177,657.00 \$355,314.00 2025 Mack Granite GU813 Mack MP-8 505 H.P. Fuller RT0-16908LL Chassis: 12 Month / 100,000 Miles Engine: 24 Month / 250,000 Miles Bruckner's Truck Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 400 Days after PO Issuance 12/31/2024 8/31/2023 No	\$179,385.00 \$358,770.00 2025 Freightliner M2-112 Detroit DD13 470HP / 1650 Lb. Ft. Eaton Fuller - FRO-16210C 1 Year Unlimited Miles Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC 8700 IH 10 East Converse, TX 78109 300 - 500 Days 10/31/2023 10/31/2023 No	No Bid
3	Deleted				
4	35K lbs. GVWR Water Distribution Trucks Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	3	\$183,495.00 \$550,485.00 2025 Mack Anthem Mack MP-7 345 HP Allison 4500 RDS Chassis: 12 Month / 100,000 Miles Engine: 2 Years / 250,000 Miles Transmission: 3 Years Bruckner's Truck Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 400 Days after PO Issuance 12/31/2024 8/31/2023 No	\$159,794.00 \$479,382.00 2025 Freightliner M2-106 Cummins B6.7 250 HP / 660 TQ Allison 3000 RDS 2 Years - Unlimited Miles Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC 8700 IH 10 East Converse, TX 78109 300 - 500 Days 10/31/2023 10/31/2023 No	No Bid

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 21, 2023 For: BESD Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks 6100016888			Local Bruckner Truck Sales Inc. 4562IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 210-666-7139			Local Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC 8700 IH 10 East Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373			Local Cavender Ford Motor Company LTD 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219		
JDLR											
Item	Description	Quantity									
5	Class 6 Regular Cab DRW, 12' Stake Bed Truck with Crash Attenuator and Message Board	1				No Bid			No Bid		
	Price Each:		\$165,720.00								
	Extended price:		\$165,720.00								
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2025 Mack MD6								
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		Cummins B6.7 220 HP								
	Transmission Offered:		Allison 2500 RDS w / PTO Provision								
	Warranty:		Chassis: 12 Month / Unlimited Miles Basic Coverage								
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Bruckner's Truck Equipment								
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219								
	Delivery		300 Days after PO Issuance								
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		12/31/2024								
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		8/31/2023								
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No								
6	Deleted										
7	Deleted										
	Payment Terms		Net 30			Net 30			Net 30		
	Total		\$1,071,519.00			\$1,122,896.00					
	Total Award		\$521,034.00			\$764,126.00					

Deleted: Item 3, Item 6, and Item 7 will be rebid at a later date.