City of San Antonio

Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: July 7, 2023
For: Annual Contract for Electrolytes
Bodega de Moya Market Supply Innovations Co., LLC Triple S Steel Holdings Inc DBA  (White Tree Construction and
o g Mallory Safety & Supply LLC PP Alapmo Iron Works. o Supplies LLC
6100016821 VF 612 McCullough Ave 1040 Industrial Way 107A Shooting Club Rd. 943 AT&T Center Pkwy. 5602 Presidio Pkwy # 1406
tern Description Estima.ted San Antonio, Longview, Boerne, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity | TX 78215 WA 98612 TX 78006 TX 78219 TX 78249
1 Electrolyte Instant Power Drink Mix, Sugar-Free 20-Oz, 50 per Pkg
1a Qwik Stick Fruit Punch 10
Brand Name Qwik Stick Sqwincher Sqwincher All Sport Sqwincher
Supplier Part # QS Fruit Punch 60102 159060102 10122524 B00515PCPO
Quantity Per Package 50 50 500 50 50
Unit Price $32.00 $17.95 $189.38 $17.07 $29.89
Extended Price $320.00 $179.50 $1,893.80 $170.70 $298.90
1b Qwik Stick Grape 40
Brand Name Qwik Stick Sqwincher Sqwincher All Sport Sqwincher
Supplier Part # QS Grape 60107 159060107 10122525 B004QGYRXK
Quantity Per Package 50 50 500 50 50
Unit Price $32.00 $17.95 $189.38 $17.07 $43.75
Extended Price $1,280.00 $718.00 $7,575.20 $682.80 $1,750.00
1c Qwik Stick Mixed Berry 20
Brand Name Qwik Stick Sqwincher Sqwincher All Sport Sqwincher
Supplier Part # QS Mixed Berry| 60101 159060101 10122525 B00815PLM8
Quantity Per Package 50 50 500 50 50
Unit Price $32.00 $17.95 $189.38 $17.07 $27.99
Extended Price $640.00 $359.00 $3,787.60 $341.40 $559.80
1d Qwik Stick Orange 10
Brand Name Qwik Stick Sqwincher Sqwincher All Sport Sqwincher
Supplier Part # QS Orange 60100 159060100 10122522 B004G6YRRG
Quantity Per Package 50 50 500 50 50
Unit Price $32.00 $17.95 $189.38 $17.07 $27.99
Extended Price $320.00 $179.50 $1,893.80 $170.70 $279.90
1e Qwik Stick Strawberry 10
Brand Name Qwik Stick Sqwincher Sqwincher All Sport Sqwincher
Supplier Part # QS Strawberry 60099 159060099 10122523 BOO9MOQTJE
Quantity Per Package 50 50 500 50 50
Unit Price $32.00 $17.95 $189.38 $17.07 $32.00
Extended Price $320.00 $179.50 $1,893.80 $170.70 $320.00
1f Qwik Stick Waternelon 20
Brand Name Qwik Stick Sqwincher Sqwincher All Sport Sqwincher
Supplier Part # QS Watermelon 60097 159060097 10122525 B088CGT59
Quantity Per Package 50 50 500 50 50
Unit Price $32.00 $17.95 $189.38 $17.07 $35.59
Extended Price $640.00 $359.00 $3,787.60 $341.40 $711.80
2 Electrolyte Instant Powder Drink Mix, 1-Quart Yield, 144 per Case
2a Gatorade G Fruit Punch 5
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade 1QTFP 33808 33808 308-33808
Quantity Per Case 144 32-0z 1Qt 32-0z
Unit Price $125.00 $131.08 $130.00 No Bid $248.00
Extended Price $625.00 $655.40 $650.00 $1,240.00
2b Gatorade G Lemon-Lime 5
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade 1QTLL 03928 03928 308-03928
Quantity Per Case 144 32-0z 1Qt 32-0z
Unit Price $125.00 $131.08 $130.00 No Bid $248.00
Extended Price $625.00 $655.40 $650.00 $1,240.00




City of San Antonio

Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: July 7, 2023
For: Annual Contract for Electrolytes
Bodega de Moya Market Supply Innovations Co., LLC Triple S Steel Holdings Inc DBA  (White Tree Construction and
o g Mallory Safety & Supply LLC PP Alapmo Iron Works. o Supplies LLC
6100016821 VF 612 McCullough Ave 1040 Industrial Way 107A Shooting Club Rd. 943 AT&T Center Pkwy. 5602 Presidio Pkwy # 1406
tern Description Estima.ted San Antonio, Longview, Boerne, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity | TX 78215 WA 98612 TX 78006 TX 78219 TX 78249
3 Electrolyte Instant Powder Drink Mix, 2.5 Gallon Yield, 144 per
3a Gatorade G Fruit Punch 5
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade 25GFP 33691 33691 308-3391
Quantity Per Case 144 2.5 Gal 2.5Gal 32 Cases
Unit Price $750.00 $179.29 $168.59 No Bid $1,726.93
Extended Price $3,750.00 $896.45 $842.95 $8,634.65
3b Gatorade G Lemon-Lime 5
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade 25GLL 03969 03969 308-03969
Quantity Per Case 144 2.5 Gal 2.5Gal 32 Cases
Unit Price $750.00 $179.29 $168.59 No Bid $1,726.93
Extended Price $3,750.00 $896.45 $842.95 $8,634.65
3c Gatorade G Orange 5
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade 25GO 03970 03970 308-03970
Quantity Per Case 144 2.5 Gal 2.5Gal 32 Cases
Unit Price $750.00 $179.29 $168.59 No Bid $1,726.93
Extended Price $3,750.00 $896.45 $842.95 $8,634.65
3d Gatorade G Riptide Rush 5
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade 25GRR 33673 33673 308-33673
Quantity Per Case 144 2.5 Gal 2.5 Gal 32 Cases
Unit Price $750.00 $179.29 $168.59 No Bid $1,593.62
Extended Price $3,750.00 $896.45 $842.95 $7,968.10
3e Gatorade G Glacier Freeze 5
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade 25GGF 33677 33677 308-33677
Quantity Per Case 144 2.5 Gal 2.5Gal 32 Cases
Unit Price $750.00 $179.29 $168.59 No Bid $1,726.93
Extended Price $3,750.00 $896.45 $842.95 $8,634.65
4 Electrolyte Ready-to-Drink Thirst Quencher, 20-Oz, 24 per Case
4a Gatorade Cool Blue - Wide Mouth 100
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade CBBOT! 32481 BO1M1HKC+B
Quantity Per Case 24 24 24
Unit Price $38.00 No Bid $44.00 No Bid $74.99
Extended Price $3,800.00 $4,400.00 $7,499.00
4b Gatorade Fruit Punch - Wide Mouth 100
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade FPBOT 20405 B0034YBB46
Quantity Per Case 24 24 24
Unit Price $38.00 No Bid $44.00 No Bid $74.99
Extended Price $3,800.00 $4,400.00 $7,499.00
4c Gatorade Grape - Wide Mouth 50
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade GRBOT] 20406 BOOFQ55E6Q
Quantity Per Case 24 24 24
Unit Price $38.00 No Bid $44.00 No Bid $74.99
Extended Price $1,900.00 $2,200.00 $3,749.50




City of San Antonio

Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: July 7, 2023
For: Annual Contract for Electrolytes
Bodega de Moya Market Supply Innovations Co., LLC Triple S Steel Holdings Inc DBA  (White Tree Construction and
o g Mallory Safety & Supply LLC PP Alapmo Iron Works. o Supplies LLC
6100016821 VF 612 McCullough Ave 1040 Industrial Way 107A Shooting Club Rd. 943 AT&T Center Pkwy. 5602 Presidio Pkwy # 1406
tern Description Estima.ted San Antonio, Longview, Boerne, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity | TX 78215 WA 98612 TX 78006 TX 78219 TX 78249
4d Gatorade Lemon Lime - Wide Mouth 100
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade LLBOT 32868 B003UY9GDO
Quantity Per Case 24 24 24
Unit Price $38.00 No Bid $44.00 No Bid $76.75
Extended Price $3,800.00 $4,400.00 $7,675.00
4e Gatorade Orange - Wide Mouth 100
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade ORBOT] 32867 B0034Y9FUS
Quantity Per Case 24 24 24
Unit Price $38.00 No Bid $44.00 No Bid $77.80
Extended Price $3,800.00 $4,400.00 $7,780.00
4f Gatorade Riptide Rush - Wide Mouth 100
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade RRBOT 32488 B0034Y96JO
Quantity Per Case 24 24 24
Unit Price $38.00 No Bid $44.00 No Bid $89.58
Extended Price $3,800.00 $4,400.00 $8,958.00
Estimated business days to complete the project. 4 Days 5 Days 5-7 Days Not Specified 10 Days
Payment Terms Net 30 Days Net 30 Days .25 10 Days Net 30 Days 2% 10 Days

Estimated Total

Estimated Award




	Draft Bid Tab

