
Opened: July 17, 2023 Non Local Local Local Local
For: Capital Printing Co. LTD. Clear Visions, an RR 

Donnelley, Co.
Rush American Printing 
Inc. 

Smith Print II, Inc.

6100016907 TM
4001 Caven Rd 121 Interpark Blvd, Suite 

801
10912 Wye Dr. 333 Burnet St. 

Item Description Estimated 
Annual Quantity

Austin,                            
TX, 78744
918-693-3525

San Antonio                             
TX, 78216
210-632-7591

San Antonio                             
TX, 78217
210-341-5904

San Antonio                               
TX, 78202
210-690-8338

A CATEGORY A = LETTERHEAD

1 Executive Level: Final Size 8.5" x 11", 28#, 
Fluorescent White, Gold Foil Embossed (7/8 left to 
right - 1 3/16 top to bottom), Art file & die to be 
provided by City, 500 sheets per box

1A One sided, black or 1 Pantone Matching System (PMS) 
color ink to be determined (TBD), tight registration 
without bleeds

35

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $373.15 No Bid $268.50
Extended Price: $13,060.25 $9,397.50

1B One sided, 2 PMS color ink TBD, tight registration 
without bleeds

10

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $537.46 No Bid $315.00
Extended Price: $5,374.60 $3,150.00

1C One-sided, Full color ink, tight registration without 
bleeds

10

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $692.58 No Bid $338.40
Extended Price: $6,925.80 $3,384.00

Total Category A NO BID $25,360.65 NO BID $15,931.50

B CATEGORY B - ENVELOPES

2 No Window Envelopes #10, 24 lb., Machinable, 
White Woven Envelopes, Finished product must 
comply with USPS specifications, 500 per box

2A Black or 1 PMS Color 1/0 ink TBD by requestor, tight 
registration without bleeds

100

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $68.54 $140.00 $37.50
Extended Price: $6,854.00 $14,000.00 $3,750.00

2B Two Color ink 2/0 TBD by requestor, tight registration 
without bleeds

50

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $70.66 $140.00 $41.00
Extended Price: $3,533.00 $7,000.00 $2,050.00

2C Full color ink 4/0 TBD by requestor, tight registration 
without bleeds 

10

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $164.50 $150.00 $85.00
Extended Price: $1,645.00 $1,500.00 $850.00

3 Window Envelopes #10, 24lb., Machinable, White 
Woven Envelopes, Finished product must comply 
with USPS specifications, 500 per box

3A Black or 1 PMS Color 1/0 ink TBD by requestor, tight 
registration without bleeds

200

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $73.32 $147.00 $35.00
Extended Price: $14,664.00 $29,400.00 $7,000.00

3B Two Color ink 2/0 TBD by requestor, tight registration 
without bleeds

50

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $75.44 $147.00 $43.00
Extended Price: $3,772.00 $7,350.00 $2,150.00

3C Full color ink 4/0 TBD by requestor, tight registration 
without bleeds 

10

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $169.28 $160.00 $86.50
Extended Price: $1,692.80 $1,600.00 $865.00

4 No Window Envelopes #9, 24lb., Machinable, White 
Woven Envelopes, Finished product must comply  
with  USPS specifications, 500 per box

4A Black or 1 PMS Color 1/0 ink TBD by requestor, tight 
registration without bleeds

100

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $68.54 $140.00 $37.50
Extended Price: $6,854.00 $14,000.00 $3,750.00

4B Two Color ink 2/0 TBD by requestor, tight registration 
without bleeds

50

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $70.65 $140.00 $41.00
Extended Price: $3,532.50 $7,000.00 $2,050.00

Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services 
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4C Full color ink 4/0 TBD by requestor, tight registration 
without bleeds 

10

Unit Price Per Box: No Bid $164.13 $154.00 $85.00
Extended Price: $1,641.30 $1,540.00 $850.00

5 Executive Level: No Window Envelopes #10, 28lb., 
Fluorescent White (or approved equal), Gold Foil 
Embossed (3/4 left to right - 1 1/16 top to bottom), 
Art file and die to be provided by City, 500 per box

5A Black or 1 PMS Color 1/0 ink TBD by requestor, tight 
registration without bleeds

35

Unit Price Per Box: No BId $561.82 $585.00 $322.50
Extended Price: $19,663.70 $20,475.00 $11,287.50

 
5B Two Color ink 2/0 TBD by requestor, tight registration 

without bleeds
15  

Unit Price Per Box: No BId $914.56 $585.00 $378.00
Extended Price: $13,718.40 $8,775.00 $5,670.00

5C Full color ink 4/0 TBD by requestor, tight registration 
without bleeds 

5

Unit Price Per Box: No BId $1,177.24 $585.00 $473.76
Extended Price: $5,886.20 $2,925.00 $2,368.80

Total Category B No Bid $83,456.90 $115,565.00 $42,641.30

C CATEGORY C - FLYERS

6 Flyers Final Size 8.5" x 11", white 70lb. Bond, one-
sided, black ink or 1 PMS color TBD without bleeds

6A Flyer 50,000
Unit Price Per 8.5" x 11" sheet: $0.036 $34.23 $0.41 $0.057
Extended Price: $1,800.00 $1,711,500.00 $20,500.00 $2,850.00

7 Flyers Final Size 8.5" x 11" white 70 lb. bond, One-
sided, 2 PMS color ink without full bleeds, 2/0 

7A Flyer 50,000
Unit Price Per 8.5" x 11" sheet: $0.04 $40.99 $0.41 $0.060
Extended Price: $2,000.00 $2,049,500.00 $20,500.00 $3,000.00

8
Flyers Final size 8.5” x 11” white 70 lb. bond, One-
sided, full color ink TBD without full bleeds 4/0

8A Flyer 10,000
Unit Price Per 8.5" x 11" sheet: $0.0875 $145.36 $0.41 $0.18
Extended Price: $875.00 $1,453,600.00 $4,100.00 $1,800.00

9 Flyers Final size 8.5” x 11” white 70lb. bond, two-
sided, Black Inc or 1 PMS color ink TBD with full 
bleeds 1/1.

9A Flyer 10,000
Unit Price Per 8.5" x 11" sheet: $0.0875 $135.15 $0.73 $0.150
Extended Price: $875.00 $1,351,500.00 $7,300.00 $1,500.00

10
Flyers Final size 8.5” x 11”, white 70 lb. bond, two-
sided, 2 PMS color ink TBD with full bleeds 2/2

10A Flyer 100,000
Unit Price Per 8.5" x 11" sheet: $0.042 $48.08 $0.73 $0.06
Extended Price: $4,200.00 $4,808,000.00 $73,000.00 $6,000.00

11
Flyers Final size, 8.5” x 11”, white 70 lb. bond, two-
sided, full color PMS ink TBD with full bleeds 4/4

11A Flyer 200,000
Unit Price Per 8.5" x 11" sheet: $0.033 $46.53 $0.85 $0.060
Extended Price: $6,600.00 $9,306,000.00 $170,000.00 $12,000.00

Total Category C $16,350.00 $20,680,100.00 $295,400.00 $27,150.00

Subtotal $16,350.00 $20,680,100.00 $295,400.00 $27,150.00
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 
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Less Prompt Payment Discount $16,350.00 $20,680,100.00 $295,400.00 $27,150.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 66%

Price differential $10,800.00
Non Local Award $16,350.00

D CATEGORY D - NCR FORMS

12
Finished Size 8.5” x 11”, carbon-less paper, one-
sided, one color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded 

12A Two Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $173.56 $0.56 $0.14
Extended Price: $4,339,000.00 $14,000.00 $3,500.00

12B Three Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $239.39 $0.77 $0.215
Extended Price: No Bid $5,984,750.00 $19,250.00 $5,375.00

12C Four Part 50,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $427.39 $0.96 $0.29
Extended Price: No Bid $21,369,500.00 $48,000.00 $14,500.00

13
Finished size 8.5” x 11”, carbon-less paper, two-
sided, one color PMS TBD, without bleeds, padded 

13A Two Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $185.79 $0.66 $0.145
Extended Price: No Bid $4,644,750.00 $16,500.00 $3,625.00

13B Three Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $254.66 $0.87 $0.22
Extended Price: No Bid $6,366,500.00 $21,750.00 $5,500.00

13C Four Part 50,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $441.65 $1.06 $0.30
Extended Price: No Bid $22,082,500.00 $53,000.00 $15,000.00

14
Finished size 8.5” x 11”, carbon-less paper, two-
sided, one color PMS TBD, without bleeds, padded

14A Two Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $186.62 $0.75 $0.17
Extended Price: No Bid $4,665,500.00 $18,750.00 $4,250.00

14B Three Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $250.43 $1.05 $0.27
Extended Price: No Bid $6,260,750.00 $26,250.00 $6,750.00

14C Four Part 50,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $452.69 $1.35 $0.36
Extended Price: No Bid $22,634,500.00 $67,500.00 $18,000.00

15
Finished size 8.5” x 14”, carbon-less paper, two-
sided, two color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded 

15A Two Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $191.82 $0.85 $0.185
Extended Price: No Bid $4,795,500.00 $21,250.00 $4,625.00

15B Three Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $322.87 $1.15 $0.278
Extended Price: No Bid $8,071,750.00 $28,750.00 $6,950.00

15C Four Part 50,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $540.13 $1.45 $0.365
Extended Price: No Bid $27,006,500.00 $72,500.00 $18,250.00

16
Finished size 8.5” x 14”, carbon-less paper, one-
sided, one color PMS TBD, without bleeds, padded

16A Two Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $214.50 $0.65 $0.16
Extended Price: No Bid $5,362,500.00 $16,250.00 $4,000.00
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16B Three Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $321.73 $0.88 $0.25
Extended Price: No Bid $8,043,250.00 $22,000.00 $6,250.00

16C Four Part 50,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $429.36 $1.12 $0.34
Extended Price: No Bid $21,468,000.00 $56,000.00 $17,000.00

17
Finished Size 8.5” x 14”, carbon-less paper,one-
sided, two color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded 

17A Two Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $227.10 $0.75 $0.167
Extended Price: No Bid $5,677,500.00 $18,750.00 $4,175.00

17B Three Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $323.75 $0.98 $0.259
Extended Price: No Bid $8,093,750.00 $24,500.00 $6,475.00

17C Four Part 50,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $444.50 $1.22 $0.342
Extended Price: No Bid $22,225,000.00 $61,000.00 $17,100.00

18
Finished size 8.5” x 14”, carbon-less paper, two-
sided, one color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded 

18A Two Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $228.99 $1.04 $0.202
Extended Price: No Bid $5,724,750.00 $26,000.00 $5,050.00

18B Three Part 25,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $321.54 $1.47 $0.312
Extended Price: No Bid $8,038,500.00 $36,750.00 $7,800.00

18C Four Part 50,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $455.77 $1.90 $0.41
Extended Price: No Bid $22,788,500.00 $95,000.00 $20,500.00

19
Finished size 8.5” x 14”, carbon-less paper, two-
sided, two color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded 

19A Two Part 5,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $502.32 $1.14 $0.32
Extended Price: No Bid $0.00 $5,700.00 $1,600.00

19B Three Part 10,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $498.27 $1.57 $0.43
Extended Price: No Bid $4,982,700.00 $15,700.00 $4,300.00

19C Four Part 10,000
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $649.24 $2.00 $0.46
Extended Price: No Bid $6,492,400.00 $20,000.00 $4,600.00

Total Category D No Bid $257,118,350.00 $805,150.00 $205,175.00
E CATEGORY E - BROCHURES

20 Flat size 8.5” x 11”, 80 lb. gloss text, two-sided, fold 
TBD

20A One color with bleeds 125,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.0376 $43.77 No Bid $0.056
Extended Price: $4,700.00 $5,471,250.00 $7,000.00

20B One color without bleeds 50,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.046 $50.95 No Bid $0.065
Extended Price: $2,300.00 $2,547,500.00 $3,250.00

20C Two colors with bleeds 125,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.0432 $46.01 No Bid $0.060
Extended Price: $5,400.00 $5,751,250.00 $7,500.00

20D Two colors without bleeds 50,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.0408 $55.77 No Bid $0.073
Extended Price: $2,040.00 $2,788,500.00 $3,650.00
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20E Full color with bleeds 125,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.048 $55.91 No Bid $0.065
Extended Price: $6,000.00 $6,988,750.00 $8,125.00

20F Full color without bleeds 50,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.07 $70.66 No Bid $0.086
Extended Price: $3,500.00 $3,533,000.00 $4,300.00

21 Flat size 8.5” x 14”, 80 lb. gloss text, two-sided, fold 
TBD

21A One color with bleeds 25,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.076 $87.62 No Bid $0.138
Extended Price: $1,900.00 $2,190,500.00 $3,450.00

21B One color without bleeds 25,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.076 $87.62 No Bid $0.138
Extended Price: $1,900.00 $2,190,500.00 $3,450.00

21C Two colors with bleeds 25,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.088 $94.28 No Bid $0.171
Extended Price: $2,200.00 $2,357,000.00 $4,275.00

21D Two colors without bleeds 25,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.088 $94.28 No Bid $0.171
Extended Price: $2,200.00 $2,357,000.00 $4,275.00

21E Full color with bleeds 25,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.08 $125.23 No Bid $0.191
Extended Price: $2,000.00 $3,130,750.00 $4,775.00

21F Full color without bleeds 25,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.08 $125.23 No Bid $0.191
Extended Price: $2,000.00 $3,130,750.00 $4,775.00

21G One color with bleeds 25,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.076 $87.62 No Bid $0.138
Extended Price: $1,900.00 $2,190,500.00 $3,450.00

21H One color without bleeds 25,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.076 $87.62 No Bid $0.138
Extended Price: $1,900.00 $2,190,500.00 $3,450.00

Total Category E $39,940.00 $46,817,750.00 $65,725.00

Subtotal $39,940.00 $46,817,750.00 $0.00 $65,725.00
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Less Prompt Payment Discount $39,940.00 $46,817,750.00 $0.00 $65,725.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 65%

Price differential $25,785.00
Non Local Award $39,940.00

F CATEGORY F - NEWSLETTERS/BOOKLETS

22 Cost per Spread (one spread 11"x17" equals 4 
pages of 8.5"x11"). Flat final size 8.5"x11", 70 lb. 
text, Two-sided, Fold TBD, Saddle stitching requred 
for multiple spreads

22A One color with bleeds 125,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.15 $189.02 No Bid $0.116
Extended Price: $18,750.00 $23,627,500.00 $14,500.00

22B One color without bleeds 50,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.15 $197.62 No Bid $0.126
Extended Price: $7,500.00 $9,881,000.00 $6,300.00

22C Two colors with bleeds 125,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.15 $203.37 No Bid $0.126
Extended Price: $18,750.00 $25,421,250.00 $15,750.00

22D Two colors without bleeds 50,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.15 $212.62 No Bid $0.141
Extended Price: $7,500.00 $10,631,000.00 $7,050.00

22E Full color with bleeds 125,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.15 $235.18 No Bid $0.130
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Extended Price: $18,750.00 $29,397,500.00 $16,250.00

22F Full color without bleeds 50,000
Unit Price Per Each: $0.15 $245.87 No Bid $0.153
Extended Price: $7,500.00 $12,293,500.00 $7,650.00

Total Category F $78,750.00 $111,251,750.00 $67,500.00
G CATEGORY G - FOLDERS

NAS
23 Flat Size 19.5” x 16”. Finished size 9” x 12”, 100 lb. 

silk cover (or  approved equal), one-sided, 4/0, 2 
standard pockets 4” glued, includes 2 business 
cards slits

23A Per folder, without UV/Aqueous coat 500
Unit Price Per Each: $2.00 $3,578.80 No Bid $3.20
Extended Price: $1,000.00 $1,789,400.00 $1,600.00

23B Per folder, without UV/Aqueous coat 2000
Unit Price Per Each: $2-$1.25 $1,091.60 No Bid $1.40
Extended Price: $1000-$2500 $2,183,200.00 $2,800.00

23C Per folder, without UV/Aqueous coat 5000
Unit Price Per Each: $1.25-$.66 $663.14 No Bid $0.75
Extended Price: $2500-$3300 $3,315,700.00 $3,750.00

23D Per folder, without UV/Aqueous coat 5,001 +
Unit Price Per Each: $0.65 $660.00 No Bid $0.53
Extended Price: $3,250.65 $3,300,660.00 $2,650.53

23E Per folder, with UV/Aqueous Coat 500
Unit Price Per Each: $2.10 $3,773.84 No Bid $3.25
Extended Price: $1,050.00 $1,886,920.00 $1,625.00

23F Per folder, with UV/Aqueous Coat 2000
Unit Price Per Each: $2.10-$1.30 $1,418.50 No Bid $1.45
Extended Price: $1050-$2600 $2,837,000.00 $2,900.00

23G Per folder, with UV/Aqueous Coat 5000
Unit Price Per Each: $1.32-$.68 $807.61 No Bid $0.80
Extended Price: $2600-$3400 $4,038,050.00 $4,000.00

23H Per folder, with UV/Aqueous Coat 5,001 +
Unit Price Per Each: $0.66 $800.00 No Bid $0.58
Extended Price: $3,300.66 $4,000,800.00 $2,900.58

24 Flat Size 19.5” x 16”, Finished size 9” x 12”, 100 lb. 
silk cover (or approved equal) two-sided, 4/4, 2 
standard pockets 4” glued, includes 2 business 
card slits

24A Per folder, without UV/Aqueous coat 500
Unit Price Per Each: $2.40 $3,821.68 No Bid $4.45
Extended Price: $1,200.00 $1,910,840.00 $2,225.00

24B Per folder, without UV/Aqueous coat 2000
Unit Price Per Each: $2.40-$1.30 $1,504.50 No Bid $1.93
Extended Price: $1200-$2600 $3,009,000.00 $3,860.00

24C Per folder, without UV/Aqueous coat 5000
Unit Price Per Each: $1.30-$.71 $722.38 No Bid $0.91
Extended Price: $2600-$3550 $3,611,900.00 $4,550.00

24D Per folder, without UV/Aqueous coat 5,001 +
Unit Price Per Each: $0.69 $720.00 No Bid $0.63
Extended Price: $3,450.69 $3,600,720.00 $3,150.63

24E Per folder, with UV/Aqueous Coat 500
Unit Price Per Each: $2.50 $4,007.52 No Bid $4.50
Extended Price: $1,250.00 $2,003,760.00 $2,250.00

24F Per folder, with UV/Aqueous Coat 2000
Unit Price Per Each: $2.50-$1.35 $1,557.00 No Bid $1.98
Extended Price: $1250-$2700 $3,114,000.00 $3,960.00

24G Per folder, with UV/Aqueous Coat 5000
Unit Price Per Each: $1.35-$.69 $742.99 No Bid $0.96
Extended Price: $2700-$3450 $3,714,950.00 $4,800.00
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24H Per folder, with UV/Aqueous Coat 5,001 +
Unit Price Per Each: $0.67 $740.00 No Bid $0.68
Extended Price: $3,350.67 $3,700,740.00 $3,400.68

Total Catefory G $50,422.42
H CATEGORY H - FIVE BANK COPY TABS/DIVIDERS

25 9"x11", 90 lb. white index stock cover, 1/5 cut

25A Cost per Set,  Standard 2500
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $1.63 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price: $4,075.00

25B Cost per Set, Mylar 2500
Unit Price Per Set: No Bid $1.93 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price: $4,825.00

Total Category H $8,900.00

I CATEGORY I - LABOR RATE & ADDITIONAL 
SERVICES

26 Based on 8.5” x 11” Sheet

26A Formatting - per hour 10 hours
Unit Price per hour/MIL: $80.00 $80.00 $25.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $800.00 $800.00 $250.00

26B Folding - per mil 25 mil
Unit Price per mil: $28.00 $15.00 $30.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $700.00 $375.00 $750.00

26C Scoring - per mil 25 mil
Unit Price per mil: $28.00 $20.00 $45.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $700.00 $500.00 $1,125.00

26D Numbering - per mil 25 mil
Unit Price per mil: No Bid $20.00 $30.00 No Bid
Extended Price: No Bid $500.00 $750.00

26E Perforating - per mil 25 mil
Unit Price per mil: $38.00 $75.00 $45.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $950.00 $1,875.00 $1,125.00

26F Collating - per mil 25 mil
Unit Price per mil: $38.00 $45.00 $10.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $950.00 $1,125.00 $250.00

26G Die Cut - per mil 50 mil
Unit Price per mil: $38.00 $105.00 $58.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $1,900.00 $5,250.00 $2,900.00

26H Cutting - per mil 25 mil
Unit Price per mil: $28.00 $45.00 $28.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $700.00 $1,125.00 $700.00

26I Punching - per mil 25 mil
Unit Price per mil: $38.00 $16.00 $4.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $950.00 $400.00 $100.00

26J Padding - per mil 25 mil
Unit Price per mil: $38.00 $16.00 $10.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $950.00 $400.00 $250.00

26K Coil Binding - per mil 25 mil
 Unit Price per mil: $150.00 $12.00 $25.00 No Bid

Extended Price: $3,750.00 $300.00 $625.00

26L Shrink Wrap - per mil 25 mil
Unit Price per mil: $400.00 $160.00 $8.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $10,000.00 $4,000.00 $200.00

26M Inserting - per mil 25 mil
Unit Price per mil: $50.00 $50.00 $8.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $200.00

26N Stapling - per mil 25 mil
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Opened: July 17, 2023 Non Local Local Local Local
For: Capital Printing Co. LTD. Clear Visions, an RR 

Donnelley, Co.
Rush American Printing 
Inc. 

Smith Print II, Inc.

6100016907 TM
4001 Caven Rd 121 Interpark Blvd, Suite 

801
10912 Wye Dr. 333 Burnet St. 

Item Description Estimated 
Annual Quantity

Austin,                            
TX, 78744
918-693-3525

San Antonio                             
TX, 78216
210-632-7591

San Antonio                             
TX, 78217
210-341-5904

San Antonio                               
TX, 78202
210-690-8338

Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services 

Unit Price per mil: $38.00 $125.00 $20.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $950.00 $3,125.00 $500.00

26O Graphics - per hour 10 hours
Unit Price per hour: $100.00 $125.00 $35.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $1,000.00 $1,250.00 $350.00

26P UV Coating - per mil 25 mil  
Unit Price per mil: No Bid $76.00 $35.00 No Bid
Extended Price: No Bid $1,900.00 $875.00

Total Category  I $25,550.00 $24,175.00 $10,950.00

Prompt Payment: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $163,940.67 $436,009,842.55 $1,227,065.00 $474,545.22
Estimated Annual Award $56,290.00 $8,900.00 $10,950.00 $381,670.22
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