
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 31, 2024

For: AC for Work Gloves

Complete Supply  Gonzalez Auto Parts Matori Industries Medwheels Inc SCM Consultants Inc

6100017519 VR

13821 Diplomat Dr
Farmers Branch, TX 75234  4220 San Bernardo Ave.

Laredo, TX 78041 
401 E. Sonterra Blvd. Ste 375

San Antonio, TX 78254
1322 E. Houston St.

San Antonio, TX 78205
9898 Bissonnet St. Ste 375D

Houston, TX 77036

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual Quantity 

(Pairs)

1 Leather Palm Glove, Per Pair
Small 18
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Condor Wells Lamont Uline
Manufacturer PN# 7500A A260GRRM 4AJ80 Y3106S S-21620-M
Unit Price Per Pair 4.30$                                     14.84$                                       9.72$                                          5.90$                                3.75$                                          
Extended Price 77.40$                                   267.12$                                     174.96$                                      106.20$                            67.50$                                        
Medium 36
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Condor Wells Lamont Uline
Manufacturer PN# 7500A A260GRRM 4AJ82 Y3106M S-21620-M
Unit Price Per Pair 4.30$                                     14.84$                                       9.72$                                          5.90$                                3.75$                                          
Extended Price 154.80$                                 534.24$                                     349.92$                                      212.40$                            135.00$                                      
Large 68
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Condor Wells Lamont Liberty Safety
Manufacturer PN# 7500A A260GRRL 3AT60 Y3106L 520-LG
Unit Price Per Pair 4.30$                                     14.84$                                       9.72$                                          5.90$                                3.74$                                          
Extended Price 292.40$                                 1,009.12$                                  660.96$                                      401.20$                            254.32$                                      
X-Large 68
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Condor Wells Lamont Liberty Safety
Manufacturer PN# 7500A A260GRRXL 3AT34 Y3106XL 520-XL
Unit Price Per Pair 4.40$                                     14.84$                                       9.72$                                          5.90$                                3.74$                                          
Extended Price 299.20$                                 1,009.12$                                  660.96$                                      401.20$                            254.32$                                      
XX-Large 34
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Condor Wells Lamont PIP Split Leather Palm
Manufacturer PN# 7500A A260GRRXXL 2MDE2 No Bid 84-7532/XXL
Unit Price Per Pair 4.69$                                     14.84$                                       9.72$                                          3.74$                                          
Extended Price 159.46$                                 504.56$                                     330.48$                                      127.16$                                      

2 Dip Glove, Per Pair
Small 6
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove 400 Showa Best Global Glove 300
Manufacturer PN# 3894 A100G4RS 19L42 300S-07 300/7
Unit Price Per Pair 1.24$                                     1.67$                                         3.05$                                          6.40$                                2.00$                                          
Extended Price 7.44$                                     10.02$                                       18.30$                                        38.40$                              12.00$                                        
Medium 12
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove 400 Showa Best Global Glove 300
Manufacturer PN# 3894 A100G4RM 19L491 300M-07 300/8
Unit Price Per Pair 1.24$                                     1.67$                                         3.05$                                          6.40$                                2.00$                                          
Extended Price 14.88$                                   20.04$                                       36.60$                                        76.80$                              24.00$                                        
Large 8
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove 400 Showa Best Global Glove 300
Manufacturer PN# 3894 A100G4RL 19L490 300L-08 300/9
Unit Price Per Pair 1.24$                                     1.67$                                         3.05$                                          6.40$                                2.00$                                          
Extended Price 9.92$                                     13.36$                                       24.40$                                        51.20$                              16.00$                                        



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 31, 2024

For: AC for Work Gloves

Complete Supply  Gonzalez Auto Parts Matori Industries Medwheels Inc SCM Consultants Inc

6100017519 VR

13821 Diplomat Dr
Farmers Branch, TX 75234  4220 San Bernardo Ave.

Laredo, TX 78041 
401 E. Sonterra Blvd. Ste 375

San Antonio, TX 78254
1322 E. Houston St.

San Antonio, TX 78205
9898 Bissonnet St. Ste 375D

Houston, TX 77036

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual Quantity 

(Pairs)
X-Large 8
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove 400 Showa Best Global Glove 300
Manufacturer PN# 3894 A100G4RXL 19L489 300XL-10 300/10
Unit Price Per Pair 1.24$                                     1.67$                                         3.05$                                          6.40$                                2.00$                                          
Extended Price 9.92$                                     13.36$                                       24.40$                                        51.20$                              16.00$                                        
XX-Large 8
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove 400 Showa Best Global Glove 300
Manufacturer PN# 3894 A100G4RXL 19L493 300XXL-10 300/11
Unit Price Per Pair 1.24$                                     1.67$                                         3.05$                                          6.40$                                2.00$                                          
Extended Price 9.92$                                     13.36$                                       24.40$                                        51.20$                              16.00$                                        

3 Denim Cuff Gloves, Per Pair
Small 60
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove MCR Safety Mustang 1935
Manufacturer PN# 7300R A210GRRXL 5210S 5210 1935S
Unit Price Per Pair 2.89$                                     8.65$                                         4.50$                                          3.95$                                12.00$                                        
Extended Price 173.40$                                 519.00$                                     270.00$                                      237.00$                            720.00$                                      
Medium 72
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove MCR Safety Mustang 1935
Manufacturer PN# 7300R A210GRRXL 5210M 5210 1935M
Unit Price Per Pair 2.89$                                     8.65$                                         4.50$                                          3.95$                                12.00$                                        
Extended Price 208.08$                                 622.80$                                     324.00$                                      284.40$                            864.00$                                      
Large 28
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove MCR Safety Mustang 1935
Manufacturer PN# 7300R A210GRRXL 5210L 5210 1935L
Unit Price Per Pair 2.89$                                     8.65$                                         4.50$                                          3.95$                                12.00$                                        
Extended Price 80.92$                                   242.20$                                     126.00$                                      110.60$                            336.00$                                      
X-Large 28
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove MCR Safety Mustang 1935
Manufacturer PN# 7300R A210GRRXL 5210XL 5210 1935XL
Unit Price Per Pair 3.16$                                     8.65$                                         4.50$                                          3.95$                                12.00$                                        
Extended Price 88.48$                                   242.20$                                     126.00$                                      110.60$                            336.00$                                      
XX-Large 15
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove MCR Safety Mustang 1935
Manufacturer PN# 7300R A210GRRXXL 5210XXL No Bid 1935XL
Unit Price Per Pair 3.35$                                     8.65$                                         4.50$                                          12.00$                                        
Extended Price 50.25$                                   129.75$                                     67.50$                                        180.00$                                      

4 Leather Driver Glove, Per Pair
Small 60
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove Protective Industrial Products
Manufacturer PN# 8212 A260GRRM 4364S 4364 68-168/S
Unit Price Per Pair 2.92$                                     4.68$                                         4.50$                                          4.95$                                14.39$                                        
Extended Price 175.20$                                 280.80$                                     270.00$                                      297.00$                            863.40$                                      
Medium 120
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove Protective Industrial Products
Manufacturer PN# 8212 A260GRRM 4364M 4364 68-168/M
Unit Price Per Pair 2.92$                                     4.68$                                         4.50$                                          4.95$                                15.48$                                        
Extended Price 350.40$                                 280.80$                                     540.00$                                      594.00$                            1,857.60$                                   
Large 296
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove Protective Industrial Products
Manufacturer PN# 8212 A260GRRL 4364L 4364 68-168/L
Unit Price Per Pair 2.92$                                     4.68$                                         4.50$                                          4.95$                                10.71$                                        
Extended Price 864.32$                                 1,385.28$                                  1,332.00$                                   1,465.20$                         3,170.16$                                   



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 31, 2024

For: AC for Work Gloves

Complete Supply  Gonzalez Auto Parts Matori Industries Medwheels Inc SCM Consultants Inc

6100017519 VR

13821 Diplomat Dr
Farmers Branch, TX 75234  4220 San Bernardo Ave.

Laredo, TX 78041 
401 E. Sonterra Blvd. Ste 375

San Antonio, TX 78254
1322 E. Houston St.

San Antonio, TX 78205
9898 Bissonnet St. Ste 375D

Houston, TX 77036

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual Quantity 

(Pairs)
X-Large 296
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove Protective Industrial Products
Manufacturer PN# 8212 A260GRRXL 4364XL 4364 68-168/XL
Unit Price Per Pair 2.92$                                     4.68$                                         4.50$                                          5.15$                                16.29$                                        
Extended Price 864.32$                                 1,385.28$                                  1,332.00$                                   1,524.40$                         4,821.84$                                   
XX-Large 75
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove Protective Industrial Products
Manufacturer PN# 8212 A260GRRXXL 4364XXL 4364 68-168/XXL
Unit Price Per Pair 3.10$                                     4.68$                                         4.50$                                          5.45$                                5.29$                                          
Extended Price 232.50$                                 351.00$                                     337.50$                                      408.75$                            396.75$                                      

5 Full Finger Mechanic Glove, Per Pair
Small 30
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Gloves Valeo Valeo GMFS
Manufacturer PN# 77871 A771BKYS MC18S GMFS 736097-00295
Unit Price Per Pair 7.48$                                     14.20$                                       7.95$                                          18.95$                              13.85$                                        
Extended Price 224.40$                                 426.00$                                     238.50$                                      568.50$                            415.50$                                      
Medium 100
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Gloves Valeo Valeo GMFS
Manufacturer PN# 77871 A771BKYM MC18M GMFS 736097-00296
Unit Price Per Pair 7.48$                                     14.20$                                       7.95$                                          18.95$                              13.85$                                        
Extended Price 748.00$                                 1,420.00$                                  795.00$                                      1,895.00$                         1,385.00$                                   
Large 108
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Gloves Valeo Valeo GMFS
Manufacturer PN# 77871 A771BKYL MC18L GMFS 736097-00297
Unit Price Per Pair 7.48$                                     14.20$                                       7.95$                                          18.95$                              13.85$                                        
Extended Price 807.84$                                 1,533.60$                                  858.60$                                      2,046.60$                         1,495.80$                                   
X-Large 108
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Gloves Valeo Valeo GMFS
Manufacturer PN# 77871 A771BKYXL MC18XL GMFS 736097-00298
Unit Price Per Pair 7.48$                                     14.20$                                       7.95$                                          18.95$                              13.85$                                        
Extended Price 807.84$                                 1,533.60$                                  858.60$                                      2,046.60$                         1,495.80$                                   
XX-Large 50
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Gloves Valeo Valeo GMFS
Manufacturer PN# 77871 A771BKYXXL MC18XXL GMFS 736097-00299
Unit Price Per Pair 7.48$                                     14.20$                                       7.95$                                          18.95$                              13.85$                                        
Extended Price 374.00$                                 710.00$                                     397.50$                                      947.50$                            692.50$                                      

6 Brown Jersey Glove, Per Pair
One Size Fits All 100
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Seattle Glove Magid Jersey Master
Manufacturer PN# 1410C A030WHRXL J2109 J2109 T29
Unit Price Per Pair 0.58$                                     1.85$                                         1.56$                                          1.05$                                1.25$                                          
Extended Price 58.00$                                   185.00$                                     156.00$                                      105.00$                            125.00$                                      

7 Oil and Gas Hand Protection, Per Pair
Small 30
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Mechanix Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7700 AP55G8RS 87-MF1ORHDS ORHD-CR-008 ORHD-CR-008
Unit Price Per Pair 17.53$                                   27.50$                                       34.76$                                        65.85$                              38.62$                                        
Extended Price 525.90$                                 825.00$                                     1,042.80$                                   1,975.50$                         1,158.60$                                   



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 31, 2024

For: AC for Work Gloves

Complete Supply  Gonzalez Auto Parts Matori Industries Medwheels Inc SCM Consultants Inc

6100017519 VR

13821 Diplomat Dr
Farmers Branch, TX 75234  4220 San Bernardo Ave.

Laredo, TX 78041 
401 E. Sonterra Blvd. Ste 375

San Antonio, TX 78254
1322 E. Houston St.

San Antonio, TX 78205
9898 Bissonnet St. Ste 375D

Houston, TX 77036

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual Quantity 

(Pairs)
Medium 75
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Mechanix Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7700 A722G8RM 87-MF1ORHDM ORHD-CR-009 ORHD-CR-009
Unit Price Per Pair 17.53$                                   27.50$                                       34.76$                                        65.85$                              38.62$                                        
Extended Price 1,314.75$                              2,062.50$                                  2,607.00$                                   4,938.75$                         2,896.50$                                   
Large 60
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Mechanix Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7700 A722G8RL 87-MF1ORHDL ORHD-CR-010 ORHD-CR-010
Unit Price Per Pair 17.53$                                   27.50$                                       34.76$                                        65.85$                              38.62$                                        
Extended Price 1,051.80$                              1,650.00$                                  2,085.60$                                   3,951.00$                         2,317.20$                                   
X-Large 60
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Mechanix Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7700 A722G8RXL 87-MF1ORHDXL ORHD-CR-011 ORHD-CR-011
Unit Price Per Pair 17.53$                                   27.50$                                       34.76$                                        65.85$                              38.62$                                        
Extended Price 1,051.80$                              1,650.00$                                  2,085.60$                                   3,951.00$                         2,317.20$                                   
XX-Large 50
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Mechanix Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7700 A722G8RXXL 87-MF1ORHDXXL ORHD-CR-012 ORHD-CR-012
Unit Price Per Pair 17.53$                                   27.50$                                       34.76$                                        65.85$                              38.62$                                        
Extended Price 876.50$                                 1,375.00$                                  1,738.00$                                   3,292.50$                         1,931.00$                                   

8 Oil and Gas Hand Protection Waterproof, Per Pair
Small 30
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves IRONCLAD Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7739HV AP55G8RS 21AN82 ORHD-OD-008 ORHD-OD-008
Unit Price Per Pair 6.73$                                     27.50$                                       51.04$                                        66.80$                              50.74$                                        
Extended Price 201.90$                                 825.00$                                     1,531.20$                                   2,004.00$                         1,522.20$                                   
Medium 75
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves IRONCLAD Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7739HV AP55G8RM 21AN83 ORHD-OD-009 ORHD-OD-009
Unit Price Per Pair 6.73$                                     27.50$                                       51.04$                                        66.80$                              50.74$                                        
Extended Price 504.75$                                 2,062.50$                                  3,828.00$                                   5,010.00$                         3,805.50$                                   
Large 60
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves IRONCLAD Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7739HV AP55G8RL 21AN84 ORHD-OD-010 ORHD-OD-010
Unit Price Per Pair 6.73$                                     27.50$                                       51.04$                                        66.80$                              50.74$                                        
Extended Price 403.80$                                 1,650.00$                                  3,062.40$                                   4,008.00$                         3,805.50$                                   
X-Large 60
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves IRONCLAD Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7739HV AP55G8RXL 21AN85 ORHD-OD-011 ORHD-OD-011
Unit Price Per Pair 6.73$                                     27.50$                                       51.04$                                        66.80$                              50.74$                                        
Extended Price 403.80$                                 1,650.00$                                  3,062.40$                                   4,008.00$                         3,044.40$                                   
XX-Large 50
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves IRONCLAD Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7739HV AP55G8RXXL 21AN86 ORHD-OD-012 ORHD-OD-012
Unit Price Per Pair 6.73$                                     27.50$                                       51.04$                                        66.80$                              50.74$                                        
Extended Price 336.50$                                 1,375.00$                                  2,552.00$                                   3,340.00$                         2,537.00$                                   

9 High Visibility Heavy Duty Glove, Per Pair
Small 30
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7739V A770BKYS HVGOR5S CG40-75-008 CG40-75-008
Unit Price Per Pair 12.63$                                   19.30$                                       10.55$                                        54.50$                              46.19$                                        
Extended Price 378.90$                                 579.00$                                     316.50$                                      1,635.00$                         1,385.70$                                   



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 31, 2024

For: AC for Work Gloves

Complete Supply  Gonzalez Auto Parts Matori Industries Medwheels Inc SCM Consultants Inc

6100017519 VR

13821 Diplomat Dr
Farmers Branch, TX 75234  4220 San Bernardo Ave.

Laredo, TX 78041 
401 E. Sonterra Blvd. Ste 375

San Antonio, TX 78254
1322 E. Houston St.

San Antonio, TX 78205
9898 Bissonnet St. Ste 375D

Houston, TX 77036

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual Quantity 

(Pairs)
Medium 75
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7739V A770BKYM HVGOR5M CG40-75-009 CG40-75-009
Unit Price Per Pair 12.63$                                   19.30$                                       10.55$                                        54.50$                              46.19$                                        
Extended Price 947.25$                                 1,447.50$                                  791.25$                                      4,087.50$                         3,464.25$                                   
Large 60
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7739V A770BKYL HVGOR5L CG40-75-010 CG40-75-010
Unit Price Per Pair 12.63$                                   19.30$                                       10.55$                                        54.50$                              46.19$                                        
Extended Price 757.80$                                 1,158.00$                                  633.00$                                      3,270.00$                         2,771.40$                                   
X-Large 60
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7739V A770BKYXL HVGOR5XL CG40-75-011 CG40-75-011
Unit Price Per Pair 12.63$                                   19.30$                                       10.55$                                        54.50$                              46.19$                                        
Extended Price 757.80$                                 1,158.00$                                  633.00$                                      3,270.00$                         2,771.40$                                   
XX-Large 50
Manufacturer Name Cordova Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Mechanix Wear Mechanix Wear
Manufacturer PN# 7739V A770BKYXXL HVGOR5XXL CG40-75-012 CG40-75-012
Unit Price Per Pair 12.63$                                   19.30$                                       10.55$                                        54.50$                              46.19$                                        
Extended Price 631.50$                                 965.00$                                     527.50$                                      2,725.00$                         2,309.50$                                   

10 High Dexterity Impact Leather Glove, Per Pair
Small 15
Manufacturer Name No Bid Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove PIP Magid T-Rex Windstorm
Manufacturer PN# A745GRRS HVD1844IMPS 120-4100/S TRX743S
Unit Price Per Pair 26.19$                                       8.80$                                          36.65$                              27.35$                                        
Extended Price 392.85$                                     132.00$                                      549.75$                            410.25$                                      
Medium 75
Manufacturer Name No Bid Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove PIP Magid T-Rex Windstorm
Manufacturer PN# A745GRRM HVD1844IMPM 120-4100/M TRX743M
Unit Price Per Pair 26.19$                                       8.80$                                          36.65$                              27.35$                                        
Extended Price 1,964.25$                                  660.00$                                      2,748.75$                         2,051.25$                                   
Large 50
Manufacturer Name No Bid Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove PIP Magid T-Rex Windstorm
Manufacturer PN# A745GRRL HVD1844IMPL 120-4100/L TRX743L
Unit Price Per Pair 26.19$                                       8.80$                                          36.65$                              27.35$                                        
Extended Price 1,309.50$                                  440.00$                                      1,832.50$                         1,367.50$                                   
X-Large 50
Manufacturer Name No Bid Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove PIP Magid T-Rex Windstorm
Manufacturer PN# A745GRRXL HVD1844IMPXL 120-4100/XL TRX743XL
Unit Price Per Pair 26.19$                                       8.80$                                          36.65$                              27.35$                                        
Extended Price 1,309.50$                                  440.00$                                      1,832.50$                         1,367.50$                                   
XX-Large 50
Manufacturer Name No Bid Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove PIP Magid T-Rex Windstorm
Manufacturer PN# A745GRRXXL HVD1844IMPXXL 120-4100/XXL TRX743XXL
Unit Price Per Pair 26.19$                                       8.80$                                          36.65$                              27.35$                                        
Extended Price 1,309.50$                                  440.00$                                      1,832.50$                         1,367.50$                                   

11 High Dexterity Leather Glove, Per Pair
Small 15
Manufacturer Name No Bid Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Carhatt Carhatt
Manufacturer PN# A776BKYS 4364SBKS GD0659-M A659S
Unit Price Per Pair 16.27$                                       34.00$                                        45.00$                              31.79$                                        
Extended Price 244.05$                                     510.00$                                      675.00$                            476.85$                                      



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 31, 2024

For: AC for Work Gloves

Complete Supply  Gonzalez Auto Parts Matori Industries Medwheels Inc SCM Consultants Inc

6100017519 VR

13821 Diplomat Dr
Farmers Branch, TX 75234  4220 San Bernardo Ave.

Laredo, TX 78041 
401 E. Sonterra Blvd. Ste 375

San Antonio, TX 78254
1322 E. Houston St.

San Antonio, TX 78205
9898 Bissonnet St. Ste 375D

Houston, TX 77036

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual Quantity 

(Pairs)
Medium 75 No Bid
Manufacturer Name Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Carhatt Carhatt
Manufacturer PN# A776BKYM 4364SBKS GD0659-M A659S
Unit Price Per Pair 16.27$                                       34.00$                                        45.00$                              31.79$                                        
Extended Price 1,220.25$                                  2,550.00$                                   3,375.00$                         2,384.25$                                   
Large 50 No Bid
Manufacturer Name Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Carhatt Carhatt
Manufacturer PN# A776BKYL 4364SBKS GD0659-M A659S
Unit Price Per Pair 16.27$                                       34.00$                                        45.00$                              31.79$                                        
Extended Price 813.50$                                     1,700.00$                                   2,250.00$                         1,589.50$                                   
X-Large 50 No Bid
Manufacturer Name Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Carhatt Carhatt
Manufacturer PN# A776BKYXL 4364SBKS GD0659-M A659S
Unit Price Per Pair 16.27$                                       34.00$                                        45.00$                              31.79$                                        
Extended Price 813.50$                                     1,700.00$                                   2,250.00$                         1,589.50$                                   
XX-Large 50 No Bid
Manufacturer Name Portwest Gloves Seattle Glove Carhatt Carhatt
Manufacturer PN# A776BKYXXL 4364SBKS GD0659-M A659S
Unit Price Per Pair 16.27$                                       34.00$                                        45.00$                              31.79$                                        
Extended Price 813.50$                                     1,700.00$                                   2,250.00$                         1,589.50$                                   

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 2%/10 Days Net 30 2%/10 Days 


