
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 21, 2024 LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR DOOR HANGERS AND TAGS Litho Press Inc. Capital Printing LLC. Clear Visions - An RR 

Donnelley Company 
One Touch Point Southwest 
Corp.

Promo Solutions The Watermark Group, Inc.  

6100017999 CM 4334 Milling Road 4001 Caven Road 121 Interpark Blvd Suite 
801

8410-B Tuscany Way 11104 Windjammer Drive 4271 GateCrest 

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
Texas 78219
(210) 333-1711

Austin,
Texas 78744

San Antonio,
Texas 78216

Austin,
Texas 78754

Frisco,
Texas 75036

San Antonio, 
Texas 78217

CATEGORY I – DOOR HANGERS

1.1 Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 11”, and White 100 lb. Cover 
Stock, Two-Sided, Four-Color Process, Die Cut and wrapped, Full 
Bleed - without UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.14 $0.08 $0.16758 $0.27 No Bid $0.2182
Extended Price: $1,400.00 $800.00 $1,675.80 $2,700.00 $2,182.00

1.2 Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 11”, and White 100 lb. Cover 
Stock, Two-Sided, Four-Color Process, Die Cut and wrapped, Full 
Bleed - with UV/Aqueous Coat

15,000

Unit Price Each: $0.14 $0.07 $0.1246 $0.23 No Bid $0.175
Extended Price: $2,100.00 $1,050.00 $1,869.00 $3,450.00 $2,625.00

1.3 Door Hanger, Finished Size, 4.25” X 14”, White 100 lb. Cover, Two-
Sided, Four-Color Process, Die Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - 
without UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.19 $0.09 $0.21861 $0.30 No Bid $0.2491
Extended Price: $1,900.00 $900.00 $2,186.10 $3,000.00 $2,491.00

1.4 Door Hanger, Finished Size, 4.25” X 14”, White 100 lb. Cover, Two-
Sided, Four-Color Process, Die Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - with 
UV/Aqueous Coat

15,000

Unit Price Each: $0.15 $0.08 $0.16548 $0.26 No Bid $0.202
Extended Price: $2,250.00 $1,200.00 $2,482.20 $3,900.00 $3,030.00

1.5 Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 17”, and White 100 lb. Cover 
Stock, Two-Sided, Four-Color Process, Die Cut and wrapped, Full 
Bleed - without UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.20 $0.10 $0.22596 $0.30 No Bid $0.2502
Extended Price: $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,259.60 $3,000.00 $2,502.00

1.6 Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 17”, and White 100 lb. Cover 
Stock, Two-Sided, Four-Color Process, Die Cut and wrapped, Full 
Bleed - with UV/Aqueous Coat

15,000

Unit Price Each: $0.18 $0.09 $0.17486 $0.26 No Bid $0.2032
Extended Price: $2,700.00 $1,350.00 $2,622.90 $3,900.00 $3,048.00

1.7 Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 11”, 110 lb. Color Cover Stock, 
Two-Sided Black ink, Die Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - without 
UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.16 $0.07 $0.2214 $0.18 No Bid $0.2293
Extended Price: $1,600.00 $700.00 $2,214.00 $1,800.00 $2,293.00

1.8 Deleted

1.9 Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 14”, 110 lb. Color Cover Stock, 
Two-Sided Black ink, Die Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - without 
UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.16 $0.08 $0.287 $0.20 No Bid $0.2625
Extended Price: $1,600.00 $800.00 $2,870.00 $2,000.00 $2,625.00

1.10 Deleted

1.11 Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 17”, 110 lb Color Cover Stock, 
Two-Sided Black ink, Die Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - without 
UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.16 $0.09 $0.28875 $0.20 No Bid $0.2637
Extended Price: $1,600.00 $900.00 $2,887.50 $2,000.00 $2,637.00
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San Antonio,
Texas 78219
(210) 333-1711

Austin,
Texas 78744

San Antonio,
Texas 78216

Austin,
Texas 78754

Frisco,
Texas 75036

San Antonio, 
Texas 78217

1.12 Deleted

1.13 Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.375” X 13”, 100 lb Gloss Cover Stock, 
Two Sided 4/4, Die Cut and wrapped (each version/zone boxed and 
labeled), Full Bleed - without UV/Aqueous Coat

100,000

Unit Price Each: $0.06 $0.06 $0.10545 $0.11 No Bid $0.084
Extended Price: $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $10,545.00 $11,000.00 $8,400.00

1.14 Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.375” X 13”, 100 lb Gloss Cover Stock, 
Two Sided 4/4, Die Cut and wrapped (each version/zone boxed and 
labeled), Full Bleed - with UV/Aqueous Coat

1,500,000

Unit Price Each: $0.05 $0.05 $0.05288 $0.08 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price: $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $79,320.00 $120,000.00

CATEGORY II – TAGS
2.1 Tag, Finished Size 4.25” X 11”, and White 100 lb. Cover Stock, Two-

Sided, Four-Color Process, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No 
Die Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - without UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.15 $0.18 $0.21147 $0.24 No Bid $0.1803
Extended Price: $1,500.00 $1,800.00 $2,114.70 $2,400.00 $1,803.00

2.2 Tag, Finished Size 4.25” X 11”, and White 100 lb. Cover Stock, Two-
Sided, Four-Color Process, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No 
Die Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - with UV/Aqueous Coat

15,000

Unit Price Each: $0.14 $0.17 $0.16884 $0.20 No Bid $0.142
Extended Price: $2,100.00 $2,550.00 $2,532.60 $3,000.00 $2,130.00

2.3 Tag, Finished Size, 4.25” X 14”, White 100 lb. Cover, Two-Sided, 
Four-Color Process, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No Die 
Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - without UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.18 $0.19 $0.2352 $0.26 No Bid $0.2018
Extended Price: $1,800.00 $1,900.00 $2,352.00 $2,600.00 $2,018.00

2.4 Tag, Finished Size, 4.25” X 14”, White 100 lb. Cover, Two-Sided, 
Four-Color Process, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No Die 
Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - with UV/Aqueous Coat

15,000

Unit Price Each: $0.16 $0.18 $0.1876 $0.23 No Bid $0.163
Extended Price: $2,400.00 $2,700.00 $2,814.00 $3,450.00 $2,445.00

2.5 Tag, Finished Size 4.25” X 17”, and White 100 lb. Cover Stock, Two-
Sided, Four-Color Process, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No 
Die Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - without UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.18 $0.20 $0.23562 $0.26 No Bid $0.2029
Extended Price: 1,800.00 2,000.00 2,356.20 2,600.00 2,029.00

2.6 Tag, Finished Size 4.25” X 17”, and White 100 lb. Cover Stock, Two-
Sided, Four-Color Process, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No 
Die Cut and wrapped, Full Bleed - with UV/Aqueous Coat

15,000

Unit Price Each: $0.17 $0.19 $0.18795 $0.23 No Bid $0.1646
Extended Price: $2,550.00 $2,850.00 $2,819.25 $3,450.00 $2,469.00

2.7 Tag, Finished Size 4.25” X 11”, 110 lb. Color Cover Stock, Two-
Sided Black ink, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No Die Cut 
and wrapped, Full Bleed - without UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.13 $0.17 $0.266 $0.15 No Bid $0.1914
Extended Price: $1,300.00 $1,700.00 $2,660.00 $1,500.00 $1,914.00
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Quantity

San Antonio,
Texas 78219
(210) 333-1711

Austin,
Texas 78744

San Antonio,
Texas 78216

Austin,
Texas 78754

Frisco,
Texas 75036

San Antonio, 
Texas 78217

2.8 Deleted 

2.9 Tag, Finished Size 4.25” X 14”, 110 lb. Color Cover Stock, Two-
Sided Black ink, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No Die Cut 
and wrapped, Full Bleed - without UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.15 $0.18 $0.28425 $0.17 No Bid $0.2152
Extended Price: $1,500.00 $1,800.00 $2,842.50 $1,700.00 $2,152.00

2.10 Deleted 

2.11 Tag, Finished Size 4.25” X 17”, 110 lb. Color Cover Stock, Two-
Sided Black ink, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No Die Cut 
and wrapped, Full Bleed - without UV/Aqueous Coat

10,000

Unit Price Each: $0.15 $0.19 $0.28665 $0.17 No Bid $0.2164
Extended Price: $1,500.00 $1,900.00 $2,866.50 $1,700.00 $2,164.00

2.12 Deleted

2.13 Tag, Finished Size 4.375” X 13”, 100 lb. Gloss Cover Stock, Two 
Sided 4/4, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No Die Cut and 
wrapped (each Tag will be wrapped, boxed and labeled by the color 
code located on the top left of the Tag), Full Bleed - without 
UV/Aqueous Coat

500,000

Unit Price Each: $0.08 $0.08 $0.09765 $0.09 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price: $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $48,825.00 $45,000.00

2.14 Tag, Finished Size 4.375” X 13”, 100 lb. Gloss Cover Stock, Two 
Sided 4/4, Double Sided Tape on Spanish Side, No Die Cut and 
wrapped (each Tag will be wrapped, boxed and labeled by the color 
code located on the top left of the Tag), Full Bleed - with 
UV/Aqueous Coat

500,000

Unit Price Each: $0.08 $0.0900 $0.0873 $0.09 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price: $40,000.00 $45,000.00 $43,650.00 $45,000.00

Subtotal $194,600.00 $193,900.00 $226,764.85 $269,150.00 $50,957.00
Payment Terms: 3% 10 Days Net 30 1/2% 10 Days Net 30 No Bid Net 30
Total Less Prompt Payment Discount: $188,762.00 $193,900.00 $225,631.03 $269,150.00 No Bid $50,957.00

Estimated Annual Total: $188,762.00 $193,900.00 $225,631.03 $269,150.00 No Bid Incomplete
Estimated Annual Award: $188,762.00

Total for Litho Press Inc. is $194,600.00 prior to application of Prompt Payment Discount
Deleted Item(s): Items 1.8, 1.10, 1.12, 2.8, 2.10, & 2.12 Deleted, No Longer Required.
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