
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Santex Truck Centers, LTD. Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc.

dba Cavender Grande Ford 8700 IH 10 East dba Kyrish Truck Centers 4562 IH-10 East
4562 IH-10 East Converse, TX 78109 1380 Ackerman Rd San Antonio, TX 78219

6100018098 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-277-4373 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity 210-245-4706 210-661-8371

1 1 Ton Full Four Door, DRW, 4x4 Pickup Truck 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/ Gooseneck Hitch

Price Each: $69,676.00
Extended price: $69,676.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2024 F350 Ford DRW Crew Cab 4x4

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Ford 6.7L 4V OHV Power Stroke
(Include SAE NET HP): Diesel 475 H.P.

Transmission Offered: Ford Torqshift

10 Speed Automatic

Warranty: 36 Months or 36,000 Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cavender Grande Ford

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 240 - 310 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 10/31/2024

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2024

cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No

2 Deleted

3 Deleted

4 Deleted
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018098 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

1 1 Ton Full Four Door, DRW, 4x4 Pickup Truck 1
w/ Gooseneck Hitch

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 

cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2 Deleted

3 Deleted

4 Deleted

Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc. Fast Forward EV, LLC Pegasus CDJR LLC Yeargin Enterprise LLC
4562 IH-10 East 381 Hemlock Trail 401 South I-45 6451 Bastogne Dr. Unit C
San Antonio, TX 78219 Crownsville, Maryland 21032 Ennis, TX 75119 Colorado Springs, CO 8902

Alternate Bid NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$71,490.75
$71,490.75

2024 RAM 3500 Tradesman Crew 
Cab 4x4

ETL 6.7L I6 Cummins Turbo
Diesel Engine

DG7 6-Spd Automatic 68RFE 
Transmission

DK3 Elec Shift on the Fly Transfer 
Case

3/36K with 5 Year/100 Powertrain

150 Calendar Days

Already Passed for 2024 Models

N/A - would have to move to a 
2025 Model

Yes - Currenlty in stock
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Santex Truck Centers, LTD. Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc.

dba Cavender Grande Ford 8700 IH 10 East dba Kyrish Truck Centers 4562 IH-10 East
4562 IH-10 East Converse, TX 78109 1380 Ackerman Rd San Antonio, TX 78219

6100018098 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-277-4373 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity 210-245-4706 210-661-8371

5 25K GVWR Landscaping Dump Truck 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Each: $138,000.00
Extended price: $414,000.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 International MV607

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cummins B6.7
(Include SAE NET HP): 325 H.P.

Transmission Offered: Allison 3000 RDS

Warranty: Basic Vehicle: 12 Months/Unlimite Miles

Engine: 60 Months/500K Miles

Transmission: 36 Months/300K Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Kyrish Truck Centers

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 365 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 11/1/2024

Last day order can be placed without missing 11/1/2024
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018098 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

5 25K GVWR Landscaping Dump Truck 3

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc. Fast Forward EV, LLC Pegasus CDJR LLC Yeargin Enterprise LLC
4562 IH-10 East 381 Hemlock Trail 401 South I-45 6451 Bastogne Dr. Unit C
San Antonio, TX 78219 Crownsville, Maryland 21032 Ennis, TX 75119 Colorado Springs, CO 8902

Alternate Bid NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$134,038.00
$402,114.00

2024 Hino L6 GVWR: 25,950 LBS

Cummins B6.7L 260 H.P.

Allison 2500 RDS

Engine: Standard is 3 Years; Can 
extend to

7 Years; Transmission standard is 
5 Years

Kyrish Truck Center

1380 Ackerman Rd.
San Antonio, TX

200 Calendar Days

N/A

N/A

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Santex Truck Centers, LTD. Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc.

dba Cavender Grande Ford 8700 IH 10 East dba Kyrish Truck Centers 4562 IH-10 East
4562 IH-10 East Converse, TX 78109 1380 Ackerman Rd San Antonio, TX 78219

6100018098 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-277-4373 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity 210-245-4706 210-661-8371

6 35K lbs. GVWR Water Distribution Truck 2 No Bid No Bid

Price Each: $164,945.00
Extended price: $329,890.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 / 2026 Freightliner M2-106

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cummins B6.7
(Include SAE NET HP): 250 H.P.

Transmission Offered: Allison 3000 RDS

Warranty: 2 Years - Unlimited Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 8700 IH 10 East
Converse, TX 78109

Delivery 180 - 360 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 10/31/2024

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2024
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018098 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

6 35K lbs. GVWR Water Distribution Truck 2

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc. Fast Forward EV, LLC Pegasus CDJR LLC Yeargin Enterprise LLC
4562 IH-10 East 381 Hemlock Trail 401 South I-45 6451 Bastogne Dr. Unit C
San Antonio, TX 78219 Crownsville, Maryland 21032 Ennis, TX 75119 Colorado Springs, CO 8902

Alternate Bid NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Santex Truck Centers, LTD. Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc.

dba Cavender Grande Ford 8700 IH 10 East dba Kyrish Truck Centers 4562 IH-10 East
4562 IH-10 East Converse, TX 78109 1380 Ackerman Rd San Antonio, TX 78219

6100018098 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-277-4373 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity 210-245-4706 210-661-8371

7 52K lbs. GVWR, 12 Cubic Yard Dump Truck 3 No Bid

Price Each: $177,940.00 $177,000.00 $193,231.00
Extended price: $533,820.00 $531,000.00 $579,693.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 / 2026 2025 International HV613 2026 Mack Pinnacle

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Detroit DD13 International S13 Mack Engine Model MP8 505 HP

(Include SAE NET HP): 470 H.P. / 1650 Lb. Ft. 470 H.P. with REPTO System

Transmission Offered: Detroit DT 12V Allison 4500 RDS Mack mDrive 14 Speed AMT

Vocational Auto Transmission Transmission with Crawler Gears

Warranty: 12 Months - Unlimited Miles Basic Vehicle: 12 Months/Unlimite Miles Basic Truck - 12 Month/100,000 
Miles

Engine: 60 Months/500K Miles Engine - 2 Year/250,000 Miles
Transmission: 36 Months/300K Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Kyrish Truck Centers Bruckner's Truck Equipment

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 4562 IH-10 East 
Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 150 - 360 Calendar Days 400 Calendar Days 300 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 10/31/2024 11/1/2024 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2024 11/1/2024 11/1/2024
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No No Yes

8 Deleted
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018098 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

7 52K lbs. GVWR, 12 Cubic Yard Dump Truck 3

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:

(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

8 Deleted

Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc. Fast Forward EV, LLC Pegasus CDJR LLC Yeargin Enterprise LLC
4562 IH-10 East 381 Hemlock Trail 401 South I-45 6451 Bastogne Dr. Unit C
San Antonio, TX 78219 Crownsville, Maryland 21032 Ennis, TX 75119 Colorado Springs, CO 8902

Alternate Bid NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$209,353.00
$628,059.00

2026 Mack Pinnacle

Mack Engine Model MP8 505 HP

Allison Automatic Model 4500RDS

with PTO Gear

Basic Truck - 12 Month/100,000 
Miles

Engine - 2 Year/250,000 Miles
Transmission - 5 Year/Unlimited 

Miles

Bruckner's Truck Equipment

4562 IH-10 East 
San Antonio, TX 78219

400 Calendar Days

12/31/2025

11/1/2024

Yes

Page 8



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Santex Truck Centers, LTD. Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc.

dba Cavender Grande Ford 8700 IH 10 East dba Kyrish Truck Centers 4562 IH-10 East
4562 IH-10 East Converse, TX 78109 1380 Ackerman Rd San Antonio, TX 78219

6100018098 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-277-4373 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity 210-245-4706 210-661-8371

9 Cab and Chassis with Roll Off 9 No Bid
Hoist and Tarp System - Min. 66K GVWR

Price Each: $238,476.00 $224,000.00 $257,948.00
Extended price: $2,146,284.00 $2,016,000.00 $2,321,532.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2026 Freightliner 1145D Plus 2025 International HV613 2026 Mack Model Granite 
GR64BR

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cummins X12 International S13 450 H.P. Mack Engine Model MP-8
(Include SAE NET HP): 455 H.P. / 1700 Lb. ft. 455 HP with REPTO System

Transmission Offered: Allison 4500 RDS Transmission Allison 4500 RDS Mack mDrive 13 Speed AMT
with REPTO System

Warranty: Chassis - 1 Year - Unlimited Miles 60 Months/Unlimited Miles Transmission Basic Truck - 12 Month/100,000 
Miles

Engine - 24 Month/250,000 Miles

Transmission - 60 
Months/Unlimited Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Kyrish Truck Centers Bruckner's Truck Equipment

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 4562 IH-10 East 
Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 210 - 360 Calendar Days ARO 400 Calendar Days 300 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 10/31/2024 11/1/2024 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2024 11/1/2024 11/1/2024
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No No Yes

Page 9



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018098 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

9 Cab and Chassis with Roll Off 9
Hoist and Tarp System - Min. 66K GVWR

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc. Fast Forward EV, LLC Pegasus CDJR LLC Yeargin Enterprise LLC
4562 IH-10 East 381 Hemlock Trail 401 South I-45 6451 Bastogne Dr. Unit C
San Antonio, TX 78219 Crownsville, Maryland 21032 Ennis, TX 75119 Colorado Springs, CO 8902

Alternate Bid NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid

$257,948.00 $272,880.00
$2,321,532.00 $2,455,920.00

2026 Mack Model Granite 
GR64BR

2024 Autocar DC64

Mack Engine Model MP-8 Cummins X12 350 - 500 H.P.
455 HP

Allison 4500 RDS Allison 4500 RDS
6 Speed Automatic

Basic Truck - 12 Month/100,000 
Miles

5/Unlimited

Engine - 24 Month/250,000 Miles

Transmission - 60 
Months/Unlimited Miles

Bruckner's Truck Equipment Doggett Freightliner of South 
Texas, LLC

4562 IH-10 East 8700 IH 10 East
San Antonio, TX 78219 Converse, TX 78109

500 Calendar Days 365 Calendar Days

12/31/2025 N/A

11/1/2024 N/A

Yes No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Santex Truck Centers, LTD. Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc.

dba Cavender Grande Ford 8700 IH 10 East dba Kyrish Truck Centers 4562 IH-10 East
4562 IH-10 East Converse, TX 78109 1380 Ackerman Rd San Antonio, TX 78219

6100018098 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-277-4373 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity 210-245-4706 210-661-8371

10 Pre-Mix Mastic Seal Applicator Truck 1 No Bid

Price Each: $372,337.00 $360,000.00 $386,423.00
Extended price: $372,337.00 $360,000.00 $386,423.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2026 Freightliner 114 5D Plus 2025 International HV613 2026 Mack Model Granite

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cummins X12 International S13 390 H.P. Mack Engine Model MP-7
(Include SAE NET HP): 455 H.P. / 1700 Lb. Ft. 365 HP

Transmission Offered: Allison 4500 RDS Allison 4500 RDS Mack mDrive 13 Speed AMT
with REPTO System

Warranty: 1 Year Unlimited Miles Basic Vehicle: 12 Months/Unlimite Miles Basic Truck - 12 Month/100,000 
Miles

Engine: 60 Months/500K Miles Engine - 24 Month/250,000 Miles

Transmission: 36 Months/300K Miles Transmission - 60 
Months/Unlimited Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Kyrish Truck Centers Bruckner's Truck Equipment

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 4562 IH-10 East 
Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 300 - 420 Calendar Days 400 Calendar Days 400 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 10/31/2024 11/1/2024 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2024 11/1/2024 11/1/2024
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No No Yes

11 Deleted
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018098 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

10 Pre-Mix Mastic Seal Applicator Truck 1

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

11 Deleted

Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc. Fast Forward EV, LLC Pegasus CDJR LLC Yeargin Enterprise LLC
4562 IH-10 East 381 Hemlock Trail 401 South I-45 6451 Bastogne Dr. Unit C
San Antonio, TX 78219 Crownsville, Maryland 21032 Ennis, TX 75119 Colorado Springs, CO 8902

Alternate Bid NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$386,423.00
$386,423.00

2026 Mack Model Granite 8x4

Mack Engine Model MP-7
11L 365 HP

Allison 4500 RDS
with PTO Gear

Basic Truck - 12 Month/100,000 
Miles

Engine - 24 Month/250,000 Miles

Transmission - 60 
Months/Unlimited Miles

Bruckner's Truck Equipment

4562 IH-10 East 
San Antonio, TX 78219

550 Calendar Days

12/31/2025

11/1/2024

Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Santex Truck Centers, LTD. Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc.

dba Cavender Grande Ford 8700 IH 10 East dba Kyrish Truck Centers 4562 IH-10 East
4562 IH-10 East Converse, TX 78109 1380 Ackerman Rd San Antonio, TX 78219

6100018098 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-277-4373 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity 210-245-4706 210-661-8371

12 1 Ton, Crew Cab 4x2 Stake Bed Truck, 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DRW with Lift Gate

Price Each: $82,429.00
Extended price: $82,429.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2024 Ford F350 Crew Cab

Cab and Chassis, 4x2 DRW

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Ford 6.7L 4V OHV Power Stroke V8
(Include SAE NET HP): Diesel 330 H.P.

Transmission Offered: Ford Torqshift
10 Speed Automatic

Warranty: 36 Months or 36,000 Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cavender Grande Ford

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 240 - 310 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 10/31/2024

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2024
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018098 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

12 1 Ton, Crew Cab 4x2 Stake Bed Truck, 1
DRW with Lift Gate

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc. Fast Forward EV, LLC Pegasus CDJR LLC Yeargin Enterprise LLC
4562 IH-10 East 381 Hemlock Trail 401 South I-45 6451 Bastogne Dr. Unit C
San Antonio, TX 78219 Crownsville, Maryland 21032 Ennis, TX 75119 Colorado Springs, CO 8902

Alternate Bid NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$99,490.75
$99,490.75

2024 Chevrolet 4500 LT Crew 
Cab

4x4 60" CA

L5D Engine Duramax 6.6L
Diesel Turbo V8

Allison MWA Transmission
6 Speed Automatic

3/36K Limited and 5/100K 
Powertrain

4,000 Chevrolet / GM Dealerships

Nation Wide

4 - 6 Months

Already Past

ASAP

Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Santex Truck Centers, LTD. Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc.

dba Cavender Grande Ford 8700 IH 10 East dba Kyrish Truck Centers 4562 IH-10 East
4562 IH-10 East Converse, TX 78109 1380 Ackerman Rd San Antonio, TX 78219

6100018098 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-277-4373 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity 210-245-4706 210-661-8371

13 1 Ton Regular Cab Truck 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
with Mounted Fold Down Bed

Option A - FAA Yellow - Price Each: $68,942.00
Option A Color - Extended price: $137,884.00

Option B - OEM Color White - Price Each: $67,942.00
Option B OEM Color - Extended price: $135,884.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2024 Ford F350 Regular Cab

Cab and Chassis, SRW 4x2

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Ford 7.3L 2V DEVCT NA PFI V8

(Include SAE NET HP): Gas 335 H.P.

Transmission Offered: Ford Torqshift

10 Speed Automatic

Warranty: 36 Months or 36,000 miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cavender Grande Ford

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 300 - 350 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 10/31/2024

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2024
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No

14 Deleted

15 Deleted

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Total $425,873.00 $3,382,331.00 $3,321,000.00 $3,287,648.00
Total Award $287,989.00 $329,890.00 $3,321,000.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 26, 2024
For: Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018098 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

13 1 Ton Regular Cab Truck 2
with Mounted Fold Down Bed

Option A - FAA Yellow - Price Each:
Option A Color - Extended price:

Option B - OEM Color White - Price Each:
Option B OEM Color - Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:

(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

14 Deleted

15 Deleted

Payment Terms

Total
Total Award

Bruckner Trucks Sales, Inc. Fast Forward EV, LLC Pegasus CDJR LLC Yeargin Enterprise LLC
4562 IH-10 East 381 Hemlock Trail 401 South I-45 6451 Bastogne Dr. Unit C
San Antonio, TX 78219 Crownsville, Maryland 21032 Ennis, TX 75119 Colorado Springs, CO 8902

Alternate Bid NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

$76,490.75
$152,981.50

2024 Chevrolet 5500 MD Reg Cab

& Chassis 4x2 6.6L Diesel

L5D Engine Duramax 6.6L Diesel 
Turbo V8

MWA Transmission, 6 Speed 
Automatic

3/36K Limited and 5/100K 
Powertrain

4,000 Chevrolet / GM Dealerships

Nation Wide

4 - 6 Months

Past Already 

ASAP

Yes

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

$3,336,014.00 $2,858,034.00 $323,963.00 $0.00
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	Final Bid Tab

