
Opened: January 31, 2025

For:
Annual Contract for Office, Computer, 
Electronics, and Breakroom Supplies Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

ODP Business 
Solutions, LLC

AHI Enterprises 
LLC

Asterisk Dot 
Asterisk 
Technologies LLC

Cielo Office 
Products LLC

Gateway Printing 
& Office Supply, 
Inc.

Lakeshore 
Learning Materials 
LLC

6600 North 
Military Trail

16120 College 
Oak, Suite 105

2210 Clearwater 
Dr

1408 E. Jasmine 
Ave Ste A

14803 Bulverde 
Rd.

2695 E 
Dominguez St

Category Description
Boca Raton,
FL  33496-2434

San Antonio,
TX  78249

Round Rock,
TX  78681

McAllen,
TX  78501

San Antonio,
TX  78247

Carson,
CA  90895

NAS NAS NAS
1 Badges & Badge Supplies

Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 49% No Bid 0% - 90% 37% No Bid
Non-Core Price $10,981.69 $8,538.49 No Bid NAS $19,711.72 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 91% - 96% 43% - 68% No Bid 36% - 55% 35% - 96% No Bid
Core Price $2,167.35 $7,775.66 $7,590.12 $2,689.15 No Bid
Category 1 Total $13,149.04 $16,314.15 No Bid NAS $22,400.87 No Bid

2 Breakroom
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 51% No Bid 0% - 90% 57% No Bid
Non-Core Price $85,110.23 $131,799.86 No Bid NAS $125,273.96 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 49% - 87% 13% - 66% No Bid 8% - 64% 44% - 82% No Bid
Core Price $76,176.85 $133,157.85 No Bid $107,657.38 $109,332.76 No Bid
Category 2 Total $161,287.08 $264,957.71 No Bid NAS $234,606.72 No Bid

3 Calendars
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 51% No Bid 0% - 90% 57% No Bid
Non-Core Price $18,548.76 $28,527.16 No Bid NAS $31,400.09 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 38% - 77% 46% - 79% No Bid 49% - 71% 38% - 77% No Bid
Core Price $17,804.95 $24,862.94 No Bid $34,603.79 $23,256.70 No Bid
Category 3 Total $36,353.71 $53,390.10 No Bid NAS $54,656.79 No Bid

4 Chairmats
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 52% No Bid 0% - 90% 37% No Bid
Non-Core Price $1,665.53 $2,327.12 No Bid NAS $2,847.73 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 30% - 75% 51% - 57% No Bid 54% - 64% 48% - 60% No Bid
Core Price $2,029.74 $2,224.76 No Bid $1,985.56 $2,121.29 No Bid
Category 4 Total $3,695.27 $4,551.88 No Bid NAS $4,969.02 No Bid

5 Cleaning & Sanitation
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 51% No Bid 0% - 90% 55% No Bid
Non-Core Price $20,169.70 $35,146.20 No Bid NAS $34,438.53 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 37% - 84% 24% - 66% No Bid 30% - 89% 38% - 83% No Bid
Core Price $22,995.02 $28,456.82 No Bid $38,696.79 $35,872.42 No Bid
Category 5 Total $43,164.72 $63,603.02 No Bid NAS $70,310.95 No Bid

6 Clocks
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 59% No Bid 0% - 90% 37% No Bid
Non-Core Price $1,376.03 $1,752.75 No Bid NAS $2,489.45 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 53% - 62% 44% - 66% No Bid 62% - 68% 49% - 67% No Bid
Core Price $1,651.90 $1,739.85 No Bid $1,158.54 $1,344.70 No Bid
Category 6 Total $3,027.93 $3,492.60 No Bid NAS $3,834.14 No Bid

7 Dry Erase and Bulletin Boards
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 57% No Bid 0% - 90% 44% 5%
Non-Core Price $12,108.30 $14,176.78 No Bid NAS $18,501.35 NAS

Core % Discount Offered 38% - 93% 40% - 55% No Bid 46% - 75% 21% - 86% 5%
Core Price $11,558.37 $17,010.19 No Bid $13,739.96 $19,641.33 $8,625.30
Category 7 Total $23,666.67 $31,186.97 No Bid NAS $38,142.68 NAS
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8 Frames & Sign Holders
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 52% No Bid 0% - 90% 44% No Bid
Non-Core Price $17,365.29 $15,043.75 No Bid NAS $25,902.77 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 59% - 93% 40% - 73% No Bid 38% - 68% 42% - 98% No Bid
Core Price $6,079.30 $13,855.73 No Bid $11,826.99 $8,242.42 No Bid
Category 8 Total $23,444.59 $28,899.48 No Bid NAS $34,145.19 No Bid

9 Folders & Filing
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 60% No Bid 0% - 90% 66% No Bid
Non-Core Price $26,911.12 $42,685.84 No Bid NAS $24,034.19 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 55% - 95% 38% - 89% No Bid 45% - 90% 38% - 89% No Bid
Core Price $13,990.75 $26,860.29 No Bid $33,975.89 $20,559.13 No Bid
Category 9 Total $40,901.87 $69,546.13 No Bid NAS $44,593.33 No Bid

10 General Office Supplies
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 58% No Bid 0% - 90% 66% No Bid
Non-Core Price $152,129.23 $166,394.99 No Bid NAS $130,213.44 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 51% - 97% 29% - 91% No Bid 40% - 86% 49% - 97% No Bid
Core Price $76,621.36 $134,059.27 No Bid $281,042.13 $87,516.80 No Bid
Category 10 Total $228,750.59 $300,454.26 No Bid NAS $217,730.24 No Bid

11 Small Equipment & Aids
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 52% No Bid 0% - 90% 37% 5%
Non-Core Price $37,839.75 $52,808.28 No Bid NAS $71,802.84 NAS

Core % Discount Offered 43% - 68% 43% - 68% No Bid 27% - 87% 41% - 98% 5%
Core Price $26,648.67 $39,800.64 No Bid $40,081.97 $34,048.20 $5,176.41
Category 11 Total $64,488.42 $92,608.92 No Bid NAS $105,851.04 NAS

12 Writing Supplies
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 53% No Bid 0% - 90% 48% 5%
Non-Core Price $58,533.51 $78,696.48 No Bid NAS $89,712.06 NAS

Core % Discount Offered 60% - 92% 37% - 93% No Bid 2% - 80% 41% - 92% 5%
Core Price $43,758.50 $71,559.13 No Bid $108,774.50 $66,456.79 $1,897.91
Category 12 Total $102,292.01 $150,255.61 No Bid NAS $156,168.85 NAS

13 Mailing, Packaging & Shipping
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 53% No Bid 0% - 90% 42% No Bid
Non-Core Price $969.57 $969.57 No Bid NAS $1,440.50 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 65% - 82% 33%-59% No Bid 33% - 67% 63% - 77% No Bid
Core Price $673.20 $969.57 No Bid $1,154.62 $882.03 No Bid
Category 13 Total $1,642.77 $1,939.14 No Bid No Bid $2,322.54 No Bid

14 Paper Products
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 60% No Bid 0% - 90% 54% No Bid
Non-Core Price $20,644.75 $22,155.26 No Bid NAS $70,740.32 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 41% - 84% 24%-72% No Bid 26% - 68% 40% 84% No Bid
Core Price $13,502.05 $19,029.10 No Bid $18,686.71 $15,351.54 No Bid
Category 14 Total $34,146.80 $41,184.36 No Bid NAS $86,091.87 No Bid
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15 School Supplies
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 51% No Bid 0% - 90% 30% 5%
Non-Core Price $5,011.33 $7,116.57 No Bid NAS $9,964.14 NAS

Core % Discount Offered 78% - 95% 28%-60% No Bid 43% - 89% 45% - 95% 5%
Core Price $1,388.15 $4,867.23 No Bid $3,895.64 $1,857.01 $541.22
Category 15 Total $6,399.48 $11,983.80 No Bid NAS $11,821.14 NAS

16 Tape and Adhesives
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 46% No Bid 0% - 90% 47% No Bid
Non-Core Price $12,105.44 $17,896.58 No Bid NAS $17,031.08 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 61% - 85% 7% - 69% No Bid 30% - 86% 47% - 82% No Bid
Core Price $11,730.57 $18,172.77 No Bid $15,427.99 $13,673.44 No Bid
Category 16 Total $23,836.01 $36,069.36 No Bid NAS $30,704.52 No Bid

17 Technology & Accessories
Non-Core % Discount Offered 65% 47% 5%-15% 0% - 90% 47% -
Non-Core Price $42,678.07 $48,179.41 NAS NAS $59,949.65 No Bid

Core % Discount Offered 8% - 97% 1%-80% 13%-70% 4% - 84% 9% - 94% -
Core Price $36,071.85 $54,420.34 $44,028.13 $54,637.76 $42,170.06 No Bid
Category 17 Total $78,749.92 $102,599.75 NAS NAS $102,119.72 No Bid

Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Sub Total $888,996.88 $1,273,037.24 $1,220,469.60
Percentage between lowest 
responsive bid and local bid: 37.29%
Price differential $331,472.72
Non-local Preference Award $888,996.88

   
Estimated Annual Total $888,996.88 $1,273,037.24 NAS NAS $1,220,469.60 NAS
Estimated Annual Award $888,996.88


	FINAL TAB

