
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2025
For: FY25 Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd.

DBA Bruckner Truck & Equipment DBA Cavender Grande Ford
4562 IH 10 East 3600 IH-35 North

6100018826 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity

1 37K lbs. GVWR Brush Collection Grappler Truck 2 No Bid No Bid

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2 30K lbs. GVWR, Service Truck with Crane 1 No Bid

Price Each: $222,583.00
Extended price: $222,583.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2026 Mack MD7

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cummins B6.7L
(Include SAE NET HP): 300 HP

Transmission Offered: Allison 300 RDS

Warranty: 2 Year Unlimited Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bruckners Truck & Equipment

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH 10 East

San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 270 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 5/15/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Maybe
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2025
For: FY25 Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018826 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

1 37K lbs. GVWR Brush Collection Grappler Truck 2

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2 30K lbs. GVWR, Service Truck with Crane 1

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Industrial Power, LLC
8700 IH 10 East 712 N. Beach St.
Converse, TX 78109 Fort Worth, TX 76111

No Bid

$298,661.00
$597,322.00

2026 Freightliner M2-106 Plus

Cummins L9
330 HP - 1000lb. Ft.

Allison 3000 RDS

1 Year Unlimited Miles

Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC

8700 IH 10 East
Converse, TX 78109

210 - 420 Calendar Days

8/1/2025

8/1/2025

No

No Bid $88,585 (Body) + $92,300 (Chassis)+
$4,000 (PAC, PDI, VIT, Delivery, Freight,

DOC) = $184,885

$184,885.00
$184,885.00

2026 Hino L7 (Derated) with a Knapheide
Service Body

Cummins 6.7L
260 HP

Allison 3000 RDS

5 Year Allison (can go to 7), 3 Year 
Cummins (can go to 7), Base 2 Year, frame

rails, cab, crossmember 5 Year, 
Brakes 3 Year

Rush Truck Center of San Antonio
(Hino, Cummins, Allison)

Stewart & Stevenson (Allison)

Rush: 8922 I-10 Frontage Rd. 
Converse, TX 78109

S&S: 5717 I-10, San Antonio, TX 78219

240 Calendar Days

N/A

N/A

Yes
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2025
For: FY25 Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd.

DBA Bruckner Truck & Equipment DBA Cavender Grande Ford
4562 IH 10 East 3600 IH-35 North

6100018826 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity

3 35K lbs. GVWR Water Distribution Truck 1 No Bid No Bid

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

4 Class 6 Regular Cab DRW, 12’ Stake Bed Truck 1
with Crash Attenuator and Message Board

Price Each: $161,680.00 $179,300.00
Extended price: $161,680.00 $179,300.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2026 Mack MD6 2026 Ford F650 RIC 4X2

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cummins B6.7L Ford 6.7L Powerstroke V8
(Include SAE NET HP): 220 HP 270 H.P. 800 ft. lbs. Torque

Transmission Offered: Allison 2500 RDS Ford Torqshift ltd
10 Speed W/ PTO Provision

Warranty: 2 Year Unlimited Miles 24 Months Unlimited Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bruckners Truck & Equipment Cavender Grande Ford

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH 10 East 3600 IH-35 North
San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 180 Calendar Days 240 - 300 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025 5/1/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 5/15/2025 5/1/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Maybe No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2025
For: FY25 Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018826 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

3 35K lbs. GVWR Water Distribution Truck 1

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

4 Class 6 Regular Cab DRW, 12’ Stake Bed Truck 1
with Crash Attenuator and Message Board

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Industrial Power, LLC
8700 IH 10 East 712 N. Beach St.
Converse, TX 78109 Fort Worth, TX 76111

No Bid

$174,942.00
$174,942.00

2026 Freightliner M2-106 Plus

(Left Blank)

Allison 3000 RDS

1 Year Unlimited Miles

Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC

8700 IH 10 East
Converse, TX 78109

180 - 240 Calendar Days

8/1/2025

8/1/2025

No

No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2025
For: FY25 Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd.

DBA Bruckner Truck & Equipment DBA Cavender Grande Ford
4562 IH 10 East 3600 IH-35 North

6100018826 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity

5 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, DRW, 1 No Bid
2-3 Cubic Yard, 9’ Dump Body

Price Each: $84,795.00
Extended price: $84,795.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Ford F350 RIC 4X2

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Ford 6.7L 4V PowerStroke Turbo Diesel
(Include SAE NET HP): 330 H.P.

Transmission Offered: Ford Torqshift 10 Speed Automatic

Warranty: 36 Month or 36,000 Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cavender Grande Ford

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 3600 IH-35 North
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 210 - 270 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 5/1/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 5/1/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No

6 60K lbs. GVWR 5th Wheel Tractor Truck – 5 No Bid
Automatic Transmission

Price Each: $173,674.00
Extended price: $868,370.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2026 Mack Anthem

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Mack - MP8 
(Include SAE NET HP): 505 HP

Transmission Offered: Mack TMD 12AFO-HD mDrive
12 Speed Overdrive

Warranty: 12 Month / 100,000 Mile Chassis
2 Year / 250,000 Mile Engine

5 Year / 750,000 Mile Transmission

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bruckners Truck & Equipment

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH 10 East
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 270 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 5/15/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Maybe
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2025
For: FY25 Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018826 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

5 1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, DRW, 1
2-3 Cubic Yard, 9’ Dump Body

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

6 60K lbs. GVWR 5th Wheel Tractor Truck – 5
Automatic Transmission

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Industrial Power, LLC
8700 IH 10 East 712 N. Beach St.
Converse, TX 78109 Fort Worth, TX 76111

No Bid $23,434 (Dump Body)+
$65,194 (Chassis)+ $3,500 PAC, PDI, 

CIT, DOC, Freight, Delivery = $92,128.00

$92,128.00
$92,128.00

2026 Isuzu NPR HD Diesel

Isuzu 4 Cylinder, Turbo Charged,
Intercooled, direct injection

(4HK1-TC / 317 CID (5.19 L))

Aisin A465id - 6 speed automatic with
5th & 6th gear overdrive. PTO Capable

3 Year basic, engine, transmission, frame
rails, drive axle & shaft, croxxmember, etc.

5 Year Extended Available

Henna Isuzu Truck (Isuzu Warranty)
Kyrish Truck Centers of San Antonio

(Isuzu Warranty)

Henna: 8805 N. Interstate Hwy 35B
Austin, TX 78753

Kyrish: 1380 Ackerman Rd. 
San Antonio, TX 78219

150 Calendar Days

N/A

N/A

N/A

No Bid

$165,768.00
$828,840.00

2026 Freightliner 114SD Plus Tractor

Cummins X12 
500 HP

Eaton - Cummins EEO-18112C
Endurant

1 Year Unlimited Miles

Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC

8700 IH 10 East
Converse, TX 78109

150 - 240 Calendar Days

8/1/2025

8/1/2025

No
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2025
For: FY25 Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd.

DBA Bruckner Truck & Equipment DBA Cavender Grande Ford
4562 IH 10 East 3600 IH-35 North

6100018826 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item Description Quantity

7 Dead Animal Collection Truck, Reg Cab, 6 No Bid
w/Crane

Price Each: $175,665.00
Extended price: $1,053,990.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Ford F550 RIC 4X2

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Ford 6.7L 4V PowerStroke Turbo Diesel
(Include SAE NET HP): 330 H.P.

Transmission Offered: Ford Torqshift 10 Speed Automatic

Warranty: 36 Month or 36,000 Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cavender Grande Ford

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 3600 IH-35 North
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 300 - 365 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 5/1/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 5/1/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2025
For: FY25 Medium and Heavy-Duty Trucks

6100018826 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

7 Dead Animal Collection Truck, Reg Cab, 6
w/Crane

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Payment Terms

Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC Industrial Power, LLC
8700 IH 10 East 712 N. Beach St.
Converse, TX 78109 Fort Worth, TX 76111

No Bid No Bid

Net 30 Net 30
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