City of San Antonio Draft

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles
for Alamodome
GreenZone Impact EcoVision
Business Bay LLC DC Export LLC Enterprises LLC Enviromental Inc
5801 Lonerise Ln 1550 Leona St #233 |54 Fireside Dr 12-1064 Salk Rd #250
Hilliard, Houston, Brownsville, Pickering, Ontario
6100018893 SG OH 43026 TX 77009 TX 78521 Canada L1W4B5
Item Description Quantity
1 Receptacle Liners for 25-gallon 120
receptacles. Black or approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Metal Liner comes LIN-25 Not Provided
with all receptacles
Price Each $0.00 $21.15 NO BID $39.95
Total Price $0.00 $2,538.00 NO BID $4,794.00
2 25-gallon Celestial Series CL25-BK black 80
receptacles or approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided HP-25 Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $190.16 NO BID $226.75
Total Price $16,712.00 $15,212.80 NO BID $18,140.00
3 25-gallon Celestial Series CL25-BK 40
brushed stainless-steel receptacles or
approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided HPS-25 Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $190.16 NO BID $226.75
Total Price $8,356.00 $7,606.40 NO BID $9,070.00
4 36-gallon stainless steel "LANDFILL" 50
Oakley Eco #27131. Black or stainless
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided HP-36-L Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $470.00 NO BID $226.75
Total Price $10,445.00 $23,500.00 NO BID $9,070.00
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City of San Antonio Draft

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles JGW Machine Limited |[JGW Machine Limited
for Alamodome dba Paris Site dba Paris Site North American
Furnishings and Furnishings and Import and Export Phoenix Metal
Outdoor Fitness Outdoor Fitness Company LLC Products, Inc
259 Third Concession 259 Third Concession (13115 3rd St E 1B 100 Bennington Ave
Road Road
Princeton, Ontario Princeton, Ontario Madeira Beach, Freeport,
6100018893 SG Canada NOJ1VO Canada NOJ1VO FL 33708 NY 11520
Item Description Quantity
1 Receptacle Liners for 25-gallon 120 ALTERNATE
receptacles. Black or approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-0001 NAIM-RCTL0001 WR-L-S25
Price Each $128.00 NO BID $49.00 $60.00
Total Price $15,360.00 NO BID $5,880.00 $7,200.00
2 25-gallon Celestial Series CL25-BK black 80
receptacles or approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-0003-SS NAIM-25GBRCTO001 WR-425-BK
Price Each $466.00 NO BID $275.00 $210.00
Total Price $37,280.00 NO BID $22,000.00 $16,800.00
3 25-gallon Celestial Series CL25-BK 40
brushed stainless-steel receptacles or
approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-0003-SS NAIM-25GBRCTO001 WR-425-BL
Price Each $466.00 NO BID $275.00 $210.00
Total Price $18,640.00 NO BID $11,000.00 $8,400.00
4 36-gallon stainless steel "LANDFILL" 50

Oakley Eco #27131. Black or stainless
Manufacturer

Item Number
Price Each
Total Price

Paris Site Furnishings

19283-0004-LAN
$919.00
$45,950.00

Paris Site Furnishings

19283-0004-LAN-2
$836.00
$41,800.00

North American
Furniture
NAIM-36GBRCT001
$555.00

$27,750.00

Phoenix Metal
Products, Inc
WR-136-S-L

$494.00
$24,700.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles
for Alamodome
The Prestwick Group, Technology
Inc dba Max-R Safeway Supply International, Inc Tiger Companies, Inc
W248N5499 10841 Hillpoint Dr 1331 South 64 Mountainview Blvd
Executive Drive International Parkway,
Suite 2251
Sussex, San Antonio, Lake Mary, Wayne,
6100018893 SG WI153089 TX 78217 FL 32746 NJ 07470
Item Description Quantity
1 Receptacle Liners for 25-gallon 120
receptacles. Black or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply Alpine Industries
Item Number 0-6264 21R 28409 ALP438-23-LINER
Price Each $28.70 $62.80 $67.00 $75.00
Total Price $3,444.00 $7,536.00 $8,040.00 $9,000.00
2 25-gallon Celestial Series CL25-BK black 80
receptacles or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply Alpine Industries
Item Number 183820 CL25-BK $37,926.00 ALP438-23-BLK
Price Each $982.96 $200.00 $219.00 $260.00
Total Price $78,636.80 $16,000.00 $17,520.00 $20,800.00
3 25-gallon Celestial Series CL25-BK 40
brushed stainless-steel receptacles or
approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply Alpine Industries
Item Number 183821 CL25-55 $37,894.00 ALP438-23-SS
Price Each $982.96 $260.00 $274.00 $280.00
Total Price $39,318.40 $10,400.00 $10,960.00 $11,200.00
4 36-gallon stainless steel "LANDFILL" 50
Oakley Eco #27131. Black or stainless
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply Alpine Industries
Item Number 183776 M3601LF-FT-BK M3601LF-FT-BK ALP479-38
Price Each $647.66 $716.00 $766.00 $380.00
Total Price $32,383.00 $35,800.00 $38,300.00 $19,000.00




City of San Antonio Draft

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles
for Alamodome
GreenZone Impact EcoVision
Business Bay LLC DC Export LLC Enterprises LLC Enviromental Inc
5801 Lonerise Ln 1550 Leona St #233 |54 Fireside Dr 12-1064 Salk Rd #250
Hilliard, Houston, Brownsville, Pickering, Ontario
6100018893 Se OH 43026 TX 77009 TX 78521 Canada L1W4B5
Item Description Quantity
5 36-gallon stainless steel "RECYCLE" 50
Oakley Eco#27132. Blue or stainless steel
with blue lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided HP-36-R Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $470.00 NO BID $333.50
Total Price $10,445.00 $23,500.00 NO BID $16,675.00
6 20-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 28
Series. Black receptacles or stainless steel
with black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided HPM-20 Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $203.53 NO BID $333.50
Total Price $5,849.20 $5,700.12 NO BID $16,675.00
7 20-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 28
Series. Blue or stainless steel with blue lid
or approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided HPMB-20 Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $203.53 NO BID $223.50
Total Price $5,849.20 $5,700.12 NO BID $6,258.00
8 35-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 191
Series. Black receptacles or stainless steel
with black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided HPX2-35 Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $262.51 NO BID $223.50
Total Price $39,899.90 $50,138.71 NO BID $6,258.00
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City of San Antonio Draft

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles JGW Machine Limited |JGW Machine Limited
for Alamodome dba Paris Site dba Paris Site North American
Furnishings and Furnishings and Import and Export Phoenix Metal
Outdoor Fitness Outdoor Fitness Company LLC Products, Inc
259 Third Concession 259 Third Concession (13115 3rd St E 1B 100 Bennington Ave
Road Road
Princeton, Ontario Princeton, Ontario Madeira Beach, Freeport,
6100018893 SG Canada NOJ1VO Canada NOJ1VO FL 33708 NY 11520
Item Description Quantity
5 36-gallon stainless steel "RECYCLE" 50
Oakley Eco#27132. Blue or stainless steel
with blue lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings| Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-004-REC 19283-004-REC-2| NAIM-36GBRCT001 WR-136-S-R
Price Each $919.00 $836.00 $555.00 $494.00
Total Price $45,950.00 $41,800.00 $27,750.00 $24,700.00
6 20-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 28
Series. Black receptacles or stainless steel
with black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-0006-BLK NAIM-20GBRCTO001 WR-320-BK
Price Each $434.00 NO BID $555.00 $467.00
Total Price $12,152.00 NO BID $15,540.00 $13,076.00
7 20-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 28
Series. Blue or stainless steel with blue lid
or approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-0006-BLU NAIM-20GBRCTO001 WR-320-BL
Price Each $434.00 NO BID $555.00 $467.00
Total Price $10,850.00 NO BID $15,540.00 $13,076.00
8 35-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 191
Series. Black receptacles or stainless steel
with black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-0008-BLK NAIM-35GBRCT001 WR-335-BK
Price Each $434.00 NO BID $659.00 $500.00
Total Price $82,894.00 NO BID $125,869.00 $95,500.00
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles
for Alamodome
The Prestwick Group, Technology
Inc dba Max-R Safeway Supply International, Inc Tiger Companies, Inc
W248N5499 10841 Hillpoint Dr 1331 South 64 Mountainview Blvd
Executive Drive International Parkway,
Suite 2251
Sussex, San Antonio, Lake Mary, Wayne,
6100018893 Se WI 53089 TX 78217 FL 32746 NJ 07470
Item Description Quantity
5 36-gallon stainless steel "RECYCLE" 50
Oakley Eco#27132. Blue or stainless steel
with blue lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply Alpine Industries
Item Number 183782 M3601RE-FT-BL M3601RE-FT-BL3 ALP479-38-BLU
Price Each $647.66 $716.00 $766.00 $380.00
Total Price $32,383.00 $35,800.00 $38,300.00 $19,000.00
6 20-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 28
Series. Black receptacles or stainless steel
with black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply
Item Number 183783 SC20-01-BB-FY SC20-01-BB-FT
Price Each $497.16 $416.00 $450.00 NO BID
Total Price $13,920.48 $11,648.00 $12,600.00 NO BID
7 20-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 28
Series. Blue or stainless steel with blue lid
or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply
Item Number 183784 SC20-01-BS-FT SC20-01-BS-FT
Price Each $497.16 $416.00 $450.00 NO BID
Total Price $13,920.48 $11,648.00 $12,600.00 NO BID
8 35-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 191
Series. Black receptacles or stainless steel
with black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply Alpine Industries
Item Number 183785 SC35P-01-BB-FT SC35P-01-BB-FT ALP4460-01-A
Price Each $597.06 $528.00 $573.00 $350.00
Total Price $110,600.46 $100,848.00 $109,443.00 $66,850.00




City of San Antonio Draft

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles
for Alamodome
GreenZone Impact EcoVision
Business Bay LLC DC Export LLC Enterprises LLC Enviromental Inc
5801 Lonerise Ln 1550 Leona St #233 |54 Fireside Dr 12-1064 Salk Rd #250
Hilliard, Houston, Brownsville, Pickering, Ontario
6100018893 Se OH 43026 TX 77009 TX 78521 Canada L1W4B5
Item Description Quantity
9 35-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 96
Series. Blue or stainless steel with blue lid
or approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided HPX2-35B Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $262.51 NO BID $282.50
Total Price $20,054.40 $25,200.61 NO BID $53,957.50
10 55-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 207
Series. Black receptacles or stainless steel
with black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided HP55 Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $363.11 NO BID $282.50
Total Price $43,242.30 $75,163.77 NO BID $27,120.00
11 55-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 207
Series. Blue or stainless steel with blue lid
or approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided HP55B Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $363.11 NO BID $338.50
Total Price $43,242.30 $75,163.77 NO BID $70,069.50
12 55-gallon stainless steel The Wave black 50
receptacles. Black or stainless steel with
black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Business Bay H-PRO Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Item Number Not Provided PH55BT Not Provided
Price Each $208.90 $599.00 NO BID $408.50
Total Price $10,445.00 $29,950.00 NO BID $20,425.00
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City of San Antonio Draft

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles JGW Machine Limited |JGW Machine Limited
for Alamodome dba Paris Site dba Paris Site North American
Furnishings and Furnishings and Import and Export Phoenix Metal
Outdoor Fitness Outdoor Fitness Company LLC Products, Inc
259 Third Concession 259 Third Concession (13115 3rd St E 1B 100 Bennington Ave
Road Road
Princeton, Ontario Princeton, Ontario Madeira Beach, Freeport,
6100018893 SG Canada NOJ1VO Canada NOJ1VO FL 33708 NY 11520
Item Description Quantity
9 35-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 96
Series. Blue or stainless steel with blue lid
or approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-0008-BLU NAIM-35GBRCT001 WR-335-BL
Price Each $434.00 NO BID $659.00 $500.00
Total Price $41,644.00 NO BID $63,264.00 $48,000.00
10 55-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 207
Series. Black receptacles or stainless steel
with black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-0008-BLK NAIM-55GBRCTO001 WR-355-BK
Price Each $489.00 NO BID $859.00 $567.00
Total Price $101,223.00 NO BID $177,813.00 $117,369.00
11 55-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 207
Series. Blue or stainless steel with blue lid
or approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-0010-BLU NAIM-55GBRCT001 WR-355-BK
Price Each $489.00 NO BID $859.00 $567.00
Total Price $101,223.00 NO BID $177,813.00 $117,369.00
12 55-gallon stainless steel The Wave black 50
receptacles. Black or stainless steel with
black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Paris Site Furnishings North American Phoenix Metal
Furniture Products, Inc
Item Number 19283-0010-BLK NAIM-55GBRCT002 WR-355-WV-BK
Price Each $489.00 NO BID $699.00 $567.00
Total Price $24,450.00 NO BID $34,950.00 $28,350.00




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles
for Alamodome
The Prestwick Group, Technology
Inc dba Max-R Safeway Supply International, Inc Tiger Companies, Inc
W248N5499 10841 Hillpoint Dr 1331 South 64 Mountainview Blvd
Executive Drive International Parkway,
Suite 2251
Sussex, San Antonio, Lake Mary, Wayne,
6100018893 Se WI 53089 TX 78217 FL 32746 NJ 07470
Item Description Quantity
9 35-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 96
Series. Blue or stainless steel with blue lid
or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply Alpine Industries
Item Number 183787 SC35P-01-BS-FT SC35P-01-BS-FT ALP4460-01-C
Price Each $597.06 $528.00 $573.00 $350.00
Total Price $57,317.76 $50,688.00 $55,008.00 $33,600.00
10 55-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 207
Series. Black receptacles or stainless steel
with black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply
Item Number 183791 SC55P-01-BB-FT SC55P-01-BB-FT
Price Each $669.36 $608.00 $661.00 NO BID
Total Price $138,557.52 $125,856.00 $136,827.00 NO BID
11 55-gallon stainless steel Witt Standard 207
Series. Blue or stainless steel with blue lid
or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply
Item Number 183793 SC55P-01-BS-FT SC55P-01-BS-FT
Price Each $669.36 $608.00 $661.00 NO BID
Total Price $138,557.52 $125,856.00 $136,827.00 NO BID
12 55-gallon stainless steel The Wave black 50
receptacles. Black or stainless steel with
black lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply
Item Number 183816 SC55P-W1-BB-FT SC55P-W1-BB-FT
Price Each $669.36 $676.00 $716.00 NO BID
Total Price $33,468.00 $33,800.00 $35,800.00 NO BID
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles
for Alamodome
GreenZone Impact EcoVision
Business Bay LLC DC Export LLC Enterprises LLC Enviromental Inc
5801 Lonerise Ln 1550 Leona St #233 |54 Fireside Dr 12-1064 Salk Rd #250
Hilliard, Houston, Brownsville, Pickering, Ontario
6100018893 SG OH 43026 TX 77009 TX 78521 Canada L1W4B5
Item Description Quantity
13 55-gallon stainless steel The Wave blue 50

receptacles. Blue or stainless steel with
blue lid or approved equal
Manufacturer

Item Number

Price Each

Total Price

Payment Terms

Vendor shall complete the delivery within
__calendar days of receipt of Ciy's
Purchase Order.

Plastic Liner Product Warranty

Steel Receptacle Product Warranty

Steel Receptacle Lifetime Expectancy

Business Bay
Not Provided
$208.90
$10,445.00

Net 30

77-90 Calendar Days
3 Years
4 Years

10 Years

H-PRO
HP55BB
$599.00
$29,950.00

1% 10 Days

90 Calendar Days
1 Year
4 Years

15 Years

ACO Recycling
8479.89.97.90.19
$35,000.00
$210,000.00

Net 30

90 Calendar Days
Not Provided
3 Years

15 Years

Haoyida Outdoor
Facility Co.Ltd.
Not Provided
$408.50
$20,425.00

Net 30

90 Calendar Days
2 Years
3 Years

15 Years




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles JGW Machine Limited |JGW Machine Limited
for Alamodome dba Paris Site dba Paris Site North American

Furnishings and Furnishings and Import and Export Phoenix Metal
Outdoor Fitness Outdoor Fitness Company LLC Products, Inc
259 Third Concession 259 Third Concession (13115 3rd St E 1B 100 Bennington Ave
Road Road
Princeton, Ontario Princeton, Ontario Madeira Beach, Freeport,

6100018893 SG Canada NOJ1VO Canada NOJ1VO FL 33708 NY 11520

Item Description Quantity
13 55-gallon stainless steel The Wave blue 50

receptacles. Blue or stainless steel with
blue lid or approved equal
Manufacturer

Item Number

Price Each

Total Price

Payment Terms

Vendor shall complete the delivery within
__calendar days of receipt of Ciy's
Purchase Order.

Plastic Liner Product Warranty

Steel Receptacle Product Warranty

Steel Receptacle Lifetime Expectancy

Paris Site Furnishings
19283-0012-BLU
$489.00

$24,450.00

2% 10 Days

90 Calendar Days
3 Years
3 Years

10 Years

NO BID
NO BID

2% 10 Days

90 Calendar Days
3 Years
3 Years

10 Years

North American
Furniture
NAIM-55GBRCT002
$699.00

$34,950.00

.5% 10 Days

90 Calendar Days
1 Year
3 Years

5 Years

Phoenix Metal
Products, Inc
WR-355-WV-BL
$567.00
$28,350.00

Net 30

90 Calendar Days
1 Year
3 Years

10 Years




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 28, 2025
For: IFB CSF Trash and Recycle Receptacles
for Alamodome
The Prestwick Group, Technology
Inc dba Max-R Safeway Supply International, Inc Tiger Companies, Inc
W248N5499 10841 Hillpoint Dr 1331 South 64 Mountainview Blvd
Executive Drive International Parkway,
Suite 2251
Sussex, San Antonio, Lake Mary, Wayne,
6100018893 Se WI 53089 TX 78217 FL 32746 NJ 07470
Item Description Quantity
13 55-gallon stainless steel The Wave blue 50
receptacles. Blue or stainless steel with
blue lid or approved equal
Manufacturer Max-R Witt Industries Guest Supply
Item Number 183817 SC55P-W1-BS-FT SC55P-W1-BS-FT
Price Each $669.36 $676.00 $716.00 NO BID
Total Price $33,468.00 $33,800.00 $35,800.00 NO BID
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 .25% 10 Days Net 30
Vendor shall complete the delivery within
__calendar days of receipt of Ciy's
Purchase Order. 90 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days| 238 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days
Plastic Liner Product Warranty 2 Years 1 Year 1 Year 2 Years
Steel Receptacle Product Warranty 3 Years 3 Years 1 Year 3 Years
Steel Receptacle Lifetime Expectancy 25 Years 7 Years 1 Year 10 Years
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