City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 28, 2025 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT BULK COPY PAPER FOR PRINT SHOP Clampitt Paper Co., LLC Western-BRW Paper Co., Inc.
3550 Ridgeside 1800 Kelly Blvd
6100018966 MAA San Antonio, TX 78219 Carrollton, TX 75006-5529
Estimated 210-599-9600 512-339-9987
Item Description Annual
Quantity
1(a.) Muti-Use Copy Paper 20lb White
Size 8.5” X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 480,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $9.00, $8.76|
Extended Price $4,320.00 $4,204.80)
1(b.) Muti-Use Copy Paper 20lb White
Size 8.5" X 147 8.5" X 14”
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 200,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $12.87| $13.28
Extended Price $2,574.00] $2,656.00
1(c.) Muti-Use Copy Paper 20lb White
Size 11" x17” 11" x17”
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 200,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $18.90 $20.88
Extended Price $3,780.00 $4,176.00
2(a) Multi-Use Copy Paper 20Ib. Pastel Assorted Colors
Size 8.5" X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $63.00| $13.08|
Extended Price $6,300.00] $1,308.00)
2 (b.) Multi-Use Copy Paper 20lb. Pastel Assorted Colors
Size 8.5" X 147 8.5" X 14”
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $18.50 $17.86
Extended Price $925.00 $893.00
2 (c.) Multi-Use Copy Paper 20lb. Pastel Assorted Colors
Size 11" x 17" 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $67.25| $28.08|
Extended Price $6,725.00] $2,808.00)
2(d.) Multi-Use Copy Paper 20Ib. Pastel Assorted Colors
Size 12 x 18| 12" x 18"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $32.50 NO BID
Extended Price $1,625.00 NO BID
3(a.) Multi-Use Paper 60Ib. Brite Hue Assorted Colors
Size 8.5" X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $30.02] $24.25|
Extended Price $3,002.00] $2,425.00)
3(b.) Multi-Use Paper 60Ib. Brite Hue Assorted Colors
Size 8.5" X 147 8.5" X 14”
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM N/A $30.87
Extended Price N/A $1,543.50]
3(c.) Multi-Use Paper 60Ib. Brite Hue Assorted Colors
Size 11" x 17" 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $60.08| $48.54]
Extended Price $6,008.00] $4,854.00)
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 28, 2025 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT BULK COPY PAPER FOR PRINT SHOP Clampitt Paper Co., LLC Western-BRW Paper Co., Inc
3550 Ridgeside 1800 Kelly Blvd
6100018966 MAA San Antonio, TX 78219 Carrollton, TX 75006-5529
Estimated 210-599-9600 512-339-9987
Item Description Annual
Quantity
3(d.) DELETE
4(a) Multi-Use Premium Copy Paper 70Ib. White NAS
Size 8.5" X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 480,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $13.70] $14.06
Extended Price $6,576.00] $6,748.80
4 (b.) Multi-Use Premium Copy Paper 70Ib. White NAS
Size 11" x17” 11" x17”
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 480,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $29.50 $30.10
Extended Price $14,160.00 $14,448.00
4 (c.) Multi-Use Premium Copy Paper 70Ib. White NAS
Size 12"x 18" 12" x 18"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 200,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $69.25| $34.76
Extended Price $13,850.00, $6,952.00
5(a.) Multi-Use Copy Paper 60Ib. White NAS
Size 8.5 X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 200,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $11.73 $12.05
Extended Price $2,346.00 $2,410.00
5(b.) Multi-Use Copy Paper 60Ib. White NAS
Size 8.5” X 14" 8.5" X 14”
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $12.81 $16.41
Extended Price $640.50 $820.50
5(c.) Multi-Use Copy Paper 60Ib. White NAS
Size 11" x17” 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 200,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $25.18 $25.79
Extended Price $5,036.00 $5,158.00
5(d.) Multi-Use Copy Paper 60Ib. White NAS
Size 12"x 18" 12" x 18"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $31.90| $29.79
Extended Price $1,595.00) $1,489.50
6 (a.) Muti Use copy paper 21Ibs. 2NRC (white / yellow)
Size 8.5 X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $38.56 $23.50
Extended Price $3,856.00 $2,350.00
6 (b.) Muti Use copy paper 21lbs. 2NRC (white / yellow)
Size 8.5” X 14" 8.5" X 14"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $47.16| $29.88|
Extended Price $4,716.00] $2,988.00)
6 (c.) Muti Use copy paper 21lbs. 2NRC (white / yellow)
Size 11" x17” 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000

Unit of Measure (UOM)

Per 1000 Sheets|

Per 1000 Sheets

Cost per UOM $73.69 $46.90
Extended Price $3,684.50 $2,345.00)
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 28, 2025 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT BULK COPY PAPER FOR PRINT SHOP Clampitt Paper Co., LLC Western-BRW Paper Co., Inc.
3550 Ridgeside 1800 Kelly Blvd
6100018966 MAA San Antonio, TX 78219 Carrollton, TX 75006-5529
Estimated 210-599-9600 512-339-9987
Item Description Annual
Quantity
7 (a.) Muti Use copy paper 21Ibs. 3 NRC (white / yellow / pink)
Size 8.5" X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $41.60| $26.46|
Extended Price $4,160.00| $2,646.00)
7 (b.) Muti Use copy paper 21lbs. 3 NRC (white / yellow / pink)
Size 8.5" X 147 8.5" X 14”
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $53.25 $33.68
Extended Price $5,325.00 $3,368.00]
7 (c.) Muti Use copy paper 21lbs. 3 NRC (white / yellow / pink)
Size 11" x 17" 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $83.20| $52.87]
Extended Price $4,160.00| $2,643.50)
8 (a.) Muti Use copy paper 21Ibs. 4 NRC (white / yellow / pink/goldenrod)
Size 8.5 X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $44.47 $28.28
Extended Price $2,223.50 $1,414.00
8 (b.) Muti Use copy paper 21Ibs. 4 NRC (white / yellow / pink/goldenrod)
Size 8.5" X 14” 8.5" X 14”
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $56.91 $36.00]
Extended Price $2,845.50] $1,800.00)
8(c.) Muti Use copy paper 21Ibs. 4 NRC (white / yellow / pink/goldenrod)
Size 11" x17” 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 25,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $88.92 $56.52
Extended Price $2,223.00 $1,413.00
9(a) Color Copy, 80# Gloss Text White
Size 8.5" X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000 51,000 qty, 3,000 sheets per box
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $21.91 NO BID
Extended Price $1,095.50] NO BID
9 (b.) DELETE
9(c.) Color Copy, 80# Gloss Text White NAS
Size 11" x17” 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 200,000 201,000 gty. 1,500 sheets per box
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $41.79 $32.74
Extended Price $8,358.00 $6,548.00
9(d) Color Copy, 80# Gloss Text White NAS
Size 12"x 18" 12" x 18"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 200,000 201,000 qty. 1,500 sheets per box|
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $45.93] $38.02
Extended Price $9,186.00] $7,604.00
9(e) Color Copy, 80# Gloss Text White NAS
Size 13" x 19" 13" x 19"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000 100,500 qty. 1,500 sheets per box
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $53.59 $44.35
Extended Price $5,359.00 $4,435.00
10 (a.) DELETE
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 28, 2025 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT BULK COPY PAPER FOR PRINT SHOP Clampitt Paper Co., LLC Western-BRW Paper Co., Inc
3550 Ridgeside 1800 Kelly Blvd
6100018966 MAA San Antonio, TX 78219 Carrollton, TX 75006-5529
Estimated 210-599-9600 512-339-9987
Item Description Annual
Quantity
10 (b.) DELETE
10 (c.) DELETE
10 (d.) Color Copy, 80# Gloss Cover White NAS
Size 12"x 18" 12" x 18"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 200,000 200,250 qgty. 750 sheets per box|
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $85.97| $71.28
Extended Price $17,194.00, $14,256.00
10 (e.) Color Copy, 80# Gloss Cover White NAS
Size 13" x 19" 13" x 19"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $74.25 $82.08
Extended Price $7,425.00 $8,208.00
11 (a.) Color Copy, 100# Gloss Text White
Size 8.5" X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000 50,540 qty. 2400 sheets per box|
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $27.39 NO BID
Extended Price $1,380.46] NO BID
11 (b.) DELETE
11 (c.) Color Copy, 100# Gloss Text White NAS
Size 11" x17” 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000 100,500 qty.
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $49.76 $41.18
Extended Price $4,976.00 $4,118.00
11 (d.) Color Copy, 100# Gloss Text White NAS
Size 12"x 18" 12" x 18"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 100,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $59.33] $47.52
Extended Price $5,933.00] $4,752.00
11 (e.) Color Copy, 100# Gloss Text White NAS
Size 13" x19” 13" x 19"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $66.35 $54.91
Extended Price $3,317.50 $2,745.50
12 (a.) DELETE
12 (b.) DELETE
12 (c.) Color Copy, 100# Gloss Cover White NAS
Size 11" x 17" 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 250,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $93.80| $77.76
Extended Price $23,450.00, $19,440.00
12 (d.) Color Copy, 100# Gloss Cover White NAS
Size 12"x 18" 12" x 18"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 250,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $108.12 $89.64
Extended Price $27,030.00 $22,410.00
12 (e.) Color Copy, 100# Gloss Cover White NAS
Size 13"x 19" 13"x 19"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 150,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $123.76 $102.60
Extended Price $18,564.00, $15,390.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 28, 2025 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT BULK COPY PAPER FOR PRINT SHOP Clampitt Paper Co., LLC Western-BRW Paper Co., Inc.
3550 Ridgeside 1800 Kelly Blvd
6100018966 MAA San Antonio, TX 78219 Carrollton, TX 75006-5529
Estimated 210-599-9600 512-339-9987
Item Description Annual
Quantity
13 (a.) Color Copy Index 110# White
Size 8.5" X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $31.90| $34.28
Extended Price $1,595.00] $1,714.00
13 (b.) Color Copy Index 110# White
Size 8.5" X 147 8.5" X 14”
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $42.98 NO BID
Extended Price $2,149.00 NO BID
13 (c.) Color Copy Index 110# White
Size 11" x 17" 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 250,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $67.65] $72.37
Extended Price $16,912.50, $18,092.50
13 (d.) Color Copy Index 110# White
Size 12"x 18" 12" x 18"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 250,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $82.30 NO BID
Extended Price $20,575.00 NO BID
13 (e.) Color Copy Index 110# White
Size 13"x 19" 13"x 19"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 150,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $84.50 NO BID
Extended Price $12,675.00) NO BID
14 (a.) Color Copy 65# Assorted Colors White Assorted Colors v White Assorted Colors v White
Size 8.5 X 11" 8.5" X 11"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets|
Cost per UOM $31.30 $29.32
Extended Price $1,565.00 $1,466.00
14 (b.) Color Copy 65# Assorted Colors White
Size 8.5” X 14" 8.5" X 14”
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $39.90 NO BID
Extended Price $1,995.00] NO BID
14 (c.) Color Copy 65# Assorted Colors White
Size 11" x17” 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 250,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $62.70 NO BID
Extended Price $15,675.00 NO BID
14 (d.) Color Copy 65# Assorted Colors White
Size 12"x 18" 12" x 18"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 250,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $79.75 NO BID
Extended Price $19,937.50, NO BID
14 (e.) Color Copy 65# Assorted Colors White
Size 13" x19” 13" x 19"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 150,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $90.50 NO BID
Extended Price $13,575.00 NO BID
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 28, 2025 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT BULK COPY PAPER FOR PRINT SHOP Clampitt Paper Co., LLC Western-BRW Paper Co., Inc.
3550 Ridgeside 1800 Kelly Blvd
6100018966 MAA San Antonio, TX 78219 Carrollton, TX 75006-5529
Estimated 210-599-9600 512-339-9987
Item Description Annual
Quantity
15 (a.) Color Copy Cover 120# White
Size 11" x 17" 11" x 17"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 50,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $120.00 NO BID
Extended Price $6,000.00] NO BID
15 (b.) Color Copy Cover 120# White
Size 12"x 18" 12" x 18"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 500,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $74.00 $135.78
Extended Price $37,000.00 $67,890.00
15 (c.) Color Copy Cover 120# White
Size 13"x 19" 13"x 19"
Estimated Annual Qty (Sheets) 150,000
Unit of Measure (UOM) Per 1000 Sheets| Per 1000 Sheets
Cost per UOM $84.50) $155.27
Extended Price $12,675.00) | $23,290.50
Delivery 5 Business Days 5 Business Days
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $408,253.46 $306,222.10
Estimated Annual Award $346,214.96 $40,469.80

Deleted: Line Items 3 (d.), 9 (b.), 10 (a.), 10 (b.), 10 (c.), 11 (b.), 12 (a.), and 12 (b.) will be re-bid at a

later date.
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