City of San Antonio

Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: May 9, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Electrolyte Replacement Drinks - Citywide
Triple S Steel Holdings Inc
CPI Foods, Inc Supply Innovations Co., LLC [Timely SA LLC DBA Alamo Iron Works.
6100018895 VF 6333 Denton Dr Ste 700 107A Shooting Club Rd. 5900 Balcones Drive 943 Frost Bank Center
Estimated
Item Description Annual |Dallas, Boerne, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |TX 75238 TX 78006 TX 78371 TX 78219
1 Electrolyte Instant Power Drink Mix, Sugar-Free
1a All Sport Sugar Free Powder Stik Orange 45
Brand Name All Sport All Sport All Sport All Sport
Supplier Part # Jel 1012522 1012522 1012522 408808FASPOWORZ
Quantity Per Package 50 50 50 50
Unit Price $39.00 $24.00 $38.80 $13.80
Extended Price $1,755.00 $1,080.00 $1,746.00 $621.00
1b All Sport Sugar Free Powder Stik Lemon-Lime 55
Brand Name All Sport All Sport All Sport All Sport
Supplier Part # Jel 10122523 10122523 10122523 408808FASPOWLLZ
Quantity Per Package 50 50 50 50
Unit Price $39.00 $24.00 $38.80 $13.80
Extended Price $2,145.00 $1,320.00 $2,134.00 $759.00
1c All Sport Sugar Free Powder Stik Fruit Punch 55
Brand Name All Sport All Sport All Sport All Sport
Supplier Part # Jel 10122524 10122524 10122524 408808FASPOWFPZ
Quantity Per Package 50 50 50 50
Unit Price $39.00 $24.00 $38.80 $13.80
Extended Price $2,145.00 $1,320.00 $2,134.00 $759.00
1d All Sport Sugar Free Powder Stik Grape 50
Brand Name All Sport All Sport All Sport All Sport
Supplier Part # Jel 10122525 10122525 10122525 408808FASPOWGRZ
Quantity Per Package 50 50 50 50
Unit Price $39.00 $24.00 $38.80 $13.80
Extended Price $1,950.00 $1,200.00 $1,940.00 $690.00
1e All Sport Sugar Free Powder Stik Variety 10
Brand Name All Sport All Sport No Bid All Sport
Supplier Part # Jel 10122520 10122520 408805FASPOWVARZ
Quantity Per Package 500 50 500
Unit Price $283.67 $24.00 $139.00
Extended Price $2,836.70 $240.00 $1,390.00
1f All Sport Sugar Free Powder Stik Orange 5
Brand Name All Sport All Sport All Sport All Sport
Supplier Part # Jel 1012522 Not Provided 101252522 408808FASPOWORZ
Quantity Per Package 50 50 50 50
Unit Price $39.00 $24.00 $38.80 $13.80
Extended Price $195.00 $120.00 $194.00 $69.00




City of San Antonio

Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: May 9, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Electrolyte Replacement Drinks - Citywide
Triple S Steel Holdings Inc
CPI Foods, Inc Supply Innovations Co., LLC [Timely SA LLC DBA Alamo Iron Works.
6100018895 VF 6333 Denton Dr Ste 700 107A Shooting Club Rd. 5900 Balcones Drive 943 Frost Bank Center
Estimated
Item Description Annual |Dallas, Boerne, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |TX 75238 TX 78006 TX 78371 TX 78219
2 Electrolyte Freezer Pops
2a Sqwincher Sqweeze Zero Sugar Freezer Pops Variety 10
Brand Name Squincher Shield Sqwincher Squeeze Squincher
Supplier Part # 159200231 02-04-01-36MX SQW-159200231 159200231
Quantity Per Case 150 36 150 150
Unit Price $76.85 $25.40 $78.00 $40.00
Extended Price $768.50 $254.00 $780.00 $400.00
2b PIP Thortz Sugar Free Electrolyte Freezer Shots Variety 10
Brand Name Sqincher PIP PIP Thortz All Sport
Supplier Part # ICEMIX-SF ICEMIX-SF 1112-ICEMIX-SF{08808FASFRZPOP-VAR-SF
Quantity Per Case 150 150 150 144
Unit Price $103.40 $61.00 $87.00 $29.09
Extended Price $1,034.00 $610.00 $870.00 $290.90
3 Electrolyte Instant Powder Drink Mix, 2.2 ounce, 144 per Case
3a Gatorade G Fruit Punch 5
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # 33808 33808 GAT33808 42763733808
Quantity Per Case 2.12 ounce / 144 per case 32 ounce / 144 per case 1 quart / 144 per case 1 quart / 144 per case
Unit Price $200.55 $130.00 $168.68 $98.61
Extended Price $1,002.75 $650.00 $843.40 $493.05
3b Gatorade G Lemon-Lime 12
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # 03928 03928 GAT03928 42763703928
Quantity Per Case 2.12 ounce / 144 per case 32 ounce / 144 per case 1 quart/ 144 per case 1 quart / 144 per case
Unit Price $200.55 $130.00 $168.68 $98.61
Extended Price $2,406.60 $1,560.00 $2,024.16 $1,183.32
4 Electrolyte Instant Powder Drink Mix, 2.5 Gallon Yield, 32 per Case
4a Gatorade G Fruit Punch 1
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # 33691 33691 GA33691 42763733691
Quantity Per Case 21 ounce / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 32 per case 2.5 gallon / 32 per case
Unit Price $260.99 $179.00 $296.00 $131.17
Extended Price $260.99 $179.00 $296.00 $131.17
4b Gatorade G Lemon-Lime 1
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # 03969 03969 GAT03969 42763703969
Quantity Per Case 21 ounce / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 32 per case 2.5 gallon / 32 per case
Unit Price $260.99 $179.00 $301.00 $131.17
Extended Price $260.99 $179.00 $301.00 $131.17




City of San Antonio

Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: May 9, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Electrolyte Replacement Drinks - Citywide
Triple S Steel Holdings Inc
CPI Foods, Inc Supply Innovations Co., LLC [Timely SA LLC DBA Alamo Iron Works.
6100018895 VF 6333 Denton Dr Ste 700 107A Shooting Club Rd. 5900 Balcones Drive 943 Frost Bank Center
Estimated
Item Description Annual |Dallas, Boerne, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |TX 75238 TX 78006 TX 78371 TX 78219
4c Gatorade G Orange 3
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # 03970 03970 GAT03970 42763703970
Quantity Per Case 21 ounce / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 32 per case
Unit Price $260.99 $179.00 $294.00 $131.17
Extended Price $782.97 $537.00 $882.00 $393.51
4d Gatorade G Riptide Rush 4
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade No Bid Gatorade
Supplier Part # 33673 33673 42763733673
Quantity Per Case 21 ounce / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 32 per case
Unit Price $260.28 $179.00 $131.17
Extended Price $1,041.12 $716.00 $524.68
4e Gatorade G Glacier Freeze 5 No Bid
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # 33677 33677 42763733677
Quantity Per Case 21 ounce / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 144 per case 2.5 gallon / 32 per case
Unit Price $260.28 $179.00 $131.17
Extended Price $1,301.40 $895.00 $655.85
5 Electrolyte Ready-to-Drink Thirst Quencher Sugar Free
5a Gatorade G2 Lower Sugar Cool Blue 20 ounce Bottle 150
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade No Bid Gatorade G Zero
Supplier Part # G2 Cool Blue 32481 - Not Lower Sugar 42763704705
Quantity Per Case 20 ounce / 8 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case
Unit Price $9.77 $43.89 $28.70
Extended Price $1,465.50 $6,583.50 $4,305.00
5b Gatorade G2 Lower Sugar Fruit Punch 20 ounce Bottle 50
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade No Bid Gatorade
Supplier Part # G2 Fruit Punch 20405 42763720405
Quantity Per Case 20 ounce / 8 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case
Unit Price $10.17 $43.89 $28.70
Extended Price $508.50 $2,194.50 $1,435.00
5c Gatorade G2 Lower Sugar Grape 20 ounce Bottle 25
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade No Bid Gatorade
Supplier Part # G2 Grape 20406 42763720406
Quantity Per Case 20 ounce / 24 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case
Unit Price $68.86 $43.89 $28.70
Extended Price $1,721.50 $1,097.25 $717.50




City of San Antonio

Draft Bid Tabulation
Opened: May 9, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Electrolyte Replacement Drinks - Citywide
Triple S Steel Holdings Inc
CPI Foods, Inc Supply Innovations Co., LLC [Timely SA LLC DBA Alamo Iron Works.
6100018895 VF 6333 Denton Dr Ste 700 107A Shooting Club Rd. 5900 Balcones Drive 943 Frost Bank Center
Estimated
Item Description Annual |Dallas, Boerne, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Quantity |TX 75238 TX 78006 TX 78371 TX 78219
5d Gatorade G2 Lower Sugar Lemon-Lime 20 ounce Bottle 65
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade No Bid Gatorade G Zero
Supplier Part # G2 Lemon-Lime 04212 G Zero Sugar 42763704215
Quantity Per Case 20 ounce / 8 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case
Unit Price $10.17 $43.89 $28.70
Extended Price $661.05 $2,852.85 $1,865.50
5e Gatorade G2 Lower Sugar Orange 20 ounce Bottle 25
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade No Bid Gatorade
Supplier Part # G2 Orange 04318 G Zero Sugar 42763704318
Quantity Per Case 20 ounce / 8 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case
Unit Price $10.17 $43.89 $28.70
Extended Price $254.25 $1,097.25 $717.50
5f Gatorade G2 Lower Sugar RipTide 20 ounce Bottle 140
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade No Bid Gatorade
Supplier Part # G2 RipTideB54 G Zero Sugar Glacier Frz 42763704427
Quantity Per Case 20 ounce / 24 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case 20 ounce / 24 per case
Unit Price $77.56 $43.89 $28.70
Extended Price $10,858.40 $6,144.60 $4,018.00
5g Gatorade G2 Lower Sugar Variety Pack 20 ounce Bottle 5
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade No Bid No Bid
Supplier Part # G2 Variety 52000133295
Quantity Per Case 20 ounce / 12 per case 20 ounce / 12 per case
Unit Price $22.25 $38.00
Extended Price $111.25 $190.00
5h Gatorade Vareity Pack 20 ounce Bottle 5
Brand Name Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade Gatorade
Supplier Part # Gatorade Regular QUA20162 Not Specified 42763705886
Quantity Per Case 20 ounce / 24 per case 20 ounce / 12 per case 20 ounce / 12 per case 20 ounce / 12 per case
Unit Price $28.68 $26.00 $21.00 $28.70
Extended Price $143.40 $130.00 $105.00 $143.50
Estimated business days to complete the project. 5 Days 10 Days 15 Days 3 Days
Payment Terms 2% 10 Days Net 30 Days 2% 15 Days Net 30 Days

Estimated Annual Total

Estimated Annual Award
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