City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Non-Local
Opened: May 14, 2025 SA Smart Solutions LLC  |Bell Electric Supply Co., |City Electrical Supply
For: Electrical Floor Boxes for CSF, Alamodome Inc. Company
8610 N New Braunfels 6909 Queens Blvd. 28368 Waterview Dr.
Ave. Suite 301
San Antonio, Woodside, Boerne,
6100018981 SG TX, 78217 NY, 11377 TX, 78006
Item Description Quantity 210-628-9024
1 Pin & Sleeve Plug PS560P9W or approved equal 12 WITHDREW NAS
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device- Legrand P&S
Kellems
Item Number HBL560P9W Not Provided PS560POW
Price Each $341.68 $317.80 $240.00
Total Price $4,100.16 $3,813.60 $2,800.00
2 Pin & Sleeve Connector PS560C9W or approved equal 12
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device- Legrand P&S
Kellems
Item Number HBL560COW Not Provided PS560COW
Price Each $389.98 $354.53 $290.00
Total Price $4,679.76 $4,254.36 $3,480.00
3 Pin & Sleeve Receptacle PS560R9W or approved equal 12
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device- Legrand P&S
Kellems
Item Number HBL560R9W Not Provided PS560ROW
Price Each $372.08 $337.67 $250.00
Total Price $4,464.96 $4,051.68 $3,000.00
4 60A Metallic Back Box w/angle opening type PSBB601W 12
or approved equal
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device-, Legrand P&S
Kellems
Item Number BB601W Not Provided PSBB601W
Price Each $116.28 $68.14 $130.00
Total Price $1,295.36 $817.68 $1,560.00
5 Pin & Sleeve Plug PS5100P7W or approved equal. 12
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device- Legrand P&S
Kellems
Item Number HBL5100P7W Not Provided PS5100P7W
Price Each $470.48 $431.12 $380.00
Total Price $5,645.76 $5,173.44 $4,560.00
6 Pin & Sleeve Connector PS5100C7W or approved equal. 12
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device- Legrand P&S
Kellems
Item Number HBL5100C7W Not Provided PS5100C7W
Price Each $550.08 $542.16 $440.00
Total Price $6,600.96 $6,505.92 $5,280.00
7 Pin & Sleeve Receptacle PS5100R7W or approved equal. 12
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device- Legrand P&S
Kellems
Item Number HBL5100R7W Not Provided PS5100R7W
Price Each $413.23 $370.12 $340.00
Total Price $4,958.76 $4,441.44 $4,080.00
8 100A Metallic Back Box with angle opening type 12
PSBB1001W or approved equal.
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device- Legrand P&S
Kellems
Item Number BB1001W Not Provided PSBB1001W
Price Each $167.26 $158.30 $178.00
Total Price $2,007.12 $1,899.60 $2,136.00
9 Pin & Sleeve Receptacle PS530R9W or approved equal. 12
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device- Legrand P&S
Kellems
Item Number HBL530R9W Not Provided PS530ROW
Price Each $237.03 $223.07 $180.00
Total Price $2,844.36 $2,676.84 $2,160.00
10 30A Metallic Back Box with angle opening type 12
PSBB301W or approved equal
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device- Legrand P&S
Kellems
Item Number BB301W Not Provided PSBB301W
Price Each $83.27 $51.75 $82.00
Total Price $999.24 $621.00 $984.00




City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 14, 2025 SA Smart Solutions LLC |Bell Electric Supply Co., |City Electrical Supply
For: Electrical Floor Boxes for CSF, Alamodome Inc. Company
8610 N New Braunfels 6909 Queens Blvd. 28368 Waterview Dr.
Ave. Suite 301
San Antonio, Woodside, Boerne,
6100018981 SG TX. 78217 NY, 11377 TX. 78006
Item Description Quantity 210-628-9024
11 5-Channel Cable Protector 5800-520-000 or approved 12
equal.
Manufacturer Hubbell Wiring Device-, NO BID Not Provided
Kellems
Item Number HBLTRED5B NO BID 5800-520-000
Price Each $337.33 NO BID $301.35
Total Price $4,047.96 NO BID $3,616.20
12 Industrial Thermal-Magnetic Circuit Breaker BAB3030H or 12
approved equal.
Manufacturer Square D/Schneider| EATON C-H
Electric|
Item Number Q0330 BAB3030H BAB3030H
Price Each $245.43 $202.00 $161.33
Total Price $2,945.16 $2,424.00 $1,935.96
13 Industrial Thermal-Magnetic Circuit Breaker BAB3040G or 12
city approved equal.
Manufacturer Square D/Schneider| EATON C-H
Electric|
Item Number QOB340 BAB3040H BAB3040H
Price Each $245.43 $343.00 $161.33
Total Price $2,945.16 $4,116.00 $1,935.96
14 Industrial Thermal-Magnetic Circuit Breaker BAB3050H or 12
approved equal
Manufacturer Square D/Schneider| EATON C-H
Electric|
Item Number QOB350 BAB3050H BAB3050H
Price Each $245.43 $343.00 $161.33
Total Price $2,945.16 $4,116.00 $1,935.96
15 Industrial Thermal-Magnetic Circuit Breaker BAB3060H or 12
approved equal
Manufacturer Square D/Schneider| EATON C-H
Electric|
Item Number QOB360 BAB3060H BAB3060H
Price Each $245.43 $336.00 $161.33
Total Price $2,945.16 $4,032.00 $1,935.96
16 Power Tray Cable AF84/001 or approved equal. 1,000
Manufacturer Omni Cable CERRO AF84
Item Number AF84/001 NO BID AF84/001
Price Each $14.47 NO BID $11,890.00
Total Price $14,470.07 NO BID $11,890.00
17 #4 AWG; 19 Strand 15,000
Manufacturer Southwire CERRO Not Provided
Item Number THHN4BLK Not Provided| THHN-4-STR-BLK-CU-500
Price Each $1.49 $1.20 $1,492.10
Total Price $22,350.00 $18,000.00 $22,381.50
18 #2 AWG; 19 Strand 15,000
Manufacturer Southwire CERRO Not Provided
Item Number THHN2BLK Not Provided| THHN-2-STR-BLK-CU-500
Price Each $2.37 $1.89 $2,355.69
Total Price $35,550.00 $28,350.00 $35,335.35
19 #8 AWG; 19 Strand 15,000
Manufacturer Southwire CERRO CERRO
Item Number THHNSBLK Not Provided Not Provided
Price Each $0.63 $0.51 $0.51
Total Price $9,450.00 $7.650.00 $7.650.00
20 #10 AWG; 19 Strand 15,000
Manufacturer Southwire CERRO Not Provided
Item Number THHN10BLK Not Provided | THHN-10-STR-BLK-CU-500
Price Each $0.34 $0.28 $341.44
Total Price $5,100.00 $4,125.00 $5,121.60
20 Deleted

Vendor shall complete the delivery within ____ calendar
days of receipt of Ciy's Purchase Order.

30 Calendar Days

14 Calendar Days

30 Calendar Days

Product Warranty 90 Days| 90 Days Not stated
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
TOTAL $140,345.11 $107,068.56 $123,778.49
TOTAL AWARD $140,345.11

Deleted: Item 20 duplicate, will not be re-bid.
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