City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Anderson Machinery San Antonio, Inc. B.D. Holt Co. Brabandt Equipment, CORP
14632 110 Frontage Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 1905 Hydro Dr.
Marion, TX 78124 San Antonio, TX 78222 Austin, TX 78728
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
1 Operator Propelled Rotary Line Remover 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each:
Total:
Year Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model
Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
2 Ride-On Mini-Track Loader 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Chaves Brothers Management LLC Cooper Equipment Company DeWinne Equipment Company
300 SW 8th St. #17 5210 N Loop 1604 E 11002 Bandera Rd.
Boca Raton, FL 33432 San Antonio, TX 78247 San Antonio, TX 78250
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
1 Operator Propelled Rotary Line Remover 2 No Bid No Bid
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $24,409.20
Total: $48,818.40
Year Make & Model Offered: Graco HP DC1021 G DCS with 10"
Diamond Drum & HD Line Driver
Attachment (Graco HP DC1013 G DCS
does not have forward and reverse up cut
capability as requested. HD Line Driver
required to operate with reverse up cut
feature.)
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Vanguard 21 HP
(Include SAE NET HP):
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): 1 Year Manufacturer Standar Warranty|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Sherwin Williams|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5123 N Loop 1604 W. Ste 102
San Antonio, TX
Delivery 60 Calendar Days;
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025
Last day order can be placed without missing 12/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes but will need to verify]|
2 Ride-On Mini-Track Loader 1 No Bid
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $32,299.00 $20,000.00
Total: $32,299.00 $20,000.00
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Viper V1300X 2025 Gravely Axis 200DT 950010
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: 24HP Yanmar Engine Kubota D1105

(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2 Year Engine
1 Year Parts and Labor

Texstar Equipment!

5446 N State Hwy 6, Waco, TX 76712
(CMB can assist with local facilities or
mobile repair as needed)

60 Calendar Days;

12/31/2025

12/31/2025

Yes but will need to verify]|

25HP]

1 Year

DeWinne Equipment
11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78250
5-10 Calendar Days
None

8/1/2025]

Yes, subject to availability|




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company Nueces Farm Center Inc. Nueces Farm Center Inc.
11002 Bandera Rd. DBA Nueces Power Equipment DBA Nueces Power Equipment
San Antonio, TX 78250 4697 FM 1516 North 4697 FM 1516 North
6100019105 JDLR Converse, TX 78104 Converse, TX 78104
Item Description Quantity
Alternate Bid Alternate Bid
1 Operator Propelled Rotary Line Remover 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each:
Total:
Year Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model
Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
2 Ride-On Mini-Track Loader 1 No Bid No Bid

PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $21,000.00
Total: $21,000.00

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2025 Gravely Axis 200DTN 950011

Kubota D1105
25HP

1 Year

DeWinne Equipment
11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78250
5-10 Calendar Days
None

8/1/2025]

Yes, subject to availability|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Professional Turf Products, RDO Construction Equipment Company Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
Limited Partnership DBA RDO Equipment Co. DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
1010 North Industrial Blvd. 192751H 35N 3025 State Hwy 161 3025 State Hwy 161
6100019105 JDLR |Euless, TX 76039 New Braunfels, TX 78610 Irving, TX 75062 Irving, TX 75062
Item Description Quantity
Alternate Bid
1 Operator Propelled Rotary Line Remover 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each:
Total:
Year Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model
Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
2 Ride-On Mini-Track Loader 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $33,000.00
Total: $33,000.00
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Vermeer S925TX
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Kubota V1505
(Include SAE NET HP): 25 HP

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

1 Year /1000 Hours

Vermeer Texas
16593 IH 35N
Selma, TX 78154
5 Calendar Days!
September of 2025

12/31/2025




City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

Anderson Machinery San Antonio, Inc.
14632 110 Frontage Rd
Marion, TX 78124

Item

Description

Quantity

B.D. Holt Co.
5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78222

Brabandt Equipment, CORP
1905 Hydro Dr.
Austin, TX 78728

Min. 12ft High Reach Skid Steer
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Enclosed Tracked Skid Steer w/

Asphalt Float and Planer Attachments

PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$112,378.00
$112,378.00

2025 CAT 275 XE

Cat C3.6 TA (Turbocharged After-Cooled)
122 HP

24 Month / 2000 Hour Total Machine
Limited Warranty|

Holt Cat

5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78222

45 Calendar Days|
12/31/2025

12/31/2025

$110,791.02
$110,791.02

2025 Giant G3500 Telescoping Boom

4 Cylinder Kubota V2403T
66 HP

Loader: 1000 Hous 2 Years
Engine: 2 Year 2000 Hours

Loader: Brabandt

Engine: Local Kubota Dealer or Brabandt,
First 100 hours Brabrandt will come and
Pick up unit in event of warranty repair

Loader: 1905 Hydro Dr. Austin, TX 78728
Engine: Local Kubota Dealer or Brabandt,

120 Calendar Days
November of 2025

9/15/2025

No Bid

Page 5



City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Cooper Equipment Company
5210 N Loop 1604 E
San Antonio, TX 78247

DeWinne Equipment Company
11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78250

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Chaves Brothers Management LLC
300 SW 8th St. #17
Boca Raton, FL 33432
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
3 Min. 12ft High Reach Skid Steer 1
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $152,898.99
Total: $152,898.99]
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Giant G 3500 Telescoping Loader
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Kubota 66 HP!
(Include SAE NET HP):
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): Manufacturer Standard 2 Years or 1000 HR|
Whichiever comes first
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Brabandt Equipment
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1905 Hydro Dr. Austin, TX 78728
Delivery 90 - 180 Calendar Days
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 8/31/2025
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes but will need to verify]|
4 Enclosed Tracked Skid Steer w/ 1

Asphalt Float and Planer Attachments
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

$151,723.00
$151,723.00

2025 Bobcat T86 T4 Compact Track Loader
105 HP Tier 4 V2 Bobcar Engine

2 Years or 2000 Hours|

Whichiever comes first

Bobcat of San Antonio|

11146 IH 35 North
San Antonio, TX 78233

180 Calendar Days
10/31/2025

10/31/2025

Yes but will need to verify]|

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

DeWinne Equipment Company
11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78250

Item

Description

Quantity

Nueces Farm Center Inc.

DBA Nueces Power Equipment
4697 FM 1516 North
Converse, TX 78104

Nueces Farm Center Inc.

DBA Nueces Power Equipment
4697 FM 1516 North
Converse, TX 78104

Min. 12ft High Reach Skid Steer
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Enclosed Tracked Skid Steer w/

Asphalt Float and Planer Attachments

PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Alternate Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Alternate Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Item

Description

Quantity

Professional Turf Products,
Limited Partnership

1010 North Industrial Blvd.
Euless, TX 76039

RDO Construction Equipment Company
DBA RDO Equipment Co.
19275IH35N

New Braunfels, TX 78610

Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
3025 State Hwy 161

Irving, TX 75062

Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
3025 State Hwy 161

Irving, TX 75062

Min. 12ft High Reach Skid Steer
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Enclosed Tracked Skid Steer w/

Asphalt Float and Planer Attachments

PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$85,000.00
$85,000.00

2025 John Deere 333P

Yanmar 4TNVO4FHT
110 HP

2 Years or 2000 Hours|

RDO Equipment Co.

192751H35N
New Branfels, TX 78610

90 Calendar Days;
12/31/2025

12/1/2025]

No Bid

No Bid

Alternate Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Anderson Machinery San Antonio, Inc. B.D. Holt Co. Brabandt Equipment, CORP
14632 110 Frontage Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 1905 Hydro Dr.
Marion, TX 78124 San Antonio, TX 78222 Austin, TX 78728
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
4.A Option A 1 No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Float Attachment
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25
Price Each: $13,800.00
Total: $13,800.00
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Simex ST200 Asphalt Float
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): 12 Months Factory Warranty|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Holt Cat|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78222
Delivery 45 Calendar Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025
Last day order can be placed without missing 12/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes|
4B Option B 1 No Bid No Bid
Planar Attachment
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25
Price Each: $31,345.00
Total: $31,345.00

Year Make & Model Offered:

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2025 Cat PC412 Cold Planer|

12 Months Factory Warranty|
Holt Cat

5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78222

45 Calendar Days|
12/31/2025

12/31/2025
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Chaves Brothers Management LLC Cooper Equipment Company DeWinne Equipment Company
300 SW 8th St. #17 5210 N Loop 1604 E 11002 Bandera Rd.
Boca Raton, FL 33432 San Antonio, TX 78247 San Antonio, TX 78250
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
4.A Option A 1 No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Float Attachment
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25
Price Each: $13,649.43,
Total: $13,649.43
Year Make & Model Offered: SAS 200 Soil and Asphalt Spreader with
Side Wing Kit# 7396290 & 7403712
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): 1 Year!
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bobcat of San Antonio
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 11146 IH 35 North
San Antonio, TX 78233
Delivery 180 Calendar Days
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 10/31/2025
Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes
4B Option B 1 No Bid No Bid
Planar Attachment
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25
Price Each: $37,617.56
Total: $37,617.56

Year Make & Model Offered:

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

48" Planer, Super Flow with Attachment
Control 7 Pin and R-Series Quick Attach
Water Kit# 7430053, 7128426, & 7434036
1 Year

Bobcat of San Antonio|

11146 IH 35 North
San Antonio, TX 78233

180 Calendar Days
10/31/2025

10/31/2025
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company Nueces Farm Center Inc. Nueces Farm Center Inc.
11002 Bandera Rd. DBA Nueces Power Equipment DBA Nueces Power Equipment
San Antonio, TX 78250 4697 FM 1516 North 4697 FM 1516 North
6100019105 JDLR Converse, TX 78104 Converse, TX 78104
Item Description Quantity
Alternate Bid Alternate Bid
4.A Option A 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Asphalt Float Attachment
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25
Price Each:
Total:
Year Make & Model Offered:
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model
Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
4B Option B 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Planar Attachment
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
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Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Item

Description

Quantity

Professional Turf Products,
Limited Partnership

1010 North Industrial Blvd.
Euless, TX 76039

RDO Construction Equipment Company
DBA RDO Equipment Co.
19275IH35N

New Braunfels, TX 78610

Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
3025 State Hwy 161

Irving, TX 75062

Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
3025 State Hwy 161

Irving, TX 75062

4.A

4B

Option A
Asphalt Float Attachment
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Option B
Planar Attachment

PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

No Bid

No Bid

$18,460.00
$18,460.00

2025 Simex ST200

1 Year or 2000 Hours
RDO Equipment Co.

192751H35N
New Branfels, TX 78610

90 Calendar Days;
12/31/2025

12/1/2025]

$50,225.00
$50,225.00

2025 Simex PLC40

1 Year or 2000 Hours
RDO Equipment Co.

192751H35N
New Branfels, TX 78610

90 Calendar Days;
12/31/2025

12/1/2025]

No Bid

No Bid

Alternate Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Anderson Machinery San Antonio, Inc. B.D. Holt Co. Brabandt Equipment, CORP
14632 110 Frontage Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 1905 Hydro Dr.
Marion, TX 78124 San Antonio, TX 78222 Austin, TX 78728
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
5 Wheeled Asphalt Paver, Minimum 15 Ton 3 No Bid
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25
Price Each: $470,840.00 $452,259.00
Total: $1,412,520.00 $1,356,777.00
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Bomag CR820 Wheeled Paver 2025 CAT AP600
w/ 16" Stretch Screed
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Model: CR820W/ CAT C4.4 173 HP|
(Include SAE NET HP): Engine: Cummins QSB 4.5 160 HP
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): One (1) Year/2,000 Hr. 12 Months Factory Warranty|
Whichever comes first
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Anderson Machiner Company, Inc. Holt Cat|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 14632 110 Frontage Rd. 5665 SE Loop 410
Marion, TX 78124 San Antonio, TX 78222
Delivery 90 - 120 Calendar Days 180 Calendar Days
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025 3/31/2026
Last day order can be placed without missing 12/31/2025 3/25/2026
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No| Yes|
6 Wheeled Asphalt Distributor 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Chaves Brothers Management LLC Cooper Equipment Company DeWinne Equipment Company
300 SW 8th St. #17 5210 N Loop 1604 E 11002 Bandera Rd.
Boca Raton, FL 33432 San Antonio, TX 78247 San Antonio, TX 78250
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
5 Wheeled Asphalt Paver, Minimum 15 Ton 3 No Bid No Bid
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25
Price Each: $648,999.99]
Total: $1,946,999.97
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Astec Roadtec 190
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cummins Tier 4F QSB6.7 230 HP
(Include SAE NET HP):
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): 1 Year or 1000 Hours
Whichever comes first
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Closner Equipment Company|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 6532 E State Hwy 114
Rhome, TX 76078
Delivery 180 - 365 Calendar Days;
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025
Last day order can be placed without missing 12/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes just need to verify|
6 Wheeled Asphalt Distributor 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company Nueces Farm Center Inc. Nueces Farm Center Inc.
11002 Bandera Rd. DBA Nueces Power Equipment DBA Nueces Power Equipment
San Antonio, TX 78250 4697 FM 1516 North 4697 FM 1516 North
6100019105 JDLR Converse, TX 78104 Converse, TX 78104
Item Description Quantity
Alternate Bid Alternate Bid
5 Wheeled Asphalt Paver, Minimum 15 Ton 3 No Bid
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25
Price Each: $431,068.00 $422,999.00
Total: $1,293,204.00 $1,268,997.00
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Vogelle Super 1703-3i! 2025 Vogelle Super 1703-3i!
6x6 Front Wheel Assist 4x6 Front Wheel Assist
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cummins QSB4.5 C173, Cummins QSB4.5 C173,
(Include SAE NET HP): 173 HP 173 HP
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): 2 Year - 2000 Hours! 2 Year - 2000 Hours
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Nueces Power Equipment Nueces Power Equipment
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4697 FM 1516 North 4697 FM 1516 North
Converse, TX 78109 Converse, TX 78109
Delivery 120 Calendar Days 120 Calendar Days
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 11/31/2025 11/31/2025
Last day order can be placed without missing 11/15/2025 11/15/2025
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Please call at time of need No Call
6 Wheeled Asphalt Distributor 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
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Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Item

Description

Quantity

Professional Turf Products,
Limited Partnership

1010 North Industrial Blvd.
Euless, TX 76039

RDO Construction Equipment Company
DBA RDO Equipment Co.
19275IH35N

New Braunfels, TX 78610

Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
3025 State Hwy 161

Irving, TX 75062

Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
3025 State Hwy 161

Irving, TX 75062

Wheeled Asphalt Paver, Minimum 15 Ton
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Wheeled Asphalt Distributor
PO Estimated to be issued by 11/30/25

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Alternate Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

Anderson Machinery San Antonio, Inc.
14632 110 Frontage Rd
Marion, TX 78124

Item

Description

Quantity

B.D. Holt Co.
5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78222

Brabandt Equipment, CORP
1905 Hydro Dr.
Austin, TX 78728

Riding Avrtificial Turf Broom
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Turf Tractor/Utility Vehicle with Attachments
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Chaves Brothers Management LLC Cooper Equipment Company DeWinne Equipment Company
300 SW 8th St. #17 5210 N Loop 1604 E 11002 Bandera Rd.
Boca Raton, FL 33432 San Antonio, TX 78247 San Antonio, TX 78250
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
7 Riding Avrtificial Turf Broom 1 No Bid
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $57,999.00 $44,454.00
Total: $57,999.00 $44,454.00
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Broce Broom Turf Boss (BB 250-B) 2025 Broce BB-250 Truf Boss|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Kubota 24 HP Diesel Engine Kubota V1505
(Include SAE NET HP): 24 HP
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): 1 Year or 1000 Hours 1 Year Broce Warranty|
Whichever comes first 2 Year Engine Warranty|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Closner Equipment Company| Cooper Equipment Co.
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 17474 Judson Rd 5210 N. Loop 1604 E
San Antonio, TX 78247 San Antonio, TX 78247
Delivery 90 - 180 Calendar Days 75 - 90 Calendar Days;
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025 11/1/2025]
Last day order can be placed without missing 12/31/2025 11/1/2025
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes just need to verify| No|
8 Turf Tractor/Utility Vehicle with Attachments 1 No Bid No Bid

PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

$149,999.99
$149,999.99

2025 Toro Outcross 9060

2025 Toro Outcross 9060 59 HP
Tier 4 Diesel

Two Year Limited Warranty|
Professional Turf Products|

5026 Service Center Dr.
San Antonio, TX 78218

180 Calendar Days
12/31/2025

12/31/2025

Yes just need to verify|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

DeWinne Equipment Company
11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78250

Nueces Farm Center Inc.

DBA Nueces Power Equipment
4697 FM 1516 North
Converse, TX 78104

Nueces Farm Center Inc.

DBA Nueces Power Equipment
4697 FM 1516 North
Converse, TX 78104

Opened: July 9, 2025

For: Off Road Equipment

6100019105 JDLR

Item Description Quantity
7 Riding Avrtificial Turf Broom 1
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each:
Total:
Year Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model
Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
8 Turf Tractor/Utility Vehicle with Attachments 1

PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Alternate Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Alternate Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Item

Description

Quantity

Professional Turf Products,
Limited Partnership

1010 North Industrial Blvd.
Euless, TX 76039

RDO Construction Equipment Company
DBA RDO Equipment Co.
19275IH35N

New Braunfels, TX 78610

Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
3025 State Hwy 161

Irving, TX 75062

Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
3025 State Hwy 161

Irving, TX 75062

Riding Avrtificial Turf Broom
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Turf Tractor/Utility Vehicle with Attachments
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

No Bid

Outcross: $95,982.67

Bullseye Field Sweep: $14,038.59
Bullseye Field Clean: $31,247.21
$141,268.47|

2025 Toro Outcross, Bullseye Field Clean
580, and Bullseye Field Sweep 660

Yanmar 4 Cylinder 59 HP

2 Years|
Professional Turf Products|

9468 Selma Parkway|
Selma, TX 78154

180 Calendar Days
This Year 2025

7/30/12025

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Alternate Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Anderson Machinery San Antonio, Inc. B.D. Holt Co. Brabandt Equipment, CORP
14632 110 Frontage Rd 5665 SE Loop 410 1905 Hydro Dr.
Marion, TX 78124 San Antonio, TX 78222 Austin, TX 78728
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
9 ‘Woodchipper 1 No Bid No Bid
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $62,546.00
Total: $62,546.00
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Bandit 12 XP
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Kohler KDI2504 74HP|
(Include SAE NET HP): 221 ftlbs Torque!
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): Chipper: 1 Year 1000 hours!
Engine: 3 Year 2000 hours|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Chipper: Brabandt|
Engine: Local Kohler Dealer or Brabandt
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Loader: 1905 Hydro Dr. Austin, TX 78728
Engine: Local Kohler Dealer or Brabandt
Delivery 120 Calendar Days
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model November of 2025
Last day order can be placed without missing 9/15/2025
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes
10 Ride-On Mini-Track Loader with Grapple 1 No Bid No Bid
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $34,507.00
Total: $34,507.00

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2025 Bauma Light TRL620D

3 Cylinder Kubota D1105 24.5 HP

Loader: 1 Year 1000 hours
Engine: 2 Year 2000 hours|

Loader: Brabandt
Engine: Local Kubota Dealer or Brabandt,

Loader: 1905 Hydro Dr. Austin, TX 78728
Engine: Local Kohler Dealer or Brabandt
120 Calendar Days
November of 2025

9/1/2025]
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Chaves Brothers Management LLC Cooper Equipment Company DeWinne Equipment Company
300 SW 8th St. #17 5210 N Loop 1604 E 11002 Bandera Rd.
Boca Raton, FL 33432 San Antonio, TX 78247 San Antonio, TX 78250
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
9 ‘Woodchipper 1 No Bid No Bid
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $199,989.99
Total: $199,989.99|
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Bandit Intimidator 21 XP
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Caterpillar C7.1L
(Include SAE NET HP): 275 HP Tier 4 Diesel
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): 1 Year or 2000 Hours
Whichever comes first
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Brabandt Equipment
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1905 Hydro Dr. Austin, TX 78728
Delivery 180 Calendar Days
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025
Last day order can be placed without missing 12/31/2028;
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes just need to verify|
10 Ride-On Mini-Track Loader with Grapple 1 No Bid No Bid

PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

$33,299.99]
$33,299.00

2025 Viper V1300X|

Yanmar 24 HP Diesel

2 Year Engine

1 Year Parts and Labor

Texstar Equipment

5446 N State Hwy 6, Waco, TX 76712
(CMB can assist with local facilities or
mobile repair as needed);

90 Calendar Days;

December of 2025

December of 2025

Yes just need to verify|
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

DeWinne Equipment Company
11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78250

Item

Description

Quantity

Nueces Farm Center Inc.

DBA Nueces Power Equipment
4697 FM 1516 North
Converse, TX 78104

Nueces Farm Center Inc.

DBA Nueces Power Equipment
4697 FM 1516 North
Converse, TX 78104

‘Woodchipper
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Ride-On Mini-Track Loader with Grapple
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Alternate Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Alternate Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Professional Turf Products, RDO Construction Equipment Company Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
Limited Partnership DBA RDO Equipment Co. DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
1010 North Industrial Blvd. 19275IH 35N 3025 State Hwy 161 3025 State Hwy 161
6100019105 JDLR |Euless, TX 76039 New Braunfels, TX 78610 Irving, TX 75062 Irving, TX 75062
Item Description Quantity
Alternate Bid
9 ‘Woodchipper 1 No Bid No Bid
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $99,500.00 $60,000.00
Total: $99,500.00 $60,000.00
Year Make & Model Offered: 2025 Vermeer BC1500 2025 Vermeer BC1000XL
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cummins QSF3.8 L Devtz TD2.9L
(Include SAE NET HP): 74 HP
Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): 1 Year / 1000 Hours 1 Year / 1000 Hours
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Vermeer Texas Vermeer Texas
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 16593 IH 35 N 16593 IH 35 N
Selma, TX 78154 Selma, TX 78154
Delivery 30 Calendar Days; 30 Calendar Days;
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025 12/31/2025
Last day order can be placed without missing 12/31/2025 12/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes|
10 Ride-On Mini-Track Loader with Grapple 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Year Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty (Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

Anderson Machinery San Antonio, Inc.
14632 110 Frontage Rd
Marion, TX 78124

Item

Description

Quantity

B.D. Holt Co.
5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78222

Brabandt Equipment, CORP
1905 Hydro Dr.
Austin, TX 78728

325 Gallon Trailer Mounted Hot Water Pressure
Washer with Wash Water Recovery System
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Make & Model Trailer and Pressure Washer Offered:
Trailer and Pressure Washer Warranty

(Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Payment Terms

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 9, 2025
For: Off Road Equipment Chaves Brothers Management LLC Cooper Equipment Company DeWinne Equipment Company
300 SW 8th St. #17 5210 N Loop 1604 E 11002 Bandera Rd.
Boca Raton, FL 33432 San Antonio, TX 78247 San Antonio, TX 78250
6100019105 JDLR
Item Description Quantity
" 325 Gallon Trailer Mounted Hot Water Pressure 2 No Bid No Bid
Washer with Wash Water Recovery System
PO Immediately Upon Award
Price Each: $31,100.00
Total: $62,200.00
Make & Model Trailer and Pressure Washer Offered: 2025 Hotsy HDS 8.0/30LFT!
Skid Hot Water Pressure Washer Trailer
Trailer and Pressure Washer Warranty 7 Year Warranty on Pressure Washer|
(Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours): 1 Year on Trailer|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Hotsy Equipment of San Antonio
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 3005 Interstate Dr.
San Antonio, TX 78219
Delivery 30 Calendar Days;
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model November of 2025
Last day order can be placed without missing November of 2025
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes just need to verify|
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

DeWinne Equipment Company
11002 Bandera Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78250

Item

Description

Quantity

Nueces Farm Center Inc.

DBA Nueces Power Equipment
4697 FM 1516 North
Converse, TX 78104

Nueces Farm Center Inc.

DBA Nueces Power Equipment
4697 FM 1516 North
Converse, TX 78104

325 Gallon Trailer Mounted Hot Water Pressure
Washer with Wash Water Recovery System
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Make & Model Trailer and Pressure Washer Offered:
Trailer and Pressure Washer Warranty

(Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Payment Terms

Alternate Bid

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30

Alternate Bid

No Bid

Net 30
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Opened:
For:

6100019105

July 9, 2025
Off Road Equipment

JDLR

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Item

Description

Quantity

Professional Turf Products,
Limited Partnership

1010 North Industrial Blvd.
Euless, TX 76039

RDO Construction Equipment Company
DBA RDO Equipment Co.
19275IH35N

New Braunfels, TX 78610

Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
3025 State Hwy 161

Irving, TX 75062

Vermeer Equipment of Texas, LLC
DBA Vermeer Texas-Louisiana
3025 State Hwy 161

Irving, TX 75062

325 Gallon Trailer Mounted Hot Water Pressure
Washer with Wash Water Recovery System
PO Immediately Upon Award

Price Each:
Total:

Make & Model Trailer and Pressure Washer Offered:
Trailer and Pressure Washer Warranty

(Minimum 1 year or 2000 hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Payment Terms

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30

No Bid

Net 30

Alternate Bid

No Bid

Net 30
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