City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Texas Enterprises, Inc. dba
Canroyal Lubricants, Inc. Golden West Oil Company Arnold Oil Company of Austin L.P.  [HJDJ American Lube Supply, Inc.
6100019101 CM 24927 N Hampton Forest 3010 Aniol St 5909 Burleson Road 8165 Whisper Oak
i Spring, TX 77389 San Antonio, TX 78219 Austin, TX 78744 San Antonio, TX 78266
Estimated (909) 210-7474 (210) 414-9626 (903) 456-2887 (210) 863-6644
Item Description Annual Usage
1 Lubricants
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)
1A. Description: 2.5-Gallon container with pour spout, price per gallon 5000
Product Name: Canroyal DEF Exhaust Fluid| Golden West Diesel Exhaust Fluid Purus| Quality DEF Solutions DEF
Product Number: DEF| DEF Gol 002 Def25G 225
Manufacturer Name: Canroyal| Musket Warren Industrial Lubricants Quality DEF Solutions
Unit Price: $2.89| $3.12 $9.99 $2.94/Gallon
Extended Price: $14,450.00 $15,600.00 $49,950.00 $14,700.00]
2 Motor Oil
MOTOR OIL, 15W40 CJ-4 VALVOLINE PREMIUM BLUE GEO #70520, or Proven Equal
2A. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price Per Gallon 30,000
Canroyal Full Synthetic Diesel|| Mobil Delvac Modern 15W40 CNG|
Product Name: Gasoline SAE 15W40 API CJ-4 SN| LNG BulK Premium Blue DA Lubricants Reliant - X92
Product Number: FSGD15W40-1P15| MBL 125396 891001 52301
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal| Mobil Valvoline DA Lubricants
Unit Price: $10.11 $9.60) $11.50 $15.00;
Extended Price: $303,300.00) $288,000.00] $345,000.00 $450,000.00
GEAR LUBE SYNTHETIC for Differentials, SAE Grade 75W-90, or Proven Equal
2B. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon 3,000
Canroyal Synthetic Gear SAE|
Product Name: 75W90 API GL-4| Golden West Syn Gear 75W90 HD Syn 75W90 Bel-Ray GL5 Synthetic|
Product Number: SSI75W90-2P)| Gol 046077687270 V70026 3022421-55
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal| Warren Oil Valvoline Calument Specailty Lubricants!
Unit Price: $8.71 $19.27 $39.05 $14.79
Extended Price: $26,130.00 $57,810.00 $117,150.00 $44,370.00]
2C. Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon 75
Canroyal Synthetic Gear SAE|
Product Name: 75W90)| Golden West Syn Gear 75W90 Delo Syngear HD 75-90 Bel-Ray GL5 Synthetic]|
Product Number: SSI75W90-2P)| Gol 046077687256 CHV57590P 3022425005
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal| Warren Oil Chevron Calument Specality Lubricants!
Unit Price: $8.88 $20.04 $43.03 $16.00;
Extended Price: $666.00 $1,503.00 $3,227.25 $1,200.00!
GEAR LUBE FULL SYNTHETIC for Differentials, SAE Grade 75W-90, or Proven Equal
2D. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon 3,000
Canroyal Full Synthetic Gear SAE|
Product Name: 75W90 API GL-5| Golden West Syn Gear 75W90 HD Syn 75W90 Bel-Ray GL5 Synthetic|
Product Number: FSI75W90-2P| Gol 046077687270 W70026 30224315-55
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal| Warren Oil Valvoline Calument Specialty Lubricants!
Unit Price: $10.50] $19.27 $39.05 $17.50,
Extended Price: $31,500.00 $57,810.00 $117,150.00 $52,500.00
2E. Description: 5-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon 75
Canroyal Full Synthetic Gear SAE]|
Product Name: 75W90 API GL-5| Golden West Syn Gear 75W90 Delo Syngear HD 75-90 Bel-Ray GL5 Synthetic|
Product Number: FSI75W90-2P| Gol 046077687256 CHV57590P 30224315-5
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal| Warren Oil Chevron Calument Specialty Lubricants!
Unit Price: $10.92] $20.04 $43.03 $19.00;
Extended Price: $819.00 $1,503.00 $3,227.25 $1,425.00!
SYNTHETIC GEAR LUBRICANT, SAE Grade 80W-140, CASTROL Syngear or Proven Equal
2F. Deleted
2G. Deleted
FULL SYNTHETIC GEAR LUBRICANT, SAE Grade 80W-140, CASTROL Syngear or Proven Equal
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc. Hampel Oil Distributors, Inc. Midtex, Oil L.P. Auto Parts Experts
6100019101 42 Longwater Drive 911 Carter 3455 IH 35 South 13611 S US HWY 181
Norwell, MA 02061 Hondo, TX 78861 New Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio, TX 78223
- (781) 427-3060 (682) 260-2257 (979) 482-6333
Item Description
1 Lubricants
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)
1A. Description: 2.5-Gallon container with pour spout, price per gallon
HAMPEL DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID,
Product Name: Performance Plus! 2/2.5GL DEF Blue Sky
Product Number: 302025 107582 30009/2/2.5 Gal 00250
Manufacturer Name: Safety-Kleen Blue Sky Blue Sky / Quality Musket Blue Sky
Unit Price: $12.55 $3.60 $2.90; $12.90
Extended Price: $62,750.00] $18,000.00 $14,500.00] $64,500.00
2 Motor Oil

MOTOR OIL, 15W40 CJ-4 VALVOLINE PREMIUM BLUE GEO #70520, or Proven Equal
2A. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price Per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

GEAR LUBE SYNTHETIC for Differentials, SAE Grade 75W-90, or Proven Equal
2B. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

2C. Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

GEAR LUBE FULL SYNTHETIC for Differentials, SAE Grade 75W-90, or Proven Equal
2D. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon

Product Name:

Product Number:

Manufactuer Name:

Unit Price:
Extended Price:

2E. Description: 5-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon
Product Name:

Product Number:

Manufactuer Name:

Unit Price:
Extended Price:

SYNTHETIC GEAR LUBRICANT, SAE Grade 80W-140, CASTROL Syngear or Proven Equal
2F. Deleted

2G. Deleted

FULL SYNTHETIC GEAR LUBRICANT, SAE Grade 80W-140, CASTROL Syngear or Proven Equal

Performance Plus
3103412
Safety-Kleen
$9.75
$292,500.00

Performance Plus
3102389
Safety-Kleen
$18.64.
$55,920.00]

Performance Plus
3102387
Safety-Kleen
$19.00;

$1,425.00!

Performance Plus
3102389
Safety-Kleen
$18.64.
$55,920.00

Performance Plus
3102387
Safety-Kleen
$19.00;

$1,425.00!

PC DURON GEO LD 15W40,
BULK GAL

115798

Petro Canada

$12.10

$363,000.00

PATRIOT DRIVESHIELD SYN
75W-90, 55GAL

105741

Martin Lubricants

$17.89

$53,670.00

PATRIOT DRIVESHIELD SYN 75W-
90, 5 GAL|

104559

Martin Lubricants

$19.39

$1,454.25

PATRIOT DRIVESHIELD SYN 75W-
90, 55GAL|

105741

Martin Lubricants

$17.89

$53,670.00

PATRIOT DRIVESHIELD SYN 75W-
90, 5 GAL|

104559

Martin Lubricants

$19.39

$1,454.25

Rotella NG 15W40]
500007490

Shell

$12.35
$370,500.00

Spirax S6 AXRME 75W 90|
550026918

Shell

$29.88

$89,640.00

Spirax S6 AXRME 75W 90|
550026915,

Shell

$40.25

$3,018.75

Spirax S6 AXRME 75W 90|
550026918,

Shell

$29.88

$89,640.00

Spirax S6 AXRME 75W 90|
550026915,

Shell

$40.25

$3,018.75

Blue Geo #70520

$1,

773780
Valvoline
$35.00
050,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
South Texas Auto Parts
Hays City Corp dba Tex-Con Oil Company dba M&M Auto & Truck
Delta Fuel Co, LLC dba Delta360 |Co Matori Industries, Inc. Parts
6100019101 521 Main Street 4906 Burleson Road 401 E Sonterra Blvd STE 375 20475 Hwy 46 W Ste 340
Natchez, MS 39120 Austin, TX 78760 San Antonio, TX 78258 Spring Branch, TX 78070
Item Description
1 Lubricants
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)
1A. Description: 2.5-Gallon container with pour spout, price per gallon *There are 80 cases per pallet*,
Product Name: Delta Branded DEF Diesel Exhaust Fluid 1/2.5| Diesel Exhaust Fluid (2.5 Gal), Napa DEF
Product Number: N/A] 702353 DYNDEF25 NPF002
Manufacturer Name: Gulf States Noxguard DYND! Old World Industries|
Unit Price: $13.95 $8.99 $14.93 $3.56/Gallon
Extended Price: $69,750.00; $44,950.00 $74,650.00] $44,500.00
2 Motor Oil

MOTOR OIL, 15W40 CJ-4 VALVOLINE PREMIUM BLUE GEO #70520, or Proven Equal
2A. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price Per Gallon
Product Name: CHYV Delo 400 XLE SB 15W40 Guardol FLT EC 15W40 Bulk Dyna-Plex 21C Dezol 15W-40 NO BID

Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

GEAR LUBE SYNTHETIC for Differentials, SAE Grade 75W-90, or Proven Equal
2B. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

2C. Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

GEAR LUBE FULL SYNTHETIC for Differentials, SAE Grade 75W-90, or Proven Equal
2D. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon

Product Name:

Product Number:

Manufactuer Name:

Unit Price:
Extended Price:

2E. Description: 5-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon
Product Name:

Product Number:

Manufactuer Name:

Unit Price:
Extended Price:

SYNTHETIC GEAR LUBRICANT, SAE Grade 80W-140, CASTROL Syngear or Proven Equal
2F. Deleted

2G. Deleted

FULL SYNTHETIC GEAR LUBRICANT, SAE Grade 80W-140, CASTROL Syngear or Proven Equal

N/A
Chevron
$14.87
$446,100.00

CHYV Delo SYNgear XM 75W90
N/A]

Chevron

$30.73;

$92,190.00]

CHYV Delo SYNgear XM 75W90
N/A]

Chevron

$32.40

$2,430.00!

CHYV Delo SYNgear XM 75W90
N/A]

Chevron

$30.73

$92,190.00]

CHYV Delo SYNgear XM 75W90
N/A]

Chevron

$32.40

$2,430.00!

403000

P66

$9.99
$299,700.00

Spirax S6 AXRME 75W 90|
550026918

Shell

$1789.99/Drum
$97,635.82

Spirax S6 AXRME 75W90|
550026915

Shell

$219.99/Pail

$3,299.85

Spirax S6 AXRME 75W 90|
550026918

Shell

$1789.99/Drum
$97,635.82

Spirax S6 AXRME 75W90|
550026915

Shell

$219.99/Pail

$3,299.85

MIDYN04710
Dyna-Plex
$14.87
$446,100.00

55 GL DPLX 21C SYNZOL 75W90
N/A

DPLX]

$2,000.87

$6,002,610.00;

DPLX 21C SYNZOL 75W90 (Pail)
MI04918

YNZOL

$40.60!

$3,045.00

55 GL DPLX 21C SYNZOL 75W90
N/A

DPLX]

$2,000.87

$6,002,610.00;

DPLX 21C SYNZOL 75W90 (Pail)
N/A

YNZOL

$40.60;

$3,045.00

Valvoline Syn Power|
70026

Valvoline

$56.36

$169,080.00

Valvoline Syn Power|
723856

Valvoline

$56.99

$4,199.25

Valvoline Syn Power|
70026

Valvoline

$56.36

$169,080.00

Valvoline Syn Power|
723856

Valvoline

$56.99

$4,199.25
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Texas Enterprises, Inc. dba
Canroyal Lubricants, Inc. Golden West Oil Company Arnold Oil Company of Austin L.P.  [HJDJ American Lube Supply, Inc.
6100019101 CM 24927 N Hampton Forest 3010 Aniol St 5909 Burleson Road 8165 Whisper Oak
i Spring, TX 77389 San Antonio, TX 78219 Austin, TX 78744 San Antonio, TX 78266
- Estimated (909) 210-7474 (210) 414-9626 (903) 456-2887 (210) 863-6644
Item Description Annual Usage
2H. Deleted
21. Deleted
API CJ-4 DIESEL ENGINE OIL, 15W-40 or Proven Equal
2J. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price per Gallon 16,000
Canroyal Full Synthetic Diesel
Product Name: 15W40 API CJ-4 Mobil Delvac HDEO 15W40 Bulk| Coastal Synblend CK 15W40 Bel Ray Hyperion SBCK - 4/5n
Product Number: SSD15W40-2P15 MBL 125152} B1540B| 3023415000
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal Mobil Coastal - Warren Industrial Calumet Specialty Lubricants
Unit Price: $10.80; $7.79] $7.51 $8.00
Extended Price: $172,800.00 $124,640.00] $120,160.00) $128,000.00
SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL, SAE 5W-40 EUROPEAN 540 or Proven Equal
2K. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon 1,200 NAS NAS NAS|
Canroyal Synthetic Gasoline SAE
Product Name: 5W40 API SP Golden West Tech Syn 5W40 Coastal Full Syn 5W40 Bel Ray Elite FS Euro|
Product Number: SSG5W40-2P10 Gol 850011903162 5HD540D| 30223315055
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal Warren Oil Coastal - Warren Industrial Calumet Specialty Lubricants|
Unit Price: $9.65 $19.03 $18.53] $17.81
Extended Price: $11,580.00] $22,836.00 $22,236.00 $21,372.00]
FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL, SAE 5W-40 EUROPEAN 540 or Proven Equal
2L. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon 1,200 NAS NAS NAS|
Canroyal Synthetic Gasoline SAE
Product Name: 5W40 API SP Golden West Tech Syn 5W40 Coastal Full Syn 5W-40 Bel Ray Elite FS Euro|
Product Number: SSG5W40-2P10 Gol 850011903162 5HD540D| 30223315055
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal Warren Oil Coastal - Warren Industrial Calumet Specialty Lubricants|
Unit Price: $10.07 $19.03 $18.53] $17.81
Extended Price: $12,084.00, $22,836.00 $22,236.00 $21,372.00]
ULTRA PLATINUM FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL, 0W-40 or Proven Equal
2M. Deleted
FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL MOBIL 1, 5W-20 or Proven Equal
2N. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price per Gallon 1,000
Canroyal Full Synthetic Gasoline
Product Name: SAE 5W20 API SP Mobil 1 5W20 Full Syn 5W20 Bel Ray BRX Elite FS
Product Number: FSG5W20-2P10 MBL 106075 881493 302219150017A
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal Mobil Valvoline Calumet Specialty Lubricants
Unit Price: $10.92 $22.17 $11.19 $8.75
Extended Price: $10,920.00] $22,170.00 $11,190.00 $8,750.00
3 Industrial Oil
CITGO HYDURANCE HYDRAULIC FLUID AW68 (Non- C PHILLIPS AW HVI Hy ic Oil or Proven Equal
3A. Deleted
ALL SEASON HYDRAULIC OIL HYD46
3B. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon 2,500

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

AP CK-4 DIESEL ENGINE OIL or Proven Equal

Canroyal Synthetic Hydraulic
W 46/

SSH-46

Canroyal

$9.14

$22,850.00]

Golden West Hydraulic AW46
Gol 046077310628

Warren Oil

$9.80

$24,500.00

AW46 Hydraulic Oil
VV042

Valvoline

$6.85

$17,125.00

Bel Ray Premium Tractor Hydraulic|
302221415-0000

Calumet Specialty Lubricants
$7.68

$19,200.00;




City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc. Hampel Oil Distributors, Inc. Midtex, Oil L.P. Auto Parts Experts
6100019101 42 Longwater Drive 911 Carter 3455 IH 35 South 13611 S US HWY 181
Norwell, MA 02061 Hondo, TX 78861 New Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio, TX 78223
- (781) 427-3060 (682) 260-2257 (979) 482-6333
Item Description
2H. Deleted
21. Deleted

AP| CJ-4 DIESEL ENGINE OIL, 15W-40 or Proven Equal

2J. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price per Gallon
PATRIOT ULTRASHIELD FLT 15W-|

Product Name: Performance Plus| 40 CK4, BULK Shell T2 15W40 Pronto
Product Number: 3102134 114878 500010130 543PR|
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen Martin Lubricants Shell Pronto
Unit Price: $8.05 $8.18 $7.94 $15.70
Extended Price: $128,800.00 $130,880.00 $127,040.00 $251,200.00

SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL, SAE 5W-40 EUROPEAN 540 or Proven Equal

2K. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS
CITGO SUPERGARD EUROPEAN
Product Name: Performance Plus| SAE 5W40, 55GAL PZL Plat Euro 5W40 NO BID
Product Number: 3102401 N/A 550051115
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen CITGO Shell
Unit Price: $19.09 $26.42 $27.91
Extended Price: $22,908.00; $31,704.00 $33,492.00]

FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL, SAE 5W-40 EUROPEAN 540 or Proven Equal

2L. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS
CITGO SUPERGARD EUROPEAN
Product Name: Performance Plus| SAE 5W40, 55GAL PZL Plat Euro 5W40 NO BID
Product Number: 3102401 N/A 550051115
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen CITGO Shell
Unit Price: $19.09 $26.42 $27.91
Extended Price: $22,908.00; $31,704.00 $33,492.00]

ULTRA PLATINUM FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL, 0W-40 or Proven Equal
2M. Deleted

FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL MOBIL 1, 5W-20 or Proven Equal

2N. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price per Gallon
CHEVRON HAV PRODS SYN 5W-

Product Name: Performance Plus| 20, 55GAL QS FS 5W20 Mobil1
Product Number: 3103356 109492 500010480 120763
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen Chevron Shell Mobil
Unit Price: $7.60 $17.25 $9.89 $33.60
Extended Price: $7,600.00 $17,250.00 $9,890.00 $33,600.00
3 Industrial Oil
CITGO HYDURANCE HYDRAULIC FLUID AW68 (Non- C i PHILLIPS AW HVI Hy ic Oil or Proven Equal
3A. Deleted

ALL SEASON HYDRAULIC OIL HYD46

3B. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon
PATRIOT HYDRASHIELD AW 46,

Product Name: Performance Plus| 55GAL| Hydurance AW 46 NO BID
Product Number: 3101480 105167 765501/55]
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen| Martin Lubricants| Citgo
Unit Price: $7.73 $6.60) $8.37
Extended Price: $19,325.00| $16,500.00 $20,925.00;

AP CK-4 DIESEL ENGINE OIL or Proven Equal
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
South Texas Auto Parts
Hays City Corp dba Tex-Con Oil Company dba M&M Auto & Truck
Delta Fuel Co, LLC dba Delta360 |Co Matori Industries, Inc. Parts
6100019101 521 Main Street 4906 Burleson Road 401 E Sonterra Blvd STE 375 20475 Hwy 46 W Ste 340
Natchez, MS 39120 Austin, TX 78760 San Antonio, TX 78258 Spring Branch, TX 78070
Item Description
2H. Deleted
21. Deleted
API CJ-4 DIESEL ENGINE OIL, 15W-40 or Proven Equal
2J. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price per Gallon
Product Name: CHV Ursa SPR+ 15W40 Guardol FLT EC 15W40 Bulk Dyna-Plex 21C Dezol 15W40 NO BID
Product Number: N/A 403000 MIDYN04710;
Manufactuer Name: Chevron P66 Dyna-Plex;
Unit Price: $12.67 $9.99 $15.62
Extended Price: $202,720.00 $159,840.00 $249,920.00
SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL, SAE 5W-40 EUROPEAN 540 or Proven Equal
2K. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS NAS
Product Name: CHV Delo 400 XSP 5W40 GT-1 Euro MO 5W40 HD Full Synthetic 5W40 55-Gal Valvoline Syn 5W40 Euro|
Product Number: N/A 406188 N/A 929
Manufactuer Name: Chevron Kendall European Valvoline
Unit Price: $24.40 $1749.99/Drum $34.27 $36.96
Extended Price: $29,280.00] $38,181.60 $41,124.00] $44,352.00
FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL, SAE 5W-40 EUROPEAN 540 or Proven Equal
2L. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS NAS
Product Name: CHV Delo 400 XSP 5W40 GT-1 Euro MO 5W40 HD Full Synthetic 5W40 55-Gal Valvoline Syn 5W40 Euro|
Product Number: N/A 406188 N/A 929
Manufactuer Name: Chevron Kendall European Valvoline
Unit Price: $26.24. $1749.99/Drum $34.27 $36.96
Extended Price: $31,488.00, $38,181.60 $41,124.00, $44,352.00
ULTRA PLATINUM FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL, 0W-40 or Proven Equal
2M. Deleted
FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL MOBIL 1, 5W-20 or Proven Equal
2N. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price per Gallon
Product Name: NO BID GT-1 MAX MO 5W20 SYN 5W20 Motor Oil (Bulk) NO BID
Product Number: 403430 N/A
Manufactuer Name: Kendall Truegard
Unit Price: $12.49 $14.60]
Extended Price: $12,490.00 $14,600.00;
3 Industrial Oil

CITGO HYDURANCE HYDRAULIC FLUID AW68 (Non- C PHILLIPS

3A. Deleted

ALL SEASON HYDRAULIC OIL HYD46

3B. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon
Product Name:

Product Number:

Manufactuer Name:

Unit Price:
Extended Price:

AP CK-4 DIESEL ENGINE OIL or Proven Equal

AW HVI Hy

ic Oil or Proven Equal

CHV HYD Oil AW 46
N/A

Chevron

$9.06

$22,650.00]

MEGAFLOW AW HYD 46
502221

P66

$499.99/Drum
$22,726.82

OTR AW 46 Hydraulic Fluid 55 Gal
MI4655G

OTR AW 46 Hydraulic Fluid 55 Gal
$22.58

$56,450.00

Napa Premium Hydraulic Oil
85-855

Warren Oil

$10.91

$27,275.00




City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Texas Enterprises, Inc. dba
Canroyal Lubricants, Inc. Golden West Oil Company Arnold Oil Company of Austin L.P.  [HJDJ American Lube Supply, Inc.
6100019101 CM 24927 N Hampton Forest 3010 Aniol St 5909 Burleson Road 8165 Whisper Oak
i Spring, TX 77389 San Antonio, TX 78219 Austin, TX 78744 San Antonio, TX 78266
- Estimated (909) 210-7474 (210) 414-9626 (903) 456-2887 (210) 863-6644
Item Description Annual Usage
3C. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price per Gallon 20,000
Canroyal Full Synthetic Diesel SAE|
Product Name: 15W40 API CK-4] Mobil Delvac HDEO 15W40| All-Terrain 15 40 Bel Ray Hyperion SB-CKY
Product Number: FSD15W40-2P 15| MBL 125152} 892873 30233415-0000
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal| Mobil Valvoline Calumet Specialty Lubricants
Unit Price: $9.61 $7.79] $9.38 $8.00
Extended Price: $192,200.00| $155,800.00) $187,600.00 $160,000.00
Chevron Rando HDZ ISO 15, PHILLIPS Megaflow® AW HVI ISO 15 Hydraulic Oil or Proven Equal
3D. Deleted
Prestone® MAX All Vehicles Antifreeze + Coolant AF2850 or proven equal
3E. Deleted
4 Transmission Fluid
SYNTHETIC TRANSMISSION FLUID ALLISON TES 668, No Substitutes
4A. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon 4,700 NAS NAS NAS
Product Name: Canroyal Synthetic ATF TES 295 Lubriguard HD Syn 295 ATF Syngard 668 DA Pro Drive AHD
Product Number: SSA-295 Lub 201048 896083 54672
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal Synthetic ATF TES 295 Warren Oil Valvoline DA Lubricants
Unit Price: $15.13 $25.90 $25.35 $33.74.
Extended Price: $71,111.00] $121,730.00 $119,145.00 $158,578.00
FULL SYNTHETIC TRANSMISSION FLUID ALLISON TES 668, No Substitutes
4B. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon 2,500 NAS NAS NAS
Canroyal Full Synthetic ATF TES

Product Name: 295 Lubriguard HD Syn 295 ATF Syngard 668 DA Pro Drive AHD
Product Number: FSA-295 Lub 201048 896083 54672
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal Warren Oil Valvoline DA Lubricants
Unit Price: $19.98 $25.90 $25.35 $33.74.
Extended Price: $49,950.00] $64,750.00 $63,375.00 $84,350.00]
POWERTRAN TM FLUID, or Proven Equal
4C. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon 6,000
Product Name: Canroyal Synthetic Powertrain TM| Golden West Premium UTF THF 1000 Bel Ray TransT04
Product Number: SSA-DIII Gol 046077310550 226606981 30230215-0000
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal|| Warren Oil Chevron Calumet Specialty Lubricants
Unit Price: $11.26| $8.18] $13.73 $12.84.
Extended Price: $67,560.00| $49,080.00 $82,380.00 $77,040.00]
4D. Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon 500
Product Name: Canroyal Synthetic Powertrain TM| Golden West Premium UTF THF1000 Bel Ray TransT04
Product Number: SSA-DIII Gol 046077687478| 226606448 30230215-0000
Manufactuer Name: Canroyal| Warren Oil Chevron Calumet Specialty Lubricants
Unit Price: $11.99 $9.31 $14.50 $12.00;
Extended Price: $5,995.00| $4,655.00) $7,250.00 $6,000.00
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc. Hampel Oil Distributors, Inc. Midtex, Oil L.P. Auto Parts Experts
6100019101 42 Longwater Drive 911 Carter 3455 IH 35 South 13611 S US HWY 181
Norwell, MA 02061 Hondo, TX 78861 New Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio, TX 78223
- (781) 427-3060 (682) 260-2257 (979) 482-6333
Item Description
3C. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price per Gallon
PATRIOT ULTRASHIELD FLT 15W-|
Product Name: Performance Plus| 40 CK4, BULK Shell T2 15W40 NO BID
Product Number: 3102134 114878 500010130
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen Martin Lubricants Shell
Unit Price: $8.05 $8.18 $7.94
Extended Price: $161,000.00 $163,600.00 $158,800.00
Chevron Rando HDZ ISO 15, PHILLIPS Megaflow® AW HVI ISO 15 Hydraulic Oil or Proven Equal
3D. Deleted
Prestone® MAX All Vehicles Antifreeze + Coolant AF2850 or proven equal
3E. Deleted
4 Transmission Fluid
SYNTHETIC TRANSMISSION FLUID ALLISON TES 668, No Substitutes
4A. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS|
PC DURADRIVE HD SYN 668 ATF,
Product Name: Performance Plusi 54GAL| Spirax S6 ATF A668; NO BID
Product Number: 3102413 115049 550062005
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen| Petro Canadal Shell
Unit Price: $20.00| $29.93] $32.69
Extended Price: $94,000.00| $140,671.00) $153,643.00
FULL SYNTHETIC TRANSMISSION FLUID ALLISON TES 668, No Substitutes
4B. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS|
PC DURADRIVE HD SYN 668 ATF,
Product Name: Performance Plusi 54GAL| Spirax S6 ATF A668; NO BID
Product Number: 3102413 115049 550062005
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen| Petro Canada) Shell
Unit Price: $20.00| $29.93] $32.69
Extended Price: $50,000.00 $74,825.00 $81,725.00,
POWERTRAN TM FLUID, or Proven Equal
4C. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon
PATRIOT TRANSHIELD TRACTOR|
HYD,
Product Name: Performance Plus! 55GAL| Spirax S4 TXM NO BID
Product Number: 3101874 105049 550026902
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen Martin Lubricants Shell
Unit Price: $13.18, $8.44 $11.35
Extended Price: $79,080.00; $50,640.00 $68,100.00;
4D. Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon
PATRIOT TRANSHIELD TRACTOR|
HYD,
Product Name: Performance Plus! 5 GAL| Spirax S4 TXM NO BID
Product Number: 3102240 103330 550026891
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen Martin Lubricants Shell
Unit Price: $15.75 $9.94 $11.98
Extended Price: $7,875.00 $4,970.00 $5,990.00
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
South Texas Auto Parts
Hays City Corp dba Tex-Con Oil Company dba M&M Auto & Truck
Delta Fuel Co, LLC dba Delta360 |Co Matori Industries, Inc. Parts
6100019101 521 Main Street 4906 Burleson Road 401 E Sonterra Blvd STE 375 20475 Hwy 46 W Ste 340
Natchez, MS 39120 Austin, TX 78760 San Antonio, TX 78258 Spring Branch, TX 78070
Item Description
3C. Description: Bulk (Transport), Price per Gallon
Product Name: CHV Ursa SPR+ 15W40 Guardol FLT EC 15W40 Bulk| Dyna-Plex 21C Dezol CK-4 NO BID
Product Number: N/A 403000 MI004710
Manufactuer Name: Chevron P66 Dyna-Plex;
Unit Price: $12.67 $9.99 $13.64.
Extended Price: $253,400.00 $199,800.00 $272,800.00
Chevron Rando HDZ ISO 15, PHILLIPS Megaflow® AW HVI ISO 15 Hydraulic Oil or Proven Equal
3D. Deleted
Prestone® MAX All Vehicles Antifreeze + Coolant AF2850 or proven equal
3E. Deleted
4 Transmission Fluid

SYNTHETIC TRANSMISSION FLUID ALLISON TES 668, No Substitutes
4A. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS NAS

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

FULL SYNTHETIC TRANSMISSION FLUID ALLISON TES 668, No Substitutes

4B. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

POWERTRAN TM FLUID, or Proven Equal

4C. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

4D. Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

CHV Delo SYN HD ATF
N/A

Chevron

$27.74]

$130,378.00

NAS

CHV Delo SYN HD ATF
N/A

Chevron

$28.34.

$70,850.00

CHV Tractor Fluid
N/A

Chevron

$13.40]
$80,400.00;

CHV Tractor Fluid
N/A

Chevron

$14.00]

$7,000.00

Spirax S6 ATF 668
550062005

Shell
$1699.99/Drum
$145,271.87

Spirax S6 ATF 668
550062005

Shell
$1699.99/Drum
$77,272.27

Powertrain Fluid
402111

P66
$699.99/Drum
$76,392.55

Powertrain Fluid
402111

P66

$79.99/Pail
$7,999.00

Syn 295 ATF 55 gal
CAS709701
Castrol

$54.00
$253,800.00

NAS

Syn 295 ATF 55 gal
CAS709701
Castrol

$54.00
$135,000.00

PowerTrain Fluid 55Gal
1074856

Phillips 66

$17.23

$103,380.00

Powertrain Fluid 5 Gal
1074857

Phillips 66

$19.44

$9,720.00

Castrol Transynd
15E2DF

Castrol

$38.18
$179,446.00

Castrol Transynd
15E2DF

Castrol

$38.18
$95,450.00

Napa Premium HD Tractor Hyd &
Transmission Fluid

85-405

Warren Oil

$10.91

$65,460.00

Napa Premium HD Tractor Hyd &
Transmission Fluid

85-405

Warren Oil

$10.91

$5,456.00




City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids

6100019101

Cc™

NON-LOCAL

NON-LOCAL

NON-LOCAL

NON-LOCAL

Item Description

Estimated
Annual Usage

Canroyal Lubricants, Inc.
24927 N Hampton Forest
Spring, TX 77389

(909) 210-7474

Texas Enterprises, Inc. dba
Golden West Oil Company
3010 Aniol St

San Antonio, TX 78219
(210) 414-9626

Arnold Oil Company of Austin L.P.

5909 Burleson Road
Austin, TX 78744
(903) 456-2887

HJDJ American Lube Supply, Inc.
8165 Whisper Oak

San Antonio, TX 78266

(210) 863-6644

POWEDRIVE FLUID 10W, or Proven Equal

4E. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

4F . Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

4G. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon

Product Name:
Product Number:
Manufactuer Name:
Unit Price:
Extended Price:

4H. Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon
Product Name:

Product Number:

Manufactuer Name:

Unit Price:

Extended Price:

Prompt Payment Discount:

5,500

500

5,500

500

NAS

Canroyal ATF Type A
MATA

Canroyal

$10.84]

$59,620.00]

NAS

Canroyal ATF Type A
MATA

Canroyal

$11.14

$5,570.00!

NAS

Canroyal Full Synthetic ATF TES
668

FSA-668]

Canroyal

$29.93

$164,615.00

NO BID

NAS
Mobil Delvac Mod Off Hwy Trans|
30

MBL 128133
Mobil
$13.22
$72,710.00

NAS

Mobil Delvac Mod Off Hwy Trans,|
30|

MBL 128146

Mobil

$27.04

$13,520.00

NAS

Lubriguard HD Syn 668 ATF
Lub 201048

Warren Oil

$25.90

$142,450.00

NO BID

NAS

Delo Torgforce
293105981
Chevron
$14.59
$80,245.00

NAS

Delo Torgforce
293105448
Chevron
$15.35
$7,675.00

NAS

Syngard 668
896083
Valvoline
$25.35
$139,425.00

NO BID

Bel Ray TransT04
302302150007

Calumet Specialty Lubricants
$12.84.

$70,620.00;

Bel Ray TransT04
302302150017

Calumet Specialty Lubricants
$12.00;

$6,000.00!

Bel Ray TransT04
302302150017

Calumet Specialty Lubricants
$12.84

$70,620.00]

Bel Ray TransT04
302302150017

Calumet Specialty Lubricants
$12.00

$6,000.00!

Estimated Total:

$1,223,720.00)

Estimated Annual Award:

$73,565.00)

$1,551,903.00

$1,515,746.50]

$1,402,097.00)

$497,535.00

$120,160.00

$42,744.00|

Deleted Item(s): Items 2F, 2G, 2H, 2|, 2M, 3A, 3D, & 3E will be rebid at a later time
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Safety-Kleen Systems, Inc. Hampel Oil Distributors, Inc. Midtex, Oil L.P. Auto Parts Experts
6100019101 42 Longwater Drive 911 Carter 3455 IH 35 South 13611 S US HWY 181
Norwell, MA 02061 Hondo, TX 78861 New Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio, TX 78223
- (781) 427-3060 (682) 260-2257 (979) 482-6333
Item Description
POWEDRIVE FLUID 10W, or Proven Equal
4E. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS
PATRIOT TRANSHIELD TO-4 SAE]|
10,
Product Name: Performance Plus! 55GAL| Spirax S4 CX 10| NO BID
Product Number: 3101483 115145 550026899
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen Martin Lubricants| shell|
Unit Price: $9.00 $13.42] $8.87|
Extended Price: $49,500.00 $73,810.00 $48,785.00

4F . Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon NAS

PATRIOT TRANSHIELD TO-4 SAE|

30,|

Product Name: Performance Plus| 55GAL| Spirax S4 CX 10 NO BID
Product Number: 3102162 107056 550026897
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen Martin Lubricants| Shell
Unit Price: $9.70 $13.42] $10.87,
Extended Price: $4,850.00! $6,710.00} $5,435.00
4G. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS

PATRIOT TRANSHIELD TO-4 SAE|
Product Name: Performance Plus| 30, 5 GAL| Spirax S4 CX 30| NO BID
Product Number: 3103450 109004 550026900
Manufactuer Name: Safety-Kleen Martin Lubricants| Shell
Unit Price: $30.00; $14.92] $8.99|
Extended Price: $165,000.00 $82,060.00 $49,445.00]

4H. Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon

Product Name: NO BID NO BID| Spirax S4 CX 30| NO BID
Product Number: 550026901
Manufactuer Name: Shell
Unit Price: $10.99|
Extended Price: $5,495.00|

Prompt Payment Discount:

Estimated Total: $1,282,786.00) $1,316,572.50 $1,372,574.50| $1,399,300.00
Estimated Annual Award: $7,600.00) $231,996.00 $109,160.00)

Deleted Item(s): Items 2F, 2G, 2H, 2|, 2M, 3A, 3D, & 3E will be rebid at a later time
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 11, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Lubricants and Hydraulic Fluids
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
South Texas Auto Parts
Hays City Corp dba Tex-Con Oil Company dba M&M Auto & Truck
Delta Fuel Co, LLC dba Delta360 |Co Matori Industries, Inc. Parts
6100019101 521 Main Street 4906 Burleson Road 401 E Sonterra Blvd STE 375 20475 Hwy 46 W Ste 340
Natchez, MS 39120 Austin, TX 78760 San Antonio, TX 78258 Spring Branch, TX 78070
Item Description
POWEDRIVE FLUID 10W, or Proven Equal
4E. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS NAS
Product Name: CHV Delo Torgforce! PowerDrive SAE 10 Powerdrive Fluid| Napa 70-4 Drivetrain 10W Hyd Oil
Product Number: N/A 402081 85-555
Manufactuer Name: Chevron P66 Phillips 66 Warren Oil
Unit Price: $14.91 $699.99/Drum $23.69 $13.64
Extended Price: $82,005.00] $69,999.00 $130,295.00 $75,020.00
4F . Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon NAS NAS
Product Name: CHYV Delo Torgforce| PowerDrive SAE 10| Powertdrive Fluid Napa 70-4 Drivetrain 10W Hyd Oil
Product Number: N/A 402082 N/A 85-505
Manufactuer Name: Chevron P66 Phillips 66 Warren Oil
Unit Price: $15.41 $79.99/Pail $24.03 $13.99
Extended Price: $7,705.00! $7,999.00 $12,015.00] $6,995.00
4G. Description: 55-Gallon Drum, Price per Gallon NAS NAS
668 Synthetic Transmission Fluid,
Product Name: CHYV Delo Syn HD ATF 668 PowerDrive SAE 10 55Gal Napa 70-4 Drivetrain 30W Hyd Oil
Product Number: N/A 402081 CAS15E2DF 85-355
Manufactuer Name: Chevron P66 Castrol Warren Oil
Unit Price: $32.59 $699.99/Drum $60.14; $13.64
Extended Price: $179,245.00 $69,999.00 $330,770.00 $75,020.00
4H. Description: 5-Gallon Pail, Price per Gallon
Product Name: NO BID PowerDrive SAE 30 NO BID Napa 70-4 Drivetrain 30W Hyd Oil
Product Number: 402092 85-305
Manufactuer Name: P66 Warren Oil
Unit Price: $79.99/Pail $13.99
Extended Price: $7,999.00 $6,995.00
Prompt Payment Discount:
Estimated Total: $1,802,211.00 $1,480,673.05 $14,183,058.00 $1,016,878.50
Estimated Annual Award:

Deleted Item(s): Items 2F, 2G, 2H, 2|, 2M, 3A, 3D, & 3E will be rebid at a later time
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