
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025 LOCAL LOCAL NON LOCAL LOCAL
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. Cooper Equipment Company Trailer Country USA LLC San Antonio Southwest Trailers, Ltd.

DBA Bruckner Truck & Equipment 5210 N Loop 1604 E 4471 s Parsons Ave 10302 IH 35 North
4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78247 Fremont, MI 49412 San Antonio, TX 78233

6100019168 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-657-5151 269-340-0899 210-657-5828
Item Description Quantity 210-666-7104

1 Half Round End Dump Trailer 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
with Electric Tarp Cover

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $51,900.00
Quantity: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) 1
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $51,900.00

Base Price Each: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) $51,900.00
Quantity: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) 1
Total: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) $51,900.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Armorlite Frameless Half-
Round End Dump

Trailer Warranty One Year Parts & Labor
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bruckner's Truck & Equipment

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 45 - 60 ARO Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

2 29 Cubic Yard Live Bottom Trailer 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid
with Hydraulic or Electric Tarp Cover

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $115,890.00
Quantity: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) 6
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $695,340.00

Base Price Each: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) $117,040.00
Quantity: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) 2
Total: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) $234,080.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2026 ETNYRE LB-237 Falcon

Trailer Warranty 1-Year
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cooper Equipment Co.

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5210 N Loop 1604 E
San Antonio, TX 78247

Delivery 145 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 11/30/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 11/30/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers

6100019168 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

1 Half Round End Dump Trailer 2
with Electric Tarp Cover

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Quantity: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)

Base Price Each: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)
Quantity: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)
Total: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2 29 Cubic Yard Live Bottom Trailer 8
with Hydraulic or Electric Tarp Cover

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Quantity: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)

Base Price Each: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)
Quantity: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)
Total: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL
Verde Inc. Certified Stainless Service, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management LLC Globe Trailer Manufacturing Inc.
2300 N. Scenic Hwy DBA West-Mark 300 SW 8th St. #17 3101 59th Ave Dr E
Lake Wales, FL 33898 2704 Railroad Ave. Boca Raton, FL 33432 Bradenton, FL 34203
863-559-3434 Ceres, CA 95307

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid NAS No Bid

$100,999.99
6

$605,999.94

$100,999.99
2

$201,999.98

2025 Trailking TKLB32-102

One-Year Factory Warranty
See Attached Warranty Info. Sheet

Southwestern Pneumatic

429 Kyle, TX 78640

200 Calendar Days

12/31/2025

12/31/2025

Most Likely, Please confirm
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025 LOCAL LOCAL NON LOCAL LOCAL
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. Cooper Equipment Company Trailer Country USA LLC San Antonio Southwest Trailers, Ltd.

DBA Bruckner Truck & Equipment 5210 N Loop 1604 E 4471 s Parsons Ave 10302 IH 35 North
4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78247 Fremont, MI 49412 San Antonio, TX 78233

6100019168 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-657-5151 269-340-0899 210-657-5828
Item Description Quantity 210-666-7104

3 Tandem Axle Enclosed Utility Trailer 4 No Bid No Bid

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $15,472.00 $16,799.00
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $61,888.00 $67,196.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Diamond Cargo 8.5x20 2025 Stallion MFG SM8520T5RG-6
Enclosed V Nose or Flat Front

Trailer Warranty 5 on Structure 3 Years Structural
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty): See Warranty Statement on other items

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bid Tex Trailer World Southwest Trailers

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 20260 IH35 South 10302 IH 35 North
Lytle, TX 78052 San Antonio, TX 78233

Delivery 60 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Will be 2025 or 2026 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing does not apply 10/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes

Subtotal $61,888.00 $67,196.00
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
Less Prompt Payment Discount $61,888.00 $67,196.00
Percentage Between Lowest Responsive Bid and Local Bid 7.90%
Price differential $5,308.00
Non Local Preference Award $61,888.00

4 20ft Deck, Min. 7K GVWR Equipment 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Transport Trailer - PINTLE

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $16,750.00
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $16,750.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Southwest Gooseneck
P14102EHMM-25S

Trailer Warranty One Year Structural
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers

6100019168 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

3 Tandem Axle Enclosed Utility Trailer 4

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Subtotal
Payment Terms 
Less Prompt Payment Discount 
Percentage Between Lowest Responsive Bid and Local Bid 
Price differential 
Non Local Preference Award 

4 20ft Deck, Min. 7K GVWR Equipment 1
Transport Trailer - PINTLE

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL
Verde Inc. Certified Stainless Service, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management LLC Globe Trailer Manufacturing Inc.
2300 N. Scenic Hwy DBA West-Mark 300 SW 8th St. #17 3101 59th Ave Dr E
Lake Wales, FL 33898 2704 Railroad Ave. Boca Raton, FL 33432 Bradenton, FL 34203
863-559-3434 Ceres, CA 95307

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$18,995.00
$75,980.00

2026 Cargomate E Series
EHW85ZOTA5

One Year

200 Dealers Nationwide

200 Dealers Nationwide

70 Calendar Days

8/1/2026

12/31/2025

Yes

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025 LOCAL LOCAL NON LOCAL LOCAL
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. Cooper Equipment Company Trailer Country USA LLC San Antonio Southwest Trailers, Ltd.

DBA Bruckner Truck & Equipment 5210 N Loop 1604 E 4471 s Parsons Ave 10302 IH 35 North
4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78247 Fremont, MI 49412 San Antonio, TX 78233

6100019168 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-657-5151 269-340-0899 210-657-5828
Item Description Quantity 210-666-7104

5 12ft Deck, min 6K GVWR Utility Trailer 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $6,975.00
Quantity: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) 4
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $27,900.00

Base Price Each: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) $6,975.00
Quantity: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) 1
Total: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) $6,975.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Southwest Gooseneck
B7083TTRG-12S

Trailer Warranty One Year Structural
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

6 20ft Deck, Min. 20K GVWR Equipment 1 No Bid No Bid
Transport Trailer – PINTLE

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $25,833.00 $25,300.00
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $25,833.00 $25,300.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Holden Model TDO20 2025 Southwest Gooseneck
P25102EHMM-25S

Trailer Warranty One Year Parts & Labor One Year Structural
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty): Unlimited Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bruckner's Truck & Equipment Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH-10 East 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 120 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2025 10/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers

6100019168 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

5 12ft Deck, min 6K GVWR Utility Trailer 5

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Quantity: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)

Base Price Each: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)
Quantity: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)
Total: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

6 20ft Deck, Min. 20K GVWR Equipment 1
Transport Trailer – PINTLE

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL
Verde Inc. Certified Stainless Service, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management LLC Globe Trailer Manufacturing Inc.
2300 N. Scenic Hwy DBA West-Mark 300 SW 8th St. #17 3101 59th Ave Dr E
Lake Wales, FL 33898 2704 Railroad Ave. Boca Raton, FL 33432 Bradenton, FL 34203
863-559-3434 Ceres, CA 95307

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$8,495.00
4

$33,980.00

$8,995.00
1

$8,995.00

2026 PJ Trailers 16' 5" Channel
Equipment Trailer Model CEJ165ZB5

One Year

100 Dealers Nationwide

100 Dealers Nationwide

60 Calendar Days

8/1/2026

12/31/2025

Yes

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$26,711.82
$26,711.82

2026 Interstate Trailers 20-DTA

1 Year
(See Attached Statement)

Holt Cat

3302 S WW White Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78222

125 Calendar Days

Changes June 1st

February 28th

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025 LOCAL LOCAL NON LOCAL LOCAL
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. Cooper Equipment Company Trailer Country USA LLC San Antonio Southwest Trailers, Ltd.

DBA Bruckner Truck & Equipment 5210 N Loop 1604 E 4471 s Parsons Ave 10302 IH 35 North
4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78247 Fremont, MI 49412 San Antonio, TX 78233

6100019168 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-657-5151 269-340-0899 210-657-5828
Item Description Quantity 210-666-7104

7 24ft Deck, Min. 30K GVWR, PINTLE Equipment 1 No Bid No Bid
Transport Trailer

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $29,934.00 $27,825.00
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $29,934.00 $27,825.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Holden Model TDO30 2025 Southwest Gooseneck
P30102EHSS-29S

Trailer Warranty One Year Parts & Labor One Year Structural
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty): Unlimited Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bruckner's Truck & Equipment Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH-10 East 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 120 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2025 10/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes

Subtotal $27,825.00
Payment Terms Net 30
Less Prompt Payment Discount $27,825.00
Percentage Between Lowest Responsive Bid and Local Bid 0.13%
Price differential $35.56
Local Preference Award $27,825.00

8 10ft Deck, 7K lb. GVWR, Tandem Axle 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Utility Drop Deck Trailer

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $21,885.00
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $21,885.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Triple L Model UT612

Trailer Warranty One Year Structural
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Trailers

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 10302 IH 35 North
San Antonio, TX 78233

Delivery 120 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers

6100019168 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

7 24ft Deck, Min. 30K GVWR, PINTLE Equipment 1
Transport Trailer

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Subtotal
Payment Terms 
Less Prompt Payment Discount 
Percentage Between Lowest Responsive Bid and Local Bid 
Price differential 
Local Preference Award 

8 10ft Deck, 7K lb. GVWR, Tandem Axle 1
Utility Drop Deck Trailer

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL
Verde Inc. Certified Stainless Service, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management LLC Globe Trailer Manufacturing Inc.
2300 N. Scenic Hwy DBA West-Mark 300 SW 8th St. #17 3101 59th Ave Dr E
Lake Wales, FL 33898 2704 Railroad Ave. Boca Raton, FL 33432 Bradenton, FL 34203
863-559-3434 Ceres, CA 95307

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$27,789.44
$27,789.44

2026 Interstate Trailers 30-DLE

1 Year
(See Attached Statement)

Holt Cat

3302 S WW White Rd.
San Antonio, TX 78222

125 Calendar Days

Changes June 1st

February 28th

No

$27,789.44
Net 30

$27,789.44

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025 LOCAL LOCAL NON LOCAL LOCAL
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. Cooper Equipment Company Trailer Country USA LLC San Antonio Southwest Trailers, Ltd.

DBA Bruckner Truck & Equipment 5210 N Loop 1604 E 4471 s Parsons Ave 10302 IH 35 North
4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78247 Fremont, MI 49412 San Antonio, TX 78233

6100019168 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-657-5151 269-340-0899 210-657-5828
Item Description Quantity 210-666-7104

9 Trailer, Min 60 Ton, Self-Lifting, Detachable 1 No Bid No Bid

Base Price Each: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) $138,500.00 $194,400.00
Total: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.) $138,500.00 $194,400.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2026 Load King 503/605 SS SFF 2026 Etnyre RTN60TD3-RA
Hydraulic Detach 24" Loaded Deck Height

Trailer Warranty See Attached Warranty Policy 1-Year
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Bruckner's Truck & Equipment Cooper Equipment Co.

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4562 IH-10 East 5210 N Loop 1604 E
San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78247

Delivery 14 Weeks 90 - 120 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025 11/30/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 11/1/2025 11/30/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes No

10 16ft Deck, Tandem Axle Flat Trailer, 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
with Dove Tails, Min 9K lbs. GVWR

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $8,575.00
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $8,575.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Southwest Gooseneck
B1083TTSI-18S

Trailer Warranty One Year Structural
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

Subtotal $8,575.00
Payment Terms Net 30
Less Prompt Payment Discount $8,575.00
Percentage Between Lowest Responsive Bid and Local Bid 6.76%
Price differential $580.00
Non Local Preference Award 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers

6100019168 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

9 Trailer, Min 60 Ton, Self-Lifting, Detachable 1

Base Price Each: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)
Total: (FY 2026 PO Issued Oct. - Nov.)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

10 16ft Deck, Tandem Axle Flat Trailer, 1
with Dove Tails, Min 9K lbs. GVWR

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Subtotal
Payment Terms 
Less Prompt Payment Discount 
Percentage Between Lowest Responsive Bid and Local Bid 
Price differential 
Non Local Preference Award 

NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL
Verde Inc. Certified Stainless Service, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management LLC Globe Trailer Manufacturing Inc.
2300 N. Scenic Hwy DBA West-Mark 300 SW 8th St. #17 3101 59th Ave Dr E
Lake Wales, FL 33898 2704 Railroad Ave. Boca Raton, FL 33432 Bradenton, FL 34203
863-559-3434 Ceres, CA 95307

No Bid

$147,843.47 $142,799.99 $164,624.22
$147,843.47 $142,799.99 $164,624.22

2025 Trail-EZE TE-120DG Trail King TK120HDG 2027 Globe Trailer GTBN60

1 Year One-Year Factory Warranty 12 Months
(See Attached Statement) See Attached Warranty Info. Sheet

Holt Cat Southwestern Pneumatic Nueces Power Equipment

3302 S WW White Rd. 429 Kyle, TX 78640 4697 Farm to Market 1516
San Antonio, TX 78222 Converse, TX

170 Calendar Days 200 Calendar Days 240 Calendar Days

Changes January 1st 12/31/2025 4/31/2025

8/31/2025 12/31/2025 4/1/2026

No Most Likely, Please confirm Yes

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$7,995.00
$7,995.00

PJ Trailers 16' 5" Channel Equipment
Trailer Model CEJ165ZB5NK

One Year

100 Dealers Nationwide

100 Dealers Nationwide

60 Calendar Days

8/1/2026

12/31/2025

Yes

$7,995.00
Net 30

$7,995.00

$7,995.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025 LOCAL LOCAL NON LOCAL LOCAL
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. Cooper Equipment Company Trailer Country USA LLC San Antonio Southwest Trailers, Ltd.

DBA Bruckner Truck & Equipment 5210 N Loop 1604 E 4471 s Parsons Ave 10302 IH 35 North
4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78247 Fremont, MI 49412 San Antonio, TX 78233

6100019168 JDLR San Antonio, TX 78219 210-657-5151 269-340-0899 210-657-5828
Item Description Quantity 210-666-7104

11 20ft Deck, Min. 10K GVWR Equipment 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Transport Trailer - PINTLE

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $16,750.00
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award) $16,750.00

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered: 2025 Southwest Gooseneck
P14102EHMM-25S

Trailer Warranty One Year Structural
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Total $298,067.00 $1,123,820.00 $61,888.00 $219,156.00
Total Award $242,300.00 $929,420.00 $61,888.00 $143,385.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 20, 2025
For: FY25 - FY26 Purchase of Trailers

6100019168 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

11 20ft Deck, Min. 10K GVWR Equipment 1
Transport Trailer - PINTLE

Base Price Each: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)
Total: (FY 2025 PO Upon Award)

Trailer Year, Make & Model Offered:

Trailer Warranty
(Minimum of a one-year Warranty):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Payment Terms

Total
Total Award

NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL NON LOCAL
Verde Inc. Certified Stainless Service, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management LLC Globe Trailer Manufacturing Inc.
2300 N. Scenic Hwy DBA West-Mark 300 SW 8th St. #17 3101 59th Ave Dr E
Lake Wales, FL 33898 2704 Railroad Ave. Boca Raton, FL 33432 Bradenton, FL 34203
863-559-3434 Ceres, CA 95307

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

$126,950.00 $202,344.73 $950,799.91 $164,624.22
$7,995.00
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	Final Bid Tab

