City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: Augqust 22, 2025 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL
For: Light Utility Vehicles for Building and Equipment JRE Golf Cars, LLC H-E-B, LP Briggs Industrial Solutions, |Chaves Brothers DeWinne Equipment, Inc.
Services Department Inc. Management, LLC
18865 Redland Road 5400 IH 35 North 5655 S. I-35 Frontage Rd | 300 SW 8th #17 11002 Bandera Rd
6100019196 GDL San Antonio San Antonio New Braunfels Boca Raton San Antonio
L - | TX 78259 TX 78218 TX 78132 FL 33432 TX 78250
ftem Description Quantity | 2101 545.7868 (2107163377 (210) 333-5021 (973) 975-5272 (210) 684-3718
1 Two Seat Electric Golf Cart 4
Price Each: $15.373.00 $16.763.00 $15,750.00 $23.579.89 No Bid
Extended Price: $61.492.00 $67.052.00 $63,000.00 $94.319.56
Year, Make & Model of Cart Offered: 2025 Cushman Hauler 800X|| 2025 Columbia Journeyman|2025 Fusion Utility Long Bed| 2025 Cushman Hauler 800X
Elite) 2x| Electric Cart - Alternate Bid Elite
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Hauler 800X 4.2 (with two|  Electric Unit 48 volt, 19 hp, Waev 5kw - 51.2V 105ah| 56.7V Li-ion Battery 11.7HP
(Include SAE Net HP) Lithium Batteries)| 5kw motor| Marxon Lithium-lon
Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours): 2 Yr Car-5YrBattery|| 2 year warranty (parts and| 2 Year Full Car/5 Year Full 2 Year Limited Warranty
labor), Batterv,
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mission Golf Cars| Parkway Systems Briaas Equioment| Mission Golf Cars
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 18865 Redland Road 5400 IH 35 North 5655 S Interstate 35 18865 Redland Road
San Antonio, TX 78259|  San Antonio, TX 78218 New Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio, TX 78259
Delivery will be made within calender days 40 Calendar Days| 100 Calendar Days 60 Calendar Days 60 - 180 (likely less)
after issuance of purchase order. Calendar Davs
Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered: Jan 20. 2026 12/19/2025 12/31/2026 10/31/2025
Last day order can be placed without missing
production
cut-off date for current vear model 1/20/26 12/19/2025 12/1/2026 10/31/2025
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes Yes| Most likely. Please confirm.
2 Two Seat 4x2 Cargo Deck Light Utility Vehicle 2
Price Each: $16.247.00) $12.856.00) $22.000.00 $21.499.89 No Bid
Extended Price: $32.494.00) $25.712.00) $44.000.00 $42.999.78
Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered: 2025 Cushman Titan XD|| 2026 Columbia Payloader| 2025 Taylor-Dunn Bigfoot, 2025 Cushman Titan XD
2XL (Heavv Dutv) XL
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: 48 Volt AC Drive, Titan XD Electric 48V 17.3 HP @ Waev 48V - 17HP AC Motor| 48 Volt DC 16.8 HP
(Include SAE Net HP) 1875 rom
Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours): 2 Yearon car+ 1 Yron| 1 Year Parts and Laborf| 4 Years 2 Year Limited Warranty
Batteries
Warrantv Service Provider Facility Name: Mission Golf Cars| Parkwav Systems| Briaas Equipment| Mission Golf Cart|
Warrantv Service Provider Facilitv Address: 18865 Redland Road 5400 IH 35 North| 5655 S. Interstate 35 18865 Redland Road
San Antonio. TX 78259 San Antonio. TX 78218 New Braunfels. TX 78132 San Antonio. TX 78259
Delivery will be made within calender days 40 Calendar Days 130 Calendar Days| 60 Calendar Days 60 - 180 (likely less)
after issuance of burchase order. Calendar Davs
Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered: Jan 20. 2026 12/18/2026 12/31/2025 10/31/2025
Last day order can be placed without missing
oroduction
cut-off date for current vear model 1/20/26 12/18/2026 12/1/2025 10/31/2025
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes Yes| Most likely. Please confirm.
3 Off-Road Utility Terrain Vehicles - Patrol & Rescue 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $27.000.00 $27.679.89 No Bid
Extended Price: $27.000.00 $27.679.89

Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(include SAE Net HP)

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:
Last day order can be placed without missing
production

cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2026 Polaris ProXD Full
Size Gas Crew - Alternate
Bid

Polaris ProStar 1,000cc Gas|
Enaine 39.5HP|

2 Years|

Briaas Equioment|

5655 S. Interstate 35|
New Braunfels, TX 78132

75 Calendar Days|

12/31/2026

12/1/2026

Yes

2026 Polaris Ranger Crew|
1000 Premium

999cc 61 HP Engine
One Year Factory Warranty
with unlimited miles

Family Powersports

11900 West Interstate 10
San Antonio. TX 78230

90 - 180 (likely less)
Calendar Davs

12/31/2025

12/31/2025

Most likely. Please confirm.
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100019196

August 22, 2025
Light Utility Vehicles for Building and Equipment
Services Department

GDL

NON-LOCAL

LOCAL Alternate

NON-LOCAL

NON-LOCAL Alternate

Item

Description

Quantity

Jamie Crandell Equipment
Corp dba Richmond
Eauinment

4803 FM 2218 Road
Richmond

TX 77469

JRE Golf Cars, LLC

18865 Redland Road
San Antonio
TX 78259

Kent Powersports, LP

15664 |H 35N
Selma
TX 78154

Kent Powersports, LP

15664 |H 35N
Selma
TX 78154

Two Seat Electric Golf Cart
Price Each:
Extended Price:

Year, Make & Model of Cart Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE Net HP)

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:
Last day order can be placed without missing
production

cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Two Seat 4x2 Cargo Deck Light Utility Vehicle
Price Each:

Extended Price:

Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE Net HP)

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours):

Warrantv Service Provider Facility Name:
Warrantv Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:
Last day order can be placed without missing
oroduction

cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Off-Road Utility Terrain Vehicles - Patrol & Rescue
Price Each:

Extended Price:

Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(include SAE Net HP)

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:
Last day order can be placed without missing
production

cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

4

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: Augqust 22, 2025 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL
For: Light Utility Vehicles for Building and Equipment JRE Golf Cars, LLC H-E-B, LP Briggs Industrial Solutions, |Chaves Brothers DeWinne Equipment, Inc.
Services Department Inc. Management, LLC
18865 Redland Road 5400 IH 35 North 5655 S. I-35 Frontage Rd | 300 SW 8th #17 11002 Bandera Rd
6100019196 GDL San Antonio San Antonio New Braunfels Boca Raton San Antonio
L - | TX 78259 TX 78218 TX 78132 FL 33432 TX 78250
ftem Description Quantity | 2101 545.7868 (2107163377 (210) 333-5021 (973) 975-5272 (210) 684-3718
4 Deleted - Will be Re-Bid
5 Two-Seat 2x4 Utility Terrain Vehicles 5
Price Each: $16.640.00 $13.878.00 $15.750.00 $20.399.89
Extended Price: $83.200.00 $69.390.00 $78.750.00 $101.999.45
Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered: 2025 ClubCar CarryAll 700( 2025 Columbia Journeyman(|2025 Fusion Utility Long Bed| 2025 Club Cab Carryall 700
2XL|| Electric Cart - Alternate Bid
Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours): 2 Yron Car +4 Yron Lead| 2 Year (Parts and Labor)| 2 Year Full Car/5 Year| 4 Year Limited Warranty
Acid Batt] Batterv,
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mission Golf Cars Parkwav Svstems| Briaas Equipment Mission Golf Carts
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 18865 Redland Road 5400 IH 35 North 5655 S Interstate 35 18865 Redland Road
San Antonio. TX 78259 San Antonio, TX 78218 New Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio. TX 78259
Delivery will be made within calender days 40 Calendar Days 100 Calendar Days 60 Calendar Days 60 - 180 (likely less)
after issuance of purchase order. Calendar Davs
Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered: Jan 20. 2026 12/19/2025 12/31/2026 10/31/2025
Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model 1/20/26| 12/19/2025 12/1/2026 10/31/2025
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes Yes| Most likely. Please confirm.
6 Two Seat 4x2 Street Legal, Electric Vehicle 1
Price Each: $41.462.00 $31.070.00] $36.000.00 $39.999.89
Extended Price: $41.462.00 $31.070.00] $36.000.00 $39.999.89
Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered: 2025 ClubCar Urban LSV - 2025 Columbia Utilitruck| 2026 Gem EX - Alternate| 2025 Club Car Urban LSV
Lithium| Bid Lithium-ion
Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours): 5 Yr Warranty Total Car + 2 Year (Parts and Labor)| 2 Year 5 Year Limited Warranty
Lithium Batterv|
Warrantv Service Provider Facility Name: Mission Golf Cars Parkwav Svstems| Briaas Eauioment Mission Golf Cars
Warrantv Service Provider Facilitv Address: 18865 Redland Road 5400 IH 35 North 5655 S. Interstate 35 18865 Redland Road
San Antonio. TX 78259 San Antonio. TX 78218 New Braunfels. TX 78132 San Antonio. TX 78259
Delivery will be made within calender days 40 Calendar Days 120 Calendar Days 90 Calendar Days 60 - 180 (likely less),
after issuance of burchase order. Calendar Davs
Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered: Jan 20. 2026 12/19/2025 12/31/2026 10/31/2025
Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model 1/20/26 12/19/2025 12/1/2026 10/31/2025
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes| Yes| Most likely. Please confirm.
7 Mid-Size Off Road 2 Seat 4x4 Utility Vehicle 2
w/Dump Bed
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $18.550.00 $15.495.89 No Bid
Extended Price: $37.100.00] $30.991.78|

Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(include SAE Net HP)

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1.000 Hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:

Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2026 Polaris ProXD Mid
Size Gas - Alternate Bid|

Polaris ProStar 570cc Gas -|
39.5HP|

2 Year|

Briggs Equipment|

5655 S. Interstate 35|
New Braunfels, TX 78132
180 Calendar Days

12/31/2026

12/1/2026

Yes

2026 Kawasaki Mule SX 4x4
XC|

401cc 4 stroke OHV Engine|

3 Year Limited Warranty|
Kawasaki of Universal City|
1737 Pat Booker Rd|
Universal City, TX 78148|

60 - 180 (likely less)
Calendar Davs

12/31/2025

12/31/2025

Most likely. Please confirm.,
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100019196

August 22, 2025
Light Utility Vehicles for Building and Equipment
Services Department

GDL

NON-LOCAL

LOCAL Alternate

NON-LOCAL

NON-LOCAL Alternate

Item

Description

Quantity

Jamie Crandell Equipment
Corp dba Richmond
Eauinment

4803 FM 2218 Road
Richmond

TX 77469

JRE Golf Cars, LLC

18865 Redland Road
San Antonio
TX 78259

Kent Powersports, LP

15664 |H 35N
Selma
TX 78154

Kent Powersports, LP

15664 |H 35N
Selma
TX 78154

Deleted - Will be Re-Bid

Two-Seat 2x4 Utility Terrain Vehicles
Price Each:

Extended Price:

Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered:

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:

Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Two Seat 4x2 Street Legal, Electric Vehicle
Price Each:

Extended Price:

Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered:

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours):

Warrantv Service Provider Facility Name:
Warrantv Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:

Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Mid-Size Off Road 2 Seat 4x4 Utility Vehicle
w/Dump Bed

Price Each:

Extended Price:

Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(include SAE Net HP)

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours):

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:

Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$16,720.00
$83,600.00

2025 Cushman Hauler XL
Elite (Lithium)

2 Yr Car Warranty + 5 Yr
Battery Warranty Lithium

Mission Golf Cars

18865 Redland Road
San Antonio, TX 78259

40 Calendar Days

Jan 20, 2026

1/20/26

No Bid

No Bid

$17,723.93
$35,447.86

2025 Can AM UTV Defender
HD7

Can AM Defender HD7
52HP

1 Year

Can AM - Kent Powersports,
LP

15664 Interstate 35N
Selma, TX 78154

90 Calendar Days
12/31/2025

12/31/2025

Yes

$16,794.83
$33,589.66

2025 Polaris Ranger 570

Polaris Ranger 570 44HP

1 Year

Polaris - Kent Powersports,
LP

15664 Interstate 35N
Selma, TX 78154

90 Calendar Days

12/31/2025

12/31/2025

Yes

Page 4




City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: Augqust 22, 2025 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL
For: Light Utility Vehicles for Building and Equipment JRE Golf Cars, LLC H-E-B, LP Briggs Industrial Solutions, |Chaves Brothers DeWinne Equipment, Inc.
Services Department Inc. Management, LLC
18865 Redland Road 5400 IH 35 North 5655 S. I-35 Frontage Rd | 300 SW 8th #17 11002 Bandera Rd
6100019196 GDL San Antonio San Antonio New Braunfels Boca Raton San Antonio
L L | TX 78259 TX 78218 TX 78132 FL 33432 TX 78250
ftem Description Quantity | 2101 545.7868 (2107163377 (210) 333-5021 (973) 975-5272 (210) 684-3718
8 6x4 Utility Vehicle 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.999.89 No Bid
Extended Price: $20.999.89
Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered: 2026 John Deere Gator TH
6x4 Gas
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: 675cc 15.5HP Air Cooled|
(Include SAE Net HP) Enaine
Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1.000 Hours): 12 Months or 1,000 Hours|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tellus Equipment Solutions|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 8587 Bandera Road
San Antonio. TX 78250
Delivery will be made within calender days 60 - 180 (likely less)
after issuance of purchase order. Calendar Davs
Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered: 12/31/2025
Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model 12/31/2025
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Most likely. Please confirm.,
9 Four Seat Electric Cart with Carao Bed 1
Price Each: $15.047.00 $20.384.00 $33.000.00 $32.399.89 No Bid
Extended Price: $15,047.00] $20,384.00 $33,000.00 $32,399.89
Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered: 2025 Cushman Shuttle 4{| 2025 Columbia Journeyman| 2026 Westward Industries, 2025 Cushman Shuttle 4
Elite 4| Max-EV 4 Seater - Alternate Elite with Cargo Bed
Rid
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Cushman Shuttle 4 Elite| Electric Unit 48 volt, 19 HP| Max EV 16kwh Lithium-lon 56.7 V Li-ion Battery 14.9
(Include SAE Net HP) (Lithium Batt) 5kw motor| 13.4HP HP
Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours): 2Yron Car+5 Yron| 1 Year
Battery| 2 Years (parts and labor) 5 Year Limited Warranty;
Warrantv Service Provider Facility Name: Mission Golf Cars Parkway Systems Briggs Equipment Mission Golf Carts
Warrantv Service Provider Facilitv Address: 18865 Redland Road 5400 IH 35 North 5655 S. Interstate 35 18865 Redland Road
San Antonio, TX 78259 San Antonio, TX 78218 New Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio, TX 78259
Delivery will be made within calender days 40 Calendar Days| 100 Calendar Days 150 Calendar Days 60 - 180 (likely less),
after issuance of purchase order. Calendar Davs
Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered: Jan 20, 2026 12/19/2025 12/31/2026 10/31/2025
Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model 1/20/26| 12/19/2025 12/1/2026 10/31/2025
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes Yes| Most likely. Please confirm.
10 Two Seat 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle w/Towing 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $21,500.00 $28,599.89 $22,165.00
Extended Price: $21,500.00 $28,599.89 $22,165.00
Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered: 2026 Polaris ProXD Full 2025 Gravely Atlas JSV-| 2025 Gravely JSV 3400
Size Gas - Alternate Bid 3400 996209
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Polaris ProStar 1,000cc Polaris 2 Cylinder SOHC Polaris 999cc 40HP
(Include SAE Net HP) 39.5HP 999cc 40 HP
Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1.000 Hours): 2 Years 1 Year Limited Warranty| 1 Year
Warrantv Service Provider Facility Name: Briaas Equipment| Hill Country Outdoor Power| DeWinne Eauipment
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5655 S. Interstate 35 4327 Centergate St. 11002 Bandera Rd
New Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio, TX 78217 San Antonio, TX 78250
Delivery will be made within calender days 75 Calendar Days 60 - 180 (likely less) 30 Calendar Days
after issuance of purchase order. Calendar Davs
Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered: 12/31/2026 10/31/2025 Oct 1
Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model 12/1/2026 10/31/2025 Oct 1
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes| Most likely. Please confirm. Dependent on availability
Subtotal $21,500.00 $22,165.00
Payment Terms 1%, 10 Days Net 30
Less Prompt Pavment Discount $21,285.00 $22,165.00
Percentage Between Lowest Responsive Bid and
Local Bid 3.97%
Price Differential $880.00
Local Preference Award $22,165.00
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 1%, 10 Days Net 30 Net 30
Total $233,695.00 $213,608.00 $340,350.00! $419,990.02 $22,165.00
Total Award $76,539.00 $126,172.00| $27,000.00] $51,991.67] $22,165.00

*Item 4 - Will be Re-Bid at a later date.
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City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100019196

August 22, 2025
Light Utility Vehicles for Building and Equipment
Services Department

GDL

NON-LOCAL

LOCAL Alternate

NON-LOCAL

NON-LOCAL Alternate

Item

Description

Quantity

Jamie Crandell Equipment
Corp dba Richmond
Eauinment

4803 FM 2218 Road
Richmond

TX 77469

JRE Golf Cars, LLC

18865 Redland Road
San Antonio
TX 78259

Kent Powersports, LP

15664 |H 35N
Selma
TX 78154

Kent Powersports, LP

15664 |H 35N
Selma
TX 78154

6x4 Utility Vehicle

Price Each:

Extended Price:

Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE Net HP)

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:

Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Four Seat Electric Cart with Carao Bed
Price Each:

Extended Price:

Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE Net HP)

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours):

Warrantv Service Provider Facility Name:
Warrantv Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:

Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Two Seat 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle w/Towing
Price Each:

Extended Price:

Year, Make & Model of Vehicle Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE Net HP)

Warranty (Minimum 1 Year or 1,000 Hours):
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:
Delivery will be made within calender days
after issuance of purchase order.

Production Cut-off Date for Year Model Offered:

Last dav order can be placed without missina
production cut-off date for current vear model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Subtotal

Pavment Terms

Less Prompt Payment Discount

Percentage Between Lowest Responsive Bid and
Local Bid

Price Differential

Local Preference Award

Payment Terms

Total

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Net 30

$0.00

Net 30

$83,600.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Net 30

$35,447.86

Net 30

$33,589.66

Total Award

*ltem 4 - Will be Re-Bid at a later date.
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