City of San Antonio Draft Tabulation

Opened: September 24, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Forklift Parts Associated Supply Company Inc  |Elite Material Handling LLC
1920 SE Loop 410 900 Port America Place
6100019052 Rz San Antonio, TX 78220 Grapevine, TX 76051
Estimated
Item Description Annua
Quantity
1 Clark Parts No Bid
1(A) Clark Catalog
1.Aa Parts Discount
Percentage Discount Offered: No Bid (Left Blank),
1.Ab Dealer Cost Plus Mark-Up
Percentage of Cost Plus Offered/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank),
Product Identification (Manufacturer): No Bid (Left Blank)
Type of Price Schedule Offered (Dealer, No Bid (Left Blank),
Price Schedule Number: No Bid (Left Blank)
Date of Price Schedule: No Bid (Left Blank)
Price Schedule Column on which Discount
is Based
(e.g., Distributor, Net, Wholesale): No Bid (Left Blank)
Warranty: No Bid (Left Blank),
1(C) Specified ltems - Clark Parts
1.1 City Provided Part Number (2510813) 1
Part Description: Brake Booster
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank),
12 City Provided Part Number (4312921) 4
Part Description: Brake Shoes
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank),
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank),
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
1.3 City Provided Part Number (2803761) 4
Part Description: Brake Shoes
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank),
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
14 City Provided Part Number (246112) 2
Part Description: Brake Cable
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
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City of San Antonio Draft Tabulation

Opened: September 24, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Forklift Parts Associated Supply Company Inc  |Elite Material Handling LLC
1920 SE Loop 410 900 Port America Place
6100019052 Rz San Antonio, TX 78220 Grapevine, TX 76051
Estimated
Item Description Annual
Quantity
15 City Provided Part Number (3736393) 2
Part Description: Brake Wheel Cylinder
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
1.6 City Provided Part Number (999504) 2
Part Description: Water Pump
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank),
1.7 City Provided Part Number (CM11N01J20D) 1
Part Description: Control Valve
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank),
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
1.8 City Provided Part Number (934336) 2
Part Description: Propane Mixer
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank),
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank),
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
1.9 City Provided Part Number (934849) 2
Part Description: Propane Regularor Kit
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
2 Doosan Parts
2(A) Doosan Parts Catalog
2.A1 Parts Discount
Percentage Discount Offered: 5% (Left Blank)
2A2 Dealer Cost Plus Mark-Up
Percentage of Cost Plus Offered/Mark-Up: (Left Blank) (Left Blank)
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City of San Antonio Draft Tabulation

Opened: September 24, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Forklift Parts Associated Supply Company Inc  |Elite Material Handling LLC
1920 SE Loop 410 900 Port America Place
6100019052 Rz San Antonio, TX 78220 Grapevine, TX 76051
Estimated
Item Description Annual
Quantity
Product Identification (Manufacturer): BOBCAT (Now Owner of Doosan) (Left Blank)
Type of Price Schedule Offered (Dealer, ASCO Fleet (Left Blank)
Price Schedule Number: ASCO DOOSAN CITY OF SA| (Left Blank)
Date of Price Schedule: 9/22 (Left Blank)
Price Schedule Column on which Discount
(e.g., Distributor, Net, Wholesale): List (Left Blank)
Warranty: 6 Months or 1000 Hours, First (Left Blank)
2(B) Specified Items - Doosan Parts
21 City Provided Part Number (110946-00650) 4
Part Description: Operators Seat
Manufacturer: BOBCAT Bobcat
Part#: 110946-00650 N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $1,053.00 $1,875.00
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $33.75 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $1,019.25 $1,875.00
Extended Price: $4,077.00 $7,500.00
22 City Provided Part Number (400910-00063) 2
Part Description: Hydraulic Pump
Manufacturer: BOBCAT Bobcat
Part#: 400910-00063 N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $2,199.14 $2,618.03
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $104.72 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $2,094.42 $2,618.03
Extended Price: $4,188.84 $5,236.06
2.3 City Provided Part Number (401106-00287) 4
Part Description: Hydraulic Pump Seal kit
Manufacturer: BOBCAT Bobcat
Part#: 401106-00287 N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $236.21 $281.20
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $11.25 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $224.96 $281.20
Extended Price: $899.84 $1,124.80
24 City Provided Part Number (301420-00014) 4
Part Description: Drive Axle Temp Sensor
Manufacturer: BOBCAT Bobcat
Part#: 301420-00014 301480-00025
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $39.61 $77.18
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $1.89 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $37.72 $77.18
Extended Price: $150.88 $308.72
25 City Provided Part Number (40040300152) 10
Part Description: Fuel Filter
Manufacturer: BOBCAT Bobcat
Part#: 40040300152 N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $55.53 $66.11
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $2.64 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $52.89 $66.11
Extended Price: $528.90 $661.10
26 City Provided Part Number (400504-00193) 10
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City of San Antonio Draft Tabulation

Opened: September 24, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Forklift Parts Associated Supply Company Inc  |Elite Material Handling LLC
1920 SE Loop 410 900 Port America Place
6100019052 Rz San Antonio, TX 78220 Grapevine, TX 76051
Estimated
Item Description Annual
Quantity
Part Description: Air Filter
Manufacturer: BOBCAT Bobcat
Part#: 400504-00193 N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $19.87 $26.65
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $0.95 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $18.92 $23.65
Extended Price: $189.20 $230.65
2.7 City Provided Part Number (D700116) 4
Part Description: Park Brake Switch
Manufacturer: BOBCAT Bobcat
Part#: D700116 N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $26.44 $31.48
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $1.26 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $25.18 $31.48
Extended Price: $100.72 $125.92
2.8 City Provided Part Number (300726-00006) 5
Part Description: Horn
Manufacturer: BOBCAT Bobcat
Part#: 300726-00006 N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $50.13 $59.68
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $2.39 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $47.74 $59.68
Extended Price: $238.70 $298.40
29 City Provided Part Number (A401082) 5
Part Description: Horn Switch
Manufacturer: BOBCAT Bobcat
Part#: A401082 N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $75.30 $89.64
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $3.59 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $71.71 $89.64
Extended Price: $358.55 $448.20
210 City Provided Part Number (A334203) 4
Part Description: Trans Temp Sensor
Manufacturer: BOBCAT Bobcat
Part#: A334203 301420-00024
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $41.92 $66.28
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $2.00 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $39.92 $66.28
Extended Price: $159.68 $265.12
3 Heli Parts
3(A) Heli Catalog
3.A1 Parts Discount
Percentage Discount Offered: No Bid (Left Blank),
3.A2 Dealer Cost Plus Mark-Up
Percentage of Cost Plus Offered/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
Product Identification (Manufacturer): No Bid (Left Blank)
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City of San Antonio Draft Tabulation

Opened: September 24, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Forklift Parts Associated Supply Company Inc  |Elite Material Handling LLC
1920 SE Loop 410 900 Port America Place
6100019052 Rz San Antonio, TX 78220 Grapevine, TX 76051
Estimated
Item Description Annual
Quantity
Type of Price Schedule Offered (Dealer, No Bid (Left Blank),
Price Schedule Number: No Bid (Left Blank)
Date of Price Schedule: No Bid (Left Blank)
Price Schedule Column on which Discount
(e.g., Distributor, Net, Wholesale): No Bid (Left Blank)
Warranty: No Bid (Left Blank),
3(B) Specified Items - Heli Parts
31 City Provided Part Number (JK4111) 2
Part Description: Key Set
Manufacturer: No Bid Heli
Part#: No Bid N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid $13.23
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid $13.23
Extended Price: No Bid $26.46
3.2 City Provided Part Number (A22A411102H) 2
Part Description: Horn Button Kit
Manufacturer: No Bid Heli
Part#: No Bid N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid $41.30
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid $41.30
Extended Price: No Bid $82.60
3.3 City Provided Part Number (H24C6-81099) 1
Part Description: Panel Switch
Manufacturer: No Bid Heli
Part#: No Bid N/A
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid $100.32
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid $100.32
Extended Price: No Bid $100.32
4 Hyster Parts No Bid (Left Blank)
4(A) Hyster Catalog
4.A1 Parts Discount
Percentage Discount Offered: No Bid (Left Blank),
4A2 Dealer Cost Plus Mark-Up
Percentage of Cost Plus Offered/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
Product Identification (Manufacturer): No Bid (Left Blank),
Type of Price Schedule Offered (Dealer, No Bid (Left Blank)
Price Schedule Number: No Bid (Left Blank)
Date of Price Schedule: No Bid (Left Blank)
Price Schedule Column on which Discount
(e.g., Distributor, Net, Wholesale): No Bid (Left Blank)
Warranty: No Bid (Left Blank),
4(B) Specified Items - Hyster Parts
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City of San Antonio Draft Tabulation

Opened: September 24, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Forklift Parts Associated Supply Company Inc  |Elite Material Handling LLC
1920 SE Loop 410 900 Port America Place
6100019052 Rz San Antonio, TX 78220 Grapevine, TX 76051
Estimated
Item Description Annual
Quantity
41 City Provided Part Number (1354806) 1
Part Description: Circuit Board
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank),
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
42 City Provided Part Number (1530583) 2
Part Description: Ignition Switch
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank),
43 City Provided Part Number (1375989) 2
Part Description: Water Pump
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank),
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
44 City Provided Part Number (1492644) 4
Part Description: Seal Kit
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank),
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank),
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank),
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
45 City Provided Part Number (1355714) 4
Part Description: Seal Kit
Manufacturer: No Bid (Left Blank)
Part#: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: No Bid (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: No Bid (Left Blank),
Extended Price: No Bid (Left Blank)
5 Mitsubishi Parts
5(A) Mitsubishi Catalog
5.A.1 Parts Discount
Percentage Discount Offered: 10% (Left Blank)
5.A2 Dealer Cost Plus Mark-Up
Percentage of Cost Plus Offered/Mark-Up: (Left Blank) (Left Blank)
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City of San Antonio Draft Tabulation

Opened: September 24, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Forklift Parts Associated Supply Company Inc  |Elite Material Handling LLC
1920 SE Loop 410 900 Port America Place
6100019052 Rz San Antonio, TX 78220 Grapevine, TX 76051
Estimated
Item Description Annual
Quantity
Product Identification (Manufacturer): MCFA (Left Blank)
Type of Price Schedule Offered (Dealer, ASCO FLEET (Left Blank)
Price Schedule Number: ASCO CITY OF SA MCFA PRICE (Left Blank)
Date of Price Schedule: 9/22/2025 (Left Blank)
Price Schedule Column on which Discount
(e.g., Distributor, Net, Wholesale): LIST] (Left Blank)
Warranty: MONTHS MAJOR (Left Blank)
COMPONENTS ENGINGS,
5(B) Specified Items - Mitsubishi Parts
5.1 City Provided Part Number (91A0521400) 4
Part Description: Ignition Switch
Manufacturer: MCFA| (Left Blank)
Part#: 91A0521400 (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $98.41 (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $8.95 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $89.46 (Left Blank)
Extended Price: $357.84 (Left Blank)
5.2 City Provided Part Number (9120514920) 4
Part Description: Key Set
Manufacturer: MCFA (Left Blank)
Part#: 9120514920 (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $20.22 (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $3.51 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $16.71 (Left Blank)
Extended Price: $66.84 (Left Blank),
53 City Provided Part Number 2
Part Description: Master Cylinder
Manufacturer: MCFA (Left Blank)
Part#: CT91A4610100 (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $155.87 (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $4.64 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $151.23 (Left Blank)
Extended Price: $302.46 (Left Blank),
54 City Provided Part Number (91E4600112) 8
Part Description: Wheel Cylinder
Manufacturer: MCFA (Left Blank)
Part#: 91E4600112 (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $90.42 (Left Blank),
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $8.22 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $82.20 (Left Blank),
Extended Price: $657.60 (Left Blank)
5.6 City Provided Part Number (91A0509010) 2
Part Description: Start Switch
Manufacturer: MCFA| (Left Blank)
Part#: 91A0509010 (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $95.33 (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $8.68 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $86.65 (Left Blank)
Extended Price: $173.30 (Left Blank)
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City of San Antonio Draft Tabulation

Opened: September 24, 2025
For: Annual Contract for Forklift Parts Associated Supply Company Inc  |Elite Material Handling LLC
1920 SE Loop 410 900 Port America Place
6100019052 Rz San Antonio, TX 78220 Grapevine, TX 76051
Estimated
Item Description Annual
Quantity
59 City Provided Part Number (91E4600114) 4
Part Description: LH Brake Shoe
Manufacturer: MCFA (Left Blank)
Part#: 91E4600114 (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $121.25 (Left Blank)
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $11.02 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $110.23 (Left Blank)
Extended Price: $440.92 (Left Blank)
5.10 City Provided Part Number (91E4600212) 4
Part Description: RH Brake Shoe
Manufacturer: MCFA (Left Blank)
Part#: 91E4600212 (Left Blank)
Unit Price Before Discount/Mark-Up: $121.37 (Left Blank),
% Discount Offered or Mark-Up Offered: $11.03 (Left Blank)
Unit Price After Discount/Mark-Up Offered: $110.34 (Left Blank),
Extended Price: $441.36 (Left Blank)
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
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