
City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2026

For: Annual Contract for Case and Caterpillar Parts 

Associated Supply Company, Inc BD Holt Co DBA Holt Texas LTD Holt Cat
6100019244 CM 1920 SE Loop 410 5665 SE Loop 410

Item Description

Estimated 
Annual 
Usage

San Antonio, TX 78220 San Antonio, TX 78222

1 Case Construction Equipment Parts

1A Parts Discount

Percent Discount Offered: 40% Markup NO BID
Products Identification (Manufacturer): Case
Type of Price Schedule (Dealer, Jobber, etc.): Dealer
Price Schedule Number: COSA CNH Price List 2026
Date of Price Schedule: 1/09/2026
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is 
Based (i.e., Distributor, Net, Wholesale, etc.): DNET

Warranty: 
6 months or 1000 hours for new components, 1 

year for remanufactured

1B Specified Items - Wheel Loaders

1. Part Description: Cylinder 2
Part Number: 84244454
Part Number Offered: 91739114
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $3,258.67
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $1,396.58
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $4,655.25 NO BID
Extended Price: $9,310.50

2. Part Description: Blade 20
Part Number: 76082416
Part Number Offered: 76082416
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $204.13
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $109.92
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $314.05 NO BID
Extended Price: $6,281.00

3. Part Description: Arm 8
Part Number: 84476111
Part Number Offered: 84476111
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $137.36
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $66.14
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $203.50 NO BID
Extended Price: $1,628.00

4. Part Description: Bolt 175
Part Number: 42021244
Part Number Offered: 420-21244
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $3.75
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $3.75
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $7.50 NO BID
Extended Price: $1,312.50

5. Part Description: Wiper Motor 10
Part Number: 84495835
Part Number Offered: 48114696
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $336.88
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $144.47
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $481.25 NO BID
Extended Price: $3,368.80

6. Part Description: Wiper Blade 15
Part Number: 76043977
Part Number Offered: 76043977
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $42.11
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $14.04
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $56.15 NO BID
Extended Price: $842.25
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7. Part Description: Shifter Switch 5
Part Number: 238270A1
Part Number Offered: 238270A1R
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $497.00
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $213.00
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $710.00 NO BID
Extended Price: $3,550.00

8. Part Description: Ignition Key 10
Part Number: 79073033
Part Number Offered: 79073033
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $10.45
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $7.55
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $19.00 NO BID
Extended Price: $190.00

9. Part Description: End Blade 7
Part Number: 75266959
Part Number Offered: 75266959
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $191.75
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $103.25
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $295.00 NO BID
Extended Price: $2,065.00

10. Part Description: End Blade 14
Part Number: 75266966
Part Number Offered: 75266966
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $191.75
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $103.25
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $295.00 NO BID
Extended Price: $4,130.00

11. Part Description: Cutting Edge 10
Part Number: 75239491
Part Number Offered: 75239491
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $138.29
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $74.46
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $212.75 NO BID
Extended Price: $2,127.50

12. Part Description: Air Filter 10
Part Number: 71104208
Part Number Offered: 71104208
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $48.94
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $13.31
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $65.25 NO BID
Extended Price: $652.50

13. Part Description: Air Filter 10
Part Number: 75254545
Part Number Offered: 75254545
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $108.81
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $58.59
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $167.49 NO BID
Extended Price: $1,674.90

1C Specified Items - Skid Steers

1. Part Description: Cutting Edge 1
Part Number: 87454487
Part Number Offered: 87454487
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $253.53
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $117.01
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $390.05 NO BID
Extended Price: $390.05
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2. Part Description: Fuel Filter 12
Part Number: 84171692
Part Number Offered: 84565884
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $25.35
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $14.65
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $39.00 NO BID
Extended Price: $468.00

3. Part Description: Fuel Filter 8
Part Number: 87548612
Part Number Offered: 47572791
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $17.66
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $5.89
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $23.55 NO BID
Extended Price: $188.40

4. Part Description: Hydraulic Filter 2
Part Number: 84475949
Part Number Offered: 84475949
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $62.76
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $33.79
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $96.55 NO BID
Extended Price: $193.10

5. Part Description: Idler 1
Part Number: 47378990
Part Number Offered: 47378990
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $462.27
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $130.38
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $592.65 NO BID
Extended Price: $592.65

6. Part Description: Light 1
Part Number: 87650097
Part Number Offered: 87650097
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $113.23
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $48.52
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $161.75 NO BID
Extended Price: $161.75

7. Part Description: Rubber Track 2
Part Number: 47638167
Part Number Offered: 4008650FP
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $875.23
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $192.12
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $1,067.35 NO BID
Extended Price: $2,134.70

8. Part Description: Track 2
Part Number: 87541112
Part Number Offered: 4008650FP
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $875.23
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $192.12
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $1,067.35 NO BID
Extended Price: $2,134.70

9. Part Description: Weight 5
Part Number: 87626717
Part Number Offered: Same
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $425.42
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $204.83
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $630.25 NO BID
Extended Price: $3,151.25

1D Specified Items - Motor Graders

1. Part Description: Belt 1
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Part Number: 71100482
Part Number Offered: 71100482
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $172.13
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $82.87
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $255.00 NO BID
Extended Price: $255.00

2. Part Description: Bit 2
Part Number: 87561763
Part Number Offered: 90417529
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $34.76
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $16.74
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $51.50 NO BID
Extended Price: $103.00

3. Part Description: Blade 8
Part Number: 75266959
Part Number Offered: 75266959
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $191.75
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $103.25
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $295.00 NO BID
Extended Price: $2,360.00

4. Part Description: Blade 8
Part Number: 75266966
Part Number Offered: 75266966
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $191.75
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $103.25
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $295.00 NO BID
Extended Price: $2,360.00

5. Part Description: Air Filter 8
Part Number: 71104208
Part Number Offered: 71104208
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $48.94
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $13.31
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $65.25 NO BID
Extended Price: $522.00

6. Part Description: Mirror 3
Part Number: 79099583
Part Number Offered: 79099583
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $118.16
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $56.89
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $175.05 NO BID
Extended Price: $525.15

7. Part Description: A/C Filter 8
Part Number: 75254545
Part Number Offered: 75254545
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $108.81
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $58.59
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $167.49 NO BID
Extended Price: $1,339.92

8. Part Description: Plate 8
Part Number: 75248807
Part Number Offered: 75248807
Manufactuer Name: Case
Price Per Each: $85.23
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $56.82
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $142.05 NO BID
Extended Price: $1,136.40

9. Part Description: Shank 10
Part Number: 75327449
Part Number Offered: 75327449
Manufactuer Name: Case
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Price Per Each: $97.71
Discount/Mark-Up Amount: $47.04
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: $144.75 NO BID
Extended Price: $1,447.50

2
Caterpillar Earthmoving, Construction and Paving 
Equipment Parts

2A Parts Discount

Percent Discount Offered: NO BID 0%
Products Identification (Manufacturer): Caterpillar
Type of Price Schedule (Dealer, Jobber, etc.): N/A
Price Schedule Number: N/A
Date of Price Schedule: N/A
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is 
Based (i.e., Distributor, Net, Wholesale, etc.): N/A
Warranty: 1 Year Parts

2B Specified Items - Caterpillar Parts:

1. Part Description: Nut 240
Part Number: 1M-1408
Part Number Offered: 1M1408
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $1.72
Extended Price: $412.80

2. Part Description: Bolt 168
Part Number: 9G-3110
Part Number Offered: 9G3110
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $2.58
Extended Price: $433.44

3. Part Description: Bolt 12
Part Number: 3T-8601
Part Number Offered: 3T8601
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $3.41
Extended Price: $40.92

4. Part Description: Stopper 12
Part Number: 5G-2247
Part Number Offered: 5G2247
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $0.87
Extended Price: $10.44

5. Part Description: Key 24
Part Number: 5P-8500
Part Number Offered: 5P8500
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $10.89
Extended Price: $261.36

6. Part Description: Bolt 12
Part Number: 9G-8592
Part Number Offered: 9G8592
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $4.35
Extended Price: $52.20
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7. Part Description: Pin 12
Part Number:108-0943
Part Number Offered: 1080943
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $38.77
Extended Price: $465.24

8. Part Description: Brushing 6
Part Number:108-0944
Part Number Offered: 1080944
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $46.47
Extended Price: $278.82

9. Part Description: Link 6
Part Number:108-0949
Part Number Offered: 1080949
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $233.99
Extended Price: $1,403.94

10. Part Description: Link 6
Part Number:108-0950
Part Number Offered: 1080950
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $233.99
Extended Price: $1,403.94

11. Part Description: Link 6
Part Number:108-0951
Part Number Offered: 1080951
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $233.99
Extended Price: $1,403.94

12. Part Description: Link 6
Part Number:108-0952
Part Number Offered: 1080952
Manufactuer Name: Cat
Price Per Each: 
Discount/Mark-Up Amount:
Price Per Each After Discount/Mark Up: NO BID $233.99
Extended Price: $1,403.94

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30
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