
City of San Antonio
Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 20, 2026

For: Annual Contract for Multi-Use Copier Paper - Citywide
Clampitt Paper LionsGate Systems LLC Western/Bosworth/OVOL 

USA

6100019527 TC 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 6301 E. Stassney Ln Bldg 9 
Ste 200

Item Description
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78217

San Antonio,
TX  78245

Austin,
TX  78744

1 RECYCLED
1a 100% Recycled Multi-Use Copy Paper, Cases

8.5 x 11 65 $62.90 No Bid $56.00
8.5 x 14 15 No Bid No Bid $0.00
11 x 17 97 No Bid No Bid $0.00

1b 30% Recycled Multi-Use Copy Paper, Cases
8.5 x 11 1319 $47.90 No Bid $51.20
8.5 x 14 15 No Bid No Bid $0.00
11 x 17 97 No Bid No Bid $0.00

2 NON-RECYCLED
2a Non-Recycled Multi-Use Copy Paper, Cases

8.5 x 11 1356 $37.25 $71.83 $50.40
8.5 x 14 15 $89.85 No Bid $74.80
11 x 17 97 $47.65 No Bid $58.80

2b Multi-Use Premium Copy Paper, Cases
8.5 x 11 30 $67.66 No Bid $98.80

Terms 1% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total
Estimated Annual Award

Page 1 of 1


	Draft Bid Tab

