

City of San Antonio Draft Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2026 For: Annual Contract For Tote Bags for Parks and Recreation 6100519600			AHI Enterprises LLC 16120 College Oak, Suite 105 San Antonio, TX 78249	Bankson Group dba Alamo Tees 12814 Cogburn Ave San Antonio, TX 78249	BSN Sports LLC 14460 Varsity Brands Way Farmers Branch, TX 75244	C&A Priority Logistics 2313 Trinity Park CT Deer Park, TX 77536	Nilson Promotional Manufacturing Corp. P.O. Box 68840 Carol Stream IL 60188	North American Logistics dba Firemarketing LLC 13115 3rd St E 1B Modern Beach, FL 33708	Promo Solutions 11104 Windjammer Drive Frisco, TX 75036	Tru Branding 1811 S Laredo St. San Antonio, TX 78207	Tru Branding 1811 S Laredo St. San Antonio, TX 78207
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity									
1	Tote Bag 12 oz 14" W x 17" H x 7" D	2000	Alternate		Alternate	Alternate				Alternate 1	Alternate 2
			Tote Bag 12 oz 20" W x 15" H x 5" D		Tote Bag 12 oz 20" W x 15" H x 5" D	Tote Bag 12 oz 15" W x 16" H				Tote Bag 12 oz 15 1/2" W x 18" H x 4" D	Tote Bag 4oz 14" W x 16" H x 4.5" L
			Price per tote bag	\$8.10	\$4.62	\$6.04	\$17.82	\$2.48	\$4.09	\$5.75	\$3.69
			Extended Price	\$16,200.00	\$9,640.00	\$12,080.00	\$35,140.00	\$4,960.00	\$8,180.00	\$11,500.00	\$7,360.00
			1 Color Imprint	Included	\$0.79	\$1.25	\$17.62	\$0.00	No Bid	\$6.50	\$3.69
			2 Color Imprint	Included	\$1.53	\$1.50	\$18.92	\$0.00	No Bid	\$6.85	\$4.09
			3 Color Imprint	Included	\$2.05	\$2.40	\$19.94	\$0.00	No Bid	\$7.15	\$4.49
			4 Color Imprint	Included	\$2.05	\$2.55	\$21.22	\$0.00	No Bid	\$7.35	\$4.69
			Additional Cost per Extra Color (beyond 4)	\$0.00	\$3.30	\$1.50	\$0.00	\$0.25	No Bid	\$0.25	\$5.39
			Logo Set Up Fee (if applicable)	Included	N/A	N/C	N/C	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	
			Standard Delivery Fee (if applicable)	Included	N/A	\$360.00	N/C	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	
			Expediated Delivery Fee (if applicable)	Customer will pay actual cost for expediated delivery requests	N/A	Request	300-600 per case	\$0.00	No Bid	Will quote if needed at time of order	
										1 Color \$40, 2 Color \$80, 3 Color \$120, 4 Color \$160	1 Color \$47.2, 2 Color \$80, 3 Color \$120, 4 Color \$160
										\$968.89	\$1,747.90
2	Tote Bag 7 oz 15" W x 16" H x 5" D	8,000									
			Tote Bag 7 oz 20" W x 15" H x 5" G		Tote Bag 6 oz 16" W x 14" H x 4.5" D	Tote Bag 6 oz 15" W x 16" H x 5" D				Tote Bag 9 oz 15 3/4" W x 20 1/2" H x 4" D	Tote Bag 5oz 10" W x 14" H x 5" D
			Price per tote bag	\$6.35	\$1.76	\$4.75	\$10.95	\$1.68	\$3.59	\$5.50	\$4.19
			Extended Price	\$50,800.00	\$14,080.00	\$38,000.00	\$87,600.00	\$13,440.00	\$28,720.00	\$44,000.00	\$33,520.00
			1 Color Imprint	Included	\$0.69	\$95.00	\$10.95	\$0.00	No Bid	\$6.25	\$4.19
			2 Color Imprint	Included	\$1.47	\$150.00	\$12.05	\$0.00	No Bid	\$6.55	\$4.69
			3 Color Imprint	Included	\$1.93	\$160.00	\$13.10	\$0.00	No Bid	\$6.85	\$4.98
			4 Color Imprint	Included	\$1.93	\$150.00	\$14.80	\$0.00	No Bid	\$7.10	\$5.39
			Additional Cost per Extra Color (beyond 4)	\$0.00	Request	\$1.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.25	\$2.45
			Logo Set Up Fee	Included	N/A	N/C	N/C	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	
			Standard Delivery Fee	Included	N/A	\$240.00	N/C	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	
			Expediated Fee	Customer will pay actual cost for expediated delivery requests	N/A	Request	300-600 per case	\$0.00	No Bid	\$2,228.92	\$968.89
			Payment Terms	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	.5% 10 Days	Net 30	Net 30
			Estimated Annual Total	\$67,000.00	\$23,720.00	\$50,080.00	\$123,240.00	\$18,400.00	\$36,860.00	\$55,500.00	\$40,000 (based on 1 color imprint)
											\$14,260 (based on 1 color imprint)