

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 8, 2026 For: FY26 Hybrid & Electric Vehicles			NON-LOCAL Donalson Imports, Inc. DBA Donalson Toyota of Silsbee 1396 Highway 327 E. Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191	LOCAL Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. 227 Broadway San Antonio, TX 78233 210-599-5000	NON-LOCAL Caldwell Country Chevrolet, LLC 800 State Highway 21 E Caldwell, TX 77836	NON-LOCAL Tesla, Inc. 1 Tesla Road Austin, TX 78725
6100019655 JDLR						
Item	Description	Quantity				
1	Compact Sedan, Plug-In Hybrid, White	8		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Price Each:		\$35,800.00			
	Extended price:		\$286,400.00			
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2027 Toyota Prius Plug-In			
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):		Toyota Prius Plug-In 2.0L 4cyl 220 HP			
	Transmission Offered:		Plug-in Hybrid System EV-HB Motor			
	Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements):		36Mo/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5Yr/60,000 Powertrain 10Yr/150,000 Battery			
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		North Park Toyota			
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		10703S/W Loop 410 San Antonio, TX			
	Delivery:		120 Calendar Days			
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:		N/A			
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model:		N/A			
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No			

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 8, 2026 For: FY26 Hybrid & Electric Vehicles 6100019655			NON-LOCAL Donalson Imports, Inc. DBA Donalson Toyota of Silsbee 1396 Highway 327 E. Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191		LOCAL Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. 227 Broadway San Antonio, TX 78233 210-599-5000	NON-LOCAL Caldwell Country Chevrolet, LLC 800 State Highway 21 E Caldwell, TX 77836	NON-LOCAL Tesla, Inc. 1 Tesla Road Austin, TX 78725
	JDLR						
Item	Description	Quantity					
2	Compact Electric Sedan, Dark Color	1	No Bid		No Bid		
	Price Each:			\$26,511.75		\$38,630.00	
	Extended price:			\$26,511.75		\$38,630.00	
	Year, Make & Model Offered:			2027 Chevrolet Bolt		2026 Tesla Model 3	
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):			Bolt LT		Tesla Model 3 Rear Wheel Drive Battery Electric Vehicle - 257 HP	
	Transmission Offered:			Auto		Battery Electric	
	Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements):			8 Year 100,000 Miles Electric Comp. 3 Year 36,000 Miles Basic		Basic 4 Year or 50,000 Miles Battery & Drive 8 Years or 100,000 70% retention of battery capacity over warranty period	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:			Gunn Chevrolet		Tesla Service - San Antonio	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:			16550 IH 35 North Selma, TX 78154		8320 - 8434 Airport Blvd San Antonio, TX 78216	
	Delivery:			180 Calendar Days		90 Calendar Days	
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:			Not set till 2027		Estimated 10/01/2026	
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model:			Not set till 2027		9/18/2026	
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:			No		No	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 8, 2026 For: FY26 Hybrid & Electric Vehicles 6100019655			NON-LOCAL Donalson Imports, Inc. DBA Donalson Toyota of Silsbee 1396 Highway 327 E. Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191		LOCAL Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. 227 Broadway San Antonio, TX 78233 210-599-5000	NON-LOCAL Caldwell Country Chevrolet, LLC 800 State Highway 21 E Caldwell, TX 77836	NON-LOCAL Tesla, Inc. 1 Tesla Road Austin, TX 78725
Item	Description	Quantity					
3	Mid-Size Hybrid SUV, 2WD, Amber Grill Mounted Strobe Lights, White Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements): Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	5	409-880-9191 2027 Toyota Highlander XLE AWD Toyota Highlander XLE AWD 2.5L 4Cyl. Elec. Controlled Variable Trans 36Mo/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5Yr/60,000 Powertrain 10Yr/150,000 Battery North Park Toyota 10703 S/W Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 120 Calendar Days N/A N/A No		No Bid	NAS 2027 Ford Police Interceptor Utility (K8A) All Wheel Drive - Hybrid 3.3L V6 Direct Injection Hybrid System 10-Speed Automatic Basic 3 Year / 36,000 Miles Drivetrain 5 Year / 100,000 Miles Hybrid / Electric Components 8 Years / 100,000 Miles Any Local Ford Dealership Any Local Ford Dealership 90 - 120 Calendar Days 2027 quoted date not set 2027 quoted date not set N/A	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 8, 2026 For: FY26 Hybrid & Electric Vehicles 6100019655						
JDLR			NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	NON-LOCAL
			Donalson Imports, Inc. DBA Donalson Toyota of Silsbee 1396 Highway 327 E. Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191	Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. 227 Broadway San Antonio, TX 78233 210-599-5000	Caldwell Country Chevrolet, LLC 800 State Highway 21 E Caldwell, TX 77836	Tesla, Inc. 1 Tesla Road Austin, TX 78725
Item	Description	Quantity				
4	Compact Electric Sedan, White	3	No Bid			
	Price Each:			\$26,511.75	\$26,694.00	\$39,630.00
	Extended price:			\$79,535.25	\$80,082.00	\$118,890.00
	Year, Make & Model Offered:			2027 Chevrolet Bolt	2027 Chevrolet Equinox EV 4 - Door, LT1 Trim	2026 Tesla Model 3
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):			Chevrolet Bolt LT	12V / 60AH, 680 ENCC	Tesla Model 3 Rear Wheel Drive Battery Electric Vehicle - 257 HP
	Transmission Offered:			Auto	N/A	Battery Electric
	Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements):			8 Year 100,000 Miles Electric Comp. 3 Year 36,000 Miles Basic	Basic 3 Year / 36,000 Miles Hybrid / Electric Components 8 Years / 100,000 Miles	Basic 4 Year or 50,000 Miles Battery & Drive 8 Years or 100,000 70% retention of battery capacity over warranty period
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:			Gunn Chevrolet	Any Local Ford Dealership	Tesla Service - San Antonio
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:			16550 IH 35 North Selma, TX 78154	Any Local Ford Dealership	8320 - 8434 Airport Blvd San Antonio, TX 78216
	Delivery:			180 Calendar Days	90 - 120 Calendar Days	90 Calendar Days
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:			Not set till 2027	2027 quoted date not set	Estimated 10/01/2026
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model:			Not set till 2027	2027 quoted date not set	9/18/2026
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:			No	N/A	No

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 8, 2026 For: FY26 Hybrid & Electric Vehicles 6100019655			NON-LOCAL Donalson Imports, Inc. DBA Donalson Toyota of Silsbee 1396 Highway 327 E. Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191		LOCAL Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. 227 Broadway San Antonio, TX 78233 210-599-5000	NON-LOCAL Caldwell Country Chevrolet, LLC 800 State Highway 21 E Caldwell, TX 77836	NON-LOCAL Tesla, Inc. 1 Tesla Road Austin, TX 78725
	JDLR						
Item	Description	Quantity					
5	Deleted - Will Rebid at a Later Date						
6	Mid-Size Hybrid SUV, 2WD, Amber Grill Mounted Strobe Lights, Vinyl Back Seats, Black	1		No Bid	NAS	No Bid	
	Price Each:		\$47,697.00		\$45,667.00		
	Extended price:		\$47,697.00		\$45,667.00		
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2027 Toyota Highlander XLE AWD		2027 Ford Police Interceptor Utility (K8A) All Wheel Drive - Hybrid		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP):		Toyota Highlander XLE AWD 2.5L 4Cyl		3.3L V6 Direct Injection Hybrid System		
	Transmission Offered:		Elec. Controlled Variable Trans		10-Speed Automatic		
	Warranty (Must meet minimum warranty requirements):		36Mo/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5Yr/60,000 Powertrain 10Yr/150,000 Battery		Basic 3 Year / 36,000 Miles Drivetrain 5 Year / 100,000 Miles Hybrid / Electric Components 8 Years / 100,000 Miles		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		North Park Toyota		Any Local Ford Dealership		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		10703 S/W Loop 410 San Antonio, TX		Any Local Ford Dealership		
	Delivery:		120 Calendar Days		90 - 120 Calendar Days		
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:		N/A		2027 quoted date not set		
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model:		N/A		2027 quoted date not set		
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No		N/A		
	Payment Terms		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30		Net 30
	Total		\$572,582.00	\$106,047.00	\$353,584.00		\$157,520.00
	Total Award		\$572,582.00	\$106,047.00			