
City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457

1 Smart Capnoline Plus O2 Adult - Inventory Item
1a. Zoll – Part # 8300-0524-01 Withdrawn

# of Cases (25 each/Case) 1,000
Price per Case: $495.33 No Bid $1,413.00
Extended Price: $495,330.00 $1,413,000.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $495,330.00 $1,413,000.00
Percentage between local bid and lowest responsive 
bid:

188.82%

Price differential $323,830.00
5 Year Total $2,476,650.00 $7,065,000.00

1b. Medtronic – Part # MVAO
# of Cases (25 each/Case) 1,000
Price per Case: No Bid $179.75 $315.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $179,750.00 $315,000.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $176,155.00 $315,000.00
Percentage between local bid and lowest responsive 
bid:

83.67%

Price differential $143,500.00
5 Year Total $880,775.00 $1,575,000.00

1c. Masimo – Part # 4459
# of Cases (25 each/Case) 1,000
Price per Case: No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price: $175,000.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $171,500.00
5 Year Total $857,500.00

6100015684



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

1 Smart Capnoline Plus O2 Adult - Inventory Item
1a. Zoll – Part # 8300-0524-01

# of Cases (25 each/Case) 1,000
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between local bid and lowest responsive 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

1b. Medtronic – Part # MVAO
# of Cases (25 each/Case) 1,000
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between local bid and lowest responsive 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

1c. Masimo – Part # 4459
# of Cases (25 each/Case) 1,000
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

6100015684

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

Zoll 8300-000200
$221.75 No Bid $428.40

$221,750.00 $428,400.00
2% 0%

$217,315.00 $428,400.00

$1,086,575.00 $2,142,000.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid $182.86 No Bid
$182,860.00

0%
$182,860.00
$914,300.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

2 Blood Pressure Cuff Adult - Inventory Item
2a. Zoll - Part # SOFT-11-2MQ Withdrawn

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 900
Price per Case: $200.81 No Bid $596.25
Extended Price: $180,729.00 $536,625.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $180,729.00 $536,625.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

162.70%

Price differential $111,933.00
5 Year Total $903,645.00 $2,683,125.00

2b. Welch Allyn - Part # Soft-11-2MQ
# of Cases (20 each/Case) 900
Price per Case: No Bid $78.00 $130.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $70,200.00 $117,000.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $68,796.00 $117,000.00
Percentage between local bid and lowest responsive 
bid:

70.07%

Price differential $48,204.00
5 Year Total $343,980.00 $585,000.00

3 Patient Sensor Adult Rainbow - Inventory Item
3a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000862 240 Withdrawn

Price per Each: $920.38 No Bid $2,576.25
Extended Price: $220,891.20 $618,300.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $220,891.20 $618,300.00
5 Year Total $1,104,456.00 $3,091,500.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

2 Blood Pressure Cuff Adult - Inventory Item
2a. Zoll - Part # SOFT-11-2MQ

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 900
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

2b. Welch Allyn - Part # Soft-11-2MQ
# of Cases (20 each/Case) 900
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between local bid and lowest responsive 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

3 Patient Sensor Adult Rainbow - Inventory Item
3a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000862 240

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid $174.30
$156,870.00

0%
$156,870.00

$784,350.00

$83.80 $97.60 No Bid
$75,420.00 $87,840.00

2% 0%
$73,911.60 $87,840.00

$369,558.00 $439,200.00

No Bid No Bid $790.30
$189,672.00

0%
$189,672.00
$948,360.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

3b. Masimo - Part # 4067 240
Price per Each: No Bid $478.50 $456.75 No Bid
Extended Price: $114,840.00 $109,620.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $112,543.20 $109,620.00
5 Year Total $562,716.00 $548,100.00

4 Patient Cable - 4' Rainbow
4a. Zoll - Part # 8000-001701 175 Withdrawn 

Price per Each: $255.16 No Bid $272.26
Extended Price: $44,653.00 $47,645.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $44,653.00 $47,645.50
5 Year Total $223,265.00 $238,227.50

4b. Masimo - Part # 4072 175
Price per Each: No Bid $156.60 $152.25 No Bid
Extended Price: $27,405.00 $26,643.75
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $26,856.90 $26,643.75
5 Year Total $134,284.50 $133,218.75



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

3b. Masimo - Part # 4067 240
Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

4 Patient Cable - 4' Rainbow
4a. Zoll - Part # 8000-001701 175

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

4b. Masimo - Part # 4072 175
Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

$976.30 $497.14 No Bid
$234,312.00 $119,313.60

2% 0%
$229,625.76 $119,313.60

$1,148,128.80 $596,568.00

No Bid No Bid $219.10
$38,342.50

0%
$38,342.50

$191,712.50

$157.20 $165.71 No Bid
$27,510.00 $28,999.25

2% 0%
$26,959.80 $28,999.25

$134,799.00 $144,996.25



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

5 Filterline Set, Adult/Pediatric
5a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0520-01 Withdrawn 

# of Cases (25 each/Case) 125
Price per Case: $390.49 No Bid $426.94
Extended Price: $48,811.25 $53,367.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $48,811.25 $53,367.50
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

244.99%

Price differential $34,662.50
5 Year Total $244,056.25 $266,837.50

5b. Medtronic - Part # MVAI
# of Cases (25 each/Case) 125
Price per Case: No Bid $140.25 $252.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $17,531.25 $31,500.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $17,180.63 $31,500.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

122.63%

Price differential $17,351.25
5 Year Total $85,903.13 $157,500.00

5c. Masimo - Part # 4454
# of Cases (25 each/Case) 125
Price per Case: No Bid $115.50 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price: $14,437.50
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $14,148.75
5 Year Total $70,743.75



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

5 Filterline Set, Adult/Pediatric
5a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0520-01

# of Cases (25 each/Case) 125
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

5b. Medtronic - Part # MVAI
# of Cases (25 each/Case) 125
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

5c. Masimo - Part # 4454
# of Cases (25 each/Case) 125
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

Zoll 8300-000208
No Bid No Bid $335.30

$41,912.50
0%

$41,912.50

$209,562.50

$158.25 No Bid No Bid
$19,781.25

2%
$19,385.63

$96,928.13

No Bid $128.57 No Bid
$16,071.25

0%
$16,071.25
$80,356.25



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

6 Blood Pressure Cuff Large Adult
6a. Zoll - Part # SOFT-12-2MQ Withdrawn 

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 100
Price per Case: $202.99 No Bid $228.56
Extended Price: $20,299.00 $22,856.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $20,299.00 $22,856.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

164.33%

Price differential $12,619.72
5 Year Total $101,495.00 $114,280.00

6b. Welch Allyn - Part # SOFT-12-2MQ
# of Cases (20 each/Case) 100
Price per Case: No Bid $78.36 $130.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $7,836.00 $13,000.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $7,679.28 $13,000.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

69.29%

Price differential $5,320.72
5 Year Total $38,396.40 $65,000.00

7 Patient Sensor Pediatric Rainbow
7a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000863 100 Withdrawn 

Price per Each: $920.38 No Bid $976.06
Extended Price: $92,038.00 $97,606.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $92,038.00 $97,606.00
5 Year Total $460,190.00 $488,030.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

6 Blood Pressure Cuff Large Adult
6a. Zoll - Part # SOFT-12-2MQ

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 100
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

6b. Welch Allyn - Part # SOFT-12-2MQ
# of Cases (20 each/Case) 100
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

7 Patient Sensor Pediatric Rainbow
7a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000863 100

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid $174.30
$17,430.00

0%
$17,430.00

$17,430.00
$87,150.00

$83.80 $94.63 No Bid
$8,380.00 $9,463.00

2% 0%
$8,212.40 $9,463.00

$41,062.00 $47,315.00

No Bid No Bid $790.30
$79,030.00

0%
$79,030.00

$395,150.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

7b. Masimo - Part # 4068 100 $472.50
Price per Each: No Bid $495.00 $47,250.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $49,500.00 0%
Prompt Payment Discount 2% $47,250.00
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $48,510.00 $47,250.00
5 Year Total $242,550.00 $236,250.00

8 Dual Lumen NIBP 10' Hose Propaq MD
8a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0002-01 50

Price per Each: $128.57 $159.02 No Bid $136.85
Extended Price: $6,428.50 $7,951.00 $6,842.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $6,428.50 $7,791.98 $6,842.50
5 Year Total $32,142.50 $38,959.90 $34,212.50

9 Blood Pressure Cuff Child 2 tube
9a. Zoll - Part # SOFT-09-2MQ Withdrawn 

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 50
Price per Case: $183.79 No Bid $206.14
Extended Price: $9,189.50 $10,307.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $9,189.50 $10,307.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

217.87%

Price differential $6,298.50
5 Year Total $45,947.50 $51,535.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

7b. Masimo - Part # 4068 100
Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

8 Dual Lumen NIBP 10' Hose Propaq MD
8a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0002-01 50

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

9 Blood Pressure Cuff Child 2 tube
9a. Zoll - Part # SOFT-09-2MQ

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 50
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

$543.38 $5.14 No Bid
$54,338.00 $514.00

2% 0%
$53,251.24 $514.00

$266,256.20 $2,570.00

$134.62 $165.94 $109.20
$6,731.00 $8,297.00 $5,460.00

2% 0%
$6,596.38 $8,297.00 $5,460.00

$41,485.00 $27,300.00

No Bid No Bid $156.10
$7,805.00

0%
$7,805.00

$39,025.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

9b. Welch Allyn - Part # Soft-09-2MQ
# of Cases (20 each/Case) 50
Price per Case: No Bid $59.00 $96.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $2,950.00 $4,800.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $2,891.00 $4,800.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

66.03%

Price differential $1,909.00
5 Year Total $14,455.00 $24,000.00

10 Disposal BP Cuff - Soft Infant - 2-tube
10a. Zoll - Part # SOFT-07-2MQ Withdrawn 

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 25
Price per Case: $183.79 No Bid $206.14
Extended Price: $4,594.75 $5,153.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $4,594.75 $0.00 $5,153.50
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

159.57%

Price differential $2,824.63
5 Year Total $22,973.75 $25,767.50



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

9b. Welch Allyn - Part # Soft-09-2MQ
# of Cases (20 each/Case) 50
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

10 Disposal BP Cuff - Soft Infant - 2-tube
10a. Zoll - Part # SOFT-07-2MQ

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 25
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

$70.00 $71.09 No Bid
$3,500.00 $3,554.50

2% 0%
$3,430.00 $3,554.50

$17,150.00 $17,772.50

No Bid No Bid $156.10
$3,902.50

0%
$3,902.50

$19,512.50



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

10b. Welch Allyn - Part # SOFT-07-2MQ
# of Cases (20 each/Case) 25
Price per Case: No Bid $72.25 $96.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $1,806.25 $2,400.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $1,770.13 $2,400.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

35.58%

Price differential $629.88
5 Year Total $8,850.63 $12,000.00

11 Neonatal BP Cuff Kit (Size 1-5)
11a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0797-01 15 Withdrawn 

Price per Each: $28.85 No Bid $32.49
Extended Price: $432.75 $487.35
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $432.75 $487.35
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

28.83%

Price differential $96.86
5 Year Total $2,163.75 $2,436.75

11b. Welch Allyn - Part # 5082-241-9 15
Price per Each: No Bid $22.85 $28.45 No Bid
Extended Price: $342.75 $426.75
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $335.90 $426.75
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

27.05%

Price differential $90.86
5 Year Total $1,679.48 $2,133.75



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

10b. Welch Allyn - Part # SOFT-07-2MQ
# of Cases (20 each/Case) 25
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

11 Neonatal BP Cuff Kit (Size 1-5)
11a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0797-01 15

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

11b. Welch Allyn - Part # 5082-241-9 15
Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

$64.40 $99.66 No Bid
$1,610.00 $2,491.50

2% 0%
$1,577.80 $2,491.50

$12,457.50

No Bid No Bid $24.50
$367.50

0%
$367.50

$1,837.50

$23.40 $6.43 No Bid
$351.00 $96.45

2% 0%
$343.98 $96.45

$482.25



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

12 Blood Pressure Cuff Thigh
12a. Zoll - Part # SOFT-13-2MQ Withdrawn 

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 3
Price per Case: $278.57 No Bid $305.33
Extended Price: $835.71 $915.99
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $835.71 $915.99
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

172.80%

Price differential $529.36
5 Year Total $4,178.55 $4,579.95

12b. Welch Allyn - Part # SOFT-13-2MQ
# of Cases (20 each/Case) 3
Price per Case: No Bid $104.20 $173.00 No Bid
Extended Price: $312.60 $519.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $306.35 $519.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

69.42%

Price differential $212.65
5 Year Total $1,531.74 $2,595.00

13 X-Series Carry Case Premium
13a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000393-01 10

Price per Each: $730.22 $995.00 No Bid $766.48
Extended Price: $7,302.20 $9,950.00 $7,664.80
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $7,302.20 $9,751.00 $7,664.80
5 Year Total $36,511.00 $48,755.00 $38,324.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

12 Blood Pressure Cuff Thigh
12a. Zoll - Part # SOFT-13-2MQ

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 3
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

12b. Welch Allyn - Part # SOFT-13-2MQ
# of Cases (20 each/Case) 3
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

13 X-Series Carry Case Premium
13a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000393-01 10

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

No Bid $125.49 $236.60
$376.47 $709.80

0% 0%
$376.47 $709.80

$1,882.35 $3,549.00

$118.00 No Bid No Bid
$354.00

2%
$346.92

$1,734.60

$785.15 $1,434.78 $620.20
$7,851.50 $14,347.80 $6,202.00

2% 0% 0%
$7,694.47 $14,347.80 $6,202.00

$38,472.35 $71,739.00 $31,010.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

14 Accuvent Flowtube
14a. Zoll - Part # 8000-001128

# of Boxes (10 each/Box) 5
Price per Box: $656.87 $705.00 No Bid $701.21
Extended Price: $3,284.35 $3,525.00 $3,506.05
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $3,284.35 $3,454.50 $3,506.05
5 Year Total $16,421.75 $17,272.50 $17,530.25

15 Cable Assembly Flow Sensor Cntr Accuvent
15a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000993 5

Price per Each: $332.14 $463.45 No Bid $361.39
Extended Price: $1,660.70 $2,317.25 $1,806.95
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $1,660.70 $2,270.91 $1,806.95
5 Year Total $8,303.50 $11,354.53 $9,034.75

16 ECG Plain White Paper - 80mm
16a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000901

# of Boxes (6 each/Box) 450
Price per Box: $26.37 No Bid No Bid $34.50
Extended Price: $11,866.50 $15,525.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $11,866.50 $15,525.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

86.86%

Price differential $5,516.10
5 Year Total $59,332.50 $77,625.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

14 Accuvent Flowtube
14a. Zoll - Part # 8000-001128

# of Boxes (10 each/Box) 5
Price per Box:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

15 Cable Assembly Flow Sensor Cntr Accuvent
15a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000993 5

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

16 ECG Plain White Paper - 80mm
16a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000901

# of Boxes (6 each/Box) 450
Price per Box:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

$688.38 $969.21 $557.90
$3,441.90 $4,846.05 $2,789.50

2% 0% 0%
$3,373.06 $4,846.05 $2,789.50

$16,865.31 $24,230.25 $13,947.50

$348.46 No Bid $282.10
$1,742.30 $1,410.50

2% 0%
$1,707.45 $1,410.50
$8,537.27 $7,052.50

Zoll 8000-000875-01
No Bid No Bid $22.40

$10,080.00
0%

$10,080.00

$10,080.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

16b. ECG Plain White Paper - 80mm or approved equal 
Vendor Name:
Vendor Part Number: Leonhard Lang 

USA Part # 17437

# of Boxes (6 each/Box) 450 5/PK X 540PKs
Price per Box: No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid
Quantity per Box: 5
Price per each: $2.40
Extended Price: $6,480.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $6,350.40
5 Year Total $31,752.00

17 X-Series Carry Case
17a. Zoll - Part # 8707-000502-01 20

Price per Each: $540.49 $727.00 No Bid $585.64
Extended Price: $10,809.80 $14,540.00 $11,712.80
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $10,809.80 $14,249.20 $11,712.80
5 Year Total $54,049.00 $71,246.00 $58,564.00

18 12 Lead One Step ECG Cable
18a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0802-01 30

Price per Each: $348.63 $412.43 No Bid $371.74
Extended Price: $10,458.90 $12,372.90 $11,152.20
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $10,458.90 $12,125.44 $11,152.20
5 Year Total $52,294.50 $60,627.21 $55,761.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

16b. ECG Plain White Paper - 80mm or approved equal 
Vendor Name:
Vendor Part Number:

# of Boxes (6 each/Box) 450
Price per Box:
Quantity per Box:
Price per each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

17 X-Series Carry Case
17a. Zoll - Part # 8707-000502-01 20

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

18 12 Lead One Step ECG Cable
18a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0802-01 30

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

ASP Global

ASP Global BTM 
#2745-10080, 

Masterfit Part# 
000875-01

75rol/container 6/Box
$13.08 $24.31 No Bid

75
$0.17

$470.88 $10,939.50
2% 0%

$461.46 $10,939.50
$2,307.31 $54,697.50

$562.50 $280.00 $464.10
$11,250.00 $5,600.00 $9,282.00

2% 0% 0%
$11,025.00 $5,600.00 $9,282.00
$55,125.00 $28,000.00 $46,410.00

$358.79 $582.38 $296.10
$10,763.70 $17,471.40 $8,883.00

2% 0% 0%
$10,548.43 $17,471.40 $8,883.00
$52,742.13 $87,357.00 $44,415.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

19 Limb Lead ECG Cable (4 Lead)
19a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0803-01 30

Price per Each: $160.71 $205.00 No Bid $175.09
Extended Price: $4,821.30 $6,150.00 $5,252.70
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $4,821.30 $6,027.00
5 Year Total $24,106.50 $30,135.00 $26,263.50

20 V Lead ECG Cable
20a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0804-01 30

Price per Each: $187.91 $232.00 No Bid $203.55
Extended Price: $5,637.30 $6,960.00 $6,106.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $5,637.30 $6,820.80 $6,106.50
5 Year Total $28,186.50 $34,104.00 $30,532.50

21 Multifunction Therapy Cable
21a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0783-01 30

Price per Each: $329.67 $385.00 No Bid $351.90
Extended Price: $9,890.10 $11,550.00 $10,557.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $9,890.10 $11,319.00 $10,557.00
5 Year Total $49,450.50 $56,595.00 $52,785.00

22 CPR Connector
22a. Zoll - Part # 8000-0370 30

Price per Each: $248.63 $345.00 No Bid $313.09
Extended Price: $7,458.90 $10,350.00 $9,392.70
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $7,458.90 $10,143.00 $9,392.70
5 Year Total $37,294.50 $50,715.00 $46,963.50



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

19 Limb Lead ECG Cable (4 Lead)
19a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0803-01 30

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

20 V Lead ECG Cable
20a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0804-01 30

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

21 Multifunction Therapy Cable
21a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0783-01 30

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

22 CPR Connector
22a. Zoll - Part # 8000-0370 30

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

$167.62 $208.00 $136.50
$5,028.60 $6,240.00 $4,095.00

2% 0% 0%
$4,928.03 $6,240.00 $4,095.00

$24,640.14 $31,200.00 $20,475.00

$192.44 $308.11 $159.60
$5,773.20 $9,243.30 $4,788.00

2% 0% 0%
$5,657.74 $9,243.30 $4,788.00

$28,288.68 $46,216.50 $23,940.00

$338.02 $295.03 $280.00
$10,140.60 $8,850.90 $8,400.00

2% 0% 0%
$9,937.79 $8,850.90 $8,400.00

$49,688.94 $44,254.50 $42,000.00

$298.90 $488.67 $248.50
$8,967.00 $14,660.10 $7,455.00

2% 0% 0%
$8,787.66 $14,660.10 $7,455.00

$43,938.30 $73,300.50 $37,275.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

23 AC Power Adapter
23a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0004 10

Price per Each: $476.37 $664.70 No Bid $505.43
Extended Price: $4,763.70 $6,647.00 $5,054.30
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $4,763.70 $6,514.06 $5,054.30
5 Year Total $23,818.50 $32,570.30 $25,271.50

24 US Power Cord
24a. Zoll - Part # 8000-0100 10

Price per Each: $67.50 $85.00 No Bid $76.77
Extended Price: $675.00 $850.00 $767.70
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $675.00 $833.00 $767.70
5 Year Total $3,375.00 $4,165.00 $3,838.50

25 X-Series Power Extension Cable
25a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000903-01 10

Price per Each: $123.63 $155.00 No Bid $136.28
Extended Price: $1,236.30 $1,550.00 $1,362.80
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $1,236.30 $1,519.00 $1,362.80
5 Year Total $6,181.50 $7,595.00 $6,814.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

23 AC Power Adapter
23a. Zoll - Part # 8300-0004 10

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

24 US Power Cord
24a. Zoll - Part # 8000-0100 10

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

25 X-Series Power Extension Cable
25a. Zoll - Part # 8000-000903-01 10

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

$489.50 $797.15 $404.60
$4,895.00 $7,971.50 $4,046.00

2% 0% 0%
$4,797.10 $7,971.50 $4,046.00

$23,985.50 $39,857.50 $20,230.00

$69.60 $97.94 $56.70
$696.00 $979.40 $567.00

2% 0% 0%
$682.08 $979.40 $567.00

$3,410.40 $4,897.00 $2,835.00

$129.18 $206.14 $105.00
$1,291.80 $2,061.40 $1,050.00

2% 0% 0%
$1,265.96 $2,061.40 $1,050.00
$6,329.82 $10,307.00 $5,250.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

26 CPR STAT PADZ HVP MULTI-FUNCTION - Intentory 
Item 

26a. Zoll - Part # 8900-0402 2,000
Price per Each: $92.19 $77.00 No Bid $290.25
Extended Price: $184,380.00 $154,000.00 $580,500.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $184,380.00 $150,920.00 $580,500.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

22.17%

Price differential $33,460.00
5 Year Total $921,900.00 $754,600.00 $2,902,500.00

27 Pedi Padz II
27a. Zoll - Part # 8900-0810-01 400

Price per Each: $123.63 $123.75 No Bid $136.28
Extended Price: $49,452.00 $49,500.00 $54,512.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $49,452.00 $48,510.00 $54,512.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

1.94%

Price differential $942.00
Local Preference Award $49,452.00
5 Year Total $247,260.00 $242,550.00 $272,560.00

28 AED Pro ECG Cable AAMI
28a. Zoll - Part # 8000-0838 5

Price per Each: $168.13 $175.00 No Bid $189.75
Extended Price: $840.65 $875.00 $948.75
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $840.65 $857.50 $948.75
5 Year Total $4,203.25 $4,287.50 $4,743.75



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

26 CPR STAT PADZ HVP MULTI-FUNCTION - Intentory 
Item 

26a. Zoll - Part # 8900-0402 2,000
Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
5 Year Total

27 Pedi Padz II
27a. Zoll - Part # 8900-0810-01 400

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
Local Preference Award
5 Year Total

28 AED Pro ECG Cable AAMI
28a. Zoll - Part # 8000-0838 5

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

$79.69 $81.09 $79.10
$159,380.00 $162,180.00 $158,200.00

2% 0% 0%
$156,192.40 $162,180.00 $158,200.00

$780,962.00 $810,900.00 $791,000.00

$102.60 $101.71 $105.00
$41,040.00 $40,684.00 $42,000.00

2% 0% 0%
$40,219.20 $40,684.00 $42,000.00

$201,096.00 $203,420.00 $210,000.00

$174.39 $166.78 $142.80
$871.95 $833.90 $714.00

2% 0% 0%
$854.51 $833.90 $714.00

$4,272.56 $4,169.50 $3,570.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

29 AED Pro Soft Carry Case
29a. Zoll - Part # 8000-0810-01 5

Price per Each: $110.44 $120.60 No Bid $132.83
Extended Price: $552.20 $603.00 $664.15
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $552.20 $590.94 $664.15
5 Year Total $2,761.00 $2,954.70 $3,320.75

30 Suction Cup for ACD-CPR Device
30a. Zoll - Part # 12-0586-000 10

Price per Each: $60.44 $65.00 No Bid $80.50
Extended Price: $604.40 $650.00 $805.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $604.40 $637.00 $805.00
5 Year Total $3,022.00 $3,185.00 $4,025.00

31 ResQCPR Carrying Case
31a. Zoll - Part # 12-0935-000 10

Price per Each: $89.01 $96.25 No Bid $110.40
Extended Price: $890.10 $962.50 $1,104.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $890.10 $943.25 $1,104.00
5 Year Total $4,450.50 $4,716.25 $5,520.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

29 AED Pro Soft Carry Case
29a. Zoll - Part # 8000-0810-01 5

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

30 Suction Cup for ACD-CPR Device
30a. Zoll - Part # 12-0586-000 10

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

31 ResQCPR Carrying Case
31a. Zoll - Part # 12-0935-000 10

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

$113.49 $102.00 $93.80
$567.45 $510.00 $469.00

2% 0% 0%
$556.10 $510.00 $469.00

$2,780.51 $2,550.00 $2,345.00

No Bid $59.43 $38.50
$594.30 $385.00

0% 0%
$594.30 $385.00

$2,971.50 $1,925.00

No Bid No Bid $56.70
$567.00

0%
$567.00

$2,835.00



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

32 Adult Disposable Circuit AEV – 6 foot
32a. Zoll - Part # 820-0106-15

# of Cases (15 each/Case) 20
Price per Case: $246.43 $250.00 No Bid $271.69
Extended Price: $4,928.60 $5,000.00 $5,433.80
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $4,928.60 $4,900.00 $5,433.80
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

0.58%

Price differential $28.60
Local Preference Award $4,928.60
5 Year Total $24,643.00 $24,500.00 $27,169.00

33 Infant Disposable Circuit AEV - 6 foot
33a. Zoll - Part # 820-0107-20

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 10
Price per Case: $371.70 $368.92 No Bid $402.79
Extended Price: $3,717.00 $3,689.20 $4,027.90
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $3,717.00 $3,615.42 $4,027.90
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:

2.81%

Price differential $101.58
Local Preference Award $3,717.00
5 Year Total $18,585.00 $18,077.08 $20,139.50



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

32 Adult Disposable Circuit AEV – 6 foot
32a. Zoll - Part # 820-0106-15

# of Cases (15 each/Case) 20
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
Local Preference Award
5 Year Total

33 Infant Disposable Circuit AEV - 6 foot
33a. Zoll - Part # 820-0107-20

# of Cases (20 each/Case) 10
Price per Case:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local 
bid:
Price differential 
Local Preference Award
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

No Bid $313.14 No Bid
$6,262.80

0%
$6,262.80

$31,314.00

No Bid $789.35 No Bid
$7,893.50

0%
$7,893.50

$7,893.50



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

34 Ventilator Test Lung
34a. Zoll - Part # 820-0132-00 10

Price per Each: $182.97 $255.00 No Bid $205.28
Extended Price: $1,829.70 $2,550.00 $2,052.80
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $1,829.70 $2,499.00 $2,052.80
5 Year Total $9,148.50 $12,495.00 $10,264.00

34b. or approved equal Vendor Name:
Vendor Part Number:
# of Boxes (6 each/Box) 10
Price per Box: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

35 Ventilator Carry Case
35a. Zoll - Part # 703-0731-17 5

Price per Each: $421.15 $565.00 No Bid $457.99
Extended Price: $2,105.75 $2,825.00 $2,289.95
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2% 0%
Price with Prompt Payment Discount $2,105.75 $2,768.50 $2,289.95
5 Year Total $10,528.75 $13,842.50 $11,449.75



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

34 Ventilator Test Lung
34a. Zoll - Part # 820-0132-00 10

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

34b. or approved equal Vendor Name:
Vendor Part Number:
# of Boxes (6 each/Box) 10
Price per Box:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

35 Ventilator Carry Case
35a. Zoll - Part # 703-0731-17 5

Price per Each:
Extended Price:
Prompt Payment Discount
Price with Prompt Payment Discount
5 Year Total

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$19.54 No Bid No Bid
$195.40

2%
$191.49
$957.46

No Bid No Bid No Bid



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
Opened: July 26, 2024 B&E Medical 

Supply
Life Assist Inc. Medwheels, Inc. Con10gency 

Consulting LLC
For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories" 7003 Brookport 11277 Sunrise 

Park Drive
1322 E. Houston 
St.

17170 Jordan Rd., 
Ste 404

MM

San Antonio, TX  
78238

Rancho Cordova, 
CA  95757

San Antonio, TX  
78205

Selma, TX  78154

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

210-731-8390 1-800-824-6016 1-210-533-9457
6100015684

Total of all line items submitted $1,453,398.11 $594,732.95 $668,159.50 $3,555,306.19

Subtotal of items recommended for award $139,347.45 $433,365.10 $183,513.75 $0.00
Payment Terms: Net 30 2%, Net 10 Net 30 Net 30
Prompt Payment Discount: 0% 2% 0% 0%
Total with Prompt Payment Discount $139,347.45 $424,697.80 $183,513.75 $0.00

Estimated Annual Total: $139,347.45 $433,365.10 $183,513.75 $0.00
Estimated Annual Award: $139,347.45 $433,365.10 $183,513.75



City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 26, 2024

For: AC for Zoll Defibrillator "X-Series 12 Lead Accessories"

MM

Item Description
Estimated

Annual 
Quantity

6100015684

Total of all line items submitted

Subtotal of items recommended for award
Payment Terms:
Prompt Payment Discount:
Total with Prompt Payment Discount

Estimated Annual Total:
Estimated Annual Award:

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Bound Tree 
Medical LLC

Quad Med Inc. Zoll Medical 
Corporation

5000 Tuttle 
Crossing Blvd.

11210-1 Phillips 
Industrial Blvd E

269 Mill Road

Dublin, OH  43016 Jacksonville, FL  
32256

Chelmsford, MA  
01824

NAS NAS NAS

$928,404.53 $782,046.87 $1,241,284.80

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2%, Net 20 Net 30 Net 30

2% 0% 0%
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00


	Rev. 1 Final All Bidders

