City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2025 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Specialty Ammunition for  |Kiesler Police Supply Inc. Dana Safety Supply, Inc. CMC Government Services Inc  |GT Distributors, Inc.
San Antonio Police Department 5405 Bandera Rd Ste 101 8154 Bracken Creek Drive  |5200 Keller Springs Rd Ste 522 (1124 New Meister LN Ste 100
6100018866 RZ San Antonio, TX 78238-1949 San Antonio, TX 78266 Dallas, TX 75248 Pflugerville, TX 78660
Item Description Quantity |812-288-5740
1 Speer Gold Dot Rifle 223 17,000
REM 75 Grain Soft Point.
Part # 24475 Rounds
Rounds Per Case 500 1000
Unit Price $313.60 No Bid No Bid $646.28
Total Price $10,662.40 $10,986.76
2 Federal American Eagle 223 80,000
REM 75 grain
Part # AE223T75 Rounds
Rounds Per Case 500 1000
Unit Price $253.08 No Bid No Bid $489.80
Total Price $40,492.80 $39,184.00
3 Federal Tactical TRU 380 10,000
WIN 168 Grain
Part# T308T Rounds
Rounds Per Case 500 1000
Unit Price $572.00 No Bid No Bid $1,179.14
Total Price $11,440.00 $11,791.40
4 CTS 9 Flashbang 24
Part# 7290-9 Each
Unit Price $149.49 $154.50 $170.31 No Bid
Total Price $3,587.76 $3,708.00 $4,087.44
5 Shipping 1
Unit Price Each $0.00 $180.00 $180.00 $0.00
Total Price $0.00 $180.00 $180.00 $0.00
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total $66,182.96 $3,888.00 $4,267.44 $61,962.16
Total Award $66,182.96 Incomplete Incomplete Incomplete
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