
CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
INTERDEPARTMENTAL MEMORANDUM 

PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMQ’?E: ?t a p T r3!? 
~~~&&-;‘&j 

TO: Mayor and City Council 
I;TE,$ /&/* 

in ~~~.jy 

FROM: Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services 

THROUGH: Terry M. Brechtel, City Manager 

COPIES: Travis M. Bishop, Assistant City Manager; 
Martin Rodriguez, Director of Code Compliance; 
Dennis Campa, Director of Community Initiatives; 
Edward Garcia, Director of Convention Facilities; 
Florencio Pena, Director of Development Services; 
Daniel Cardenas, Director of Environmental Services; 
Robert Ojeda, Fire Chief; Dr. Fernando Guerra, Director of Health; 
Gary Moeller, Director of Information Technology; 
Albert Ortiz, Police Chief; Malcolm Matthews, Director of Parks & 
Recreation; Thomas Wendorf, Director of Public Works; 
File; 

SUBJECT: Light Duty Trucks 

DATE: April 3,2003 

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION: 
This ordinance authorizes the Purchasing & General Services Department to purchase light duty 
trucks for various City of San Antonio departments. Staff recommends approval of this 
ordinance. 

BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 
The attached tabulation of thirteen bids to provide the City of San Antonio Code Compliance, 
Community Initiatives, Convention Facilities, Development Services, Environmental Services, 
Fire, Health, Public Works, Parks & Recreation, Police, Purchasing & General Services, and 
Information Technology Services Departments with light duty trucks is hereby submitted for 
council consideration and action. The bid submitted by Southway Ford, Item 2, failed to meet 
City specifications. Maxwell Auto Group, Bid No. 1, Item 3E and Philpott Motors, Inc., Bid No. 
1, Item 6D withdrew their bids. 

The low qualified bids were submitted by Lawrence Marshall Chevrolet II, L.P., Items lA, 2D, 
3C, 3F, 3G, 4A, 5A, 5B, 7A and 7B; Southway Ford, Items 2A, 2B, 41, 5C, 6A and 6B; 
Northside Ford, Items lB, 2C, 2F, 3A, 3B, 3D, 3H, 3L, 4B, 4D,4H and 6D; Philpott Motors, Inc. 
(Bid #l), Items 4C, 4F, 4K, 6C and 8; Red McCombs Dodge, Items 3E, 31 and 4E; Lawrence 
Marshall Ford-Mercury, L.P., Items 2E, 3K and 4G; Cavender-Chevrolet, Item 45; Maxwell Auto 
Group, (Bid #2), Item 3J. 



Page 2 - Memo to Council 
Light Duty Trucks 

This contract will provide 172 replacement vehicles in accordance with the City’s Vehicle 
Replacement Program. Vehicles which have acquired 72,000 miles or are 10 years old become 
eligible for replacement. An additional 31 new vehicles will be purchased, as approved by the 
2003 budget. In continuation of the City’s commitment to a cleaner environment, all diesel 
engine vehicles purchased under this contract are certified to be low emission. This contract 
provides for additional purchases during the 2003 fiscal year as funding becomes available. 

The City of San Antonio Purchasing Department advertises bids in the Daily Commercial 
Recorder, La Prensa, The San Antonio Observer and the San Antonio Express-News. This office 
also advertises bids on Public Access Channel 21, the Purchasing Website and utilizes the 
services of Demandstar.com to notify registered vendors of City bids. 

POLICY ANALYSIS: 
This contract will provide 203 light duty trucks in various configurations to include pickup 
trucks, sport utility vehicles, cab and chassis, cargo vans, passenger vans, etc. These vehicles 
will be utilized by various departments for routine administrative and field work. 

FINANCIAL IMPACT: 
The total cost of this contract is $3,509,095.62. of which $88,190 will be paid through a lease 
purchase contract with Bane of America that was passed and approved by Ordinance No. 97083 
dated January 23, 2003. The balance will be funded through the General Fund, Grants in Aid 
Trust Fund, Miscellaneous Special Revenue, Airport Fund, Equipment Renewal & Replacement 
Fund, Building Maintenance Fund. All expenditures will be in accordance with the FY02-03 
Budget approved by City Council. 

COORDINATION 
This ordinance has been coordinated with the City of San Antonio Code Compliance, 
Community Initiatives, Convention Facilities, Development Services, Environmental Services, 
Fire, Health, Public Works, Parks & Recreation, Police, Purchasing & General Services, and 
Information Technology Services Departments. 

- I / 
Travis M. Bishop, Assistant Ci& anager 
City Manager’s Office 



$med: March 07,2W3 

01: Light Duty Truck; 

tern D~SC~lptlOll 

1 Compact Pick Up Trucks 
A 24 Each - Extended Cab 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

6 2 Each. Extended Cab, Four Wheel Drive 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

2 l/2 Ton Trucks 
A 30 Each - Long Wheel Base 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

B 1 Each -Shari Wheel Base 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

C 6 Each. Extended Cab, Long Wheel Base 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

D 3 Each - Extended Cab, Short Bed 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

E 2 Each - Exlended Cab, Power Windows 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

F 1 Each. Extended Cab, Rear Seat 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

3 3/4 Ton Trucks 
A 6 Each - Exlended Cab. Lono Wheel Base 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

wmzrvx Marsha 
hevrolel II, L.P. 

0 Box 983 

empstead 
K 77445 

$12,097.0 
$290,328.0 

Chevrolc 
cs1065 

$15,181.0 
$30,362.0 

Chevrolr 
CT1065 

No Bi 

$11,886.0 
Chevrok 
cc1570 

No Bi d 

$14,327.0 
$42,981.0 

ChewoIl 
cc1575 

$16,459 0 
$32,918.0 

Chevrolf 
cc1575 

3 0 

0 
0 
?t 
3 

0 
?I 
3 

0 
0 
?I 
L 

$14.880.0 
Chewok 
cc1575 

$16,997 0 
$101,982.0 

Chevroll 
cc2595 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Bid #I Bid #2 
outhway Ford Northside Ford Philpott Motors, Red McCombs Lawrence Marshall Cavender- Maxwell Auto 

IRC. Dodge Ford-Mercury. L P. Chevrolet Group 

979 IH 35 South 9800 San Pedro PO Box 876 13663 IH 10 West PO Box 983 30700 IH 10 West PO Box 5096 

an Antonio San Antonio Port Neches San Antonlo Hempstead Boeme Round Reek 
X 78224 TX 78216 TX 77651 TX 78249 TX 77445 TX 78006 TX 78683 

$15,472.00 $12,792.00 $13,958 00 
$371.328.00 $307,008.00 $334,992 00 

Ford Ford Ford 
Ranger RI4 Ranger 

$17,950.00 $18,119.00 
$538,500.00 $543,570.00 

Ford FOKJ 
F150 F150 

$11,911.00 $11,906.00 
Ford Ford 
Fl50 Fl50 

$19,930.00 
$119,5&70.00 

Ford 
Fl5q 

$20,075.00 
$120,450.00 

Ford 
Fl50 

$17,153.00 $17,020.00 $17.277.00 
$51,459.00 $51,060.00 $51,831 .oo 

Ford Ford Ford 
Fl50 Fl50 Fl50 

NAS 
$14,589.00 
$29,178.00 

Ford 
Fl50 

$16,720.00 514,858.OO 
$33,440.00 $29.716.00 

Ford Ford 
Fl50 Fl50 

$13,995.0 
For 

F15 

$16,874.0 
$101,244.0 

$12.442 001 No Bid/ $12.323 951 
$298,608.00 $295,774.80 

Dodge Chevrolet 
Dakota CSlO653 

$15,415.00 $15,259.00 $15,259.00 
$30,830.00 $30,518.00 $30,518.00 

Ford Dodge Dodge 
Ranger Dakota Dakota 

No Bid No Bid $16,029.42 $14,399.0 
$32,058.84 528,798.O 

Chevrolet Dodg 
CT10653 Dakot 

No Bid No Bid 

$14,603.00 $14,603.00 
Dodae Dodge 

1500 

$18,146.00 $18,146.00 
5544,380.OfJ 5544,380.OfJ 

Ford Ford 
Fl50 Fl50 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bi 

$12,529.35 
Chevrolet 
cc1 5703 

No Bid $20,117.00 
$120,702 00 

Ford 
Fl50 

No Bid No Ei 

No Bid No Bid $15,299 25 
$45897.75 

Chevrolet 
cc15753 

$17,659.00 
$35,318.00 

Dodge 
1500 

$16,046.25 
$32,092.50 

Chevrolet 
cc15753 

$14.206.00 $16,133.00 $14,142.00 515349.25 
Ford Dodge Ford Chevrolet 
Fl50 1500 Fl50 cc1 5753 

$17,122 00 $17,447.00 $17,023.00 $17,485 45 
5102,732 00 $104,682.00 $102.138,00 $104,912.70 

$12,549 0 
$301,176 0 

Dodg 
Dakol 

No Bi 

No BI 

No Bi 

No Bi 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/18/2003 

Ford Dodge Ford Chevrolet 
F250 2500 F250 cc25953 

‘0 
0 
e 
a 

d 

d 

d 

d 

d 

d 

irande Truck 
:enter 

0 Box 201210 

an Antonio 
X 78220 

No Bi 

No Bi 

518,494.Ol 
$554.820.M 

For, 
Fl5r 

$20,417.01 
$122,502.M 

For1 
F15 

$15,321.01 
$45963.0 

FOi 
F15 

$15,173.0 
$30,346.01 

For, 
Fl51 

$14.424.0 
For 

F15 

$17,449.0 
$104.694.0 

For 
F25 

Page 1 



pened: March 07,2003 

31: Light Duty Trucks 

I344 PR/rm 

tern Description 

8 1 Each. Extended Cab, Long Bed 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

C 22 Each. Regular Cab, Long Bed 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

D 5 Each . Regular Cab, Four Wheel Drive 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

E 5 Each - Extended Cab, Four Wheel Drive 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

F 2 Each. Extended Cab, Forward Mount Seat Rails 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

G 1 Each. Exlended Cab, School Bus Yellow 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

H 23 Each. 54’ Usable Cab to Axle 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

I 2 Each - Four Door Crew Cab 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

J 2 Each Four Door Crew Cab, Four Wheel Drive 
Pfice Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

c . 

Bid #l Bid #2 
~wrence Marshall Southway Ford Northside Ford Phiipott Motors. Red McCombs Lawrence Marshall Cavender- Maxwell Auto Grande Truck 
hew&t II, L.P. Inc. Dodge Ford-Mercury, L.P. Chevrolet Group Center 

0 Box 983 7979 IH 35 South 9800 San Pedro PO Box 876 13663 IH 10 West PO Box 983 30700 IH 10 West PO Box 5096 PO 80x201210 

empstead 
x 77445 

San Antonio 
TX 78224 

San Antonio 
TX 78216 

Port Neches 
TX 77651 

San Antonio 
TX 78249 

Hempstead 
TX 77445 

Elcerne 
TX 78006 

Round Rock 
TX 78683 

San Antonio 
TX 78220 

$17,440.00 
Chevrolet 
cc25953 

$19,546.00 
$97.730.00 

Chevrolet 
CK25953 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Ford 
F250 

Ford 
F250 

$22,408.00 
$44,816.00 

Ford 
F250 

$22,515.00 
$45,030.00 

Ford 
F250 

$22,424.00 
Ford 
F250 

$21,723.00 
Ford 
F250 

$17,225.00 
Ford 
F250 

No Bid 

$15,142 00 
$333,124.00 

Ford 
F250 

$15,464 00 
$340,208.00 

Dodge 
2500 

$17.699.00 
$88,495 00 

Ford 
F250 

$17,417.00 
$87,085.00 

Dodge 
2500 

$19,785.00 
$98.925.00 

Ford 
F250 

$19,682.00 
Ford 
F250 

No Bid 

514,695.OO $14,763.00 

$20,838 00 
541fx76.00 

Ford 

$19,447.00 
$3a,a94.00 

Dodge 

$17,326.00 $17,814.45 
Ford Chevrolet 
F250 cc25953 

515,043.oo 
$330,946.00 

Ford 
F250 

$15,104 45 
$332,297.90 

Chevrolet 
cc25903 

$17,600.00 
$88,000.00 

Ford 
F250 

$17,723 95 
$88,619.75 

Chevrolet 
CK25903 

519,687.OO 
$98,435.00 

Ford 
F250 

$20.109.32 
$100,546.60 

Chevrolet 
CK25953 

$20,014.00 
$40,028 00 

Ford 
F250 

$20.109.32 
540.218.64 

Chevrolet 
CK25953 

$19,562.00 
Ford 

F250 

520.709.32 
Chevrolet 
CK25953 

514,596.OO 
$335708.00 

Ford 
F250 

$15,079.95 
$346,838.85 

Chevrolet 
cc25903 

$18,188.00 
$36,376 00 

Ford 
F250 

$19,175.45 
$38.350.90 

Chevrolet 
cc25943 

$20,754 00 
541,508.OO 

Ford 

No Bid 

$16,049 00 
$353,078.00 

Dodge 
2500 

$17,514.00 
$87.570.00 

DOdQe 
2500 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

515.629.00 
$359,467.00 

Dodge 
2500 

$17,253.00 
$34.506.00 

Dodge 
2500 

F2501 F2501 F250( 25001 F250( 

Preoared bv Purchasina 3/18/2003 

S18,248.OC 
Fort 

F25( 

$15,464.0( 
$340,208.0( 

FOrC 
F25f 

$18,367.0( 
$91,835.0( 

FCVC 
F25C 

$20,353 oc 
$101.?650( 

Fort 
F25C 

$23.109.01 
$46,218.0( 

Fort 
F25C 

522,877.OC 
F0rc 

F25C 

$14,820.01 
$340,860.0( 

FOrC 
F25C 

$18,714.0( 
$37.428.0( 

For< 
F25C 

$21,517.0( 
$43,034.0( 

F0rt 
F25( 

Page 2 



pened: March 07,2003 

3,: Light Duty Trucks 

IQ44 PR/IKl 

tern DeSCrlptlOtl 
K 2 Each. Exiended Cab, Diesel 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

L 1 Each - Extended Cab, 4 X 4 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

4 One Ton Trucks 
A 4 Each. 84 Cab lo Axle 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

B 1 Each - 84 Cab to Axle, Diesel 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

C 4 Each - Four Door, Crew Cab 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

D 1 Each - 60’ Cab to Axle 
P&e Total 
Make 
Model 

E 2 Each. Four Door Crew Cab, Long Bed 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

F 2 Each - Four Door Crew Cab, Four Wheel Drive 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

G 1 Each - 60” Cab to Axis. 9’ Steel Platform 
Ptice Total 
Make 
Mddel 

awrence Marsh; 
hevrolet IIS L.P. 

ill s, outhway Ford 

0 Box 983 7I 

empstead s, 
x 77445 T: 

NOB id 

$20,247.C IO 
ChewoIl 91 
CK259:: >3 

$16,056.( 
$64,224.C 

Chevrol< 
CC364C 

NOB id 

NOB id 

NOB id 

No B id 

NOB id 

NO6 id 

e 

City of San Antonio Bid ‘Tabulation 

Northside Ford 
Bid #l Bid #2 

Philpotl Motors, Red McCombs Lawrence Marshall Cavender- Maxwell Auto 
Inc. Dodge Ford-Merculy, L.P. Chevrolet Group 

379IH35South /D8OOSa”Padro ~080x876 j13663lHlOWtii rOBox !3O7OOlHlOWeit ~Bax5096 

an Antonio San Antonio Port Neches San Antonio Hemps&ad Bwrlle Round Rock 
X 78224 TX 78216 TX 77651 TX 78249 TX 77445 TX 78006 TX 78683 

$21,415.00 
$42,830.00 

Ford 
F250 

$21,311.00 
$42,622.00 

Ford 
F250 

$21,608.00 
$43.216.00 

Ford 
F250 

$23,376.00 
$46.752.00 

Dodge 
2500 

$16,239.00 
$64,956.00 

Ford 
F350 

$16,191.00 
$64,764.00 

Ford 
F350 

$16.609.00 
$66,436.00 

Ford 
F350 

$20,255.00 
581,020 00 

Ford 
F350 

$19,805.00 
579,220.00 

Ford 
F350 

$24,306.00 
$48.612.00 

Ford 
F350 

$24.004.00 
$48,008.00 

Ford 
F350 

$27,241.00 
554,482.OO 

Ford 
F350 

$23,057.00 
$46,114.00 

Ford 
F350 

$20,873.00 
Dodge 

2500 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$22.926.00 
$91,704 00 

Dodge 
3500 

No Bid 

$19,962.00 
Ford 

F250 

$16,383.00 
$65,532.00 

Ford 
F350 

$20,869.00 
Ford 

F350 

$19,964.00 
$79,856 00 

Ford 
F350 

$25,973 00 
Ford 
F350 

$24,177.00 
$48,354.00 

Ford 
F350 

$23,331 .OO 
546,662.OO 

Ford 
F350 

$22,502.80 
$45,005.60 

Chevrolet 
CC25953 

$20,698.45 
Chevrolet 
CK25943 

516,388.28 
565,553.12 

Chevrolet 
CC36403 

521S26.38 
Chevrolet 
CC36403 

520,407.81 
581,631.24 

Chevrolet 
cc35943 

$27,945 25 
Chevrolet 
CK35943 

525,772.50 
$51,545.00 

Chevrolet 
Not Given 

$23,464.16 
546,928.32 

Chevrolet 
CK35943 

$23,522.33 
Chevrolet 
CC36003 

NOB 

No B 

No B 

NOB 

NOB 

No B 

No B 

No B 

NOB 

rande Truck 
enter 

0 Box201210 

an Antonio 
X 78220 

$21,829 O( 
$43.658 O( 

For< 
F2% 

$20,503.0( 
Fort 
F2% 

517,087.0( 
568,348.0( 

FOR 
F35( 

$21,373 O( 
I%< 

F35( 

$20,414 O( 
$81,656.0( 

Fort 
F35( 

526,534.0( 
For< 

F35( 

524.614.0( 
549.228.0( 

Fan 
F15( 

523,317.0( 
$46,634.0( 

Fan 
F35( 

$22,823.0( 
Fan 

F35( 



City of San Antonio Did Tabulation 

lpened: M<vch 07,2003 

31: Light Duty Trucks 

1.044 PR/r1il 

tern Description 
H I1 Each . 60’ Cab to Axle. 9’ Steel Plallorm. 3’ Stake Sides 

Price Total 
Make 
Model 

I 1 Each . Four Door Crew Cab, Diesel 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

J 2 Each. One Ton Wreckers 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

K 2 Each Four Wheel Drive, 9’ Steel Platfom? Diesel 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

5 Sport Utility Type Vehicles 
A 8 Each. Four Door, Four Wheel Drive 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

B 1 Each - Four Door, Four Wheel Drive, High Ground Clearance 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

C 4 Each. Four Door, Two Wheel Drive 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

6 Van Type Trucks 
A 7 Each. 15 Passenger 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

B 7 Each - Cargo, 2 Passenger 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

awrence Marsh; 
hevrolel II, L.P. 

0 Box 983 

empstead 
x 77445 

$19.03l.C 
Chevrol, 
CC360( 

NOB id 

$36,987.C IO 
$73,974.C IO 

Chevrols et 
CC36OC 13 

NOB id 

518,661.C 
$149,288.C 

Chevrol, 
CTlO5( 

$18,847.( 
Chevrol 
CT1 05( 

NOB Id’ 

No B Id 

No B ,d 

& 

Bld #l 
oulhway Ford NorthsIde Ford Philpot! Motors, Red McCombs 

Inc Dodge 

379 IH 35 South 9800 San Pedro PO Dox 876 13663 It-1 10 Wesl 

an Anlonio 
X 78224 

San Antonlo 
TX 78216 

Port Neches 
TX 77651 

San An!oniO 
TX 78249 

$39,341.00 
$78.682.00 

Ford 
F350 

$35,124.00 
$70.248.00 

Not Given 
Not Given 

$21,435.00 
$171.480.00 

Ford 
Explorer 

$22,935.00 
Ford 

Explorer 

$31,038.00 
Ford 

F350 

531.340.00 
Ford 
F350 

$39,254.00 
$78,508.00 

Ford 
F350 

537,237.oo 
574,474.oo 

Ford 
F350 

521.481.00 
$171,848.00 

Ford 
u72 

$23,008.00 
Ford 
u72 

$19,974.00 
$79.896.00 

Ford 
U62 

$17,552.00 
5122,864.oO 

Ford 
F350 

515,310.00 
$107,170.00 

Ford 

521,477.OO 
$171.816.00 

Ford 
Explorer 

522,279.oo 
Ford 

Explorer 

520,199.oo 
$80,796.00 

Ford 
Explorer 

517,647.oo 
$123,529.00 

Ford 
Club Wagon 

515,458.OO 
$108,206.00 

Ford 

No Et 

No I3 

No Bi 

No BI 

No RI 

No Bi 

No 61 

No Bi 

No Bi 

F35dl E2501 Econolinel 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/18/2003 

awrence Marshall Cavender- 
ord-Mercury, L.P. Chevrolet 

Bid #2 
Maxwell Auto 
Group 

518,667.OO 
Ford 

F350 

518,872 61 
Chew&l 
CC36003 

$30,562.00 
Ford 
w31 

No Bid 

$32.667.00 
565,334.OO 

Ford 
F550 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$20,243.00 
580,972.OO 

Ford 
U62 

517648.00 
5123S36.06 

Ford 
531 

515,412.OO 

No Bid 

$18,963.19 
5151,705.52 

Chevrolet 
CT1 0506 

519,067.77 
Chevrolet 
CT10506 

523,778.95 
$95,115.80 

Chevrolet 
Tahoe 

518,733.60 
5131,135.20 

Chevrolet 
CG33706 

$16,146 53 

No R 

No 5 

NOB 

NOB 

No R 

No B 

NOB 

NOB 

NOB 
$107,884.00 

Ford 
E250 

$113,025.71 
Chevrolet 
CG23405 

rande Truck 
enter 

0 Box201210 

an Antonio 
X 78220 

$18,918.0 
For 

F35 

528.328.0 
For 

F35 

539,409.0 
578,818.O 

For 
F35 

$33,774.0 
$67,648 0 

FOl 
1-55 

No RI 

No 81 

No BI 

519,227.C 
5134,589.C 

FOI 
54: 

516,704.C 
5116,928.C 

FO! 
S: 



@x,ed: March 07,2003 

01: Light Duty Trucks 

3044 PR/rm 

tern DWTlp1kXl 
C 3 Each. Cargo, 5 Passenger 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

D 3 Each - Cargo, 2 Passenger, Diesel 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

7 Suburban Type Wagons 
A 1 Each - 3/4 Ton, Front Bucket Seats 

Price Total 
Make 
Model 

B 4 Each - 3/4 Ton 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

8 3 Each - Step Vans 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

Total Awarded 

hall S wm?wce Mars 
hew&t it, L F 

3 Box 983 

empstead 
r( 77445 

No Bid 

528,972 
Chew 
CK25! 

$26,249 
$104,996 

Chew 
cc255 

NO Bid 

$1,084,285 .oo 

c 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Bid #l 

~ 

No Bi d 

529,267.00 
Ford 

Excursion 

$26.781.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$29,510.00 
Ford 

Excursion 

$26.87500 

No Bi 

No 81 
$107,124.00 

Ford 
Excursion 

$107,500.00 
Ford I ‘I EXCUWXl 

L awrence Marshall Cavender- 
F ord-Mercury L.P. Chevrolet 

t P ‘OBox983 /3o/“lHlOW~il ~OBo.5096 

d $16,991.00 
$50,973.00 

Ford 
E350 

$17.553.97 
$52,661.91 

Chevrolet 
CG23406 

$19,668.00 
$59,M)4.00 

Ford 
E34 

No Bid 

d $29,312.00 
Ford 
u41 

$29,187.20 
Chevrolet 
CK25906 

d $26,277.00 
$105,108.00 

Ford 
u40 

527.965.00 No t31 
$111,860.00 

Not Given 
Not Given 

d $48,762.00 
$146,286.00 

Workhorse 
WP31442 

No Bid 

$94.427.001 $67,975X21 $38,756.0 

Bid #2 
Maxwell Auto 
Group 

No BI 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No BI 

irande Truck 
:enter 

090x201210 

an Antonio 
X 78220 

$17,604.( 
$52,812.C 

Foi 
SZ 

520,763.C 
$62,289.C 

For 
Econolir 

NOB 

No BI 

No BI 
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r * 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

pened: March 07,2003 

,r: Light Duty Trucks 

r-044 PK/rm 

lem Description 

1 Compact Pick Up Trucks 
A 24 Each. Extended Cab 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

B 2 Each - Extended Cab, Four Wheel Drive 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

2 l/2 Ton Trucks 
A 30 Each - Long Wheel Base 

Price Each 
Price To&l 
Make 
Model 

B 1 Each - Short Wheel Base 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

C 6 Each. Extended Cab, Long Wheel Base 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

D 3 Each. Extended Cab, Short Bed 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

E 2 Each. Extended Cab, Power Windows 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

F 1 Each . Extended Cab, Rear Seat 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

3 3/4 Ton Trucks 
A 6 Each - Extended Cab, Long Wheel Base 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

Bld #I 
laxwell Auto 
1roup 

0 Box 5096 

ound Rock 
X 78663 

NOB 

No B 

No B 

NOB 

NOB 

NOB 

NOB 

NO6 

$17,269 I 
$103.734.1 

FO 
FZ! 

PI 
I” 

P 

~ 

Pa 
T. 

Bid #2 
hilpott Molars, 
C. 

0 Box 876 

art Neches 
X 77651 

$13,4OO.C 
$321,600.0 

FOI 
F15 

NOB 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No 61 

No BI 

NOB 

No 6 

Bid #l 
Iush Truck Cente 
.A 

an Antonio 
X 78220 

No 91 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No 61 

Bid #2 
ush Truck Cenh 
.A. 

an Antonio 
X 76220 

NOB 

No B 

No B 

NO5 

No B 

No 6 

No B 

No 6 

Prepared by Purchasing 38612003 Page 6 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

l$med: March 07,2003 
Bid #l Bid b’2 Bid #l Bid #2 

Maxwell Auto Phllpolt Motors, Rush Truck Center Rush Truck Centr ’ 
Group Inc. SA S.A. 

01: PO Box 5096 PO Box 676 PO Box 200105 PO Box 200105 

3-4 PR/rnl Round Rock Port Neches San Ammo San Antonlo 
TX 76683 TX 77651 TX 78220 TX 76220 

tern Description 

B 1 Each - Extended Cab, LOnQ Bed 
Price Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bi 
Make 
Model 

C 22 Each - Regular Cab, LOnQ Bed 
Price Each $15,299.00 No Bid No Bid No Bi 
Price Total $336.576.W 
Make Ford 
Model F250 

D 5 Each Regular Cab, Four Wheel Drive 
Price Each $17,859.00 No Bid No Bid No BI 
Price Total $89,295.00 
Make Ford 
Model F250 

E 5 Each. Extended Cab, Four Wheel Drive WITHDREW 

Price Each $17,369.00 No Bid No Bid No BI 
Price Total $86,945.00 
Make Ford 
Model F250 

F 2 Each. Extended Cab, Fowatd Mount Seat Rails 
Price Each No Bid $22544.00 No Bid No BI 
Price Total $45,066.00 
Make Ford 
Model F250 

G 1 Each - Extended Cab, School Bus Yellow 
Price Total No Bid No Bid No Bid NO B’ 
Make 
Model 

H 23 Each - 54’ Usable Cab to Axle 

Price Each $14.829.00 No Bid No Bid NOB 

Price Total $341,067.00 

Make Ford 
Model F250 

I 2 Each - Four Door Crew Cab 
Pdce Each No Bid No Bid No Bid NOB 

Price Total 
Make 
Model 

J 2 Each - Four Door Crew Cab, Four Wheel Drive 
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid NOB 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/18/2003 Page 7 



c 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

March 07,2003 

,I: Light Duty Trucks 

l-044 I’R/ FlIl 

tern Descrlptlon 
K 12 Each - Extended Cab, Diesel 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

L 1 Each - Extended Cab, 4 X 4 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

4 One Ton Trucks 
A 4 Each. 64’ Cab to Axle 

Price Each 
Pttce Total 
Make 
Model 

El 1 Each - 64’ Cab to Axle, Diesel 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

C 4 Each. Four Door, Crew Cab 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

0 1 Each - 60’ Cab to Axle 

Price Total 
Make 
Model 

E 2 Each . Four Door Crew Cab, Long Bed 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

F 2 Each - Four Door Crew Cab, Four Wheel Drive 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
MOCkI 

G 1 Each - 60’ Cab to Axle, 9’ Steel Platform 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

Bid #1 
axwsll Auto 
roup 

wnd Rock 
c 76683 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

d 

d 

d 

d 

d 

d 

d 

d 

d 

Bid #2 
h@ott Motors, 
NC 

0 Box 876 

ott Neches 
X 77651 

No 81 

No BI 

No 61 

NOB 

No B 

No B 

No B 

No B 

NOB 

Bid #l 
tish Truck Cente 
A. 

3 Box 200105 

3” Anton10 
< 78220 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No BI 

No BI 

No BI 

No 6’ 

Bid #2 
ush Truck Can11 
.A. 

0 Box 200105 

an Antonio 
X 78220 

NOB 

NOB 

NOB 

No B 

No B 

No f? 

No E 
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c . 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

pened: March 07,2003 

X: Light Duty Trucks 

1044 PR/rm 

lem Descrlptlon 
H I1 Each 60’ Cab to Axle, 9’ Steel Plallorm, 3’ Stake Sides 

Price Total 
Make 
Model 

I 1 Each Four Door Crew Cab, Diesel 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

J 2 Each. One Ton Wreckers 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

K 2 Each I Four Wheel Drive, 9’ Steel Piatfoml, Diesel 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

5 Sport Utility Type Vehicles 
A 8 Each. Four Door, Four Wheel Drive 

Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

R 1 Each. Four Door, Four Wheel Drive, High Ground Clearance 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

C 4 Each - Four Door, Two Wheel Drive 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

6 Van Type Trucks 
A 7 Each - 15 Passenger 

Price Each 
Price Tolal 
Make 
Model 

B 7 Each _ Cargo, 2 Passenger 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

Bld #l 
laxwell Auto 
iKWp 

0 BOX 5096 

aund Rock 
X 78683 

No 811 

No Bil 

No Bil 

No Bit 

No BII 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

Bid #2 
hilpotl Motors, 
c 

Bid #l 
lush Truck Con% 
#A 

,r R 
S 

Bid #2 
ush Truck Centc 
.A. 

0 Box 676 ‘0 Box 200105 P OBox200105 

ml Neches 
X 77651 

A 
S 

P 

~ 

S 
T 

an Antonio S an Antonio 
X 78220 T X 78220 

No BI No Bi d No B 

No Bi No Bi d No B 

.$40,958.0 
$61,916.0 

FOl 
F45 

$39.591.7 
$79,163.5 

GMC 
w4501 

$42,727.5 
$85455.0 

GM 
w450 

No Bi No l3i d No B 

No Bi No Bi d No B 

No 81 No Bi d No B 

No Bi No 81 d No B 

No Bi No Bi d No B 

No El No Bi d NOB 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: March 07,2003 

For: Light IJuly Trucks 

Bld #l Bid #2 Bid #l Bid #2 
Maxwell Au10 Philpotl Motors, Rush Truck Center Rush Truck Center 
Group Inc. SA S.A 

PO Box 5096 PO Box 676 PO Box 200105 PO Box 200105 

03.044 I’R/rm 

D 3 Each - Cargo, 2 Passenger, Diesel 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

7 Suburban Type Wagons 
A 1 Each .3/4 Ton, Front Bucket Seats 

Price Total 
Make 
Model 

6 4 Each - 3/4 Ton 
Pace Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

8 3 Each - Step Vans 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Make 
Model 

und Rock 
76663 

Port Neches 
TX 77651 

San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio 
TX 76220 TX 76220 TX 76220 

No Bid No Bid No Bid NOB No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NOB 

No Bid No Bfd No Bid NOB No Bid 

No Bid No i3ld No B!d No t3 No Bid 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NOB 
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