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CITY OF SAN ANTONIO : ; ; :‘i: 1” : ,a.: i--*-s ,I 

INTERDEPARTMENTAL MEMORANDUM 
PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT 

TO: Mayor and City Council 

FROM: Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services 

THROUGH: Terry M. Brechtel, City Manager 

COPIES: Travis M. Bishop, Assistant City Manager; 
Department Directors; File 

SUBJECT: Annual Contracts for Fiscal Year 2003-2004 

DATE: May 1,2003 

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION: 
The attached tabulations of bids to provide the City of San Antonio with annual contracts for 
various materials and services is hereby submitted for Council consideration and action. 
Annually at this time, bids are requested for various materials, parts and services. This ordinance 
includes contracts for EZ Go golf cart parts & service, p.v.c. pipe & fittings, elevator 
maintenance for Police Headquarters and Landa Branch Library, personal computer software, 
training & service ammunition, and gum rubber sheets on an annual basis which will be recurring 
needs throughout the next fiscal year. These annual contracts establish the costs and other 
conditions, so that repetitive bidding is not required. 

Many bids are on a firm, non-escalating basis, while others such as petroleum related items and 
certain other commodities require escalation of prices during the contract period. Generally, bids 
reflect small increases over recent prior years, but in many cases reflect decreases. 

It is recommended that these contracts be approved. 

SECTION I: The bids in this section are competitive low bids in which award is recommended 
to the lowest bidders. (9 contracts) 

SECTION II: The bids in this section are low qualified bids in which award is recommended 
to bidders other than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet 
the City’s specifications. (2 contracts) 

POLICY ANALYSIS: 
Annual contracts are an efficient method of securing the best prices through volume purchasing 
and by reducing large amounts of work related to the bid process. This group of contracts 
represents a portion of approximately 250 annual contracts that will be brought before City 
Council throughout the remainder of the fiscal year. 



Page 2 - Memo to Mayor and Council 
Annual Contracts for FY2003-2004 

FINANCIAL IMPACT: 
Funds are not expended by this ordinance. It is estimated that approximately $20,000,000 will be 
spent on annual contracts in the 2003-2004 fiscal year. All expenditures will be in accordance 
with the 2003-2004 budget to be approved by City Council. The total estimated amount for the 
contracts listed on this ordinance are approximately $778,624. 

SUPPLEMENTAL COMMENTS: 
Several agencies including schools, municipalities, Bexar County, San Antonio Water System, 
and City Public Service have been included in some of the bids in a cooperative effort. 

MINORITY & WOMAN OWNED BUSINESS ENTERPRISE AWARDS: 

Number of Estimated / Goal : Goal: Goal: 
Council Contracts Dollars MBE’s 11.7% WBE’s 12.8% AABE’s 1.7% 

Date Awarded Awarded Amount % Awards Amount % Awards Amount % Awards 
/ 3-20-03 / 6 $103,673 ___ $53,915 52 2 ; $19,715 19.02 1 
/ 4-10-03 j 

- 
5 

LY4-24-03 j 7 
$415,579 
$202,607 / ~~ ~ r- 

! 

5-l-03 I 11 ! $778,624 j $415,873 53.41 j 2 ~ $439,375 56.43 / 2 / $1,498 ,192 1 

TOTAL: 29 $1,500,483 $469,788 31.31 4 $459,090 30.60 3 $1,498 .lO 1 

e B. Cantu, C.P.M., Director 
& General Services 

Approved: 

Terry M. B tel 
City Manager 



SECTION I 
COUNCIL, MAY 1, 2003 

COMPETITIVE LOW BIDS 

SECTION 1: COMPETITIVE LOW BIDS 

The bids in this section are competitive low bids in which award is recommended to the 
bidders. 

1. 

2. 

3. 

4. 

5. 

COMMODITY 
EZ-Go Golf Cart Parts & Service 
A078-04 
10-l -03 through 9-30-04 
with two one-year options to extend 

P.V.C. Pipe & Fittings/Solvent Cement 
& Primer 
Al 65-04 
1 O-l -03 through 9-30-04 
with two one-year options to extend 

Elevator Maintenance for Police Kone, Inc. 
Headquarters Entire Bid 
A494-04 Est. Amount $8,760 
1 O-l -03 through 9-30-05 
with two one-year options to extend 

Elevator Maintenance for Landa Branch Kone, Inc. 
Library Entire Bid 
A682-04 Est. Amount $6,540 
lo- I -03 through 9-30-05 
with two one-year options to extend 

Personal Computer Software 
A905 
Upon award through 12-3 l-03 

MBE VENDOR 
Mission Golf Cars 
Entire Bid 
Est. Amount $25,000 

WBEI 
MBE 

Alamo Iron Works 
Entire Bid 
Est. Amount $25,000 

WBEI SHI Government Solutions 
MBE Sections 7-10, 12, 15, 17 

Est. Amount $414,375 

Dell Marketing, L.P. 
Sections 1, 16 
Est. Amount $30,845 

Global Government Computer 
Section 14 
Est. Amount $4,032 

AABE/ Commonwealth Computer Co. 
MBE Section 11 

Est. Amount $1,498 

CDWG Government, Inc. 
Section 13 
Est. Amount $174 

lowest 

co. 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: 

For: 

April 11,2003 

Annual Contract for EZ-Go Golf 
Cart Parts & Service 

A078-04 
Description 

MkWdc 

EZ-Go Golf Cart Parts 
Percent of discount offered 
Product identification (Mfr.) 
Type price schedule 
Price schedule number 
Date of price schedule 
Price schedule column on which discount is based 

Labor rate for service 
Service call 
Delivery 

Terms 

Estimated Annual Award 

nission Golf Cars 

8865 Redland Road 
San Antonio, 
-X 78259 

25% 
EZ-GO 

Retail 
124 

4/8/2003 
List 

TERM: October 2003 - September 2004 with two (2) one-year extensions. 
CONTRACT AMOUNT: Estimated $ 24,OOO.OO for one year, $72,000.00 for three years. 
END USERS: Parks & Recreation. 
SCOPE: Repairs and service for EZ-Go golf carts. 

Prepared by Purchasing 4/16/2003 

1 - 

Page 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

lperieil March 21, 2003 

“T. Annual Contract lor P V C Pipe & FlttingsiSolvent Cement & Primer 

I SCH 40 Pressure Pipe 8 Fittings 
A PVC Pepe 

(1) l/2’ 

(2) 314’ 

(3) 1’ 

(4) 11/4’ 

(5) 11/2’ 

(6) 2’ 

(7) 3 

(8) 4’ 

(9) 6 
(10) 8 

II Deleted 

Ill SCH 80 Pressure Pope & Fitl~ngs 
A PVC Pipe 

(1) l/Z 

(2) 3/4’ 

(3) 1’ 

(4) 11/4’ 

(5) 11/2 

(6) 2 

(7) 3” 

(8) 4” 

(9) 6 

$0 103 $0 1782 

$0 133 $0 237f 

$0 197 $0 3486 

$0 277 $0 472( 

$0 313 $0 562f 

$0 406 $0 75% 

$0 965 $1.5&3( 

$1 159 $2 13% 

$2 066 $3 765( 

$5 776( 

601% 
5/2&2Wl 

LZISCC 
5 Day5 

No Btc 

No BIG 

No BIG 

No BIG 

No BIG 

No BIG 

No BIG 

No Btc 

No BIG 

Prepared by Purchasing 4/16/2003 Page 1 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

~?ened March 21, 2003 

Annual Contract for P V C Pipe & Fillings/Solvent Cement & Primer 

Description 

MKH/dc 

B SCH 80 Flttlngs 
mcount from current pnce IiS1 
Date 
Mlr 
Dellvery 

IV Sdvent Cemerll 8 Primer 
A Solvent Cement 

Pnce per quart w/ dobber 
Pnce per p,nt w/d&bet 
Mfc 

B Hi-tech Solvent Primer 
Pnce pet quart w/ dobber 
Pnce per p,“t w/dobber 
Mfr 
Dellvery 

Terms 

Estimated Annual Award 

CP 913OQOO4 OPT 2-l YR EXTEN EXPIRES2006 

TERM October 2003 - September 2004 with two (2) one-year etienstons 
CONTRACT AMOUNT Esttmated $25,WO 00 lor one year, $75.000 W for three years 
END USERS Parks 8 Recreatton and Public Works 
SCOPE P V C pope and supplies used for repan 

am0 Iron works am0 Iron works water Zone water Zone 

13 SBC Parkway 13 SBC Parkway 1100 N Industrial Blvd 1100 N Industrial Blvd 

3” Antonlo, 3” Antonlo, Round RoCk, Round RoCk, 
I( 78219 I( 78219 TX 78681 TX 78681 

81% 81% No Bid No Bid 
5/26L?OOl 5/26L?OOl 

SpSWS SpMS 
15 Days 15 Days 

$4 17 $4 17 $3 79 $3 79 
$2 40 $2 40 $2.24 $2.24 

Reclorseal Gold 

Rectorseal Jim PR-1 

EL-Weld 

$3 79 
$2 24 

EL-Weld 

Net 30 

Prepared by FurchasIng 4/16/2003 Page 2 



City of San Antdnio Bid Tabulation 

Opened. March 25, 2003 
FOE Annual Contract for Elevator Maintenance for 

Police Headquarters 

1 

A494-04 MRldc 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

Price per monthly rate 
Total price 

Price per hour-Outside Prime-Time 
Total Price 

Terms 

Estimated Annual Award i 

Est. Qty. 

12 

60 

Ione, inc. 

2017 Starcrest 

#an Antonto, 
x 78247 

$27O.OC 
$3,24O.OC 

$92.00 
$5,520.0(3 

Net 30 

$8,760.00 

EMR, Inc. Omnt Elevator 

4407 Walzem Rd. #206 1730 E. Commerce St. 

San Antonio, San Antonio, 
rx 78218 TX 78203 

$445.00 $438.OC 
$5,340.00 $5,256.OC 

$142.50 $92.8C 
$8,550.00 $5,568.OC 

Net 30 Net 30 

Prepared by Purchasing 4/18/2003 Page 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Annual Contract for Elevator Maintenance for 
g 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

Price per monthly rate 
Total price 

Price per hour-Outside Prime-Time 
Total Price 

Terms 
Estimated Annual Award 

Est. Qty. 

12 

60 

Ione. Inc. 

2017 Starcrest 

*an Antonio, 
X 78247 

$85.01 
$1,02O.Oi 

$92.00 
$5,520.0( 

4407 Walzem Rd. #206 1730 E. Commerce St. 

$115.00 $185.OC 
$1.380.00 $2.220.0(3 

$142.50 $92.8C 
$8550.00 $5,568.00 

Thyssen Krupp Elevator 

1077 Central Pkwy. S. 
#300 
San Antonio, 
TX 78232 

$240.0( 
$2.880.0( 

$98.0( 
$5,880.0( 

Net 30 
$6,540.00[ 

Net 30 Net 30 Net 3( 

Prepared by Purchasing 4/18/2003 Page 1 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

or Personal Computer Software 230 N Mdwaukee 1158 Arion Parkwq 

Pnce Per License 
Pnce Per M&a 

Not Gtw 

Pnce Per Llcenss 
Price Per Media 

Pnce Per License 
Pnce Per Med!a 

Pnce Per License 
Price Per Made 

Price Per LIcewe 
Pnce Per Medta 

Pnce Per LIcewe 
Pnce Per Media 

Not Giver 

Price Per License 
Price Per Media 

Price Per Media 

Prepared by Purchasmg 4/18/2003 Page 2 



ul 

pened. February 24,2003 

or: Personal Computer Sofrware 

905 

Section Description 

Item #2 Acrobat 5 0 for Wlndows Upgrade 
Price Per License 
Pnce Per Mad@ 

Item #3 Acrobat Approval for Wbndows 
Pnce Per License 
Price Per Media 

Delivery 

Section Total 

13 Wmz~p Computelng Applzation Verston 8.1 
Pnce Per License 
Pnce Per Medba 

Dellvery 

Section Total 

I 
14 ]Verltas Backup Exec for Windows 2000 Server 

IExchanQe 2000 Enterprise Server Upgrade 
Pnce Per Ltcanse 
Price Per Media 

Section Total 

t 
15 IEhelp Robohelp Appilcations 
Item Cl lRob&ielp 9.0 for Mwosofl HTML Help 

Pnce Per License 
Pnce Per Media 

Item #2 RoboHelp Office 9 0 
Pnce Per License 
Price Per Media 

Delivery 

Section Total 

16 Macromedia Appkcatmns Multtpie 

Item Xl Studio MX 
Pnce Per License 
Pnce Per Media 

Quantity 

20 
20 

200 
200 

IO 
IO 

IO 
IO 

IO 
10 

IO 
10 

IO 
IO 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

6910 State Route 36 24165 IH IO West 

Incomplete 
$18 00 - $23 00 ’ 

Not Gwen 

2-3 Days 

$420 00 $451 94 
$50 00 $29 42 

3-5 Days 

$37.27 No Offer $42 98 $82 41 $86.00 $95 22 
$21 48 No Offer $20 98 $23.00 $22 00 No Offer 

$12 78 $12 77 $19 3c $18.81 $20 00 $30 22 
$21 48 $20 61 $20 98 $23 00 $22 00 No Offer 

IO-14 Days 5-30 Days 

$9,495 75 

7-12 Days I-10 Days 

$10,934.20 $12,094 95 

No Offer No Offer $22.98 
No Offer No Offer $0 LX 

10-14 Days 

$4,813 60 

No Offer 
No Offer 

No Offer No Offer $948.98 No Offer No Offer No Offer 
No Offer No Offer $O.Dc No Offer No Offer No Offer 

i563.00 - $835.00 * 

i 

$550 05 $553.04 
$16.00 $0 00 $13 41 

Not Gwen Not Gwen 

$12,160 00 

No Offer No Oh 
No Offer No Offer 

7-12 Days 

$229 80 

$446 98 $455 79 
$32.98 $31 26 

7-12 Days I-10 Days 

$4,799 6C $4,870 50 

$386 00 
$33 00 

21 Days 

$4,190 00 

$624 40 
$34 55 

Not Gwen 

$6,589.50 

$472.98 No Offer No Offer No Offer 
$O.K No Offer No Offer No Offer 

7-12 Days 

$14,219 6C 

$554.98 $551 80 $596 DO 

soot $15 02 $1500 

Incomplete 
$635.79 
No Offer 

DWG Amherst Communication 
fovernment, INC Technologies, Inc 

30 N Milwaukee 121 Intequrli Hlvd 1158 Anon Parkway 
ve ste 21s 

ernon Hills, IL San Antonio, TX San Antonlo, TX 
3061 78216 78216 

Prepared by Purchastng 4/18/2003 Page 3 



pened February 24,2003 

r Personal Computer Software 

Section 
Item #Z/Dreamweaver MX 

Description 

Prvx Per License 
Price Per Medta 

Item #3 Dreamweaver MX Upgrade 
Pnce Per Llcensc 
Pnce Per Media 

Item #4 Fireworks MX 
Price Per License 
Price Per Media 

item #5 Fireworks MX Upgrade 
Price Per License 
Pnce Per Meoia 

Dellvery 

I 
17 ]Kolax Applical~ons Multiple 
item #l Ascent Capture V5.5 Scan Station License 

a AC-1500-l 100 1 Pack Scan 5K per Month 
Price Per License 

b AC-1510-1100 3 Pack Scan 5K per Month 
Pnce Per License 

c AC-1500.1300 1 Pack Scan 25K Per Month 
Pnce Per License 

d AC-1510.1300 3 Pack Scan 25K Per Month 
Pnce Per LIcewE! 

e AC-l 500-l 500 1 Pack Scan 75K Per Month 
Pnce Per License 

f AC-1510-1500 3 Pack Scan 75K Per Month 
Pnce Per License 

g AC-l 500-i 700 1 Pack Scan ZOOK Per Month 
Pnce Per License 

h AC-1510.1700 3 Pack Scan 200K Per Month 
Pnce Per LIcerIse 

I AC-1500-1200 1 Pack Scan 500K Per Month 
Pnce Per La?nse 

Quantity 

10 
10 

10 
10 

10 
10 

10 
10 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

50 Capital of Teua: 

v 
3g 1, ste 350 

istin, TX 78746 

eii Marketmg L P 

‘“I? Dell way 

ound Ficck. TX 
8682 

Global Government Commonwealth CDWG 
Education Solutions Computer Co Government, INC 

6910 State Route 36 24165 IH 10 West 230 N Mtlwaukee 
Suite 217.616 AVe 

Fletcher. OH San Anlonio. TX Vernon Hills, IL 
45326 78257 6cCJ61 

II I I 
281 00 $362 00 

$16 Of 
$276 17 $276 98 $280 2 

$1341 $0 00 $150 

;170.00 - $186 00 
$160~ 

$150 70 
$1341 

$151 98 

$0 00 

$151 9 
$15 0 

;21100-$27100 
516 01 

$206 94 $207 98 $208 2 
$1341 so 00 $15 0 

;127 00 $139 00 
$16 01 

$11284 
$1341 

$112 98 

$0 00 

$1139 
$15 0 

3-5 Day 

$14,320 01 

5-30 Days 7-12 Days 

$13,667 40 $13,049 00 

Not Gwe 

$13,813 6 

$682 01 No Offer No Offer No Offf 

$1.880 01 No Offer No Offer No Offc 

$2,260 M No Offer No Offer No Oflc 

$6,235 01 No Offer No Offer No Offf 

$3,772 0 No Offer No Offer No Offer No Offt 

$10,414 01 No Offer No Offer No Offer No Off< 

$6,769 0 No Offer No Offer No Offer No Offc 

$17,912 0 No Offer No Offer No Offer No Off6 

$13,760 0 No Offer No Offer No Offer No Off< 

P 

1 

s 

s 
7 

0 
2 

8 
2 

9 
2 

9 
2 

n 

0 

?( 

11 

v 

3r 

?r 

3r 

,* 

fr 

fr 

21 Intcrpd. l3lvd 

te 215 

~a” Antonio, TX 
8216 

$294 lx 
$15OC 

$161 CC 
$15oc 

$221 oc 
$15 OC 

$119oc 
$15 oc 

21 Days 

$14,660 OC 

Incomplete 

$671 Oc 

$1.850 lx 

$2,225 Oc 

$6,134.OC 

$3.711 al 

$10,245.00 

$6,680.0(: 

$17,621 .OC 

$13,537.oc 

ommunicat~on 
echnologles, Inc. 

158 Arcon Parkway 

an Antonio, TX 
8216 

$317 3: 
No 0% 

$191.9E 
No Off01 

$238.28 
No Offei 

$143 42 
No 0Re1 

Not Giver 

No Oh 

No Ofle 

No Ofb 

No Offe 

No Offea 

No Offec 

No Oflea 

No Offel 

No Offe 

Prepared by Purchasing 4/l &I/2003 Page 4 



CJl 

- 
opened: February 24,2003 

or Personal Computer Software 

Section Description 
j AC-1510-1200 3 Pack Scan 500K Per Month 

Pnce Per License 

Item #2 Ascent Capture V5 5 Workstation License 
a AC-15002000 1 Pack Workstation 

Pnce Per License 

b AC-1510.2000 3 Pack Workstal~on 
Pnce Per License 

c AC-l 500-2000 10 Pack Workstation 
Pnce Per License 

item #3 Ascent Capture V5.5 Upgrade License 
a DU-1500.1530 1 Pack Scan 25K to 75K Upgrade 

Pnce Per License 

b DU-15001730 1 Pack Scan 25K to 200K Upgrade 
Pnce Per License 

Item #4 Ascent Capture Internet Server (ACIS) V5 5 License 
a AC-t 500-3500 1 Pack Internet Server 75K Per Month 

Pnce Per License 

b AC-1500.3700 1 Pack Internet Server 200K Per Month 
Pnce Per License 

item #5 Ascent Capture Web Valrdatlon Server (WVS) V5 5 License 
a AC-1500-6100 1 Pack Web Valldatwn Server 5K per Month 

Pnce Per License 

b AC-1510.6300 1 Pack Web VaIldalton Server 25K per Month 
Pnce Per License 

c AC-1510-6500 1 Pack Web Validatro” Server 75K per Month 
Pnce Per License 

d AC-1510-6700 1 Pack Web Vakdatron Server ZOOK per Month 
Pnce Par License 

Item #6 Kofax Software VRS 
a SV-1100-1100 1 Pack SVRS Personal 

price Per LiCB”SB 

b SV-1100-1300 1 Pack SVRS Professional 
Pnce Per Lkxnse 

c SV-1110-1100 3 Pack SVRS Personal 
Pnce Per License 

allantit~ 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

2 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 
HI Govemmenl 
dutions 

!50 Capital of Tex 
WY 
ldg 1, Sic 350 

~st!“, TX 78746 

$37,979 

$1,879 

$5,206 

$16,066 

$1,499 

$4,499 

$5,639 

$11,041. 

$2.051. 

$3,418 

$5,469 

$8,204 

$263 

$465 

$629 

D 

as 0 

R 
71 

00 

00 

00 

00 

00 

co 

00 

00 

Do 

al 

00 

00 

00 

00 

Education Soiut~ons 

6910 State Route 36 

ound Hock. TX 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No 0% 

No Offf 

No Off6 

No Off6 

No Off< 

No Offf 

No Off6 

No Offf 

No Offf 

No Offf 

No Offc 

No Off6 

No Offt 

No Off< 

No Offt 

:ommonweallh 
:omputer Co 

4165 IH 10 West 
u&217-616 

~a” Antonio, TX 
8257 

No Offer 

No Ok 

No Offei 

No Offel 

No Ok 

No Offer 

No Offet 

No Offer 

No Off01 

No 0% 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No 0% 

No Ofbe 

No 0% 

DWG 
iovernment, INC 

30 N Milwaukee 
ve 

erncm Hills, IL 
0061 

No Offer 

No Offec 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No 0ffe1 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offei 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No 0% 

No Offer 

No 0% 

No Offer 

Communication 
Technologies, Inc. 

21 Interpark I3lvd 1158 Ario” Parkway 
le. 215 

an Antonio, TX San Antonlo, TX 
8216 78216 

I 

$37,362 DO 

$1,850 00 

$5,123 00 

$15,804 00 

$1.476.00 

$4,428 Oil 

$10,862 00 

$8,071 00 

No Offer 

$360 Do 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offet 

No 0ffe1 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Ofle! 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Offer 

No Off@ 

No Offer 

Prepared by Purchdsrng 4/l 812003 Page 5 



ted February 24,2003 

or Personal Computer Software 

905 

Section Description 
d SV-11 lo-1300 3 Pack SVRS Protess~onal 

Pnce Per License 

Item #7 Kofax Release Scnpt for Hummmgbtrd DDCS Fuson 
KOFAR-1500-1002 DOCS Fusion Release Scnpt 
PIlo? Per License 

Item #8 Deleted 

Dellvery 

Section Total 

18 /Deleted 
I 

Total Award 

Quantity 

2 

2 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 
HI Government Dell Marketmg L P 
OliillOnS 

250 Capttal of Texas One Dell Way 

WY 
ldg 1, Ste 350 

ustm, TX 76746 Round Rock, TX 
76682 

6910 State Route 36 24165 IH 10 West 30 N Milwaukee 
Sute 217.616 .ve 

Fletcher, OH 
45326 

San Antonto. TX 
78257 

‘ernon Hills. IL 
CO61 

$1,198 00 No Offe No Offer No Off< 

$856 00 

// 

No Offer No Offer No Otlt 

$414,375 00 $30,845 80 $4,032 40 $1,498 0 

mvG 
iovernment, INC 

No 0% 

No Offei 

an Antonto, TX San Antomo, TX 
8216 78216 

No Ofh 

No 0ffe1 

21 Dayz 

$328.640 00 

No Offe 

No Ofie 

/ 

Prepared by Purchasmg 4/18/2003 Page 6 



SECTION II 
COUNCIL, MAY 1,2003 
LOW QUALIFIED BIDS 

SECTION II: LOW QUALIFIED BIDS 

The bids in this section are low qualified bids in which award is recommended to bidders other 
than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet the City’s specifications. 

1. 
COMMODITY 

Training & Service Ammunition 
A308-04 
lo-l-03 thru 9-30-04 
with two one-year options to extend 

MBE VENDOR 
GT Distributors 
Entire Bid 
Est. Amount $245,000 

2. Gum Rubber Sheets 
A5 18-04 
lo-l-03 thru 9-30-04 
with one-year option to extend 

Industrial Rubber Products, Inc. 
Entire Bid 
Est. Amount $17,400 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

lpened: April 11,2003 

GX: Annual Contract for Training 8 Service Ammunition 

~308-04 DRldc 

Item 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

a 

9 

10 

Description 

12 gauge, 2 314”. #000 buckshot 
Price per M 
Rounds per Case 
Price Total 
Brand & Mfr. 

12 gauge, 2 3/4”. 1 oz. slug 
Price per M 
Rounds per Case 
Price Total 
Brand & Mfr. 

,223 Remington caliber 
Price per M 
Rounds per Case 
Price Total 
Brand 8 Mfr. 

,308 Winchester 
Price per M 
Rounds per Case 
Pnce Total 
Brand & Mfr 

12 gauge. #4 buckshot 
Price per M 
Rounds per Case 
Price Total 
Brand 8. Mfr. 

12 gauge, 7 l/2 shot 
Price per M 
Rounds per Case 
Price Total 
Brand & Mfr. 

,223 Remington caliber, boattail hollowpoint 
Price per M 
Rounds per Case 
Price Total 
Brand & Mfr. 

.223 Remington caliber, softpoint 
Price per M 
Rounds per Case 
Pnce Total 
Brand 8 Mfr. 

40 Smith & Wesson 
Price per M 
Rounds per Case 
Pnce Total 
Brand & Mfr. 

40 Smith 8 Wesson, Speer Gold Dot 
Price per M 
Rounds per Case 
Price Total 
Brand & Mfr. 

Total 
Delivery 
Terms 

Total Estimated Award 

Estimated 
Quantity 

5,000 

2,500 

60,000 

10.000 

15,000 

15,000 

5.000 

20.000 

I ,oao,ooo 

22.000 

$262.39 $223.00 
250 250 

$5247.80 $4,460.00 
Federal F127000 Winchester XB12000 

$262.39 $247.00 
250 250 

$2,623.90 $2.470.00 
Federal F127RS Winchester Xl 2RS15 

$134.29 $143.00 
500 1000 

$16,114.80 $8580.00 
Federal XMl93 Wtnchester USA223Rl 

$479.80 $456.00 
200 200 

$23,990.00 $22,800.00 
Federal GM308M Winchester S308J 

$262.39 $243 00 
250 250 

$15.743.40 $14580.00 
Federal F1274B Wrnchester XBI 24 

$133.96 $123.00 
250 250 

$8,037.60 $7.380.00 
Federal TGL127.5 Wtnchester XUl27 

$351.80 $326.00 
200 200 

$8,795.00 $8,150.00 
Federal P223E Wrnchester RA223M 

$319.90 $247.00 
200 200 

$31,990.00 $24,700.00 
Federal 223A Winchester RA223R 

$117.63 
1000 

$127,040.40 
ccl 53957 

No Bid 

$235.79 
1000 

$5,187.38 
ccl 53961 

No Bid 

30 Days 30-45 Days 

-X 78761 ]MS 38771 
1, INCOMPLETE 

3%-l 0 Days]1 
$244,770.281 

Net 30 

Prepared by Purchasing 4/l 712003 
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Ipened: 

-or: 

April 4, 2003 

Annual Contract for Gum 
Rubber Sheets 

4518-04 

tern Description 

DRidc 

Estimated Annua 
Quantity 

‘rice per Sheet 

Total Price 

Style 

Size 

Delivery 

Terms 

120 

Total Estimated Award 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

1 

Bid #I Bid #2 

ldustrial Rubber Products, Rubber Age L.M. Mfg. Inc. 1 Rubber Age L.M. Mfg. Inc. Sunwest Sales Company 
IC. 
140 Ambassador Row 13418 Halldale Avenue 13418 Halldale Avenue 30952 San Clemente St. 
an Antonio, Gardena, Gardena, Hayward, 
X 78219 CA 90249 CA 90249 CA 94544 

NAS NAS 

$145.00 $76.55 $80.08 $144.0( 

$17,400 00 $9,186.00 $9,609.60 $17,280.0( 

I 
#I35 4ORl49 4OR576 #13! 

l/4” x 48” x 96” .250”+/- ,031”~ 48’ .250”+/- .031”x 48’ 114” x 48” x 96 

5-7 Days Not Given Not Given 14 Day 

I%-10 Days Net 30 Net 30 Net 3( 

$17,400.00~ 

Prepared by Purchascng 411712003 Page 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

>pened: April 4, 2003 :a 

:or: Annual Contract for Gum 
Rubber Sheets 

Total Price 

Style 

Size 

Delivery 

Terms 

Total Estimated Award 

.O. Box 34483 
an Antonio, 
X 78265 

$144.00 

$17,280.00 

T35(same as 135) 

l/4” x 48” x 96” 

5-10 Days 

Net 30 


