CITY OF SAN ANTONIO AT ‘
INTERDEPARTMENTAL MEMORANDUM CG : d ::} EN 'T AG Ei\ J DA

PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMFE%R ! EM
g‘L.'E\V,l E“f@. ot

TO: Mayor and City Council
FROM: Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services
THROUGH: Terry M. Brechtel, City Manager

COPIES: Travis M. Bishop, Assistant City Manager;
Department Directors; File

SUBJECT: Annual Contracts for Fiscal Year 2003-2004
DATE: Qctober 16, 2003

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION:

The attached tabulations of bids to provide the City of San Antonio with annual contracts for various
materials and services is hereby submitted for Council consideration and action. Annually at this
time, bids are requested for various materials, parts and services. This ordinance includes contracts
for copier printer paper; and door to door delivery of brush collection notices.

Many bids are on a firm, non-escalating basis, while others such as petroleum related items and
certain other commodities require escalation of prices during the contract period. Generally, bids
reflect small increases over recent prior years, but in many cases reflect decreases.

It is recommended that these contracts be approved.

SECTION L. The bids in this section are competitive bids in which award is recommended to the
lowest bidders. (3contracts)

SECTIONII:  The bids in this section are low qualified bids in which award is recommended to
bidders other than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s
specifications. (lcontract)

POLICY ANALYSIS:

Annual contracts are an efficient method of securing the best prices through volume purchasing and
by reducing large amounts of work related to the bid process. This group of contracts represents a
portion of approximately 250 annual contracts that will be brought before City Council throughout
the remainder of the fiscal year.




Page 2 — Memo to Mayor and Council
Annual Contracts for FY2003-2004

FINANCIAL IMPACT:

Funds are not expended by this ordinance. All expenditures will be in accordance with the 2003-
2004 budget to be approved by City Council. The total estimated amount for the contracts listed on
this ordinance are approximately $473,127.

SUPPLEMENTAL COMMENTS:
Several agencies including schools, municipalities, Bexar County, San Antonio Water System, and
City Public Service have been included in some of the bids in a cooperative effort.

MINORITY & WOMAN OWNED BUSINESS ENTERPRISE AWARDS:

Number of Estimated Goal: WBE’s  Goal: Goal:
Council Contracts Dollars MBE’s 15% 10% AABEs 3%
Date Awarded Awarded Amount % Awards Amount % Awards | Amount % Awards
3-20-03 6 $103,673 $53,915 52.0 2 $19,715 19.02 1
4-10-03 5 $415,579
4-24-03 7 $202,607
5-1-03 11 $778,624 $415,873 | 5341 2 $439,375 | 56.43 2 $1,498 | .192 1
5-8-03 6 $270,202 $25,000 9.25 1 $24,000 8.88 2
5-15-03 5 $157,948 $12,240 7.75 1
5-22-03 4 $175,000
5-29-03 4 $203,809 $25,000 | 12.27 2 $9,000 442
6-5-03 4 $326,300 $25,000 7.66 1 $25,000 7.66
6-12-03 6 $137,000
6-26-03 48 $3,606,507 | $129,292 | 3.55 6 $173,276 | 480 6
8-7-03 35 $899,830 $235,189 | 26.14 6 $301,573 | 33.51 8
8-14-03 11 $1,031,800 $76,000 7.37 2
8-28-03 18 $730,659 $25,676 3.51 2
9-4-03 4 $106,641
9-18-03 15 $1,320,114 $78,894 5.98 3
9-25-03 8 $313,515 $19,620 6.26 2 $6,000 1.91 1
10-2-03 28 $1,210,535 $51,948 4.30 4 $145,003 | 11.98 6 $300 .0248 1
10-9-03 2 $111,860
10-16-03 4 $473,127 $66,000 | 13.95 1 $2,300 .0486 1
TOTAL: 231 $12,575,330 |$1,160,753] 9.23 32 $1,224,136] 9.73 32 $1,798 | .0143 2

Pur

. Cantu, C.P.M., Director
sing & General Services

Approved:

f/ﬂ/i« _

Travis M. Bishop, Assist@ City Manager

Cit%omce
- P

reciitel
y Manager




SECTION I
COUNCIL, OCTOBER 16, 2003
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COMPETITIVE LOW BIDS

SECTIONI. COMPETITIVE LOW BIDS

The bids in this section are competitive bids in which award is recommended to the lowest bidders.
The terms of these contracts is indicated below.
COMMODITY MBE VENDOR

1. Copier Printer Paper Unisource Worldwide Inc
A173-04 Items 1A-1E, 3A-3B, 4A-41, 5A-5H,
Upon Award through 9-30-05 6, 8A-8B, 9, 10, 11A-B, 12A1, 12B1,
12Cl1, 12D1, 15-18
Est Amount $370,910

Clampitt Paper Co
Items 7, 12A2, 12B2, 12C2, 12D2,
13, 14
Est Amount $33,917
WBE
Universal Pen & Print
Item 2
Est Amount $2,300




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 29, 2003
For: Annual Contract for Copier Printer Paper
Unisource Worldwide, Inc. Clampitt Paper Co. Universal Pen & Print Boise Office solutions |Unisource/Paper Plus
A173-04 DG/dci4151 Woodcock Drive 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 10819 Nacogdoches Road {6007 Randolph Blvd. 8800 Broadway
Description Estimated |Jacksonville, San Antonio, San Antonio San Antonio, San Antonio,
item Quantity |FL_ 32207 TX 78217 TX 78217 TX 78233 TX 78217
1a|Offset Bond, white #4, 8 1/2° x 11", Sub 20, 55,500
Price per ream $1.84] $1.94] $21.80] $2.15 $2.11
Price total $102,120.00 $107,670.00 $1,209,900.00 $119,325.00) $117,105.00
Brand Name Domtar Copy Bond Domtar Copyi Domtar| Boise Econcsource
Price per ream $2.00 $2.11 No Bid| $2.27 No Bid
Price total $111,000.00] $117,105.00 $125,985.00]
Brand name recycled Domtar Recycled Copy Bond Domtar Recycled Copy| Boise Aspen
b|Offset Bond, white #4, 8 1/2" x 11*, Sub 20 7.000
pre-drilled with three holes
Price per ream $2.02 $2.11 $2.366 $2.33; $2.30]
Price total $14,140.00 $14,770.00] $16,562.00 $16,310.00 $16,100.00)
Brand name Domtar Copy Bond Domtar Copy]| Domtar} Boise Econosource,
Price per ream $2.18] $2.28 No Bid $2.45 No Bid
Price total $15,260.004 $15,960.00| $17,150.00
Brand name recycled Domtar Recycled Copy Bond Domtar Recycled Copy Boise Aspen
c|Offset Bond, white #4, 8 1/2° x 14°, Sub 20 4,000
Price per ream $2.37] $2.47 $2.55 $2.73 $2.70
Price total $9,480.00¢ $9,880.00 $10,200.00 $10,920.00! $10,800.00,
Brand name Domtar Copy Bond Domtar Copy] Domtar| Boise Econosource
Price per ream $2.57] $2.68 No Bid $2.88 No Bid
Price total $10,280.00) $10,720.00 $11,520.00
Brand name recycled Domtar Recycled Copy Bong Domtar Recycled Copy Boise Aspen
d|Oftset Bond, white #4, 11° x 17, Sub 20 400
Price per ream $3.72] $3.88| $4.09 $4.29] $2.11
Price total $1,468.004 $1,552.00] $1,636.00; $1,716.00] $844.00
Brand name Domtar Copy Bond Domtar Copy] Domtar| Boise Not Given:
Price per ream $4.04] $4.22 No Bid $4.52 No Bid
Price total $1,616.00§ $1,688.00 $1,808.00
Brand name recycled Dormtar Recycled Copy Bond Domtar Recycled Copy| Boise Aspen
a|Offset Bond, white 8 1/2" x 14", 24/60# weight, 400
Price per ream $3.363 $3.75 $3.63 No Bid No Bid
Price total $1,344.00 $1,500.00 $1,452.00
Brand name Domtar Whitehall Offset] windsor Offset Dormtar}
Deleted”

*Deleted as no bids were received on item.

Prepared by Purchasing 10/3/2003




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation
Opened: August 29, 2003
For: Annual Contract for Copier Printer Paper
Unisource Worldwide, Inc. Clampitt Paper Co. Universal Pen & Print Boise Office soiutions |Unisource/Paper Plus
A173-04 DG /dc|4151 Woodcock Drive 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 10819 Nacogdoches Road |6007 Randolph Blvd. (8800 Broadway
Description Estimated (Jacksonville, San Antonio, San Antonio San Antonio, San Antonio,
Iltem Quantity |FL 32207 TX 78217 TX 78217 TX 78233 TX 78217
2|Smooth 96 Brightness, white, 8 1/2" x 117, Sub 60, 1,000
500/RM
Price per ream $6.24 $3.2 $2.30 No Bid $2.75)
Price total $6,240.00 $3,230. $2,300.00 $2,750.00
Brand name Domtar Solutions Carrara White| Finch Opaque 94 Brigh Images or Dormag Navigator]
Deleted*
3a|Offset Bond, colored #4, 8 1/2° x 117, Sub 20 3,000
Price per ream $2.60% No Bid $3.42 $2.99 $2.98
Price total $7,800.00¢ $10,260.00) $8,970.00 $8,940.00
Brand name Domtar Colorsources Oomitar| Boise Colorsource
Price per ream $2.60 $2.99 No Bid No 8id No Bid
Price totat $7.800.00 $8,970.00
Brand name recycled Domtar Colorsource Hammermill /Fraser
b|Oftiset Bond, colored #4, 8 1/2* x 14", Sub 20, 500/RM 1,000 2J
Price per ream $3.3 No Bid $4.35 $3.79 $377
s Price total $3,320.00 $4,350.00 $3,790.00| $3,770.00
Brand name Domtar Colorsourcel Domtar] Boise Colorsource
Price per ream $3.32) $3.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $3,320.00) $3,810.00]
Brand name recycled Domtar Colorsource| Hammermill/Fraser|
4a|index, white, 8 1/2° x 11*, Sub 110, 260/RM 1,500
Price pef ream $3.68] $4.13 $4.58 $4.05 $4.08|
Price total $5,520.008 $6,195.00 $6,870.00] $6,075.00 $6,120.00]
Brand name Domtar Index Springhill Springhill Boise Colorsource
b|Index, white, 8 1/2" x 14", Sub 110, 250/RM 100
Price per ream $5.74 $5.49 $6.93 No Bid $5.19
Price totat $574.00 $549.00 $693.00| $519.00
Brand name Domtar Index Springhill Springhill Colorsourcel
clindex, buff, 8 1/2" x 11*, Sub 110, 250/RM 100
Price per ream $4.49] $4.98 No Bid $3.64]
Price total $449.00 $498.00 $364.00
Brand name Springhill Springhill Colorsource
d} Index, canary, 8 1/2" x 11", Sub 110, 25(/RM 100
Price per ream $4.49 $4.98 $4.05 $3.64
Price total $449.00 $498.00] $405.00| $364.00
Brand name Springhill Springhili Boise Colorsource)
e|index, green, 8 1/2" x 11°, Sub 110, 25/RM 100
Price per ream $4.49 $4.98 $4.05 $3.64
Price total $449.00 $498.00 $405.00) $364.00)
Brand name Springhill Springhill Boise! Colarsource!
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 29, 2003
For: Annual Contract for Copier Printer Paper
Unisource Wordwide, Inc. Clampitt Paper Co. Universal Pen & Print Boise Office solutions |Unisource/Paper Plus
A173-04 DG /dc|4151 Woodcock Drive 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 10819 Nacogdoches Road {6007 Randolph Blvd.  |8800 Broadway
Description Estimated |Jacksorwille, San Antonio, San Antonio San Antonio, San Antonio,
item Quantity [FL 32207 TX 78217 TX 78217 TX 78233 TX 78217
fjindex, blue, 8 1/2" x 11", Sub 110, 250/RM 100
Price per ream $39 $4.49 $4.98 $4.05 $364
Price total $398. $449.00 $498.00 $406.00! $364.00]
Brand name Dormntar Colorsou Springhill Springhill Boise Colorsource
glindex, pink, 8 1/2* x 11*, Sub 110, 250/RM 300
Price per ream $39 $4.49 $4.98] $4.05 No Bid
Price total $1,194. $1,347.00 $1,494.00 $1,215.00
Brand name Domtar Colorsou Springhill Springhill Boise
hiindex, salmon, 8 1/2" x 11°, Sub 110, 250/RM 200
Price per ream $3.98 $4.49 $4.98 $4.05 $3.64
Price total $796.004 $898.00| $996.00 $810.00 $728.00)
Brand name Domtar Colorsources Springhill Springhill Boise Colorsource
1|Index, white, 11* x 17, Sub 110, 250/RM 25
Price per ream $7.54] $8565 No Bid $3.64
Price total $188.50 $213.75 No Bid $91.00
Brand name Domtar Index Springhill Not Givan
5a|Carbonless Paper, 2 part, 8 1/2° x 117, reversed
sequence, black image, 20 Ib., 500/RM 300
Price par ream $4.44 $5.35| $6.87] No Bid| No Bid
Price total $1,332.004 $1,605.00 $2,061.00
Brand name Appleton Superio Mead Excel Mead
Price per ream $4. No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $1 ,3982?
Brand name recycled Recove
b|Carbonless Paper, 2 part, 8 1/2" x 14, reversed 300
sequence, black image, 20 Ib., 500/RM
Price per ream $5.65} $6.82| $8.74 No Bid No Bid
Price total $1,695.000 $2,046.00 $2,622.00]
Brand name Superior] Mead Excet Mead
Price per ream $5.94] No Bid No Bid No 8id NoBid
Price total $1,782.008
Brand name recycled Recover|
c|Carbonless Paper, 3 par, 8 1/2° x 11", reversed 600
sequence, black image, 20 |b.
Price per ream $4.9 $6.02 $7.73 No Bid No Bid
Price total $2,994. $3,612.00 $4,638.00
Brand name Superiol Mead Excel Mead
Price per ream $5.25) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $3,150.00
Brand name recycled Racoven]
diCarbonless Paper, 3 pan, 8 1/2° x 14°, reversed 600
sequence, black image, 20 lb.
Price per ream $6.34] $7.70 $9.84 No Bid No Bid
Price total $3,804.00¢ $4,620.00| $5,904.00]
Brand narme Superior] Mead Excel Mead:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 29, 2003
For: Annual Contract for Copier Printer Paper
Unisource Worldwide, Inc. Clampitt Paper Co. Universal Pen & Print Boise Office solutions jUnisource/Paper Plus
A173-04 DG/dc|4151 Woodcock Drive 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 10819 Nacogdoches Road |6007 Randoiph Bivd.  |8800 Broadway
Description Estimated |Jacksonville, San Antonio, San Antonio San Antonio, San Antonio,
ltem Quantity JFL 32207 TX 78217 TX 78217 TX 78233 TX 78217
Price per ream $6.69) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $4,014.00
Brand name recycled Recover|
a|Carbonless Paper, 4 part, 8 172" x 11", reversed 100
sequence, black image, 20 Ib.
Price per ream $5.34] $6.43 $8.27 No Bid No Bid
Price total $534.00; $643.00 $827.00
Brand name Superion Mead Excel Mead
Price per ream $5.754 No Bid! No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $575.00)
Brand name recycled Recover]
f{Carbonless Paper, 4 part, 8 1/2° x 14", reversed 50
sequence, black image, 20 |b., 500/RM
Price per ream $6.76{ $8.23 $10.52 No Bid No Bid
Price total $339.00k $411.50 $526.00)
Brand name Superior] Mead Excel Mead
Deleted*
g|Carbonless Paper, 5 part, 8 1/2* x 11", reversed 100
sequence, black image, 20 Ib., 500/RM
Price per ream $5.484 $6.61 $8.58 No Bid No Bid
Price total $548.00% $661.00 $858.00|
8rand name Superior] Mead Excel Mead
Deleted”
h{ Carbonless Paper, 5 part, 8 1/2" x 14", reversed 50
sequence, black image, 20 Ib., 500/RM
Price per ream $6.9 $8.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid|
Price total $349. $422 50
Brand name Superiof Mead Excel
Deleted*
6|Bond, white #4, 8 1/2° x 11", 25% rag, cockle finish, 1,400
201b.,
Price per ream $6.25{ No Bid $6.54 No Bid No Bid
Price totat $8,750.00¢ $9,156.00
Brand name Nekoosa Cotion| Capitol
Price per ream $6.25| $5.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $8,750.00 $7,966.00)
Brand name recycled Nekoosa Cotton Chadwick

Prepared by Purchasing 10/3/2003




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 29, 2003
For: Annual Contract for Copier Printer Paper
Unisource Worldwide, Inc. Clampitt Paper Co. Universal Pen & Print Boise Office solutions  |Unisource/Paper Plus
A173-04 DG /dc|4151 Woodcock Drive 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 10819 Nacogdaches Road |6007 Randolph Blvd.  |8800 Broadway
Description Estimated |Jacksonville, San Antonio, San Antonio San Antonio, San Antonio,
item Quantity |FL 32207 TX 78217 TX 78217 TX 78233 TX 78217
7|Smooth 95 Brightness, White 11" x 177, Sub 70, 1,000
Price per ream No Bidi $7.45 No Bid| No Bid! No Bid
Price total $7.450.00
Brand name Finch Opaque 94 Brighf]
Deleted”
8a|Chipboard, 8 1/2* x 11°, (.022) 960/sheets 20
Price per bundle $19.05; $27.40 $30.49! No Bidi No Bid
Price total $381.00 $548.00 $609.80,
Brand name Rockten Chipboard Roch Tenn Roctext
b{Chipboard, 8 1/2" x 14%, {.022) 760/sheets 20
Price per bundie $19.05] $27.40 $30.49 No Bid No Bid
Price total $381.00 $548.00 $609.80|
Brand name Rockten Chipboard Roch Tenn Roctext
9|Poly Window Envelopes, #10, 1/8 X 9 %, Sub 24, 500
Prica per box $6.22] $7.10 $8.22 No Bid| $6.55]
Prica total $3,110.00 $3,550.00 $4,110.00] $3,275.00|
Brand name Unisource Signef Kent Wove Universal Signet
Price per ream $6.72f No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|
Price total $3,360.00
Brand name recycled Unisource Recycled Signe
10|Linen Covers, 8 %2 X 11, 80 Ib., Long Grain, Assorted 50
Colors, 250/ream
Price per reams $7.85 No Bid No Bid| No 8id $18.73
Price total $392.50 $936.50
Brand name Domtar Nekoosa Linen Cover Classic Linen
Price per ream $7.85 $18.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $392.50) $900.00
Brand name recycied Domtar Nekossa Linan Covel Howard Linen|
11alOffset Bond, assorted colors, 8 1/27 x 117, 24/60# 300
weight, 500/RM
Price per ream $3. No Bid $5.49 No Bid $5.33
Price total $1,032. $1,647.00 $1,599.00]
Brand name Dormtar Colorsource Opaqud Domtar Colorsource
Price per ream $3.44] $3.67 No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Price total $1,032.001 $1,101.00
Brand name recycled Domtar Colorsource Opagues Hammermill/Springhill
b|Ottset Bond, assorted colors, 11" x 177, 24/60# 300
waeight, 500/RM
Price per ream $6.86 No Bid $5.248 No Bid $5.33]
Price total $2,058.00 $1,574.40 $1,599.00
Brand name Domtar Colorsource Opa Domtar| Colorsource
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 29, 2003
For: Annual Contract for Copier Printer Paper
Unisource Worldwide, Inc. Clampitt Paper Co. Universal Pen & Print Boise Office solutions  |Unisource/Paper Plus
A173-04 DG /dc|4151 Woodcock Drive 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 10819 Nacogdoches Road |6007 Randolph Bivd.  |8800 Broadway
Description Estimated |Jacksonville, San Antonio, San Antonio San Antonio, San Antonio,
Hem Quantity |FL 32207 TX 78217 X 78217 TX 78233 TX 78217
Price per ream $6.8 $7.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $2,058. $2,202.00
Brand name recycled Domtar Colorsource Opagu Springhitl
12| Tenxt, Brighthue, assorted colors, 8 1/2° x 11, 24/60# 65
weight, S00/RM
a1|Price per ream $6.2 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid|
Price total $404.
Brand name Domtar Hot
a2|Price per ream No Bids $5.1 Na Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $334.7
Brand name recycled Fraser Brights|
Text, Brighthue, assorted colors, 8 1/2" x 147, 24/60# 35
weight, 500/RM
b1|{Price per ream $7.48] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $261.80)
Brand name/Brand name recycled Domtar Hotsi
b2|Price per ream No Bi $6.514 No Bid No Bid! No Bid|
Price total $227.85
Brand name recycled Fraser BrightsF
Text Brighthue, assorted colors, 11% x 17%, 24/60# 35
weight, 500/RM
c1|Price per ream $12. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $435.7
Brand nama/Brand name recycled Domtar Hots|
c2|Price per ream No Bi $10. No Bid No Bid No Bid|
Price total $360.5
Brand name recycled Fraser Brights|
Text Brighthue, assorted colors, 8 1/2" x 117, 24/65# 200
weight, 500/RM
d1|Price per ream $11.44] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $2,288.00¢
Brand name/Brand name recycled Domtar Hot:
d2|Price per ream No Bids| $5.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $1,112.
Brand name recycled Fraser Brights|
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 29, 2003
For: Annual Contract for Copier Printer Paper
Unisource Worldwide, Inc. Clampitt Paper Co. Universai Pen & Print Boise Office solutions  |Unisource/Paper Plus
A173-04 DG /dc|4151 Woodcock Drive 3550 Ridgeside Dr. 10819 Nacogdoches Road |6007 Randoiph Blvd.  |8800 Broadway
Description Estimated |Jacksonville, San Antonio, San Antonio San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Quantity |FL 32207 TX 78217 TX 78217 TX 78233 TX 78217
13[Pumice Offset Vellum, 11° x 17", 28/70# weight, 60
S00/RM
Deleted"
Price per ream No Bidl $19.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $1,152.004
Brand name recycled Passport Pumicel
14(Xerographic Bond, white, 8 1/2" x 11, Sub 20, 500 12,000
sheets per ream
Price per ream $1.95] $1.94] $2.18 $2.15| $2.1
Price total $23,400.00 $23,280.00 $26,160.00 $25,800.00] $25,320.00
Brand/Stock No. Domtar Microprint Muttisystern Domtar Copy] Domtar] Boise P10X-9001 Econosource
No. of rearns per case 10 104 10 10] 10
15{Xerographic Bond, white, 8 1/2" x 11, 3- hole 3,200
punch, Sub 20,
Price per ream $2.11 $2.28] $2.366 $2.33 $2.300
Price total $6,752.00 $7,296.00 $7,571.20 $7,456.00 $27,600.00
Brand/Stock No. Domtar Microprint Multisystem Domtar Copy]| Domtar| Boise P10X9001P Not Given
No. of reams per case 10 10 10] 10 10
16|Xerographic Opague Paper, Starlite Torchglow Blue. 1,000
8 1/2* x 11, smooth finish one side, Sub 60
Price per ream $3. $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price total $3,360. $4,000.00
Domtar Opaque Biu Starlight Blue.
Brand/Stock No. Torchglow Opaquef
No. of reams per case 10 10|
17{Xerographic Bond, Assorted Colors, 8 1/2° x 11, Sub 1,000
20, 500 shts per ream
Price per ream $2.67] $2.99 $3.42 No Bid No Bid
Price total $2,670.004 $2,990.00 $3,420.00
Brana/Stock No. Domtar Multipurpose Colorsource Hammermill or Fraser] Domtar|
10 10 10|
18|Xerographic Index, green, 8 1/2° x 11, Sub 90, 250 500
sheets per raam
Price per ream $3.3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|
Price total $1,695.
Brand/Stock No. Domtar Colorsource index
9775551A)
Totals $400,550.35 $386,932.85 $1,340,999.20 $360,085.00 $229,672.50
Terms Net 30 2%-10)] Net 30 Net 30, Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $370,910.35] $33,917.1 $2,300.
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SECTION II
COUNCIL, OCTOBER 16, 2003
LOW QUALIFIED BIDS

SECTION II: LOW QUALIFIED BIDS

The bids in this section are competitive bids in which award is recommended to the lowest bidders.
The terms of these contracts is indicated below.

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR
Door to Door Delivery of Brush Collection MBE Door Direct Inc
Notices Entire Bid
A928-04 Est Amount $66,000

Upon Award through 9-30-04
With one-year option to extend




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 21, 2003

For: Annual Contract for Door to Door Delivery of Brush Collection Notices

Door Direct, Inc. Alternative Delivery ASJ Enterprises Guadalupe Samaniego R & R and Associates
Solutions Legal Services
A928-04 Aw/d 4306 Tej 4674 Callaghan Rd. 116 Villita, Suite 2
¢ 306 Tejasco 15454 Tradesman 145 Deer Creek Callaghan illta, Suite
San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ITEM Description TX 78218 TX 78249 TX 78070 TX 78228 TX 78205
1 Door to Door Delivery for One(1) Notice/Door Hanger NAS NAS
Price/M $120.000 $200.000 $160.000 $0.10/$100.00* $0.08/$80.00*
2 Door to Door Delivery for One(2) Notices/Door Hangers
Price/M $145.000 $260.000 $200.000 $0.10/$100.00* $0.15/$150.00*
3 Door to Door Delivery for One(3) Notices/Door Hangers
Price/M $185.000 $200.000 $220.000 $0.15/$150.00* $0.24/8240.00*
Terms 1%-10] 2%-10 5%-10 Net 30 Net 30
*Price has been adjusted for evaluation purposes only.
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