CITY OF SAN ANTONIO
INTERDEPARTMENTAL MEMORANDUM
PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT

TO: Mayor and City Council
FROM: Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services
THROUGH: Terry M. Brechtel, City Manager
COPIES: Travis M. Bishop, Assistant City Manager;
Robert Ojeda, Fire Chief;
File
SUBJECT: Fire Hose
DATE: September 4, 2003

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION:

This ordinance authorizes the Purchasing & General Services Department to accept the low
qualified bids that were submitted by Casco Industries, Inc., items 1, 5 and 6; Municipal
Emergency Services, items 3 and 4; Armored Textiles, Inc., item 7; and Ferrara Fire Apparatus,
items 8 and 9 to provide fire hose for the City of San Antonio Fire Department. Staff
recommends approval of this ordinance.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

The attached tabulation of five bids to provide the City of San Antonio Fire Department with fire
hose is hereby submitted for council consideration and action. The bids submitted by Armored
Textiles, Inc., item 1 and 3 failed to meet City specifications. The low qualified bids were
submitted by Casco Industries, Inc., items 1, 5 and 6; Municipal Emergency Services, items 3
and 4; Armored Textiles, Inc., item 7; and Ferrara Fire Apparatus, items 8 and 9.

The City of San Antonio Fire Department currently reviews the condition of the fire hose with a
scheduled and non-scheduled replacement program utilized for the Firefighting Division. This is
an annual purchase, which will provide the Fire Department with approximately 17,700 feet of
new fire hose and adapters.

The City of San Antonio Purchasing Department advertises bids in the Daily Commercial
Recorder, La Prensa, The San Antonio Observer, and the San Antonio Express-News. This
office also advertises bids on Public Access Channel 21, the Purchasing Website and utilizes the
services of Demandstar.com to notify registered vendors of City bids.

POLICY ANALYSIS:
This contract will provide the Fire Department Firefighting Division with various sizes of new
fire hose utilized in routine structural and brush firefighting. Replacement of older and/or
damaged hoses is necessary to ensure continued safety for the City’s Firefighters as well as the
community. The fire hose have a ten-year manufacturers warranty.
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FINANCIAL IMPACT:
The total cost of this contract is $66,252.60. Funding will be from the General Fund. All
expenditures will be in accordance with the FY2002-2003 budget approved by City Council.

COORDINATION
This ordinance has been coordinated with the City of San Antonio Fire Department.

SUPPLEMENTAL INFORMATION:
This contract was developed utilizing the formal competitive bid process; therefore, an Ethics
Disclosure Form is not required.

(Donud Lowste

Jaéie{B. Cantu, C.P.M., Director
Purchasing & General Services

/Z A /g\u, —

Travis M. Bishop, Assistant C@/ Manager
City Manager’s Office

JBC/cve




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:  August 08, 2003 Casco Industries Inc Armored Textiles, Inc. Municipal Emergency Ferrara Fire Apparatus  {Hagemeyer
Services
For; Fire Hose 516 E. 177th St 10 Main St. 3500 S Richey 774 Julia Dr. 306 Airline Dr, #100A
Ste. 170
03-088 TC/rm Georgetown Jaffrey Houston New Braunfels Coppell
TX 78626 NH 03452 TX 77017 TX 78130 TX 75019
ITEM Description
1 70 Sections - 5" Large Diameter Hose, Extruded, 100" Section NAS
Price Per Section $435.00 $429.87 $450.00 $448.00 $537.75
Total Price $30,450.00 $30,090.90 $31,500.00 $31,360.00 $37,642.50
Manufacturer Angus Hi-Volume Armored Textiles, Inc. North American Key Pro-Flow| Kidde Flexiine Flomaster
2 DELETED
3 - |8 Sections - 5" Large Diameter Hose, Extruded, 25' Sections NAS
Price Per Section $205.00 $171.55! $182.00 $187.50 $250.00
Yotal Price $1,640.00 $1,372.40 $1,456.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00
Manufacturer Angus Hi-Volume|  Armored Textiles, Inc. North American Key Pro-Flow| Kidde Flexline Flomaster
4 50 Sections - 1-3/4" Double Jacket Attack Hose, 50" Sections
Price Per Section $66.45 $64.61 $62.00 $63.08 $79.47
Total Price $3,322.50 $3,230.50] $3,100.00 $3,154.00 $3,973.50
Manufacturer Angus Ultima North American North American| Key-800 Kidde Flexiine
5 115 Sections - 1" Redline Booster Fire Hose, 100" Sections
Price Per Section $246.00 No Bid $356.00 $323.00 No Bid
Total Price $3,690.00 $5,340.00 $4,845.00
Manufacturer Boston Chemical North American Goodyear
6 15 Sections - 3/4* Redline Booster Fire Hose, 100" Sections
Price Per Section $203.00] No Bid $288.00 $270.00 No Bid
Total Price $3,045.00| $4,320.00 $4,050.00
Manufacturer Boston Chemical North American Goodyear
7 |40 Sections - 5" Large Diameter Hose, High Pressure, Double-
Jacket, 100’ Sections
Price Per Section $585.00 $522.79 $595.00 $572.22 $745.42
Total Price $23,400.00 $20,911.60 $23,800.00 $22,888.80 $29,816.80
Manufacturer Angus Hi-Pressure North American North American Key Hi-Pressure Kidde Angus
8 120 Each - 5" Storz to 5" NST Male Adapter
Price Per Each $104.00 No Bid $106.00 $85.00 $105.89
Total Price $2,080.00 $2,120.00 $1,700.00 $2,117.80
Manutacturer Harrington Harrington| Kochek 836 Storz
9 |20 Each - 5" Storz to 5" Female Swivel with Rocker Lugs Adapter
Price Per Each $116.85 No Bid $124.00 $95.00 $138.71
Total Price $2,337.00 $2,480.00 $1,900.00 $2,794.20
Manufacturer Task Force Tips Harrington)] Kochek] 54RL Storz
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 3% Net 30
Total Award $37,185.00 $20,811.60 $4,556.00 $3,600.00

Prepared by Purchasing 8/20/2003
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