
CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
INTERDEPARTMENTAL MEMORANDUM 

PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPART 

TO: Mayor and City Council 

FROM: Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services 

THROUGH: Terry M. Brechtel, City Manager 

COPIES: Erik J. Walsh, Assistant to the City Manager; 
Department Directors; File 

SUBJECT: Annual Contracts for Fiscal Year 2003-2004 

DATE: November 13,2003 

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION: 
The attached tabulations of bids is hereby submitted for Council consideration and action. Annually 
at this time, bids are requested for various materials, parts and services. This ordinance includes 
contracts for maintenance & repair of auxiliary generators, paper products & janitorial supplies, 
SOOMZ subscriber unit accessories, and pet food. 

Many bids are on a firm, non-escalating basis, while others such as petroleum related items and 
certain other commodities require escalation of prices during the contract period. Generally, bids 
reflect small increases over recent prior years, but in many cases reflect decreases. 

Recommended these contracts be approved. 

SECTION I: The bids in this section are competitive bids in which award is recommended to the 
lowest bidders. (4 contracts) 

SECTION II: The bids in this section are low qualified bids in which award is recommended to 
bidders other than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s 
specifications. (1 contract) 

POLICY ANALYSIS: 
Annual contracts are an efficient method of securing the best prices through volume purchasing and 
by reducing large amounts of work related to the bid process. This group of contracts represents a 
portion of approximately 250 annual contracts that will be brought before City Council throughout 
the remainder of the fiscal year. 

FINANCIAL IMPACT: 
Funds are not expended by this ordinance. All expenditures will be in accordance with the 2003- 
2004 budget approved by City Council. The combined total estimated amount for contracts listed on 
this ordinance is approximately $142,930. 



Page 2 - Memo to Mayor and Council 
Annual Contracts for FY2003-2004 

SUPPLEMENTAL COMMENTS: 
Several agencies including schools, municipalities, Bexar County, San Antonio Water System, and 
City Public Service have been included in some of the bids in a cooperative effort. 

MINORITY & WOMAN OWNED BUSINESS ENTERPRISE AWARDS: 
Number of Estimated Goal: WBE’s Goal: 

Council Contracts Dollars MBE’s 15% 10% 
Goal: 

AABE’s 3% 
1 Date Awarded Awarded 1 Amount 1 % I Awards I Amount I % I Awards I Amount I % 1 Awards 1 

3-20-03 6 $103,673 $53,915 52.0 2 $19,715 19.02 1 
4-10-03 5 $415,579 
4-24-03 7 $202.607 
5-l-03 I 11 1 $778,624 1 $415,873 1 53.41 1 2 I $439,375 I 56.43 I 2 / $1,498 / .192 / 1 
5-8-03 1 6 1 $270,202 1 $25,000 1 9.25 1 1 1 $24,000 1 8.88 1 2 1 

1 5-15-03 1 5 1 $157,948 1 $12,240 1 7.75 1 1 
5-22-03 4 $175,000 
5-29-03 4 $203,809 $25,000 12.27 2 $9,000 4.42 1 
6-5-03 4 $326,300 $25,000 7.66 1 $25,000 7.66 1 
6-12-03 6 $137.000 
6-26-03 48 $3,606,507 $129,292 3.55 6 $173,276 4.80 6 
8-7-03 35 $899,830 $235,189 26.14 6 $301,573 33.51 8 
8-14-03 11 $1,031,800 $76,000 7.37 2 

.-CL-IL ?<I q 8-28-03 18 $730,659 $LJ,U IU J.JI L 
9-4-03 4 $106,641 

9-18-03 15 $1.320.114 $78.894 5.98 3 

11-13-03 1 5 1 $142,930 $19,530 13.66 1 
TOTAL: 1 254 1 $13,808,395 $1,277,022 9.25 34 $1,256,112 9.10 34 $1,798 .0130 2 

P(&hasing & General Services 

E>k J. Walk, Assistant to the City Manager 
City Manager’s Office 



SECTION I 
COUNCIL, NOVEMBER 13,2003 

COMPETITIVE LOW BIDS 

SECTION I: COMPETITIVE LOW BIDS 

The bids in this section are competitive bids in which award is recommended to the lowest bidders. 
The terms of these contracts is indicated below. 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 
1. Maintenance & Repair of Auxillary Clifford Power Systems 

Generators for the Fire Department Entire Bid 
Al 18-04 Est Amount $33,000 
Upon Award through 9-30-04 
With two one-year options to extend 

To provide labor and materials for 
maintenance of auxiliary generators located at 
various Fire Stations throughout the City. 

2. Paper Products & Janitorial Supplies for 
Nutrition Centers 
A858-04 
Upon Award through 9-30-04 
With two one-year options to extend 

Unisource Worldwide Inc. 
Entire Bid 
Est Amount $68,03 1 

The items in this contract compliment the 
Comprehensive Nutrition Program by 
providing all the necessary paper goods and 
janitorial supplies for all centers. 

3. 800MZ Subscriber Unit Accessories Daily & Wells Communications 
A935-04 Item 3,4 
Upon Award through 9-30-04 Est Amount $11,736 
With one-year option to extend 

WBE L.A. Goodnow Co. Inc. dba New 
To provide headsets used by Special Eagle International 
Operations Units for communications and to Item 1 
allow hands-free radio operations in special Est Amount $19,530 
applications such as Helicopter and Swat 
Units. 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

‘pened: August 8,2003 

x Annual Conrract for Mainfenance d Repair of Auxiliary Generarors for Ihe Fire Departmen 

118-m MFudC 

Item Descrlptlon 

I 
1 Onan Generator Paris 

Percent of discount offered 
Product Information 
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) 
Price Schedule Number 
Date of Price Schedule 
Price Schedule Column on which discount is based (i.e. distributor, net, 

2 Koehler Generator Parts 
Percent of discounl offered 
Product Information 
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, Lobber. etc.) 
Price Schedule Number 
Date of Price Schedule 
Price Schedule Column on which discount is based (i.e. distributor, net, 

3 Caterpillar Generator Parts 
Percenl ol discount offered 
Product lnlormatlon 
Type o( Price Schedule (dealer. jobber. etc.) 
Price Schedule Number 
Dale of Price Schedule 
Price Schedule Column on which discount is based (i.e. distributor, net, 

4 Gsnerac Generator Parts 
Percent of discount olfered 
Product Information 
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber. etc.) 
Price Schedule Number 
Date of Price Schedule 
Price Schedule Column on which discount is based (i.e. distributor, net. 

5 Labor and Service 
Labor rate for services I Standard Hours 
Labor rate for services / Premium hours 
Paris available for pickup 

6 
A 

Auxiliary Generator Inspections 
Fire Station No. 1, 801 E. Houston. Onan Diesel, 12 KW 

“A 
‘El 
Fire Station No. 4. 1430 N. SI. Mary’s, Onan Diesel, 12 KW 
“A” 
‘El 
Fire Station No. 8. 810 Hamilton, Generac Natural Gas, 35KW 

“A” 
“5 
Fare Station No 9. 649 Delmar. Olympian Natural Gas, 35KW 
“A 
“E 
Fire Station No. 1 1,610 S. Frio. Koehler Natural Gas, 80 KW 

“A 
‘6 
Fire Station No. 12, 408 Tinker, Detroit Diesel, 60 kW 

“A 
“8” 
Fire Station No. 14.2515 Thousand Oaks, Koehler Diesel, 30 KW 
“A 
‘8 
Fire Station No. 15.3150 Ruiz, Onan Diesel, 30 KW 
“A 
‘8 
Fire Station No. 16, 2110 Nogalilos. Onan Natural Gas, 3.5 KW 

“A 
‘6 
Fire Station No. 17.8545 Jones Maltsberger, Onan Diesel. 30KW 
“A’ 
‘B 

195 W. Goforth Rd. 3302 S. W.W. White 

0% 
Onan Generator Parts Onan Generator Part 

Wholesale 
2003 
2003 

List 

2003 
2003 N 

0% 
Generator Parts 

Fleet 
NIA 

Jan 2003.04 
Fleet 

0% 
OEM 

Dealer 
N/A 

Currenl 
N/A 

5% 
Kohler Generator Parts Kohler Generator Part 

Distributor 
2003 2003 

Jan. Jan. 2003 2003 
List List 

0% I 
Generator Parts 

N/A 
N/A 
N/A 
N/A 

0% 
OEM 

Dealer 
N/A 

Current 
N/A 

0% 0% 
:aterpiltar Generator Parts :aterpiltar Generator Parts 

Wholesale Wholesale 
2003 2003 
2003 2003 

List List 

0% 
Generator Parts 

N/A 
N/A 
N/A 
N/A 

0% 
OEM 

Dealer 
N/A 

Current 
N/A 

5% 5% 
Generac Generator Parts Generac Generator Parts 

Wholesale Wholesale 
2003 2003 
2003 2003 

Lisl Lisl 

0% 
NIA 
N/A 
N/A 
N/A 
N/A 

0% 
OEM 

Dealer 
N/A 

Current 
N/A 

80.00 80.00 572.00 s70.00 
$105.00 $105.00 $108.00 s110.00 

3 Days 3 Days 14 Days 14 Days 

$331.00 $331.00 
$190.00 $190.00 

$331 .oo $331 .oo 
$190.00 $190.00 

$365.00 $365.00 
$190.00 $190.00 

$365.00 $365.00 
$190.00 $190.00 

5395.00 5395.00 
s190.00 s190.00 

$345.00 $345.00 
s190.00 s190.00 

$340.00 $340.00 
$190.00 $190.00 

S340.00 S340.00 
$190.00 $190.00 

$365.00 $365.00 
$190.00 $190.00 

S340.00 S340.00 

$549.00 5440.00 
399.00 5215.00 

$549.00 
8199.00 

s549.00 
$199.00 

s549.00 
$199.00 

$549.00 
$199.00 

$440.00 
S215.00 

5440.00 
s215.00 

S440.00 
5215.00 

5440.00 
$215.00 

5199.00 

$549.00 
$199.00 

$549.00 
$199.00 

$549.00 
$199.00 

S440.00 
$215.00 

5440.00 
5215.00 

5440.00 
5215.00 

5440.00 
$215.00 

$549.ooI s440.00 
S190.00~ S199.00( $215.00~ 

Prepared by Purchasing 9/16/2003 Page 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

pried: August 8.2003 

or: Annual Contract for Maintenance 6 Repair of Auxiliary Generators for the Fire Departmen 

.118-04 MRldc 

Item Descrlptlon 

K Fire Station No. 20.3347 S.WW While, Koehler Natural Gas, 35 KW 

L 

M 

N 

0 

P 

Q 

A 

S 

T 

U 

V 

W 

X 

Y 

2 

AA 

AB 

AC 

“A 
‘B 
Fire Statlon No. 21, 5537 South Floras. Olympian Diesel, 35 KW 
“A- 
‘B 
Fire Station No. 22, 1100 March, Onan Diesel. 30 KW 
“A” 
‘B 
Fire Station No. 26, 4140 Culebra. Onan Diesel, 30 KW 

‘A” 
“B 
Fire Station No. 29, 827 Hot Wells Blvd.. Onan Diesel, 30 KW 

“A 
“B 
Fire Station No. 32, 2235 Babcock, Olympian Natural Gas, 35 KW 
“A 
“0 
Fire Station No. 33. 2002 Southwest 36th. Onan Gas, I5 KW 
‘A 
“B 
Fire Station No. 34, 15300 Babcock, Onan Gas, 30 KW 
“A” 
“B 
Fire Station No. 35. 7038 C&bra. Onan Natural Gas, 35KW 
“A 
‘6 
Fire Stallon No. 36. 5826 Ray Ellison. Koehler Diesel, 33 KW 

‘A 
‘6 
Fire Station No. 38, 6000 Distribution. Onan Gas, 20 KW 
“A 
‘B 
Fire Station No. 39, 10750 Nacogdoches. Onan Diesel, 30 KW 
“A^ 
“0 
Fire Slation No. 40, 14331 O’Connor, Olympian Nalural Gas, 30 KW 
“A” 
‘5” 
Fire Station No. 41. 9146 Dover Ridge, Caterpillar Natural Gas, 30KW 
“A” 
“8” 
Fire Station No. 42. 10400 Horn, Onan Diesel, 12 KW 
“A” 
“8 
Fire Station No. 43. 2055 Bitters Rd., Onan Diesel, 30KW 
“A” 
“B 
Fire Stalion No. 44, 1351 Horal. Onan Diesel, 30KW 

“A 
*B 
Fire Station No. 46. 1165 Evans, Caterpillar Natural Gas, 40 KW 
“A” 
‘8 
Inspiration Hills, 4127 Willowbrook, Onan Propane, 3SKVA 
“A” 

Terms 

p: 10/01/03-09/30/2004 OPT: 2- 1 YR. EXTENSION-2006 

Mford Power SySlem.9 Cummins Southern 
Plains 

Holt Cal 

195 W. Goforth Rd. 

uda, 
X 78610 

6226 Pan Am 
Expressway 

San Antonio. 
TX 78218 

3302 S. W.W. White 
Rd. 

San Antonio, 
TX 78222 

5549.00 
$199.00 

$549 00 
$199.00 

5549.00 
s199.00 

S-549.00 
s199.00 

5549.00 
5199.00 

$549.00 
s199.00 

$549.00 
$199.00 

S-549.00 
$199.00 

5549.00 
$199.00 

s549.00 
$199.00 

5549.00 
$199.00 

5549.00 
5199.00 

s49.00 
$199.00 

$549.00 
5199.00 

s549.00 
$199.00 

5549.00 
$199.00 

$549.00 
$199.00 

5549.00 
$199.00 

Net 30 

S440.0 
5215.0’ 

5440.0 
5215.0 

5440.01 
5215.01 

5440.01 
5215.01 

S440.M 
5215.01 

$4400 
5215 01 

s440.01 
S215.0( 

S440.01 
5215.01 

S440.01 
5215.01 

5440.01 
5215.01 

S440.01 
s215.01 

s440 Ol 
s215.0< 

S44o.ot 
S215.0( 

%40.0( 
5215.01 

544o.ot 
52150 

S44o.ot 
S215.Ot 

$440.0( 
s215.Oi 

5440.01 
S215.0( 

Net 31 

Prepared by Purchasing 9/l 60303 Page 2 



Ipened: August 22.2003 

or Annual Contract for Paper Products 8 Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrittm Centers 

Item Deswtptton Etltmated 

Paper Towels, Kitchen 
Price Per Roll 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Nun-&r Per Case 

Paper Towels, Single Fold 
P&e Per Case 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Eand Number 
Number Per Case 

Scrub Pads. Heavy Duty 
Price Per Pad 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Gloves, Disposable Pdy. Medium 
Price Per Glove 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Aprons. Plaslic. Disposable 
Price Per Aprm 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Plaslio Wrap, Clear 
P&e Per BOX 
Prtce Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

AJurrinum Foil 
Price Per Box 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

4.280 

55 

67.ooO 

108.CC0 

50 

70 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Perkins Casca Perkins Casca 

NOB NOB 

NOB NOB 

NOB NOB 

No8 $0.0331 
$207.70 

The Safety Zone 
GDPE-MD 

10.~ 

No 

No8 

Royal Paper Prod 

$0.0224 
$2.419.20 

me Safety zone 
DAPI 25 24x24 

10X 

No 

NOB No Bid No 

NO@ NO Bid NO NoE Lid 

rely 8 company Dispozo Products, Inc. &Xx-v3 Supplies 8 Repairs 

19 Dwal Street P.O. Box 766 

m Antonio, Fcunlain Ann. 
I( 78208 SC 29644 

$0.711 No 
$3.043.08 

Winsdt 
Win 1220 

30 

$26.47 No 513.t 
$1.455.85 5718.1 

Fort James Advanta( 
FTJ20904 AD-Al C4 

No 

MB1 Staruest 

an Antonio. 
K 78247 

$0.1 
w7o.r 

Advanla( 
ADAlZ 

$14.1 
5e.4w.t 

A 
A-30! 

$O.fm 
$328.: 

ma Safety Zor 
sz-370 

1 o.ol 

No8 id 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 1 



op 
Fol 

: A8 
I 

lend: August 22.2CQ3 

r: Annual Contract for Paper Products 8 Janilortal 
Supplies For Nutdlicn Centers 

58-04 TCkk 

Item 

a 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

Toilet Tissue. 2 Ply 
Price Per Roll 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Forks. Plastic 
Price Per Fork 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

spoons. Plastic 
Price Per spoon 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Knives. Plastic 
Price Per Knife 
Price Total 

Brand Nan-a 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Picnic Pack, Plastic 
Price Per Pack 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Plates. 10 -, 3 CwnpaIlment 
Price Per Plate 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Deleted 

CUPS. a 02.. stfldoam 
Price Per cup 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

Estimated 

12,cco 

50.000 

129,wo 

76.0X 

201,750 

275,ooO 

220,txa 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

lisource Worldwide, 1%. All American Poly 

51 Woodcodr Drive 40 Turner Place 

ckscnville. Piscataway. 
32207 NJ 08854 

$0.2999 No Bi 
53.598.80 

NOQ 

NOB 

NOB 

NOB No Bi $O.l( 
$20.175.0 

NO 

Disport 
P5003PCKI: 

50 

NoE No Bi No Bi NOBi 

NoE 

wy 8 Company 

9 Dwd street 

ipozo PmdUcts, Inc. 

3. Box 766 

3one SupplleJ 8 Repairs 

Sal starcrest 

m Antonio, untain Ann. n Antcnio. 
: 76208 : 23644 78247 

$0.39@ 
54.756.8( 

Fort Jame: 
FTJ 191 

9f 

$0.0131 $0 oi 
$655.0( $1.oco.oc 

Did1 Dispozc 
DIX PFMZ PI001 

loo( 1Mx 

$0.013 
$1.689.9l 

Dixi, 
PTMP’ 

loo( 

$0.013 
S995.M 

$0.02 
$1.520.0( 

Dixi Dispozc 
PRM2 PlcG 

100 1004 

$0.012 
$2.828.0 

Dixl 
DCCBJ 

1OC 

No Bid NO 

$0.02 
162.5ao.M 

P&x 
loo( 

NOBi 

NO 

NO 

NO 

NO& 

Prepared by Purchasing 10131/2003 Page 2 



lpened: Au9ust 22,2003 

or Annual Contract 1~ Paper Products & Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrition Centers 

ma-04 TC/& 

Item Descrtptlon 

16 

17 

ia 

cups. a OZ.. squat 
Price Per cup 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Lid. a oz. squat. cup 
Pke Per Lid 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Bags. Brown Paper 
price Per Bag 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

B-q. Plastic Sandwich 
Ptice Per Bag 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Can Linen. 2Jx 1 (rx 39 
Price Per Liner 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Nwnber Per Case 

Can liners. 22% 16x 58 
Price Per Liner 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Can Uners, 16x14’~ 
Price per liner 
Price total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

Estimated 
Ctuantitles 

340,ooO 

315,cco 

148,cm 

146,OMl 

20.600 

22.103 

6.240 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

kource Worldwide. Ii-c. All American Poly my 8 Cwnpany spozo Products. Inc. 

151 Wcc&xk Drive 40 Turner Place 

Ickscwille. 
_ 32207 

Piscataway. . 
NJ 08854 

1 

NOB4 NOB NOBi NOB4 

NOB4 NOB NOB NOBi 

NO Bi NOB No B No Bi 

NOBi NOB NOB NOBi 

$0.049 $0.117 
$1.013.5 $2.422.: 

All American Pd The Safety Zor 
23103 I-LD20231038 

15 1t 

Nol3 $0.05 
S1.153.6 

Advantag 
ABaJ39XH 

15 

$0.103 so.: 
$2.280.7 54.42O.C 

All American Pd The Safety zw 
2165 I-LD2022165@ 

10 1t 

No & $0.094 
$2.084.0 

Advantag 
AB-3656Xt-h 

10 

$0.0495 
$309.1 

No B NOB $0.044 
5280. i 

All Amelican PO 
16143 

Advantag 
AB-3036Xkil 

20 

I9 Dwal Streel 0. Box 766 

an Antonio. 
x 78208 

xlntain Ann. 
3 29644 

-Stone Supplies 8 Repairs 

zxl Starcrest 

an Antcnio. 
x 78247 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 3 



m-d: August 22.2003 

I: Annuei Ccntrect for Paper Products 8 Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrition Centers 

se.-04 TCl& 

ttem 

23 

fksCrlptl0” 

Detergent, Liquid Pot and Pan, Gallon 

24 

25 

26 

27 

26 

29 

Price Per Bottle 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Band Number 
Number Per Case 

Bleach , Gallon 
Prkx Per Bottle 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Band Number 
Number Per Case 

Disinfectant. Pin&d, Gallon 
Price Per Bottle 
Price Total 

Band Name 
Brand Number 
Numb-x Per Case 

Cleaner. Toilet Bowl. Quart 
Pdce Per Bottle 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Napkins, White 
P&e Per Napkin 
Price Total 

Band Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Detergent, Dishwashing Machine 
Price Per Container 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Cleanor. Limo-A-Way. Gallon 
Price Per Bottle 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

INumber Per Case 

Estimated 
Quantltles 

792 

208 

3a4 

420,ooO 

20 cases 

40 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

lisoune Worldwide. Inc. All American Pdy 

51 Woodcock Drive 40 Turner Place 

cksonville. Piscalawey, 
32207 NJ 08854 

64.08 NO B 
$2.203.20 

Allstar Pine-O- 

Allstar Nonacid Bowl 

Cascade Cascade 
2629 2629 
6012 6012 

$a.15 6a.15 
$163.00 $163.00 

Atlstar Wave Cond Dishwasher Atlstar Wave Cond Dishwasher 
ui7892 ui7892 

1 1 

$4.54 $4.54 
6iai.60 6iai.60 

NOB NO 

NOB $7 
$1,591 

Cl< 
CL0 35 

NOB NO 

NOB NO 

No B 

NOB 

rery 8 Company 

9 Dwal Street 

m Antonio, 
( 78208 

NO 

NO 

NO 

rpozo Prodxts. Ins 

3. Box766 

w-ttain Ann, 
: 29644 

NOB 

NOB 

NOB 

NOB 

NOB 

NO8 

NOE 

Stone Supplies a Repairs 

?oal starcrest 

an Antonio, 
I( 78247 

$6.6 
$3.515.4 

Essential Liquid Dish Soi 
3JXF 

NOB 

NOB 

$1.2 
$514.5 

Essential Tits 6 Fixture Cl1 
296R 

NOB 

NOB 

No B 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 4 



wiled. August 22,2003 

K: Annual Contract for Paper Products 8 Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrition Centers 

158M TC/& 

Item DeSCrlptlOfl 

IDwreaser. Gallon 30 
PI& Per Bottle 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

31 Sanitized Skips 
price Per strip 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

32 Hair Nels 
Ptke Per Hair Net 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Nurrber Per Case 

33 straws. Individually wrapped 

Price Per Box 
Piice Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

34 Brush. Hand and Nail, 5 
Price Per Brush 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

35 Gloves. Disposable Pdy. Large - Eara Large 
Price Per Glove 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

36 Bag. Plastic Storage, Zip Lock, Quart 
price Per Bag 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

Estimated 
allantlties 

20 

27,072 

168 

50 

56.Oco 

53,000 

I Un 
41! 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Allsfar Super Power 

Flo Pat Daisy Han 

NO 

NO 

NO 

ely a company 

9 owal slreet 

m Antonio. wntain Ann. m Antonio. 
: 76208 ; 29644 C 78247 

No Bit NOBi NO 

NOBi 

$0.057 
$196.5 

The Safety Zcm 
DPLW-2 

144 

NOBi 

NOB NoE NC 

$0.00: 
b179.E 

The Safety Zor 
GDPL-LG or -) 

1 o.Oi 

NOB NOI NOE 

SpaLO Produck. Inc. 

0. Box 766 

NOB 

NOB 

162.: 
$420.1 

DiSpO. 
DSJW24.5M 

NoE NoE 

Stone Supplies 8 Repairs 

‘081 Starcrest 

NO 

NO 

NO 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 5 



Augusl22,2003 

Annual Con&xl for Paper Prcdwts &Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrilion Centers 

658.04 TC/dc 

Dercrlptlon 

Soap, Anti-Microbial Lotion, Cartridge 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Spacdle. Perfor&d. 4 oz. 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Spoodle. Solid, 4 oz. 
Price Per Each 
Price Tolal 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Tongs. Utility, 16 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Towels. Paper. Roll 
Price Per Roll 
Price TOM 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

TerK6 

Rid Tntal 

lT01al Eslimaled Award 
:otals have been adjusled lo reflect variances in packaging. 

Estimated 
QUWOtlll~S 

20 

94 

94 

94 

25 cases 

TERM: Up-on Award - Sept. 30.2004 with hvo (2) one-year extensions - Expires 2006 
CONTRACT MOUNT: $66,031.99 for one year; $204.095.97 for three years. 
END USER: Community initiatives - Nutrition Centers 
SCOPE: Items will be utilized by Community Initiatives for the City’s Comprehensive Nutrition 
Project serving 59 nutrition centers by providing meals to our community’s senior citizens. 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

nisource Worldwide, Iw. All American Poly 

I51 Wc.xkxck Drive 

1cksonville. 
_ 32207 

40 Turner Place 

Piscataway. 
NJ 08864 

$39.1 

% 

No Bi 
$703.2 

Allstar 
u1501 

NOB 

No BI 

G&S Grand Inc. 
Not Given I 

No BI 

Cascad 
10175 

1%-l 

$68,031.99 

$69.031.99 

lmMplete 

I 

very a Company ~spozo Products. Inc. 

19 Dwal Street 0. BOX 766 

an Antonio. 
X 76208 

xlntain Ann. 
3 29644 

No Bi 

NO&’ 

NOBi 

$1.7 
$510-C 

Fort Jan% 
FTJ 264-O 

1 

Net 3 

lncomplele 

No @i 

No Bi 

NO Bi 

NO Bi’ 

No 0i 

Net 3 

Stone Supplies 8 Repairs 

!081 Star-crest 

317 Antonio. 
< 76247 

NO 

NO 

NO 

NO 

6’ 
$35 

AdM”l 
ADA1 

NE 

lnccmpleIe 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 6 



F Kf 

3E 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation mned: August 22. xx)3 

K Annual Cmlracl for Paper Pmducls 8 Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrition Centers 

L56-w TC/& 

mtron Health Cars. 111~. *lock Paper Dist. PRIDE Enterprises QuiU Corporation fety Supply, Iffi. 

04 Kelton Jackson Road 

xingfield, 
4 37172 

XX Binr-Engleman. 
18 143 

an Antonio. 
K 76219 

12425 26th Street Ncfth 1 CO SChellar Rd. 

St. Petersburg. Lincolnshire. 
FL 33716 IL 60969 

O?dl Crownpoint. 
3160 

1-t Antonio. 
: 76233 

Item 
I 

Description 

NOBi No Bid 
Paper Towels. Kitchen 
Price Per Roll 
Price Total 

Esllmated 
Quantltles 

4.260 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Paper Tow&.. Single Fdd 
Price Per Case 
Price Total 

55 
NOBi 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Scrub Pads, Heavy Duty 
Price Per Pad 
Price Total 

600 
NOB 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per CaSa 

Gloves. Disposable Pdy, Medium 
Price Per Glove 
Price Total 

67.003 
$O.C 

b670S 

Brand Name Kentrc 
Brand Number 09503 Laq 
Number Per Case IM 

Aprons, Plastic. Disposable 
P&e Per Apron 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Plastic Wrap. Clear 
Price Per Box 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

Aluminum Fdl 
Price Per Box 
Price Total 

108,Mx) 

50 

70 

$O.of 
57.020.M 

Kontrc 
Not Gin 

II 

NOE 

No E4 $0.69.% 
$3.643.44 

scone> 
BID-01462Q6F 

3f 

$20.5 
$1,129.7( 

CSA Second Natun 
BID-SK165OE 

Ii 

No Bit 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

$1.63 
$6,976.40 

Prime Source 

Withdraw 

$0 0256 
$15.36 

755wxl 
12 

$14.55 
$600.25 

NC.Bi 

Prims Swrcel 
75w4301 

16 

$0.26 
$156.00 

3M 
N96 

20 

$0.0267 
$1.788.90 

NOBi 

1961 
2 

1 

so.cca 
$536.00 

$0.007 $0.0 
SO2.Y $2,6aO.O 

Galax Met-@ 
BlD.370h 5c.iOl 

100 1oC 

NOBi SO.02 
53.024.c 

Corda 
PA284 

IM 

NOB 

Impact 
8600 

Prims Scurce 
75005 1305 

Royal 
61702640 

NOBi 

Prims Source 
75033631 

$14.72 
$1.030.40 

Reynolds 
17300574 

NoE No Ei NO8 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 7 



>.3WId: AuSust22.2003 

lr: Annual CcWacl for Paper Products 8 Janitorial 
Supplies For Nulrition Cenlers 

I5804 TCl& 

Item DetCrlpUOtl 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

Toilet Tissue, 2 Ply 
Pdce Per Rdl 
Price Total 

12,Ow 
No 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$0.026 
$312.00 

Mainstreet 
TM1610 

96 

Forks. Plastic 
Pdce Per Foh 
Ptie Total 

50,WO 
NO 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$O.M)61 
BO5.W 

Regal I solo 
Not Given 

lK.0 

spoons. Flaslii 
Price Per spoon 
Price Tote1 

129,wJ 
No 

Band Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

8O.Oc61 
$786.90 

Regal I Sdo 
Not Given 

loo0 

Kniies. Plastic 
Price Per Knife 
Price Total 

76.000 
No 

Bmnd Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$0 owl 
$463.60 

Regal I Solo 
Not Given 

1oM) 

Piiic Pack, Plastic 
Price Per Pack 
Price Total 

201,750 

275,ooo 

22omJ 

No 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$0.cc62 
$1.250.85 

T/W 
Not Given 

250 

Plates, 10 -, 3 Ccmparlment 
Price Per Plate 
Price Total 

No 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$0.0505 
$13.887.50 

IkIll 
Not Given 

500 

Deleted 

Cups. 8 oz.. Styrofoam 
Price Per cup 
Price Tote1 

No $0.011 
$2.420.00 

Brand Name Dart 
Brand Number Not Given 

Estimated wingfield. 
auanuues 4 37172 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

mtron Health Care, Iw. 

C-4 Kelton Jackson Road 

ilock Paper Dist. PRIDE Enterprises Quill Corporation Salety supply. Inc. 

102 Binz-Englemen. 
18 143 

an Antonio. 
K 76219 

12425 28th Street Norlh 100 sheller Rd. lx)50 crowlpcint. 
S1e 160 

St. Petenbur9. Lincdnshire. San AnllniO. 
FL 33716 IL 60069 TX 78233 

$0.26 
$3.360.00 

Stelco 
17740238 

96 

$O.W737 
$368.50 

Regal 
18205210 

loo0 

$0.01 CO5 NO Bit 
$502.50 

Joseph Weil8 Sons 
BIDEFW White 

1000 

$0.00737 $0.01005 No Bit 
$950.73 $1296.45 

Regal Jmeph Weil8 Sons 
18205205 BIDESW White 

loo0 

$0.00737 
$560.12 

$0.06986 
$19,211.50 

Center Price 
18705326 

Master Container 
8D 

$0.333 No Bit 
53.996.w 

BID-740281 
96 

1030 

$0.01005 No Bi 
$763.80 

Jceeph Wail a Sons 
BID-EKW White 

loo0 

NoBi 

NoBi 

No BI 

WilUXJp 
BID-H85 

Prepared by Purchasing 1 O/31/2003 Page a 



ened: At&w3 22,ZWN 

r Annual Contract for Paper Products 8 Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrition Centers 

58-04 TC& 

item I DeSCrlpllOll 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

cups. 8 oz.. squat 
Price Per cup 
Pice Total 

Eslimated 
cauantlllet 

340,CCO 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Lid, 8 oz. squat. cup 
Price Per Lid 
Plice Total 

315.cc4 
NO 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Bags. Brown Paper 
Pdce Per Bag 
Price Total 

148,coJ 
NO $0.02123 

$3.142.04 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Bag, Plastic Sandwich 
Price Per Bag 
Price Tolal 

146.D’Xl 
NO 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Elkay 
Nol Given 

can uners. 23-x 10-x 39 
Price Per Liner 
Price Total 

20.600 
NO 

2 

1 

$0.071 
$1.46269 

Brand Name Tut1 Tote Herila~e 

Brand Number Not Given 

Number Per Case 150 

can tiners. 22’x 16-X 58 
Price Per Liner 
Price Total 

22.100 
NO 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$0.12 
$2.652.00 

Herilage 
l-r 

1M) 

can Liners. 16-x14%6 
Price per liner 
Price total 

6,240 
NC $O.ocz? 

$388.13 

Brand Name Heritage 

Brand Number TT 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

“tro” He&h Care. Inc. lock Paper DBI. PRIDE Enterprises 

04 Kelton Jackson Road 

~ringfield. 
I 37172 

$0.0151 5 
$5.270.01 3 

Mas!er Ccmtaine !, 
8( : 

50 0 

NOl NOI 

$0.010 4 
$3.276.0 0 

Masler Container s 
L24D’ ” 

100 0 

NO Nol 

$0.0233 7 
$3.458.7 6 

Kra h 
74cowa 85 

1OC lc 

NO NOl 

‘5 
15 

$0.01042 
$1.522X 

paper cc 
164DXf 

2M 

* 
* 
D 

$0.0: 
$4.788 

Zl 
Bid-94 

NO 

NOB id NO NO 

NO8 id NO NO 

NoE lid NC NO 

au ill Corporation 

lo( 3 Scheller Rd. 

tin c&shire. 
IL 60069 

- 

m Antonio. 
: 78233 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 9 



pened: AUQUSI 22,2003 

x Annual Cc&act for Paper Products 8 Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrition Centers 

958-04 TC/dc 

Item 

23 

24 

26 

26 

27 

26 

Desulptlon 

Detergent Liquid Pot and Pan, Gallon 
Pti Per Bottle 
Price Total 

NOB 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

tilcck Paper Dbl. PRIDE Enterprises GUI Corporalion Safely Supply, Inc. 

I02 Bin%Engleman. 12425 28th Streel North 100 Scheller Rd. lx)50 Crowpdnl. 
e 143 Sle 160 

In Antonio. St. Pelersburg, Lincolnshire. San Anlcnio. 
( 78219 FL 33716 IL 60069 TX 78233 

NO Bid $2.34 No Bid NoBi 
$1263.60 

Ptide Pot Sctub 
64150761 

Bleach. Gallon 
Price Per Bottle 
Price Total 

NOB $6.03 
54.775.76 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Tillyf B&o Pride General Purpme Bleach Clorox 
Not Given 64403204 BID-02490 

Disinfwlanl. Pin&d. Gallon 
Price Per Bottle 
Price Total 

208 
NOB 

4 4 

$5.58 $2.86 
$1,160.64 $594.88 

Brand Name Betco 
Brand Number No1 Given 
Number Per Case 4 

Cleaner. Toilet Bowl. Quati 
Price Per Bottle 
Price Total 

NOB $1.39 $1.24 $2.81 NOW 
$533.76 $476.16 $1.079.04 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Beta, 
Nol Given 

12 

Napkins, While 
Price Per Napkin 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

420,CCO 
NOB fO.cO45 

$1.89O.C0 

SCA 
D820 

12 

Detergent, Dishwashing Machine 
P&e Per Container 
Price Total 

20 cases 
NOB 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$1.07 
$658.05 

Cascade 
Not Given 

6 

Cleaner. Lime-A-Way. Gallon 
Price Per Bottle 
Price Total 

40 
NO!? 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

$4.45 
$178.00 

B&O 
AC1 14 

4 

Estimated 
QWdWill~S 

540 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

mlron Health Care, lrc. 

504 Kelton Jackson Road 

pringlield. 
N 37172 

4 

$1.00 $2.49 
5792.w $1.972.08 

NOBi 

NOBi 

Pride Pine Gerticide 
644w404 

4 

LW 
BID-74278 

1 

$0.005575 
$2,341.50 

S.C.A. Napkins 
14100780 

6OXt 

$0.00688 
$2.889.60 

Coronet 
BID-L3141 

6cco 

NO& 

W4.W 
$880.00 

Prima Source 
75034180 

1 

$2.21 NOB4 
$1.060.80 

C@CM4 
BID378010 

24 

$2.16 
$86.40 

Pride Lime Free 
64101304 

4 

No Bid NOB 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 10 



pe”ed: August 22,2W3 

a: Annual Ccmacl for Paper Products 8 Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrition Centers 

E&o4 TUdc 

Item DescripUon 

30 Degreaser. Gallon 
Price Per Boll19 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

31 

32 

33 

34 

35 

36 

Sanitized Strips 
Price Per Ship 
Price Tolal 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Heir Nels 
Price Per Hair Nel 
Price Total 

Brand Nan-s 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Straws. Individually Wrapped 
Price Per Bar 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Brush. Hand and Nail, 5 
Price Per Brush 
Price Told 

Band Name 
Band Number 
Number Per Case 

Gloves. Disposable Pdy. Large - Extra Large 
Phe Per Glove 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Baa Plastic Storage. zip Lock, Quart 
Price Per Bag 
Price Total 

Brand Nan-se 
Brand Number 

INumber Per Case 

Etllmaled 
auanllller 

20 

5.ooo 

27.072 

168 

50 

58,ooO 

53,ccO 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

enlron Health Care. Ino. 

504 Kellon Jackson Road 

pringfield. 
v 37172 

NO5 

P T 3 
S 
S 
T 

id 

t 
NOBi 

$0.0 $0.10 
$2,165.7 $2.707.20 

Kenlro CfAycap 
940075b Not Given 

100 1440 

NOE? $1.49 
$250.32 

Sdo 
Nol Given 

24 

NOB 

$O.C f0.008 $0.0054 $0.0075 
Lb58O.C 6464.ooo $371.7 $435.00 

Kenlrc IlllpoCl Prima sourc 
09x 

Galaxy 
Not Given 75007140 BID370L 

lo( Not Given 1o.w lO.ooo 

$O.C $0.0213 
161.59o.c $1.128.90 

No Bi 

Kenlrc 
20081 

5( 

Ziplock 
Not Given 

‘dlcck Paper Disl. PRIDE Enterprises Quill Corporation .%ety supply. II-%. 

$4.57 
591.40 

Belco 
Not Give” 

4 

$O.oa 
$45x0 

NPBPC 
Nol Given 

1w 

$1.04 
$52.W 

Flopac 
Not Given 

1 

802 BinsEngleman. 
ste 143 

#an Antonio. 
X 78219 

I2425 28lh Street Nodh 100 Sohelter Rd. 

St. Petersburg, Lincdnshire, 
FL 33716 IL 60069 

12050 crowlpdnt. 
Se 160 

San Anlonio, 
TX 78233 

$1.68 $12.44 
$33.20 $62.20 

Pride Power Punch Simple Green 
643wzQ4 BID13W5Q 

NOB 

No &‘I No Bid No Bi 

$0.02 
$566.5 

River Cit 
04wBc 

lOi- 

$4.4 
$764.3 

Clear Shit? 
1820210 

$5.61 
$942.48 

Dixie 
BID-JWHO 

IO 

No BI 

No Bi No Bid NOBi 

NOB 

1 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 11 



IpWWd: Au&St 22,zoa 

CJC Annual Contract for Paper P&u% & Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrition Centers 

658-04 TC/ck 

Item 

37 

DeSCrlpliOll 

SOap, Anti-Micrc4ial Lotion. Carthdoe 

38 

39 

40 

41 

Prkx Per case 
Price Total 

Band Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Spoodle. Perfwated, 4 oz. 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Spade. Sdid. 4 oz. 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Tongs. Utility. 16 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Towels. Paper. Roll 
Price Per Roll 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

TermS 

IBid Total 

/Total Estimated Award 
otals hare been adjusted to reflect variances in packaging. 

Estimated 
auantitler 

20 

94 

94 

94 

25 cases 

TERM: Upon Award - Sept. 30.2004 with two (2) one-year extensions - Expires 2006 
CONTRACT AMOUNT: $68.031.99 for one year. $204.095.97 for three years. 
END USER: Community Initiatives - Nutrition Centers 
SCOPE: Items will be utilized by Community lnitlatlves for the Ciys Comprehensive Nutrition 
Project serving 58 nutrition centers by providing meals lo our community’s senior citizens. 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

enIrOn Health Care, Inc. 

EO4 Kelton Jackson Road 

pringfield. 
N 37172 

NO 

NO 

NO 

NO 

NO 

1% 

Incomplete 

‘Meek Paper Dist. PRIDE Enterprises 

602 Binz-Engleman. 12425 28th Street NoRh 
ite 143 

ian Antonio, St. Petersburg. 
x 76219 FL 33716 

526.99 NOB 
$579.80 

F%tco 
Not Given 

12 

$6.48 
$EOs.lZ 

NOB NO NoE 

ALMI 
Not Given 

1 

$6.48 NOB 
$609.12 

ALM 
Not Given 

1 

$3.75 
$352.50 

NOB 

ALM 
Not Given 

Prime Soun 
750043; 

uill Corporati 

x) Schelter Rd. 

ncdnshire. 
.6oc69 

NC NoE 

NO 

NO 

S’ 
$545 

Jceeph Weil & S 
BID-RK3 

Nt3 

Incomplete 

ialety Supply. Inc. 

2a50 Crownpoint. 
ite 160 

lan Antonio. 
X 78233 

NO6 

NO8 

NO@ 

Net : 

IMXNllpMe 
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pened: AUQUSI 22,2txo 

x: Annual Contract for Paper Products &Janitorial 
Supplies FM Nutrition Centers 

556.04 TCXJC 

km Deocrlptlon 

I 
1 (Paper Tow&. Kitchen 

P&e Per Roll 
P&x Total 

Estimated 
Quantltles 

4,260 
$0.72 NOBi 

$3.06160 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Mainstreet 
Hl31990 (#2098) 

30 

Paper Towels. Single Fdd 
Price Per case 
Price Total 

55 
$26.97 NOB 

$1.48335 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Scrub Pads, Heavy Duly 
Price Per Pad 
Price Total 

$0.26 NOB 
$168.00 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Gloves, Dispmable Pdy, Medium 
Price Per Glove 
Price Total 

67,Mx) 
$0.06 No Bi 

$5.36O.c0 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Rotson 
DGWll (111642) 

Aprons. Plastic, Disposable 
Price Per Aprrm 
Price Total 

1 

“I 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$0.05 NOBi 
$5,4cO.@l 

R&on 

Plastic wrap. Clear 
Price Per Box 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 11162 PVC 16.(X2516) 

Alurrinum Foil 
Price Per Box 
Price Total 

108.0 

50 

70 
$22.64 No 0 

$1.56460 

Brand Name Durable 
Brand Number fl.91805 (#lw4) 

1 

u 

P. 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

NOB 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 13 



X%%U: August 22,zoa 

K Annual Contrad la Paper Products 8 Janitorial 
Supplies For NutritiM Centers 

l56-04 TCldc 

Item 

0 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

Tcilet Tissue. 2 Ply 

Descrlptio” 

. Price Per Roll 
Price Total 

12.ow 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

S. Whdesale Prodwcts Unipak Corp. 

0. BOX 34403 P.O. Box 3oxQ7 

tn Antonio. Brwkly”. 
( 762654463 NY 11230 

$0.05 NOB 
$60300 

National 
X002 (U3792) 

Forks. Plastic 
Price Per Fork 
Pke Total 

50,ooo 

96 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$0.0081 NOB 
$405.W 

Polar 
70043 (Y1620) 

1 .wo.OOO 

Spoo”s. Plastic 
Price Per spoca 
Price Total 

129.OCO 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$O.cQ61 
$1 .c.w.SO 

Polar 
7w (X1622) 

1 .ooo.MM 

Knives. Plastic 
Price Per Knile 
P&e Total 

76,OCG 

Brand Name 
Brand Nu”&%r 
Number Per Case 

$0.0361 NOB 
$615.60 

P&r 
70041 (Y1621) 

~,~.~ 

Picnic Pack. Plastic 
Price Per Pack 
Price Total 

201.750 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

$0.0702 NOB 
$14.162.65 

Tidewater 

Plates, 10 -, 3 Co”lpattma”l 
Price Per Plate 
Price Total 

275,ooO 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Da” 
1OcPWC 10.25’(#1971) 

D&led 

cups, 6 oz.. Styrdoam 
price Per cup 
Price Total 

220,cca 

Brand Name Dar( 
Brand Number 6J6 (U2502) 

[Number Per Case 1 .oW.wO 

Estimated 

1 U. 

P. 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

NOB 

NOE 

Prepared by Purchasing 10/31/2003 Page 14 



Aw&st 22.2C03 

Annual Contact for Paper Products & Janitwial 
Supplies For Nutritia, Centers 

a5t3.04 TC/& 

Item 

16 

17 

16 

19 

20 

21 

22 

Cups. 6 oz., Squat 
Price Per Cup 
Price Total 

Dercrlptlon 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Lid, 0 oz. squat. cup 
Price Per Lid 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Band Number 
Number Per Case 

Bags, Brow” Paper 
Price Per Bag 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Bag. Plastic Sandwich 
Price Per Bag 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Nunber 
Number Per Case 

can Liners. 23-x 10-x 39 
Price Per Liner 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Can Liners. 22-x 16-x 50 
Price Per Liner 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Can Liners. 16k14w6 
Price per liner 
Price total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

)Number per case 

Estimated 
auantitles 

3‘wml 

315,ooo 

148.CKt 

146.wo 

20,600 

22,tcQ 

6,240 

1 U 

P. 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

.s. wholesale Prcducts lnipak Corp. 

.o. Box 34483 .O. Box3CCO27 

sn Antcnio. rmw”. 
X 762654493 ‘Y 11230 

$0.021 
$7.14O.C 

Ds 
85512 (#151! 

l.ooO.o( 

NOBi 

NOB 

No Bi 

NO Bi 

NOES 

NOBi 

NOBi 

NOBi 

NOBi 

$0.061 
$1.660.9 

upt 
40x1 

15 

$0.139 
$3.002.9 

upt 
60x1 

10 

$0.065 
$406.1 

UPI 
37x1 
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. 

Of 
FC 

i 
At 

N 

mmd: August 22,2W3 

K Annual Contract for Paper Products 8 Janitorial 
Supplies For Nutrition Centen 

lso4 TC& 

km DeSC~lpUOIl 

I 

23 ~Delargenl. Liauid Pot and Pan, Gallon 

24 

25 

26 

27 

Price Per sot& 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Bleach , Gallon 
Price Per Bottle 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Disinfectant. Pine-Sol. Gallon 
Price Per Boltle 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Cleaner. Toilet Bowl. Quad 
Price Per Bonle 
Price Total 

Brand Nan-a 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Napkins. While 
Prke Per Napkin 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Delerganl. Dishwashing Machine 
Price Per Container 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Cleaner. Lime-A-Way. Gallon 
Prkx Per Bottle 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

Estimated 
Quantltles 

540 

792 

208 

364 

420,CCO 

20 cases 

40 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

I. WhOleSSlS Products lipak Corp. 

). Box 34483 

Un r P.1 3. Box 3cw27 

n Antonio. *Yn 
78265-4463 ’ 11230 

NOBi 

NO6 

NO6 

NoE NOI 

NoE NOl 

NO& 

NOB 

NOB 

NOI 

Not 
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P3”%d: AUQUS! 22,2W3 

r: Annual Cmlrad for Paper Prodazls 8 Janitorial 
Supplies Fw Nutrilicn Centers 

m-04 TC/dc 

liem DeSdpth 

30 Degreaser, Gallon 

31 

32 

33 

34 

35 

36 

Price Per Bottle 
Price Tolal 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Sanilized Strips 
Pke Per strip 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Hair NelS 
Price Per Hair Nel 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Straws, Individually Wrapped 
Price Per Box 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Blush. Hand and Nail. 5 
P&x Per Brush 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Gloves. Disposable Pdy, Large - Exlra Large 
Price Per Glove 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Bag. Plastic Skxage. Zip Leek. Ouarl 
Price Per Bag 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 

/Number Per Case 

Estimated 
aua”ulles 

20 

27,072 

168 

50 

5a.ooo 

53.003 

F U. 

P.1 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

s. Wholesale Products 

0. Box 34463 

m Antonio, 
: 782654463 

NO 

NO 

NO 

NO 

NO 

NC 

ipak Corp. 

1. Box XX027 

=w. 
’ 11230 

NOBi 

NOB 

NO B 

NOB 

No E 

NoE 

No E 
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mned: 

‘C 

August 22.2oQ3 

Annual Conlraa for Paper Products & Janilorial 
Supplies For Nufrkion Centers 

m-04 

Item DeSCdpUO” 

TCldc 

Estimated 
Qu*“uues 

37 Soap. Anti-Microbial Lotion. Canridge 

38 

39 

40 

41 

Price Par case 
Pke Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Spcdle. Perforated. 4 oz. 
Price Par Each 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Spoodle. Sdid. 4 oz. 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Nu-r&er Per Case 

Tongs. Lltility. 16’ 
Price Per Each 
Price Total 

Brand Name 
Brand Numbar 
Number Per Case 

Towels, Paper, Roll 
Pdcs Per Rdl 
Price TOW 

Brand Name 
Brand Number 
Number Per Case 

Te”“S 

IBid Total ln-xx”plete 

/Total Estimaled Award 
-&Is have been adjusted lo reflect variances in packaping. 

20 

94 

94 

94 

25 cases 

TERM: Upon Award - Sept. 30.2004 with two (2) one-year extensions - Expires 2006 
CONTRACT AMOUNT: $66031.99 for one year; $204,095.97 for three years. 
END USER: Community Initiatives - Nutrition Centers 
SCOPE: Items will be utilized by Community lniliatives for the Cily% Comprehensive Nutrition 
Project sewing 58 nutrition centers by providing me& to our community’s senior citizens. 

,City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

S. Whdesale Producls 

3. Box 34483 

m Antonio. 
: 71326544133 

No Bi NO 

NOBi 

NOBi 

NO Bi NC 

NOB NoE 

Net : 

lipak Corp. 

0. Box 3ooo27 

‘xw”. 
Y 11230 

NO 

NO 

Nd : 

lncofnplete 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

?ened: August 22,2003 

Annual Contract for 800MZ Subscriber Unit Accessories 

335-m LB/de 

Item Descrlptlon 
Estimated 
Quantities 

1 Special Operations, Low Profile Headset 
Price each 
Total Price 
Brand/Model No. 

2 Deleted 

3 XP Headset 
Price each 
Total Price 
Brand/Model No. 

4 Permanent Panel Mounts 
Price each 
Total Price 
Brand/Model No. 

4 
o Bid: Industrial Communications 

C P: Upon Award thru 09/30/2004 OPT: 1 YR. EXT-EXPIRES 2005 
* Item 4 Price includes item 3 XP Headset and cannot be purchased individually 

35 

12 

8 

$518.00 --=I No Bi 
$6,216.00 

David Clark Co. IndHl O-1 3X 

Iavid Clark Co. lnc/~%~~~ 

---I 
30 Days 

No Bi 

21-35 Da) 

Net 30 
$11,73&OOI 

Net 3 
$19.53O.C 

s -‘.-.- 
Prepared by Purchasing 1 l/3/2003 Page 1 



SECTION II 
COUNCIL, NOVEMBER 13,2003 

LOW QUALIFIED BIDS 

SECTION II: LOW QUALIFIED BIDS 

The bids in this section are competitive bids in which award is recommended to the lowest bidders. 
The terms of these contracts is indicated below. 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 

1. Pet Food U.S. Wholesale Products 
A889-04 Entire Bid 
Upon Award through 9-30-04 Est Amount $10,633 
With one-year option to extend , 

To provide complete and balanced nutritional 
dog food for the K-9 Units. 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

0 

r 

pened: October 27,2003 

I 

nnual Contract For: Pet Food 

889-04 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

I Deleted 

Deleted 

Canine Active Performance Dry Dog Food 
Price per pound 
Price total 
Brand & Mfr. No. 
Number of pounds per bag 
Delivery 

Adult Lamb 8. Rice Formula Dry Dog Food 
Price per pound 
Price total 
Brand & Mfr. No. 
Number of pounds per bag 
Delivery 

Fish and Sweet Potato Dog Food 
Price per pound 
Price total 
Brand & Mfr. No. 
Number of pounds per bag 
Delivery 

Adult Chicken and Rice Formula Dog Can FOC 
Price per 14 oz. can 
Price total 
Brand & Mfr. No. 
Number of ounces per can 
Delivery 

Adult Beef Formula Dog Can food 
Price per 14 oz. can 
Price total 
Brand & Mfr. No. 
Number of ounces per can 
Delivery 

Terms 

IEstimated Award 

DFUdc 

ESTIMATED 
QUANTD-Y 

8,750 Ibs. 

600 Ibs. 

360 Ibs. 

432 cans 

432 cans 

S. Wholesale Products 
Alternate 

U.S. Wholesale Products 

Eukanuba Penorma 

Eukanuba 

Wellness Fish 8 

$1.21 
$522.72 

lams Adult Chicken & Rice 
1402. 

2-3 Days 

$1.21 
$522.72 

lams Canned Beef Formula lams Canned Beef Formul 
1402. 

2-3 Days 

Net 30 Net 3011 

NAS 
$0.7 

$6,125X 
Diamond Pet FOc 

3 
2-3 Day 

NAS 
$0.6 

$402.0 
Diamond Pet FOC 

3 
2-3 Da) 

No B 

No 6 

No Bi 

Net : 
II 

$10,633.24( 
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