
PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT 

TO: Mayor and City Council 

FROM: Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services 

THROUGH: Terry M. Brechtel, City Manager 

COPIES: Erik J. Walsh, Assistant to the City Manager; 
Department Directors; File 

SUBJECT: Annual Contracts for Fiscal Year 2004-2005 

DATE: May 27,2004 

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION: 
The attached tabulations of bids is hereby submitted for Council consideration and action. Annually 
at this time, bids are requested for various materials, parts and services. This ordinance includes 
Ultra OPT/CICS and SQL Back Track for MC SQL SR/BMC maintenance renewal, PC 
Dots/Fulcrum Enterprise Suite and traffic sign materials. 

Many bids are on a firm, non-escalating basis, while others such as petroleum related items and 
certain other commodities require escalation of prices during the contract period. Generally, bids 
reflect small increases over recent prior years, but in many cases reflect decreases. 

It is recommended these contracts be approved. 

SECTION I: The bids in this section are single source of supply contracts. (1 contract) 

SECTION II: The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to 
the lowest bidder. (1 contract) 

SECTION III: The bids in this section are low qualified bids in which award is recommended to 
bidders other than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s 
specifications. (4 contracts) 

POLICY ANALYSIS: 
Annual contracts are an efficient method of securing the best prices through volume purchasing and 
by reducing large amounts of work related to the bid process. This group of contracts represents a 
portion of approximately 250 annual contracts that will be brought before City Council throughout 
the remainder of the fiscal year. 

FINANCIAL IMPACT: 
Funds are not expended by this ordinance. All expenditures will be in accordance with the FY 2004- 
2005 budget approved by City Council. The combined total estimated amount for contracts listed on 
this ordinance is approximately $2688 18. 
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SUPPLEMENTAL COMMENTS: 
Several agencies including schools, municipalities, Bexar County, San Antonio Water System, and 
City Public Service have been included in some of the bids in a cooperative effort. 

&Thti 
VJ anie Cantu, C.P.M., Director 

Purchasing & General Services 

Approved: 

Erik J. Walk, Assistant to the City Manager 
City Manager’s Office 



SECTION I 
COUNCIL, MAY 27,2004 
SINGLE SOURCE BIDS 

SECTION I: SINGLE SOURCE BIDS 

The bids in this section are single source of supply contracts. The term of these contracts is indicated 
below. 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 
1. PC Dots/Fulcrum Enterprise Suite Hummingbird, Ltd. 

A733-05 Entire Bid 
lo-l-04 through 9-30-05 Est Amount $70,328 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Information Technology Services 
Department with software upgrades that will 
enhance the existing functionality and adds 
new functionality to the products that 
integrate with Microsoft Office and other City 
software. 



CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR: PC DOCS/FULCRUM ENTERPRISE SUITE (A7331 

Hummingbird, Ltd. 
1 Sparks Avenue 
Toronto, Ontario M2H 2Wl 

Description Total Price Annually 

Maintenance Renewal Hummingbird DMYDOCS Open 
Enterprise Suite Support Renewal Platinum, DM 
(October 1, 2004 - September 30, 2005) 

$70,328.39 

Terms Net 30 

DS/dg 
A733-05 



SECTION II 
COUNCIL, MAY 27,2004 
LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS 

SECTION II: LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS 

The bids in this section are low bids in which award is recommended to the lowest bidders. 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 

1. Ultra OPT/CICS & SQL Back Track for MS Floyd Thomas, LLC 
SQL SR/BMC Maintenance Renewal Utilizing the D.I.R. “GoDirect” 
A805-05 Contract No. DIR-VPC-03-014 
lo-l-04 through 9-30-05 Entire Bid 

Est Amount $41,677 
This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Information Technology Services 
Department with software maintenance 
renewal for software used to maximize user 
productivity by increasing network 
throughout, as well as, ensure maximum 
recoverability of mission critical applications. 



, 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR: ULTRA OPT/CICS & SQL BACK TRACK FOR MS SQL SR./BMC 
MAINTENANCE RENEWAL 

Floyd Thomas LLC 
6505 Winterberry Drive 
Austin, Texas 78750-83 19 

DESCRIPTION 

CMF Monitor 

Mainview AutoOPERATION for OS/390 

Mainview FOCAL POINT 

Mainview for OS/390 

SQL Back Track for Microsoft Server 

ULTRAOPT/CICS 

Less Discount 

TOTAL 

(October 1,2004 - September 30,2005) 
GODirect Contract : DIR-VPC-03-014 

PRICE 

$7,968.24 

$6824.71 

$3,255.29 

$10,752.94 

$4,045.88 

$9,230.59 

$400.00 

$41,677.65 

TERMS 

DG 
A805-05 

NET 30 



SECTION III 
COUNCIL, MAY 27,2004 ‘ 
LOW QUALIFIED BIDS 

SECTION III: LOW QUALIFIED BIDS 

The bids in this section are low qualified bids in which award is recommended to bidders other than 
the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s specifications. 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 
1. Traffic Sign Materials 3M 

Al 84-05 Items l-6, 8,9, 12A-B 
lo- l-04 through 9-30-05 Est Amount $85,185 
with two one-year options to extend 

American Traffic Safety Materials 
This contract will provide the City of San Items 1 OA-B 
Antonio Public Works Traffic Division with Est Amount $44,478 
traffic sign material for fabrication of street 
signs and directional markings. These Nippon Carbide Corporation 
material are used to manufacture signs and Item 7 
other traffic signs such as stop signs, yield Est Amount $23,490 
signs, street signs, etc. 

Custom Products Corporation 
Items 11 A-B 
Est Amount $3,660 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation . 

u?nedz Apdl26.2Qo4 

r: Annual Contract for Tnffu Sign MatedsIr 

DG 

hem Lascllptton 

Engineering Grade (ryw A) Rekctive Sign Sheetinp. Unpunched 
pressure sensibve (non-removable) 
Price per square yard 

Brand 6 No. 

High lntenstty (Type C). Reflective Sign Sheetlnp. Unpunched. 
pressure sensitive (non-removable) 
Price p-3 square yad 

Brand a NO. 

H,gh Wensity. (Type C) Re”ectIve Sa”4cade Sheeting. Unpunchm 
prsrtum renslive (non-removable) 
Pike per square yard 

Bnnd 6 No. 

Super High Intensity. nontkxnxcent prismatic vyps 0) Retktke 
Sian Sheeting. Unpunched. pressure sensitive (nowremovable) 
Price p-m square yard 

Brand 6 NO 

Super High Intensity. fluorescent prismatic (Type E) Reflective Sig 
Sheeting. Unpunched. pressure sensitive (non-removable) 
Price per square yard 

Brand 6 NO 

NoMe”Ml”e Vinyl Sig” Sh.Xti”Q W, CM, bZXZid”g. ““p”“Ched. 
p,ers”,x ser!sttI”e (non-removable, 
Price per square yard 

Brand 6 No 

Eleamnldiy Cuttable Fltm. unpunshed 
price prsquam yard 

Brand 6 No. 

Englnserinp Grads (Typo A, Re”ecti”e Sign ShOOthQ. U”p”“chtx 
b, “oh& markings. prersure sensitive (noMemo”sbte) 
PIICO per *q”sre yald 

Brand 6 No. 

Tnnspamt SML)” printing Inks for vehicle markf”g. 1 Qattp” 
Price PM QSlt-2” 

Brand 6 No. 

ttnutad 
mtnle* 

l.WC 

2.00( 

2w 

2a 

6a 

6ci 

3.oM 

201 

2 

Ce”t0,. Bldg. 225 
46. Box 33225 

f7.? 
s11.o7o.c 

ATSM SRP 
serler vB15c 

117.1 
f34.2w.C 

ATSM Srer 
3aw sent 

NOB 

NAS 
55.98 

517.Q43.1 
“ATM Series 1 

NO E 

NoE 

id 

lid 

contract Period: October 1, Ian4 tbrqh September 30, 
X,X; Two (1) one year options to extRd 

MLWN 
Istom Products coq 

3. Box 54091 

ckson. 
j 39266 

No Si 

NO El 

No Si 

No Si 

NOB 

,. N 

3 

R 
C 

d 

d 

d 

* 

d 

MLW MLWN FLWN 
iDM” C~lbldO l”d”StMS bt;lll SlQ”S I Roadrun”er Tram 1 

511.34 tt8.W 
t22.5w.w s3e.cc4 00 

Nikkaliio Brand “Walite 3M series x 3670 
Grade II N800~5W Series 

*t1.34 f19.69 
S2.266.W s3.936.w 

Nitblle Brand “Hnlie 3M sell** # 3624 
Grade II NSW Series 

No Bid 647.61 
s9.592.00 

3M series II 3990 White 

f55.13 
t2.431.23 

3M X 3983 MG 

%.55 
15.940.9W 

3M t 7725 Serbs 

Marking Films 5QQQ *sties 

119.24 
657.72Q.M) 

3M seti** t 1170 

529.03 
55.806.w 

3M selie* x WncP. 

tt*.3t 
tY3,ea.w 

3M serlc* x 3870 

NOBtd 

NOBM 

NO Bid 

58.95 
57.Q9Q.M) 

3M iy 7725 Selie* 

612.07 
538.21o.w 

3M Sofia, ,170 

631.13 
SwiwaQ 

364 Series 680 CR 

NAS 
*‘NO Charge I No Bid 

Nikkaltte Brand Transparent I 

No Bid 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

pled: Aplil26.2ca 

x Annual Contract for Tnffnc Sign MaWah 

Do 

l&m 

10 Clam or Opaque Pmspacing Taps 
A Opaque Pnlpacing Tape 

Price per square yard 

Brand h No. 

B mar Pmrpaclng Tape 
Price pr square yard 

Brand 6 No. 

High lrtlcnrity mflecllve shwdng with aluminum backing. precut 
11 octagons withcal slop legend 

A 24’Cclagdn 
Price fw each 

Brand 5 NO. 

B 30‘ Odagon 
Price ‘or each 

Brand 5 No. 

tiMted 
luntnlaa 

22.M 

22.01 

1, 

II 

12 Die Cut 6afcty Cone Sleeves. High Mensky flype C) 
A 4’steeves 

Price psr package (pack of 100) 

Brmd L NO. 

B 6. Sleeves 
Price per package (pack of 100) 

Brand 6 NO. 

Delivery 

TOflllS 
IEstimated Tdsl 
llohl Awarded 

NAS 
henun Tmfhc Sdety: Item 7 dsquakded due to the vendor’s matena I being vinyl instead of 
actyii as per bid rpecifmtionr. 
Ntppon CarbIde Indwner: Item 9 dirqualifled due to vendor stipulating “no charge” bared on 
am,d 0, kerns 1 and 2 M~ich sn not low bid. 
Ha,, S,gns: “em WB war mtltdrarm by vendor due to p"ct"Q enor. 

MLW 

A Cantsr. Bldg. 225 
i.06. Box 33225 

SO.61 
514.828X 

ASTM PMlC 

NO Bid NOB 

NO B 

NOB 

No B 

[contyct Period: C&e l,.ifJM tbrcu~h September 30, 
X0.5, Two 0, cne war ODUON to extmd 

1 

MLWN MLWN 

.o. Box 54oQl 31% E. Ucloria Sl. 

Ranch0 Domiww. 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

CPC 52424 R11 HA 

No Bid 

No Bid 

3.l4 Days 

s1.e 
s39.6m.c 

PmtecRis t 67f 

$1 .I 
s39.600.~ 

Transfer Rite II 151 

NOB 

NOB 

NOB 

NOB 

10.15 DP 

Net 301 Net: 
s3.660.00 I 123.490.0 
s3,56o.w 1 s23.490.0 

4. 

B lmminlon. IN 47402 ;:,““” 

lo 
lo 
io 

NO Bid $2.55 
S53.1W.O 

SCPM- 

IO 
x) 
IO 

wmiDRAw 
si.13 

S24.560.W 
“3M t SCPS-2 

$5.3 
s116.620.0 

SMTPM- 

id 516.36 
Sl.636.00 

3wHSl 

$15.1 
s1.51*.0 

““ka” * RI- 

id 125.17 123.7 
12.517.00 52.371.0 

3MMS1 ““lea” x RI- 

id S306.00 
Sl.224.00 

3M 3040 4c 

NO Bi 

id 1295.88 
Sl.183.52 

3M 3340 6c 

NO Bi 

yt 

30 
0 
0 

30 Days 21-50 Day 

Net301 Net3 
I 

MLWN FLW 

0 

g 
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