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CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
INTERDEPARTMENTAL MEMORANDUM 

PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTME 

Mayor and City Council 

Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services 

Terry M. Brechtel, City Manager 

Erik J. Walsh, Assistant to the City Manager; 
Department Directors; File 

Annual Contracts for Fiscal Year 2004-2005 

September 9,2004 

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION: 
The attached tabulations of bids is hereby submitted for Council consideration and action. Annually 
at this time, bids are requested for various materials, parts and services. This ordinance includes 
contracts for lights, sirens and speaker parts, electrical parts and fixtures, therm0 lay pothole patch 
equipment parts, printing of library cards. 

Many bids are on a firm, non-escalating basis, while others such as petroleum related items and 
certain other commodities require escalation of prices during the contract period. Generally, bids 
reflect small increases over recent prior years, but in many cases reflect decreases. 

It is recommended these contracts be approved. 

SECTION I: The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to 
the lowest bidder. (4 contracts) 

POLICY ANALYSIS: 
Annual contracts are an efficient method of securing the best prices through volume purchasing and 
by reducing large amounts of work related to the bid process. This group of contracts represents a 
portion of approximately 250 annual contracts that will be brought before City Council throughout 
the remainder of the fiscal year. 

FINANCIAL IMPACT: 
Funds are not expended by this ordinance. All expenditures will be in accordance with the FY 2004- 
2005 budget approved by City Council. The combined total estimated amount for contracts listed on 
this ordinance is approximately $285,500. 

SUPPLEMENTAL COMMENTS: 
Several agencies including schools, municipalities, Bexar County, San Antonio Water System, and 
City Public Service have been included in some of the bids in a cooperative effort. 



Page 2 - memo to council 
Annual contracts 

MINORITY & WOMAN OWNED BUSINESS ENTERPRISE AWARDS: 
Number of Estimated Dollars Goal: WBE’s Goal: Goal: 

Council Contracts MBE’s 15% 10% AABE’S 3% 
Date Awarded Awarded Amount % Awards Amount % Awards Amount % Awards 

4-15-04 1 6 1 $252,419 $59,880 23.72 1 $7,842 3.11 1 
4-22-04 1 4 1 $206,792 $80,000 38.69 1 

1 8-26-04 I 10 1 $;12.;35 1 $63.i41 1 8.89 1 3 I 
4 El 4 

145 

$i,OSi,i64 
$285,500 

$16,384,385 

19.79 
28.02 
6.90 

7h4 Janie Cantu, C.P.M., Director 

v Purchasing & General Services 

1 E 1 
19 

$80,000 28.02 1 
$446,818 2.73 10 

Erik J. Waxh, Assistant to the City Manager 
City Manager’s Office 



SECTION I 
COUNCIL, SEPTEMBER 9,2004 

LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS 

SECTION I: LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS 

The bids in this section are low bids in which award is recommended to the lowest bidders. 

COMMODITY VENDOR 

1. Lights, Sirens, and Speaker Parts Southwest Public Safety 
A233-05 Entire Bid 
lo-l-04 through g-30-05 Est Amount $155,000 annually 
with two one year options to extend 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Fire Department, Fleet Maintenance, 
and Aviation with lights, sirens, speaker parts 
for the emergency vehicles in their fleet. 

2. Electrical Parts and Fixtures 
A391a 
lo- l-04 through g-30-05 

Graybar 
Entire Bid 
Est Amount $25,000 annually 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio with electrical parts and fixtures to 
be used in the maintenance and repairs of 
electrical fixtures throughout the City. 

3. Therm0 Lay Pothole Patch Equipment Parts MBE/ Texas Equipment Company 
A602-05 WBE Entire Bid 
lo-l-04 through g-30-06 Est Amount $80,000 for two year 

contract period 
This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Purchasing & General Services Fleet 
Operations with parts and service for pothole 
patch equipment to cover potholes in the 
street. 

4. Printing of Library Borrower Cards 
A998-05 
1 O-l -04 through g-30-05 
with one year option to extend 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Public Library with digitally color 
printed library borrower cards. Cards will be 
issued to patrons. 

PSI Plastic Graphics 
Entire Bid 
Est Amount $25,500 annually 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

pened: June ii,2004 

INI Annual Contract for Lights, Siren & Speaker Parts 

233-05 MkR 

Item Description 

IFederal Signal Corporation Parts 
Percent of discount offered 
Product identification 
Type price schedule 
Price schedule number 
Date of price schedule 
Prfce schedule column on which discount is based 

1 
A. 
0. 
C. 
D. 
E. 
F. 

2 
A. 
0. 
C. 
D. 
E. 
F. 

3 
A. 
0. 
c. 
D. 
E. 
F. 

4 
A. 
8. 
C. 
D. 
E. 
F. 

Whelen Engineering Co. Parts 
Percent of discount offered 
Product identification 
Type price schedule 
Prfce schedule number 
Date of price schedule 
Price schedule column on which discount is based 

Public Safety EG Force Four L.P., Intensity, Code 3 Parts 
Percent of discount offered 
Product identification 
Type price schedule 
Price schedule number 
Date of price schedule 
Price schedule column on which discount is based 

Unity Parts 
Percent of discount offered 
Product identification 
Type price schedule 
Price schedule number 
Date of price schedule 

IPrice schedule column on which discount is based 

outhwest Public 
3fety 

BTMC Corp. GT Distributors, Inc. 

370 Nacogdoches Rd., 156 E. Broadway Ave. 2545 Brockton Drive, Ste. 
168 100 

an Antonio, Westerville, Austin 
X 78217 OH 43081 TX 78758 

30% 
Federal Signal Corp. 

List 
2004 List Price Book 

i/1/2004 
List 

30% 30% 
Federal Signal Federal Signal 

Jobber List Price 
04US 1 IOOSL-8/Replacement Parts 
2004 Jan 2004 

Jobber List Price 

36% 37% 25% 
Whelen Engineering Whelen Whelen 

List List List 
PLOCOWL PL040.0UA I PPLO4.0 I PL04.0WL / PL04.0WL Addenum PLO4.0WD 
12/24/2003 Dee 2003 I Dee 2003 I Dee 2003 I6/30/2004 12/24&903 

List 
II 

List 
I 

List I 
30% 25% 

Code 3 Public Safety Equipment 
Master Distributor List 

N/A C3MD0304 I Parts MD0304 
3/i 512004 3/l 5/2004 

List List 

No Bid 20% 
Unity 

List 
122-02 

12/l/2002 

Prepared by Purchasing 8/20/2004 Page 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 
Opened: June 11,2004 

For: Annual Contract for Lights, Siren & Speaker Parts 

Southwest Public 
Safety 

BTMC Corp. GT Distributors, Inc. 

A233-05 MkR 

Item Description 

Delivery 

Terms 
CP: 09/30/2005 OPT: 2 - 1 YR. EXT.-EXPIRES 2007 

3370 Nacogdoches Rd., 156 E. Broadway Ave. 
# 168 

San Antonio, Westerville, 
TX 78217 OH 43081 

2545 Brockton Drive, Ste. 
100 

Austin 
TX 78758 

3 - 5 days for stock items 3 days 

Net 30 Net 30 

TERM: October 2004 - September 2005 with two (2) one-year extensions. 
CONTRACT AMOUNT: Estimated $ 155,OOO.OO for one year, 
$465.000.00 for three years. 
END USERS: Fire Department, Fleet Maintenance and Operations, 
and Aviation /Operations & Maintenance. 
SCOPE: This contract is used to purchase lights. sirens, and speaker 
parts for the emergency vehicles in the fleet. 

Due to this contract purchasing lights, sirens, and speaker parts for our 
emergency vehicles, a delivery date of no more than three (3) days was 
required. Two of the vendors, BTMC Corp, and Whelen 
Engineering Co. took exception to the delivery time of three (3) days 
and consequently, their bids were disqualified. 

On item I., both Southwest Public Safety and GT Distributors 
offered 30% discounts but Southwest Public Safety offered a prompt 
payment discount of I%/15 days and GT Distributors did not offer a discount. 
On item 4, Stasco, Inc. was the lowest bidder but their prices on the 
specified items did not reflect the percentage of discount from their price list. 
As a result, theirbid was disqualified and this item was awarded to Southwest 
Public Safety. 

Expenditures for the 2002-2003 contract year were $ 153.600.00. This new 
contract reflects a decrease in percentages given on all four (4) items bid. 

Prepared by Purchasing 8/20/2004 Page 2 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

pened: June 11.2004 

Jr: Annual Contract for Lights, Siren & Speaker Parts 

233-05 MkR 

Item Description 

Federal Signal Corporation Parts 1 
A. 
B. 
C. 
D. 
E. 
F. 

2 
A. 
B. 
C. 
D. 
E. 
F. 

3 
A. 
B. 

. c. 
D. 
E. 
F. 

4 
A. 
B. 
C. 
D. 
E. 

Percent ofdiscount offered 
Product identification 
Type price schedule 
Price schedule number 
Date of price schedule 
Price schedule column on which discount is based 

Whelen Engineering Co. Parts 
Percent of discount offered 
Product identification 
Type price schedule 
Price schedule number 
Date of price schedule 
Price schedule column on which discount is based 

Public Safety EG Force Four L.P., Intensity, Code 3 Parts 
Percent of discount offered 
Product identification 
Type price schedule 
Price schedule number 
Date of price schedule 
Price schedule column on which discount is based 

Unity Parts 
Percent of discount offered 
Product identification 
Type price schedule 
Price schedule number 
Date of price schedule 

F. IPrice schedule column on which discount is based 

TASCO, Inc. helen Engineering Company 

0. Box 3087 sute 145 Winthrop Rd. 

ouston, 
K 77253 

hester, 
T 06412 

No 

No 

No 

L 
Jot 

12/t/2 
Jot 

No Bi 

25: 
Whelen 

List Price Sheet (Less 25%) 
PLO4.OWL / PPLO4.0 I and Price List Addenda 

Void June 6.2004 
List Price 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Prepared by Purchasing 8/20/2004 Page 3 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 
. 

Opened: June 11,2004 

For: Annual Contract for Lights, Siren & Speaker Parts 

STASCO. inc. Whelen Engineering Company 

A233-05 MkR P. 0. Box 3087 Route 145 Winthrop Rd. 

Item Description Houston, Chester, 
TX 77253 CT 06412 

Delivery 3 Days 30 - 60 days 

Terms Net 30 Net 30 

CP: og/30/2005 OPT: 2 - 1 YR. EXT.-EXPIRES 2007 

TERM: October 2004 - September 2005 with two (2) one-year extensions. 
CONTRACT AMOUNT: Estimated $155,000.00 for one year, 
$465,000.00 for three years. 
END USERS: Fire Department, Fleet Maintenance and Operations, 
and Aviation /Operations & Maintenance. 
SCOPE: This contract is used to purchase lights, sirens, and speaker 
parts for the emergency vehicles in the fleet. 

Due to this contract purchasing lights, sirens, and speaker parts for our 
emergency vehicles, a delivery date of no more than three (3) days was 
required. Two of the vendors, BThlC Corp, and Whelen 
Engineering Co. took exception to the delivery time of three (3) days 
and consequently, their bids were disqualified. 

On item I., both Southwest Public Safety and GT Distributors 
offered 30% discounts but Southwest Public Safety offered a prompt 
payment discount of lo/o15 days and GT Distributors did not offer a discoun 
On item 4, Stasco, inc. was the lowest bidder but their prices on the 
specified items did not reflect the percentage of discount from their price list 
As a result, theirbid was disqualified and this item was awarded to Southwe! 
Public Safety. 

Expenditures for the 2002-2003 contract year were $ 153,600.OO. This new 
contract reflects a decrease in percentages given on all four (4) items bid. 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 
. 

pena August 16.2004 

“7 Annual Contract for Electrical Pads L Fixtures 

391 a-05 MkR 

tern DeSCrlpllO” 

I Wire. copper, solid. Romex. #t2-2 w/g Romex 
Price per M/FL 
Manufacturer 
Part Number 

2 wire. copper. stranded. UF. #6 
Pdce per M/FL 

Manufacturer 
Part Number 

3 wire. comer. standed. UF. U4 
Price per Mm. 
Manufacturer 
Part Number 

4 Cord. neoprene jacket, stranded copper. SJO. #if%0 
Price per ft. 
Manufactumr 
Part Number 

5 Cord. neoprene jacket, stranded copper. SJO. W14n 
Plica per ft. 
MCX”UfXt”,M 
Part Number 

6 wire. aluminum. tdplex. #l/O 
price per ft. 
Manufacturer 
Part Number 

7 Fixture. fluMescent. 48’strtp. 2.Lamp 120 Volt 
price Each 
Manufacturer 
Part Number 

6 Floodlight. 400W. high pressure sodium. wide beam. quad tap. ballast with tamp. Slipfitter mwnting 
Price Each 
Manufacturer 
Pad Number 

9 Floodlight. 4OOW. metal halide, wide beam. quad tap. ballast with lamp. slipfitter mounting 
Price Each 
Manufacturer 
Part Number 

(Delivery 

TERM: October 2004 - September 2005. 
CONTRACT AMOUNT: Estimated S 25.000.00 for one year. 
END USERS: Various City Departments. 
SCOPP Electrical parts and futures. 

aybar American Light 

23 N. Hackbeny 10615 Sentinel Dr. 

I” Antonio. San Antenio. 
: 76202 TX 78217 

CED 

102 E. Josephine 

San Antonio, 
TX 76215 

Dealers ElectrIcal supply 

2510 Bitters Rd. 

San Antonio. 
TX 70217 

No Bid 

NO Bii 

NO Bid 

NO Bii 

No Bid 

NO Bid 

$15.10 
Llthonla 

C240-120 V 

$164.23 
Lithonb 

TFL 400s RA2 TB 

$150.61 
Lithonia 

TFL 400 M RAZ TB 

1 Day 

Net 301 

a0 1300 

I 

Southtire/Encnre/Esse 
NM-W2 WG 

50.1301 
Enmn 

NM122W( 

$0.7700 
Southwir&ncoreIEss 

UFGRWG 

No Bid 

i 

$O.lxKl 
Carol Cable/General Cabl 

SJO 1m 

$0.750 
Enawl 

UF62M 

12.443 
EnC0n 

TRA43M 

so.194 
c&ma 
SJO 16 

$0.774 
AJca 

AC% l/O-3 Neriti TR IO NEI 

$15.50 

I 

Columbia 
CS4-240-LE12 

$16.5 
Llthonta / Hubbt 

S240/12 

$167.0 
HUbbe 

MHS-Y400S-468114024 

MVK-0400H-266-L 

5156.0 
Hubbe 

MHS-Y400t+46&1/4024 

1 Day 3 Da) 

Net 3011 2X-10 days] 

Prepared by Purchasing 6i26i2004 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Dpened:’ August 13.2004 

For: Annual Contract for Therm0 Lay Pothole Patch Equipment Parts & Service 

A602-05 DR Texas Equipment Company 

7490 FM 1560 

Item Description San Antonio, 
TX 78254 

1 Therm0 Lay Pothole Patch Equipment Parts I 
A. Percent of discount offered Net 

B. Product identification (Mfr.) TEC/lhermolay 

C. Type price schedule Dealer 

D. Price schedule number TEC0408 

E. Date of price schedule Aug. 1.2004 

F. Price schedule column on which discount is based List 

2 Labor and Service 

Labor rate for service $50.00 per hour 

Terms Net 30 

Prepared by Purchasing 8/26/2004 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation . 

P 

Bid #l Bid 62 
Opened: July 30,2004 PSI Plastic Graphics Computype Dynamic Imaging Lamination Service, The IRIS Companies The IRIS Companies 

Solutions Inc. 

Annual Contract for Printing of Library Borrower Cards 16149 Westwoods 2285 W. County 6305 Northam Drive, 3081 Bartlett 901 Park Road 901 Park Road 
Business Park Road C Ste. #5 Corporate Drive 

A998-05 AW/atw Ellisville. St. Paul, Mississagua, Bartlett, Fleetwood, Fleetwood, 
MD 63021 MN 55113 Ontario Canada TN 38133 PA 19522 PA 19522 

L4Vl w9 
Estimated 

Item Description Annual Quantlly 

1 Library Borrower Cards 150.000 

Price per Thousand $309.83 $179.39 $241 .OO $410.00 $168.00 
Total Price $46,474.50 $26.908.50 $36,150.00 $61,500.00 $25.200.00 

2 One-time Tooling/Setup Fee 
Price Each No Charge No Charge No Charge No Charge No Charge 

Terms Net 30 1.5%-7 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 
Total Estimated Annual Award 
No Bid: The Library Store, Inc. 

This contract will provide the San Antonio Public Library with digitally color printed library borrower cards. Cards will be issued to patrons requesting library cards which 
are required to access various resources available at the Central library and library branches. 
User: San Antonio Public Library 
‘Award based on 2% discount 

Prepared by PUEhaSinQ fiCW2004 Page 1 


