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/ 
CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 

INTERDEPARTMENTAL MEMORANDUM 
PURCHASING & GENE= SERVICES DEPARTME@ 

Mayor and City Council 

Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services 

J. Roland0 Bono, Interim City Manager 

Erik J. Walsh, Assistant to the City Manager; 
Department Directors; File 

Annual Contracts for Fiscal Year 2004-2005 

October 7,2004 

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION: 
The attached tabulations of bids is hereby submitted for Council consideration and action. Annually 
at this time, bids are requested for various materials, parts and services. This ordinance includes 
contracts for Edgeport 22C USB expansion modules, emergency medical supplies-maintenance, 
elevator maintenance for the St. Mary’s Street parking garage, police patrol vehicle radar units. 

Many bids are on a firm, non-escalating basis, while others such as petroleum related items and 
certain other commodities require escalation of prices during the contract period. Generally, bids 
reflect small increases over recent prior years, but in many cases reflect decreases. 

It is recommended these contracts be approved. 

SECTION I: The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to 
the lowest bidder. (1 contract) 

SECTION II The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to 
bidders other than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s 
specifications. (12 contracts) 

POLICY ANALYSIS: 
Annual contracts are an efficient method of securing the best prices through volume purchasing and 
by reducing large amounts of work related to the bid process. This group of contracts represents a 
portion of approximately 250 annual contracts that will be brought before City Council throughout 
the remainder of the fiscal year. 
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L 
FINANCIAL IMPACT: 
Funds are not expended by this ordinance. All expenditures will be in accordance with the FY 2004- 
2005 budget approved by City Council. The combined total estimated amount for contracts listed on 
this ordinance is approximately $175,761. 

MINORITY & WOMAN OWNED BUSINESS ENTERPRISE AWARDS: 

chasing & General Services 

Approved: 

- 
Erik J. W a h ,  Assistant to the City Manager 

J. Roland0 Bono 
Interim City Manager 
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SECTION I 
COUNCIL, OCTOBER 7,2004 

LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS 

SECTION I: LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS 

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to the lowest 
bidder. 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 

1. Edgeport 22C USB Expansion Modules W€W OM Office Supply Inc. 
A1 001 -05 MBE EntireBid 
Upon Award through 12-31-05 Est Amount $56,400 annually 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Information Technology Services 
Department with multi-connectors for mobile 
and high-end workstation users who need to 
attach multiple serial ports to a laptop 
computer at one time. 



)pened: September 13,2004 

or: Annual Contract for Edgeport 22C USE Expansion Modules 
outhwestern Bell 
elephone L. P. 
119 Broadway Rm. 
60 
an Antonio 
X 78209 

$99.24 

$59,544.00 

45 - Days 

Net 30 

L1001-05 DSIdc 

I Estimated 

Americas Computers Austin Ribbon & 
Company Computer 
3800 NW Loop 410 

San Antonio Austin 
TX 78229 TX 78730 

6601 Vanght Raqnch 
Rd. Ste. G-I0 

$102.00 s103.M: 

$61,200.00 $61,800.0( 

14 -Days 7-14- Day 

Net 25 Net 3( 

Item 

1 

Ouantities Description 

Edgeport 22C USB Expansion Modules 
Mfg. Part Digi. International 301-1003-30 

Price per Each 

Price Total 

Delivery 

Terms 

600 Ea 

$94.00 

$56,400.00 

IS - Days 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

$97.SC 

$58,500.00 

10 -Days 

Sales Inc. 

19th FI. 
lechanicsburg El Segundo 

Net 3011 Net 3C 

:ommonwealih 
:omputer Company 
4165 IH 10 West Ste 
17-616 
an Antonio 
'X 78257 

. $98.85 

$59,3 10.00 

7 -  I2 Days 

Net 30 

Prepared by Purchasing 9/27/2004 Page 1 
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SECTION I1 
COUNCIL, OCTOBER 7,2004 

LOW QUALIFIED BIDS 

SECTION 11: LOW QUALIFIED BIDS 

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to 
bidders other than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City's 
specifications. (3 contracts) 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 

1. Emergency Medical Supplies - Miscellaneous Emergency Medical Supply 
A143-05 
10-1 -04 through 9-30-05 
with two one-year options to extend 

Item lA, lB, 7,8,14, 18A, 18B, 
18C, 20 
Est Amount $12,525 annually 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Fire Department EMS Division and 
Health Department with miscellaneous 
medical supplies utilized for various types of 
patient care. Matrix Medical, Inc. 

Items 4,6A-F, 17,21 
Est Amount $7,564 annually 

Southestern Emergency Equipment 
Items 5,10A, By D, E, 11,16 
Est Amount $7,671 annually 

American La FrancgMedic Master 
Item 23 
Est Amount $4,10O'arinually 

Blue Ridge Medical Inc. 
Items 3, 15,24 
Est Amount $3,997 annually 

Emergency Medical Products 
Item 19 
Est Amount $1,854 annually 

Ever Ready First Aid 
Items 2A-C 
Est Amount $1,734 annually 

MMSA Medical Supply Co. 
Item 12 
Est Amount $624 annually 

Alliance Medical Inc. 
Items 9,22 
Est Amount $620 annually 

VFC Medical Supply Co. 
Item 13 

MBE 

Est Amount $272 annually 



SECTION II 
COUNCIL, OCTOBER 7,2004 

LOW QUALIFIED BIDS 

SECTION II: LOW QUALIFIED BIDS 
- -  

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to bidders other 
than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s specifications. (3 contracts) 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 

2. Elevator Maintenance for the St. Mary’s W E  Automatic Elevator 
Street Parking Garage Entire Bid 
A49 5 a-04 
Upon Award through 9-30-07 

Est Amount $9,200 annually 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Public Works Department Parking 
Division with labor, materials and equipment 
to perform preventative maintenance on 
elevators located at the St. Mary’s Street 
Parking Garage. 

3. Police Patrol Vehicle Radar Units 
A809-05 
10- 1-04 through 9-30-05 
with one-year option to extend 

Applied Concepts, Inc. 
Entire Bid 
Est Amout $69,200 annually 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Police Department Traffic Division 
with patrol radar meters and motorcycle radar 
units to assist the Traffic enforcement 
program to assure fair and equitable treatment 
of all motorists while maintaining the highest 
degree of individual and agency credibility. 



1 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

nergency Medical Southeastem Emergency Matrix Medical, inc. 
JPPlY Equipment 

)8 Saltwell Rd P.O. Box 1196 200 Gates Road 8500 Palmetto 830 Sunaest Or. 171 1 Paramount 385 Union Avenue 4655 Wright Rd. 

iepherdsville. Wake Forest Ballentine Ladson. Gray Waukesha. Brooklyn, Stafford TX 
f 40165 NC 27588 sc 29002 SC 29456 TN 37615 W 53166 NY 11211 77459 

American La France Blue Ridge Medical. Emergency Medical 
Medic Master Inc. Products. Inc. 

Ever Ready First Aid MMSA Medical 
supply co. 

Commerce Parkway CoUlt Sle. 250 

med: May 3.2004 

,r Annual Contract for Emergency Medical Supplies- 
Miscellaneous 

Alliance Medical. VFC Medical Supply 
Inc. Co. 

P.O. Box 147 

Russellville San Antonlo 
MO 65074 TX 78265 

P.O. Box 47624 

oescrlpuon 

1 AdheJiveJape 
A 1' 

PIice each tape 
Prk? total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Price each la* 
price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

A *x 15' 

82. 

2 Padded Board Splints 

Plice each 
m total 
Number 
Slze 

B 5 x 3 6 '  
Plice each 
Pike totai 
Number 
Size 

C3'X54. 
price each 
Price total 
Number 
Size 

$0.64 
$1.792.00 

144 
Hermitage 

7111 

$1.28 
$3.584.00 

72 
Hermitage 

7112 

3 Sterile Wposable Suction Tubing 
priar each tubing 
price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

4 Surgical Suction Device 
Plice each device 
Priee total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Price each pack 
price total 
No. per case 
Mh. 
Number 

6 Air Splints 

Price each 
Price total 
Mfr. 
Number 

5 Instant Cold Packs 

A Foot and Ankle 

$0.95 
$2.660.00 

1 
J B J '  

Whi1274370C 

$1.90 
$5.320.00 

6 
J B J  

WH 127-051 1 C 

Estlmated 
L 

2.800 

2,800 

600 

600 

600 

500 

400 

13.400 

225 

$0.64 
51,792.00 

144 
Dukal 

DC110 

$1.28 
$3.547.60 

72 
Dukal 

$0.95 
$2.660.00 

12 
Kendall 

7138 

$1.85 
$5.320.00 

12 
Ken d a I I 

No Bid 

WTHDREW 

WTHDREW 

50.571 
72 

Clinical Devices 
05042 

$2.3 
$1,392.00 

F3153 
3.~15' 

$3.74 
$2,244.00 

F3154 
3' x 36' 

$5.48 
$3.288.00 

F3155 
3' x 54' 

Momson 

so. 
$212. 

Conm 
348 

$0.30 $4*04 9115000 

91,010.2 
No Bi 

OUlol 

$1,125.00 f5'001 $1.203.7 I $1.710.001 
$7.60 I 

wl 

I I 

91 1500441 I I M660024 3757111 I 
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med: May 3.2004 

,r: Annual Contract for Emergency Medical Suppiies- 
Miscellaneous 

mergency Medtcai Ever Ready First Aid MMSA Medical 
rcducls. Inc. supply Co. 

14345 JWm 

Alliance Medical. VFC Medical Supply 
inc. co. 

711 Paramount 385 Union Avenue 
ourt 
laukesha. Bmklyn, 
/l 53186 NY 11211 

Esllmated 

225 
atv. 

225 

225 

225 

225 

180 

250 

2.000 

900 

900 

900 

4855 Wright Rd. P.O. Box 147 P.O. Box 47624 
Ste. 250 
Stafford TX Russellvilie San Antonlo 
77459 MO 65074 TX 78265 

Equipment 

Item 

B 

C 

D 

F 

7 

8 

9 

10 
A 

B 

C 
D 

NO Bid 

Description 

Half Leg 
Price each 
price total 
Mfr. 
Number 
Full Leg 
Price each 
prica total 
Mfr. 
Number 
Hand and Wrist 
mce each 
Prlce total 
Mfr. 
Number 

‘%2ch 
Price total 
Mfr. 
Number 
Full Arm 
Price each 
Price total 
Mfi. 
Number 

Sterlle Bum Sheets 
Prlce each Sheet 
Prlce total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Replacement Cartridges for V-Vac 
price each cartridge 
price total 
No. per box 
Mfr. 
Number 

Albuteml Sulfate. USP 
Prlce each sulfate 
Prlce Total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Disposable Sharps Collectors 
1 quail size 
Price each collector 
Price Total 
No. per case 
8 quart slze 
Price each collector 
Price Total 
No. per case 
Deleted 
1 quart size, reclosable lid 
Price each collector 
Price Total 
No. per case 

No Bh 

No 011 

NO BIN 

No Bi 

No Bi 

$3.3 
$603.0 

1 
GAM 306 

D502 

$10.4 
52.6i7.5 

8 
b a r d  

ma5o-8 

No B 

$6.29 
$1.415.25 

Dixie 
375712 

$7.29 
$1.640.25 

Dixie 
375713 

54.45 
51.001.25 

D i l e  
375701 

$8.50 
$1.912.50 

Dixle 
375702 

$5.95 
$1.338.75 

D i i e  
375703 

KAS 
$1.25 

$225.00 
1 

Dixle 
Not Given 

$13.29 
$3,322.50 

80 
Laerdal 
985001 

50.19 
$380.00 

25 
Cardinal 
1472273 

$1.20 
$1,080.00 

72 

$5.40 
$4,860.00 

20 

$2.55 
$2.295.00 

Incomplete 

10 

$6.12 
$1,377.00 
Mayflower 

660024 

$6.95 
$1,563.75 

660023 

54.12 
$927.00 

Maflower 
660022 

$5.00 
$1,125.00 
Mayflower 

660021 

$5.77 
$1.298.25 
Mayflower 
660020 

Mayflower 

$3.83 
$689.40 

12 
Gam 
7010 

$10.85 
$2,712.50 

80 
Laerdal 
985080 

$0.29 
$580.00 

300 
Dey Labs 

697-03 

$1.16 
$1.044.00 

80 

$4.79 
$4.31 1 .OO 

24 

$1.64 
$1.476.00 

$4.: 
$3.825.( 

NOB $2.: 

$4.: 
$3.825.( 

No Bi 

NO Bid1 $2.: 
$2,034.1 

11 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Commerce Parkway 
illentine Ladson. Gray 
: 29002 SC 29456 TN 37615 

I I 

911500 

12.19/ 
$1,971.00 $3.375.001 

No B 

No B 

No B 

No E 

No e 

$6.1 
$1.188.’ 

Gi 
M530- 

No t  

SO. 
$360. 

C 
WH147-227: 

No I 

No 1 

No 

1001 121 

Prepared by Purchasing 9/23/2004 

=-=FnJ $320. 

$1.21 
$1.089.00 

72 

$4.38 
$3,942.00 

24 

$2.02 
$1.818.00 $ 1 , 8 Z l  

rool 1001 1001 1001 1001 
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mergency Medical Southeastern Emergency Matrix Medical. Inc. American La France Blue RidQe Medical. Emergency Medical Ever Ready First Aid 
Equipment Medic Master Inc. Products, Inc. UPPiY 

38 Saltwell Rd P.O. Box 1196 200 Gates Road 8500 Palmetto 830 Suncrest Dr. 171 1 Paramount 385 Union Avenue 

hepherdsville. Wake Forest Ballentine Ladson. Gray Waukesha. Brooklyn. 
Y 40165 NC 27588 sc 29002 SC 29456 TN 37615 WI 53186 NY 11211 

Commerce Palkway COUfl 

MMSA Medical Alliance Medical, VFC Medical Supply 
Supply Co. Inc. Co. 

4655 Wmht Rd. P.O. Box 147 P.O. Box 47624 
Sle. 250 
Stafford TX Russellvilie San Antonlo 
77459 MO 65074 TX 78265 

Item 

' E 

11 

12 

13 

, 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 
A 

, 

B 

Descrtptlon 

4.8 quart sue 
Price each colledor 
Price Total 
No. per case 

HydmQen Pemxide 
P k e  each 
No. per case 
Price total 
Mfr. 
Number 

I ~ ~ A l c o h o l  
Prlce each 
NO. per case 
Price total 
Mfr. 
N!mber 
AccuGhek Comfort Curved Strip 
Price each strip 
Price total 
No. per Qse 
Mfr. 
Number 

memovan ~ m b e  Coven 
Price each cover 
price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

EmesisBags 
Pria, each bag 
Prlce total 
No. per case 
MI?. 
Number 

PanmedkSdssors 
Price each sdssor 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Hotpacks 
Price each pack 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Oxygen Delivery Devices 
Non-Rebreathing Mask, Adult 
Price each mask 
Price total 
No.percase 
Mfr. 
Number 
Non-Rebreathlng Mask, Pediatric 
P h  each mask 
Price total 

$0.00 

$0.58 
Not Given 

$480.00 
Medline 

WH145-3042 

$0.84 
Not Glven 
$1,008.00 

Medline 
W221-3049 

$0.97 
$3ee.00 

50 
ROChs 

WH277-8199 

$0.97 
$12.125.00 
Not Given 

. 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

pen& May 3.2004 

,T: Annual Contract for Emergency Medical Supplies- 
MiscellaneOus 

14505 JWm 

Estimated 

900 
ptv. 

1,200 

1200 

400 

12.500 

10.000 

300 

1.000 

1,667 

1,667 

$2.541 $3 .4  $3.19 
$2.871.00 

12 

$1 20 
12 

$1.440.00 
Swan 

BU SW47061OS 

$3.240.00 

'1 '1 
$0.77 NO:] 

S 

$0.80 $1.20 
12 

$1,440.00 
12 

$960.00 
Not Given 

MDS 09800 

"1 $1.05 
$420.00 

50 
Roche 

Not Given 

$0.15 
$1.875.00 

240 
Thermoscan 

Not Given 

$20.59 
$205,900.00 

Not Given 
ArmStrollQ 

AE5331 

NAS 
$0.69 

$207.00 
each 
Mxle 

101808 

$0.75 
$750.00 

24 

4516 
M a r e x  

$1.20 
$2,000.40 

50 
Dixie 

144150 

$1.15 
$1,917.05 

NO Bid 

Roch 
RD 203037 

$0.05 

Welch Allyn 
0507 

GKR 
b000 

$0.95 
$285.00 

Not Glven 
EM1 

1095 

$0.65 
$650.00 

24 
Gam 

13-01 

$0.96 

N 
N Magnu MedSw 

$0.4 
5400.0 

2 
CPBS 429 

2302 S352 

$0.90 

50 
$1,500.30 $1,466. $1.600.32( $1,450.29 

Unorne B B F  
91 15002 

$2.10 I $3.500.70 
$1.18 

$1,967.06 
to.97Il $1.001 $1.091 

$1.616.ss( $1,667.00 $1,817.03 
1 1 1 

Prepared by Purchaslng 9/23/2004 Page 3 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

nergency Medical Southeastem Emergency Matrix Medical. Inc. American La France Blue Ridge Medical, Emergency Medical Ever Ready First Aid 
UPplY Equipment Medic Master Inc. Products. Inc. 

KI Saltwell Rd P.O. Box 1196 200 Gates Road 8500 Palmetto 830 Suncrest Dr. 171 1 Paramount 385 Union Avenue 

hepherdsville, Wake Forest Ballentine Ladson. Gray Waukesha. Brooklyn. 
r 40165 NC 27588 sc 29002 SC 29456 TN 37615 WI 53188 NY 11211 

commerce Parkway COUlt 

501 50 50 50 50 50 

sned: May 3.2004 

It: Annual Conttad for Emergency Medical Supplies- 
Miscellaneous 

MMSA Medical 
Supply co. 

4655 Wright Rd. 
Ste. 250 
Stafford TX 
77459 

143-05 J W n  

C 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 
Nasal O m e n  Cannula, Adult 
Price each mask 
Price total 
NO. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Patient Restraints 
Price each restraint 
Price total 
NO. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

h r g e n c y  Disposable Obstetrical Kit 
P k e  each k t  
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Medication Nebulizer Kits 
Ptice each kit 
Prlce total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

lsagel Watertess Soap 
Prlce each bottle 
Pria, total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

C0mMtubeAirway 
price each 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 

Rebadable Lancet 
Pfice each lancet 
Price total 
No. per box 

ITerms 

$4.06 
$812.00 

Momson 
2030 

$0.90 
$270.00 

50 
Allegiance 

0020 

$3.00 
$1.200.00 

48 
J 8 J Prevacare 

37004 

$43.67 
$4,367.00 

Kendall 
518441 

$0.245 
$612.50 

200 
Roche 

Net 

Delivew 

1 

4 

30 

Total Estimated Award 

$40.65 
$4,065.00 

4 
Kendall 
430142 

$0.13 
$325.00 

100 
Surgilance 

NAS 

Net 30 

Estimated 
ptv. 

1,667 

300 

200 

300 

400 

100 

2.500 

5-10 Days! 7-10 Days 

$12.525.14 $7,671 .OO 

3 Days 3 Days 7 Days 4.6 Days 10-12 Days 12 Da: 

67.564.25 (64,100.00 $3,997.50 $1,854.00 $1.734.00 $624.1 

$533. 

001310 

Not Given 

$4.400.0 

Kendall5-184411 Kendad 
ML518441 

$0.12 
$300.00 

100 

NAS 

Startine Surgilance Roche Amche  

Net 30 

$6.85 
51.370.00 

10 
Dynarex 

WHDY4902 

$1.06 
$318.00 

50 
Hudson 

HD1883C 

$1.05 
$420.00 

24 
Medline 

ML097030 

No Bid 

5 
Hudso 

105 

$0.6 
$1,000.2 

5 
Hudso 

110 

No Bl 

NO Bi 

NO B 

$l.C 
5436.C 

1saq 
1M 

No B 

f0.d 
$1.025.( 

l! 
H m a  

Net : 

iiance Medical. VFC Medical Suppl! 
C. co. 

ussellville San Antonio 
0 65074 TX 78285 

B&F 64090 

$0.231 
1577.50 

No BI 

NOB 

No B 

NOB 

NOB 

W.C 
fB.Mx).( 

Ken6 
5184. 

SO., 
5400.1 

1( 
Owen Mumfa 

NAS 

-4 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Item 

1 
A 

B 

pen& May 3,2004 

DBscripuon 

Adhesive Tape 
1' 
Price each tape 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 
2' 
Price each tape 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

K Annual Contract for Emergency Medical Suppiies- 
Miscellaneous 

B 

14305 JWrm 

Price each 
Price total 
Number 
Size 
3.~36' 
Price each 
price total 
Number 
Sue 

C3.X54' 
Price each 
Price total 
Number 
Size 

3 

2 Padded Board Splints 
d3.x 15. 

Sterile Disposable Suction Tubing 
price each lublng 
Price total 
No. per case 

4 

5 

6 
A 

Surgical Suction Device 
priu, each device 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 
instant Cold Packs 
Price each pack 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Alr Splints 
Foot and Ankle 
Price each 
Price total 
Mfr. 
Number 

Estimated 

2,600 
pcv. 

2,800 

600 

600 

600 

500 

400 

13,400 

225 

,lorpast Corp. 

155 West Oak 
rcle 
srietia 
4 30062 

NO Bis 

No 818 

N o  Bi 

No Bi 

No BI 

No BI 

No B 

. NoB 

No B 

$0.77 
$2.156.00 

12 
wrapore 

15381 

$1.55 

6 
Durapore 

15382 

No Bid 

No Bid 

N o  Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$1.12 
$448.00 

50 
Kendall 
40525 

No Bid 

N o  Bid 

Corporation 

!xington Melville Wappingers Fails 
NY 12590 

No Bim 

No Bi 
$2.656.0 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No B 

No B 

No B 

$269.: 
$60,700.! 

LaerC 
I I I i 702-000( 

Prepared by Purchaslng 9/23/2004 

$0.63 
$2,324.00 

144 
Moore Medica 

06215 

$1.665 
54.564.00 

72 
MIM 

08217 

54.95 
$2.970 00 

51757 
3'x 15" 

$6.05 
$3,630.00 

51760 
3'x36' 

$6.65 
54.110.w 

S1761 
3'X54' 

Dyna-Med 

$8.206 
$4,104.00 

10 
Con M e d  
0034920 

0.w9 
$399.60 

50 
M/M 

70540 

* i  $1.21 
$16.214.00 

24 
Med C 

3215069904 

No Bid 

10.52 
$1,456.00 

144 
AM6RITMD 

665210 

$1.04 
$3.584.00 

72 
AMDRitmed 

665220 

No Bld 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$0.39 
$5,226.00 

24 
DynarexlRenton 

884512 

No Bid 

edSupply Partner! 

160 Commerce 
rcie, Ste. E 
ianta 
4 30336 

$0.5 
$1.568.0 

14 
Dynam 

357 

$1.1 
54.662.0 

7 
Dynare 

357 

No BI 

NO B 

No B 

No B 

N o  B 

No B 

No E 

ressing Group, Inc. 

Dr.. Sle. C 
Indanapoli 

9 15317 IN 46203 

Wlthdrew 
N o  Bid 

$1.624. 

$1.624. 
I 1 4  

No Bid 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

No Bld 

No Bid 

N o  Bid 

$0.69 
$9,246.00 

24 
Dynarex 
DY4512 

No Bid 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

! Annual Contract for Emergency Medical Supplies- 
Miscellaneous 

ned. May 3,2004 

istlmated 

225 
otv. 

225 

225 

225 

225 

180 

250 

2,000 

900 

900 

900 

No Bid 

No Bic 

No Bic 

No Bii 

No Bit 

No Bi 

No BI 

No B 

No E 

No I 

wards Medical Henry Schein, Inc. Home-Aid- 
)ply Inc. Healthcare. Inc. 

KentrOn Health 
Care, Inc. 

5 South Lake 
Urt 
iington 
29073 

orpast Corp. 

55 West Oak 
cle 
rietta 
,30062 

No Bi 

No BI 

No BI 

No B 

No B 

No E 

No t 

, No1 

No 

No 

135 Duryea Rd. P.O. Box 801764 P.O. Box 120 
M495 
Melville Santa Ctarita Springfield 
NY 11747 CA 91380 TN 37172 em Descrlpucil 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$3.92 
$705.60 

18 
Duramed 

BM736 

$15.07 
$3,767.50 

80 
MR.4 

44812 

$0.378 
$756.00 

Not Given 
03301 9 

4 L  $2.419 
$2.177.10 

80 

$5.68 
$5,112.00 

24 

$2.698 
$2.428.20 

No Bldl 

$133.88 
$30.123.00 

Laerdal 
7026 1001 

$178.88 
$40.248.00 

Laerdal 
702-02001 

$223.88 
$50.373.00 

Laerdal 
702-03001 

$17.96 
$4,041.00 

Laerdal 
702-5040 

$53.55 
$12.048.75 

Laerdal 
70204040 

No Bid 

$12.29 
$3.072.50 

1 
Laerdal 
985001 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bii 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No BI 

No B 

$5.1 
$1,060.; 
Not Giw 

Ga 
30- 

No E 

$0. 
$460. 

RXEl 
667940001 

Incomplete 
No I 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bld 

No Bld 

No Bid 

$3.79 
$682.20 

12 
Gam 
3001 

$11.83 
$2.957.50 

80 
Laerdal 
985001 

$0.17 
$340.00 

251 
Albuteml 

12526 

$2.29 
$2,061.00 

20 

$4.80 
$4.320.00 

24 

C 

D 

E 

F 

7 

8 

s 

10 
A 

Price each 
Price total 
Mfr. 
Number 
Full Leg 
Price each 
Price total 
Mfr. 
Number 
Hand and Wrist 
Price each 
Price total 
Mh. 
Number 
Half Arm 
Price each 
Price total 
Mfr. 
Number 
Full A m  
Price each 
Price total 
Mfr. 
Number 

Sterile Bum Sheets 
Prim each sheet 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mk. 
Number 

Replacement Ca-es forV-Vac 
price each cartridge 
Price total 
No. per box 
Mfr. 
Number 

Albuteml Suifate. USP 
Prlce each sulfate 
Pdce Total 
NO. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Disposable Sharps Collectors 
1 quart sire 
price each collector 
Price Total 
NO. per case 

B 8 quart size 
Price each collector 
Price Total 
NO. per case 

C Deleted 
D 1 quart ske. reclosable IM 

Price each collector 
Price Total 
NO. per case 

$4.11 
$3,699.00 
Not Given 
987-3933 

$2.90 
$2.610.00 

121 1001 

Prepared by Purchasing 9/23/2004 

potation 

Circle, Ste. E 
ippingers Falls Atlanta 
12590 GA 30336 

No Bid 

No Bic 

No Bii 

No Bii 

No Bi, 

No Bi 

NO B 

No B 

Incomplete 
$1.1 

$981 .I 

No E 

$1. 
$1.485. 

s i n g  Gmup. Inc. 

Page 6 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Item 

E 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 
A 

B 

r 

DercripUon 

4.8 quart sue 
Price each collector 
Price Total 
No. per case 

Hydmgen Pemxlde 
Price each 
NO. per case 
Price total 
Mfr. 
Number 

lsopropyl Alcohol 
Price each 
NO. per case 
Price total 
Mfr. 
Number 

AccuGhek Comfort Curved Strips 
Price each strip 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Themscan Pmbe Coven 
Price each cover 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mh. 
Number 

EmeskBags 
Price each bag 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Paramedic Sdsson 
Price each sdssor 
Pl iw total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

HotPacks 
Price each pack 
Price total 
NO. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Oxygen Delivery Devices 
Non-Rebealhing Mask. Adult 
Price each mask 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 
Non-Rebreathing Mask, Pedlatrlc 
Price each mask 
Price total 

pen&. May 3.2004 

)r Annual Contract for Emergency Medical Supplies- 
Miscellaneous 

No Bid 

$0.44 
12 

$528.00 
HIS 

140045DE 

$0.67 
12 

$804.00 
HIS 

1001 PDE 

No Bid 

$7.00 
$87,500.00 

200 
Not Given 
Not Given 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$1.70 
$2,833.90 

50 
Hudies 

1060 

$2.12 
$3,534.04 

14345 JWm 

No Bid 

$1.61 
24 

$1,932.00 
BL NDC 

243850113-16 

No Bid 

$0.68 
$352.00 

50 
As Specified 

$0.11 
$1,375.00 

800 
B-Brown 
PCBOO 

$0.38 
$3.800.W 
Not Given 

Medline 
NON70800 

$2.79 
5837.00 

100 
ADC 
320R 

No Bid 

4 L  

$2.16 
$3.600.72 

50 
Hudson 

1060 

$2.70 
$4,500.90 

$0.66 
12 

$792.00 
Generic 

12660 

$48.29 
$19,318.00 

50 
Am-Check 

22107 

$12.27 
$153,375.00 

800 
Welch aiiyn 
05074-800 

$15.33 
$153.300.00 

240 
GKR 

52758 

$1.42 
$426.00 

1 
Trans Ametican 

1080 

$0.45 
$450.00 

24 

EsUmaled 

-%- 

1,200 

1,200 

400 

12,500 

10,000 

300 

1,000 

1.687 

1,667 

MOrpaSt Cow. 

I55 West Oak 
rcle 
arieUa 
9 30062 

SO.[ 

NO B 

NO B 

No B 

No B 

No B 

No B 

No E 

No E 

Kentron Health 
upply Inc. 

exington Melville 
C 29073 NY 11747 CA 91380 TN 37172 

Employ 8 Abiii 

$3,150.6 

No B 

NO B 

NO B 

No B 

No B 

$0 ! 
$297 I 

Kentn 
KH41-l 

$0 ' 
$950 I 

Certified Safe 
234-0: 

$0 I 
$1.583 I 

Kent 
Hospit 

$1 
$1,917 1 

aerdal orporation Medical 

67 Myers Comei 
oad 
/appingers Fal!s 
IY 12590 

No 

No 

No 

No 

No 

No 

No 

NO 

No 

edsupply Partnen 

160 Commerce 
rcle. Ste. E 
lanta 
4 30336 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

NO Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No 81 

No B 

No B 

ercy Surgical 
essing Group, Inc 

)2 Rahwy Road 

CMunay 
4 15317 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

$0.69 
$278.0 

5 
Roch 

RD203038 

No 81 

No BI 

No BI 

No B 

No B 

No B 

?ch 8 Med Ind. I 
!30 Park Emerson 
r.. Ste. C 
dianawlis 

" O B I  

Prepared by Purchasing 9/23/2004 Page 7 



1 

olorpast Corp. Edwards Medical Henry Schein. Inc. Home-Aid- Kentmn Heal:h 
Supply Inc. Healthcare. Inc. Care, Inc. 

355 West Oak 106 South Lake 135 Duryea Rd. P.O. Box 801764 P.O. Box 120 
rude cwrl M495 
arielta Lexington Melville Santa Clarita Springfield 
A 30062 SC 29073 NY 11747 CA 91380 TN 37172 

50 50 50 50 

'pen&. May 3.2004 

DT: Annual Contract for Emergency Medical Supplies- 
Miscellaneous 

Laerdai Medical 
Corporation 

167 Myers Corners 
Road 
Wappingen Falls 
NY 12590 

143-05 JWrm 

C 

19 

No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Nasal Oxygen Cannula. Adult 
Price each mask 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Patient Resbalnls 
Price each restraint 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Cardival 
001267 

$0.53 
$883.51 

50 
Cardival 
001310 

No Bid 

$5.68 
$1.136.00 

10 
hFavex 

2071-4902 

No Bid 

$1.44 
$576.00 

24 
Pureir 

21305 

$61.77 
$6,177.00 

1 

$0.27 
$675.00 

200 
Saf-T-Pro 

Net 30 

Hudson 
1058 

$0.875 
$1,458.63 

50 
B & F  

33239 

$12.95 
$3.885.00 

1 
MIM 

55903 

No Bid 

$1.90 
$597.00 

50 
MIM 

49659 

$1.09 
$756.00 

48 
As specified 

$81.99 
58.199.00 

4 
KDL 

518441 

50.279 
$697.50 

200 
As Specified 

* I  

Net 30 

Kentex 
Hospitek 

$0.39 
$650.13 

50 
Kentex 

Hospitek 

No Bid 

$5.50 
$1.100.00 

10 
hFarex 

4902 

$1.05 
$315.00 

50 
Not given 
Hospltek 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

1%-10 

Total Estlmated Award 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

NO Bid 

$0.89 
$356.00 

36 
Colorplast 

1644 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

1%-I0 

Estimated 
QW. 

1,667 

300 

200 

300 

400 

100 

2.500 

20 

21 

22 

Emergency Disposable Obstelrlcal KR 
Price each kil 
Price total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

Medication Nebulizer Kits 
% each klt 
Prlce total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

lsagei Waledess Soap 
Price each bottle 
Prlce total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 
Number 

No BM 

$1.15 
$460.00 

24 
Denna Science 

Dss505-42 

No Bid 

NAS 
$0.025 
$62.50 

200 
Medical Plastics 

Net 30 

23 CombitubeAlrway 
Price each 
%total 
No. per case 
Mfr. 

24 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No BI 

No BI 

No B 

NO B 

Net : 

Retractable Lancet 
price each lancet 
Prim total 
No.perbox 
Mfr. 

Terms 

1 

edSupply Partner 

360 Commerce 
inle. Ste E 
ilanla 
A 30336 

No B 

No B 

$4 : 
5874 c 

1 
W a r t  

49c 

NO B 

NO B 

No B 

NAS 
so 1 

$300 [ 
I( 

Not Giw 

1 %- 

3-5 Da? 

Dr.. Ste. C 
cMunay Indianapolis 

AS75020 I 
No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$325. 

Ne'301 

Prepared by Purchasing 9i23R004 Page 8 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

utomatic Elevator EMR, Inc. 

1.0. Box 533 

iomerset, Cedar Hill, 
'X, 78069 TX 75104 

1035 S. Cedar Hill Rd. 

$255.00 $325.00 
$3,060.00 $3,900.00 

$255.00 $325.00 
$3,060:00 $3,900.00 

$255.00 $325.00 
$3,060.00 $3,900.00 

$9,180.00 $1 1,700.00 

Net 30 Net 30 

Opened August 27,2004 
Annual Contract for Elevator Maintenance for the St. 
Mary's Street Parking Garage 

A495a-04 

KONE Inc. Omni Elevator, Inc. ThyssenKrupp 

12017 Starcrest Drive 

San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, 
TX 78247 TX 78203 TX 78232 

1730 E. Commerce St. 1077 Central Parkway S., 
#300 

NAS 
$135.50 $278.00 $274.50 

$1,626.00 $3,336.00 $3,294.00 

$135.50 $278.00 $274.50 
$1,626.00 $3,336.00 $3,294.00 

$1 35.50 $278.00 $274.50 
$1,626.00 $3,336.00 $3,294.00 

$9,882.00 $4,878.00 $1 0,008.00 

Net 30 2% 10 Net 30 

I I I 

, ITEM DESCRIPTION 

1 

2 

3 

Monthly Service for Dover Elevator C-MI787 
Annual Cost 

Monthly Service for Dover Elevator C-M1788 
Annual Cost 

Monthly Service for Dover Elevator C-M1789 
Annual Cost 

Total Annual Cost 

Ist. Qty 

12 EA 

12 EA 

12 EA 

. ' 
r, 

Terms 
Estimated Annual Award 

Prepared by Purchasing 9/24/2004 Page 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

1A 

1B 

2 

bend September 14,2004 

or: Annual Contract for Police Patrol Vehicle Radar Units 

Police Patrol Vehicle Radar Speed Meters 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Mfr. & Model No. 

Delivery 

Police Patrol Motorcycle Radar Units 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Mfr. & Model No. 

Delivery 

Specialized Police Patrol Vehicle Radar Speed Meters 
Price Each 
Price Total 
Mfr. & Model No. 

Delivery 

Terms 
Estimated Total Award 
No Bid-Decatur Electronics 

839-05 DR 

Item I Description Estimated 
Quantity 

10 

8 

10 

609 Technology Dr. 

$1,715.0( 
$17,150.0( 

MPH Enforcer Ka-dua 

30 Day: 

$16,160.0( 

30 Day$ 

No Bic 

Net 3C 

.- 
Prepared by Purchasing 9/24/2004 
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