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CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 

PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPA 
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA MEMO RAN^ 

TO: Mayor and City Council 

FROM: Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services 

SUBJECT: Annual Contracts for Fiscal Year 2004-2005 

DATE: March 24, 2005 

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION 

The attached tabulations of bids is hereby submitted for council consideration and action. Annually at 
this time, bids are requested for various materials, parts and services. This ordinance includes contracts 
for spoken word compact discs and audiocassettes, computer service maintenance, recreational board & 
table games, Veritas software licenses and support, high intensity prismatic sign sheeting, recreational 
sports equipment, arts and crafts, plastic bags. 

Many bids are on a firm, non-escalating basis, while others such as petroleum related items and certain 
other commodities require escalation of prices during the contract period. Generally, bids reflect small 
increases over recent prior years, but in many cases reflect decreases. 

It is recommended these contracts be approved. 

SECTION I: The bids in this section are single source of supply contracts. (1 contract) 

SECTION 11: The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to the 
lowest bidder. (6 contracts) 

SECTION I11 The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to 
bidders other than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s 
specifications. (1 1 contracts) 

POLICY ANALYSIS 

Annual contracts are an efficient method of securing the best prices through volume purchasing and by 
reducing large amounts of work related to the bid process. This group of contracts represents a portion of 
approximately 250 annual contracts that will be brought before City Council throughout the remainder of 
the fiscal year. 
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FINANCIAL IMPACT 

Funds are not expended by this ordinance. All expenditures will be in accordance with the FY 2004-2005 
budget approved by City Council. The combined total estimated amount for contracts listed on this 
ordinance is approximately $858,340. 

JabieFantu, C.P.M., Director 
- - 

P w i n g  & General Services 

Erik J. Wbsh 
Assistant to the City Manager 



SECTION I 
COUNCIL, MARCH 24,2005 

SINGLE SOURCE BIDS 

SECTION I: SINGLE SOURCE BIDS 

The bids in this section are single source of supply contracts. 
COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 

1. Spoken Word Compact Discs & Books on Tape 
Audiocassettes Entire Bid 
A972-05 Est Amount $45,000 annually 
Upon Award through 9-30-05 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Public Library and library branches 
with abridged and unabridged spoken word 
compact discs and audiocassettes to be used 
by library patrons for recreational listening 
and reading. 



CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR: SPOKEN WORD COMPACT DISCS & AUDIOCASSETTES 

MLWN 
Books On Tape 
A Division of Random House, Inc. 
PO Box 25122 
Santa Ana, CA 92799-5122 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL COST 

$45,000.00 

Net 30 

' DESCRPTION 

SPOKEN WORD COMPACT DISCS & AUDIOCASSETTES 

(Contract Period upon award thru September 30,2005) 

TERMS 

AWI arw 
A972-05 

7 



SECTION II 
COUNCIL, MARCH 24,2005 

LOW BIDS 

SECTION II: LOW BIDS 

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to the lowest bidder. 

COMMODITY 

1. Computer Server Maintenance 

Upon Award through 12-23-05 
With three one-year options to extend 

A736-05 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Information Technology Services 
Department with extended warranties for Dell 
Servers. The warranties provide 7x24 
services for servers located at various City 
locations. 

2. Recreational Board and Table Games 

Upon Award through 9-30-05 
A795-05 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Parks & Recreation Department with 
recreational board and table games that will 
be used by the children’s Afterschool 
Challenge Program and Summer Recreation 
Program. 

3. Veritas Software Licenses and Support 

Upon Award through 10-3 1-06 
A925b-05 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Information Technology Services 
Department with computer data backup 
software licenses, support and related 
services. 

MBE VENDOR 

Dell Marketing, LP 
Utilizing the Texas DIR “GoDirect” 
Program, Contract No. DIR-SDD-192 
Entire Bid 
Est Amount $140,439 annually 

MBE Learning Zone 
Items 1-5, 7, 10-1 1, 13-23,25-27,30- 

Est Amount $58,256 annually 
36, 39-42 

S & G Contracting, Inc. 
Items 9, 12, 37, 38 
Est Amount $1 1,945 annually 

S & S Worldwide 
Items 6, 24,28,29 
Est Amount $1,524 annually 

Veritas Software 
Utlizing the State of Texas “GoDirect” 
Program, Contract No. 

Entire Bid 
Est Amount $272,785 annually 

DIR-VPC-03-012 



SECTION II 
COUNCIL, MARCH 24,2005 

LOW BIDS 

SECTION 11: LOW BIDS 

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to the lowest bidder. 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 

4. High Intensity Prismatic Sign Sheeting 

Upon Award through 3-3 1-06 
With two one-year options to extend 

A1020-05 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Public Works Traffic Division with 
high intensity prismatic sign sheeting that will 
be used to enhance nighttime visibility of 
traffic control signs and objects throughout 
the City. 

3M Company 
Entire Bid 
Est Amount $166,950 annually 



CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR: COMPUTER SERVER MAINTENANCE 

MLWN 
DELL MARKETING, LP 
One Dell Way 
Box 8707 
Round Rock, Tx 78682 

DESCRIPTION 

SERVER EXTENDED WARRANTY MAINTENANCE AS PER DIR CONTRACT 

Model 
Power Edge 1500SC 
Power Edge 1550 
Power Edge 1600SC 
Power Edge 2500 
Power Edge 2550 
Power Edge 2600 
Power Edge 2650 
Power Edge 4600 
Power Edge 500SC 
Power Edge 6650 

Est Qty 
1 
1 
1 
1 

21 
1 

158 
4 
1 
4 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL PRICE TOTAL $140,439.22 

(DIR Contract No. DIR-SDD-192) 
(Contract Period Upon Award through December 23,2005 with 3-1 year options to extend as per DIR contract) 

TERMS Net 30 

LB/clb 
A736-05 

1 



I 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

!arning Zone S&G Contracting, Inc. S&S Worldwide BSN Sporis Collegiate Pacific Kaplan Early Learning 
co. 

xned: January 4,2005 US Toy Co.. Inc. dba 
Constructive 

)r: Annual Contract for Recreational Board & 
Table Games 

)531 Gulldale 

in Antonio. 
< 78218 

795-05 AWIarw 

13950 Senlac #I00 PO Box 609 13201 Amngton PO Box 7726 8863 Anderson Mill 
Rd.. Ste. 108 Road 

75 Mill SI. 

, 

Grandview. Austin, Dallas, Dallas, Colchester, 
TX 78729 CT 06115 TX 75209 TX 75234 NC 27023 MO 64030 

Lewisville. 

Item Dercn’ptlon 
1 1140 tach-Candy Land 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Each-Chutes & Ladders 
Price Each 
TOW Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Each-Pick Up Sticks 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

483 Each-Uno Cards 
Price Each 
Tola Prize 
Brand 
Model 

40 Each-Gesstures 
Price Each 
Told Price 
Brand 
Model 
200 Each-Mancala 

Price Each 
TOW Price 
Brand 
Model 

900 Each-Connect Four 
Price Each 
TOW Price 
Brand 
Model 

$5.99 
$838.60 

Milton Bradley 
47lx 

$4.86 
$680.40 

Millon Bradley 
4555 

$0.73 
$102.2C 

Pressrnar 
1515 

$3.65 
$1.762.95 

Matte 
41001 

$22.99 
$919.60 

MiltDn Bradley 
4113 

Deleted 

I 
$9.59 

$1,342.60 
Milton Bradley 

4700 

$10.80 
$1,512.00 

Milton Bradley 
4555 

$2.75 
$385.00 

Pressman 
1515 

$8.34 
$4,028.22 

Mattel 
41001 

$31.19 
$1,247.60 

Milton Bradley 
4113 

Ip””hiw I 

$6 90 
$966 00 

Milton Bradley 
GA4700 

$5.92 
$828.80 

Milton Bradley 
GA4555 

$0.86 
$120.40 

Pressman 
W2631 

$3.82 
$1,845.06 

Manel 
w2040 

$23.99 
$959.60 

Miltm Bradley 
ED1203 

$7.93 
$1.110.20 

Milton Bradley 
BS-4019XXXX 

$6.68 
$935.20 

Milton Bradley 
BS-401 8XXXX 

No Bid 

$4.64 
$2.241.12 

Matte1 
BS-4038XXXX 

$7.60 
$1.061.00 

C d  Pac 
GM4700 

$6.50 
$910.00 
C d  Pac 

GM4555 

No Bid 

$6.45 
$3.1 15.35 

Col Pac 
GMlWl  

$1.128.00 
Marlon 

$9.82 

Milton Bradle 
$8,838. i 

$1 1.01 $11.64 
$1.541.40 $1,629.60 

Kaplan Milton Bradley 
a507 MB 47oC 

$10.16 No Bid 
$1.422.40 

8795 
Kaplan 

No Bid No Bid 

$6.75 No Bid 
$3.260.25 

92865 
Kaplan 

Milton Bradle Milton Bradle 

$6.041 No Bid 
$1,208.00 
Pressman 

BS-2401 XXXX 

I $17.92 I $16.128.00 
$13.37 $12.70 $16.96 

$12.033.00 $1 1,430.00 $15.264.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 24 7/2005 Page 1 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

xned: January 4,2005 

IC Annual Contract lor Recrealional Board & 
Table Gams 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

'95-05 AWlarw 

Item Description 

1238 Each-Monoply. San Antonio ed. 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

354 Each-Bingo 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

140 Each-Cmtie 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
30 Each-Shuttles 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

140 Each-Sorry 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

428 Each-Twister 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

140 Each-Go Fishing for Letters 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

240 Each-Tri-Ominos 
Price Each 
TOW Price 
Brand 
Model 

240 Each-Guess Who? 
Price Each 
TOM Price 
Brand 

Prning Zone S8G Contracting. Inc. S8S Worldwide BSN Spas  

531 Gulfdale 8863 Anderson Mill 75 Mill SI. 
Rd.. Ste. 108 

n Antonio, Austin, Cothester. 
78216 TX 78729 CT 06415 

PO Box 7726 

Dallas, 
TX 75209 

$4.89 

$12.19 

01 5 

$1 1.99 
$2.877.60 
Pressman 

021 853442001 

$21.55 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

$16.3 
$2.290.4 

Parker Bro 
BS-4042XXX 

$15.2 
$6.509.8 

Milton Bradlf 
BS-4072xxx 

No B 

No B 

No B 
52,925. $5,172.00 

Milton Bradley 
4800 W7505 

Constructive 
Playthings 

13201 Arrineton 
Road 

Lewisville. Grandview, I NC 27023 MO 64030 
allas. 
K 75234 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$15.40 
$2,156.00 

Col Pac 
GM0390 

$14.45 
$6.184.60 

C d  Pac 
GM4645 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$9.30 
I ,m.00 
wan 

8585 

No Bid 

$20.35 
$2.849.00 

9295 

$19.50 
58,346.00 

Kaplan 
7248 

W a n  

No Bid 

No Ei, 

NO 818 

No Bi 

No 81 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

$6.00 No Bid No Bi 
$1,440.00 

Col Pac 
GM4420 

No Bid $20.35 $24.: 
$4.884.00 55.808.C 

Kaplan Miltm 8radlf 
44801 MB 48( 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

llem 

peened: January 4,2005 

Desctlption 

)r: Annual Contracl for Recreational Board & 
Table Games 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$20.35 
$5,046.80 

BPan 
15821 

No Bid 

795-05 AWlarw 

280 Sets-Balls and Jacks 
Price Each 
Told Price 
Brand 
Model 
248 Each-Pclionary Junior 

Price Each 
TOW Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Sets-Flash Cards-Numbers 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

210 Each-Scrabble 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

248 Each-Hangman 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

308 Each-Throw and Go Jenga 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
138 Each-Scrabble Junior 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

140 Sets-Barrel of Monkeys 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

~ 

Model 

!arning Zone S8G Conlracbng, Inc. S&S Worldwide BSN sports 

I531 Gulldale 8863 Anderson Mill 75 Mill SI. PO BOX n 2 6  
Rd.. Sle. 108 

an Anlonio. Auslin, Cokhester. Dallas, 
I( 78216 TX 78729 CT 06415 TX 75209 

Rinc 

$2.973.5 

$33.59 
$4,299.52 

Milton Bradley 
4917 

$17.99 
$3,777.90 

Milton Bradley 
4024 

$15.59 
$3,866.32 

Millon Bradley 
4323 

$16.75 
$5,159.00 

Milton Bradley 
4793 

$13.19 
$1.820.22 

MillOn Bradley 
8743 

$5.99 
$838.60 

Milton Bradley 
8575 

$23 96 
$3,065 88 

Millon Bradley 
W2616 

$11 95 
$2,509 50 
Not Given 

GA4817 

No Bid 

NO Bid 

$8.52 
$1.175.76 

Millon Bradley 
W2611 

$2 60 
$364 00 

Milton Bradley 
w7500 

$128.8 

Milton Bradle 

No Bi 

$13.3 
$2.809.8 

Milton Bradlc 
BS-4044XXX 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

$1 .? 
9383.E 

US Gam 
NO1 GNf 

$16.: 
54.044.E 

Millon Bradlc 
BS-4124XXk 

No B 

Prepared by Purchasing 2/17/2005 

ollegiatc Pacific 

3950 Senlac #I00 

allas. 
X 75234 

No Bim 

$13 2 
$2.782.58 

Col Pa 
GM402 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

Conslrvetive 
Playthings 

Granhriew. I MO 64030 
?wisville. 
C 27023 

No Bi, 

No Bim 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bl 

No Bi 

No BI 

Page 3 



med:  January 4.2005 

IC Annual Contract lor Recreational Board 8, 
Table Games 

95-05 AWJaw 

Item Descrlplion 
27 1140s ets-Hash Cards-Alphabet 

28 

29 

30 

31 

32 

33 

34 

35 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Sets-Old Maid Cards 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

500 Sets-Playing Cards 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
508 Sets-Yahtzee 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
380 Sets-Memry 
Price Each 

Brand 
Model 

438 Sets-Dominoes 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
526 Sets-Chess. Checkers. Backgammon combo 
Priie Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
144 Sels-Trivial Pursuit Junior 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
138 Sets-Trouble 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 

Total Price 

Model 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Colleg1a:e Pacific arning Zone S&G Contracting, Inc S&S Worldwide BSN Sports 

1531 Gulfdale 8863 Anderson Mill 75 Mill SI. PO Box 7726 13950 Senlac #lo0 
Rd.. Ste. 108 

in Antonio, Austin. Colchester, Dallas, Dallas, 
: 78216 TX 78729 CT OM15 TX 75209 TX 75234 

$1,204.50 
Pressman 
Not Given 

$6.65 
$3,497.90 

Nasco 
SB19387J 

$41.99 
$6,046.56 

Pop Culture DVD 
PD40466 

$14.39 
$1.985.82 

$5.47 
$2.778.76 

Milton Bradley 
GA953 

$6.12 
$2,325.60 

Milton Bradley 
W2607 

$0.95 
$41 6.1 0 

S&S 
W2632 

$4.34 
$2.282.84 
Pressman 

W2636 

No Bid 

$9 92 
$1,368.96 

Milton Bradley 

No Bid 

$1.99 
$278.60 

BSN 
BS-4027XXXX 

$12.55 
$6.275.00 

BSN 
BS-NAPC-IXX 

$6.28 
$3,190.24 

Milton Bradley 
BS-4024XXXX 

No Bid 

$1.10 
$481.80 

Pressman 
BS-224OXXXX 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$1 -575.9 $I1 41 

No Bi 

No Bi 

'$0.833/$10 0 
$41666 

COl P i  
GMCAR 

$6 0 
$3.078 4 

COl P2 
GME09: 

No BI 

No B 

No B 

No B 

$IO! 
$1 3 1  1, 

COl P, Milton Br$$ Milton Bradle 
Not Given ~26061  BS4023XXX GM46! 

Constructive 
Playihings 

13201 AningtM 0 Box M)9 

enisville, Grandview, 

No Bid No BI 

NO Bid No Bi 

$10 16 No BI 
$3,860.80 

Kaplan 
9114 

No Bid $2.4 
Sl.Nl6.2 

constflxtn 
Playlhings MTC2; 

No Bid No B 

No Bid No B 

$14.40 No B 
$1.987.20 

7263 
&plan 



aned: January 4.2005 laming Zone S&G Contracting. Inc. SBS Worldwide 

1531 Gulfdale 8863 Anderson Mill 75 Mill SI. IC Annual Contract lor Recrealicnal Board & 
Table Games 

BSN Sports 

PO Box 7726 

'95-05 AWlarw 

) B O X 6 0 9  

!uisville. 
3 27023 

36 

37 

38 

39 

40 

41 

42 

13201 Arringlon 
Road 

Grandview. 
MO 64030 

Item Dercrlption 

l T e m  
stlmated Annual Award 
4ward based on 3%-IO discount 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
198 Sets-Rum'kub 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
188 Sets-Sequence. Standard ed. 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
188 Sets-Rack-GCard 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
40 Sets-Othello 

Pfke Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

198 Sets-Rummibkub Junior 

120 Each-Uno. Stacko 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Net 30 Net 

$16.79 
$3.156.52 

Parker Bros. 
Not Given 

$23.94 
$4.500.72 

JaX 
8002 

$10.75 
$2.021.00 

Parker Bros. 
PB40007355 

$1 1.99 
$479.60 

Mattel 
Not Givon 

$16.75 
$2.010.00 

Maltol 
Not Given 

N o  Bi 

N o  Bi 

$2,246. 

NO Bid N o  Bi 

N o  Bid No Bi 

$5.20 No BI 
$977.60 

Not Given 
w7495 

$7.89 , No B 
$31 5.60 

Maltel 
ED1769 

N A S  

$3.82 N o  B 
$458.40 

Mallel 
w2040 

dlegiate Pacific 

1950 Senlac #lo0 

allas. 
X 75234 

N o  B 

N o  B 

NO B 

NO B 

No B 

N o  E 

No E 

NcI : 2%-10 3%-10 Net 30 N c l  : 
$58,256.23] $1 1,945.001 $1,524.801 

NAS-Item 42 Vendor bid on Uno cards: specifications lor Uno Slackable (Stacko) game 

Cons t Nc t i v e 
Playthings 

Prepared by Purchasing 2/17/2005 Page 5 



CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR: VERITAS SOFTWARE LICENSES AND SUPPORT 

Veritas Software 
350 Ellis Street 
Mountain View, CA 94043 

DESCRIPTION 

Software Licenses (42% off List) 

Software Suppoi-t (42% off List) 

Technical Services (12% off List) 

Training (1 2% off List) 

(Upon Award - October 3 1,2006) 
(DIR-VPC-03-012) 

Estimated Annual Total 

Terms 

ESMATED 
QUANTITY 

79 

79 

ESTIMATED 
TOTAL PRICE 

$170,197.10 

$39,756.68 

$46,200.00 

$16,632.00 

$272,785.78 

Net 30 

A925b-05 
LB/clb 

3 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Sheeting 

41 020-05 DG 

Item Description Estimated 
Quantities 

Opened: February 18,2005 

For: Annual Contract for High Intensity Prismatic Sign 

3M Company Hall Signs, Inc. Roadrunner Traffic Supply, I 

3M Center, Bldg. 225- 

St. Paul, Bloomington, IN 
MN 55133-3225 47402 

Inc. 

P.O. Box 515 
5s-08, P.O. BOX 33225 

1 High Performance Prismatic Sign Sheeting 
Price per Square Yard 

Brand 
Model 

I Delivery 

$11.13 $15.84 
$1 66,950.00 $237,600.00 

3M 
3930 Series 3930 Series 

15000 

20-30 Days11 30-45 Days I II 
$1 66,950.00 

Terms 
Totals 
Total Estimated Award 

P.O. Box 122837 

Fort Worth, 
TX 76121 . 

$24.75 
$371,250.00 

3M 
3930 Series 

7-14 Days 

Net 30 Net 30 
$237,600.00 $371,250.00 

Prepared by COSA 3/3/2005 Page 1 



SECTION III 
COUNCIL, MARCH 24,2005 

LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS 

SECTION III: LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS 

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to bidders other than the 
lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s specifications. 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 

1. Recreational Sports Equipment 
A796-05 
Upon Award through 9-30-05 

S & S Worldwide 
Items 5, 6, 9, 10, 14-17, 20,21,25 
Est Amount $3 1,879 annually 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Parks & Recreation Department with 
recreational sports equipment for the 
children’s Afterschool Challenge Program 
sites and Summer Recreation sites. 

Gregg United Sports, Inc. 
Items 4A, 4B, 11, 12, 18,24,26,27 
Est Amount $8,530 annually 

BSN Sports 
Items 1A-lC, 2,3,7,  19,22,23 
Est Amount $4,843 annually 

2. Arts and Crafts 
A797-05 
Upon Award through 9-30-05 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio Parks & Recreation Department with 
arts and crafts supplies for the children’s 
Afterschool Challenge Program and Summer 
Recreation Program. 

S & S Worldwide 
Items 5, 7, 9, 10, 12, 13, 17, 18, 19, 

63, 64, 66, 67, 68, 70, 71, 73, 76 
Est Amount $33,193 annually 

22-29, 32, 33, 34, 39,42-48, 51,60, 

Sax Arts & Crafts 
Items 11, 14, 15, 16,20,21, 30, 31, 
35, 36, 37,40, 52, 56, 58, 65, 78,79, 

Est Amount $1 1,201 annually 
83-89,96 

Discount School Supplies 
Items 1, 2, 6, 55, 62,74 
Est Amount $8,767 annually 

Nasco 
Items 4, 57, 59, 61, 69, 72 
Est Amount $8,769 annually 

MBE Learning Zone 
Items 3, 75 
Est Amount $5,420 annually 



SECTION I11 
COUNCIL, MARCH 24,2005 

LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS 

SECTION 111: LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS 

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to bidders other than the 
lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s specifications. 

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR 

Arts and Crafts (Continued) 

Upon Award through 9-30-05 
A797-05 

3. Plastic Bags 
A934b-05 
Upon Award through 9-30-05 
With one year option the extend 

This contract will provide the City of San 
Antonio with plastic bag products for City 
facilities and buildings. 

Oriental Trading Company, Inc. 
Item 54 
Est Amount $7 16 annually 

Pyramid School Products 
Items 80, 90-95 
Est Amount $123 annually 

Central Poly Corp. 
Entire Bid 
Est Amount $48,000 annually 



pened: January 4,2005 :olteeiate Pacilic 

13950 Sencal # lo0  

>allas. 
rx 75234 

Or: Recreational Sports Equipment 

DVF Sporling Goods 
co. 

PO Box3580 

WilliatmbUrg. 
VA 23187 

796-05 AWlarw :olchester. 
:T 0641.5 

$0.96 
$192.00 

SpeclNm 
W6053001 

Boca Raton, Dallas, Lake Katrine. Federal Way, Burbank. 
FL 33497 TX 75209 NY 12449 CA 91510 WA 98003 

. $184.00 $ 0 . 9 2 i I  $180.0 No Bid $184.00 $0.92 $188.0( $0.9d 
Champior Baden CS 

PB BS VPG6HXX PG6 954 

18  

1 c  

2 

3 

4A 

48 

5 

nern Descrlptlon 

I Model 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
200 Each-Playground balls, green 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
200 Each-Playground balls, blue 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

125 Each-Jump ropes, colored plastic 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

88 Each-Basketballs 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

5 Sets. Adult s c r i m g e  vest, red 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

5 Sets, Adult scrimmage vest. yellow 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

50 Each-Flag football belt, red 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

$1.05 
$210.00 
C d  Pac 

PG6 

$1.27 
$254.00 
Col Pac 

PGBG 

$1.72 
$344.00 
cd Pac 

PGlO 

No Bid 

$2.17 
$190.96 
C d  Pac 

BBALLINT 

$39.00 
$195.00 
Col Pac 

CLSVMWN 

$39.00 
$195.00 
Col Pac 

CLSVMWN 

$0.95 
$47.50 

Col Pac 
FFBELTRh 

BS Worldwide IGreQg United Sports, IBSN Sports ]Anaconda Sports. Inc.lBaden Sports, Inc. ICannon Sports 

$1.07 
$214.00 

Voil 
BS VPG85HGR 

$1.41 
$282.00 

Voil 
BS VPGlOHBL 

$6.12 
$765.00 

US Games 
85-1040155 

$1.81 
$159.28 

$1.29 
$258.00 

Baden 
PG8.5 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$1.21 
$252.01 

CE 
954 

$1.7 
$342.01 

C6 
954 

$7.6, 
$960.01 

C6 
9501 

W6055004 

$1.67 
$334.00 

W6056003 
Spectrum 

$6.48'60.54 
$810.00 

sss 
W6165001 

$1.85 
$162.80 

P8.E 

$1.58 
$316.00 

Champion 
P1C 

$8.06 
$1,007.50 
Champior 

PR7 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$25.66 
$128.30 

BSN 
BS C47NSCXX 

$25.66 
$128.30 

BSN 
BS C47NGOXX 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$2.21 
$193.61 

C! 
BR 4 048 

$24.4 
$122.3 

C: 
136 

$24.4 
$122.3 

C! 

I I 

$0.61 
$26.2 $30.50 

Champion 
FFB1 

No B i F l  $1 19.0 

No Bi 

Champio 
SVMW 

$1 19.0 
Champio 

SVMW 

, $0.61 No Bid No Bid $0.8 

Flag A Tag C: 
BS MSFBREDq 20E 

$30.50 $40.5 

No Bid 

No Bid 

138 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

$8.1 
$715.4 
Sportin 

10307 

$29.7 
$148.6 

Champic 
SVMW 

$29.7 
f148.E 

Champic 
SVMW 

$0.: 
$46.: 

Champi( 
FFI 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

;&S Woddwde 

5 Mill St. 

:olchester. 
:T 06415 

$26.2 

w379 1 
$1.75 

$122.50 

xned: January 4.2005 Gregg United Sports, 
Inc. 

PO Box 970008 

Boca Raton. 
FL 33497 

. $0.6 
$30.5 

Chdrnpic 
FFE 

No BI 

)C Recreational Sports Equipment 

Item 

r96-05 AWlam 

Descrlptlon 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

No &d 

$1.93 
$1 35.10 

Baden 
BR4 10 

No Bid 

No B d  

No Bid 

No Bid 

$0.8 
$40 5( 

CS 
2071 

$2.21 
$154.01 

C I  
048 

$1.3. 
$92.41 

C6 
542 

No Bij 

$0.6 
$126.0 

C: 
540 

80.3 
$128.0 

C! 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

70 Each-Basketball, junior size 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

Deleted 

70 Each-Ping pong nets 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

100 Sets-Wooden eggs and spoon sals 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

200 Boxes-Ping pong balls, deluxe 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

400 Each-Witfle balls, baseball size 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

Deleted 

Spectrum 
W6110005 

SN SDorts 

3 Box 7726 

allas, 
< 75209 

$0.6' 
$30S 

Flag A Tam 
BS MSFBYEL 

$1.6! 
$1 18.31 

MacGregc 
MCX2500X: 

NO Bi, 

$8.0 
$809.01 

US Game 
BS 777xxxx 

$0.4 
$96.0 

G a m r a  
US-436 

$0.5 
$224.0 

BS 
BS3191XXX 

haconda Sports. Inc 

35 Katrine Lane 

-ake Katrine, 
UY 12449 

No Bi, 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

ederal Way, Burbank. 
/A 98003 CA 91510 

2ollegiate Pacific 

13950 Sencal Y l 0 0  

$0.9' 
$47.51 

Col Pa 
FFBELTY 

$2.51 
8175.01 
Col Pa 

BBALWI 

$1.9 
$136.5 
Col Pa 

GT105' 

No Bi 

$0.6 
$130.0 
col Pr 

GTlSTART 

No Bi 

rF Sporting Goods 
I. 

1 Box 3580 

illiamsburg. 
L 23187 

$0.9 
$46.5 

Champio 
FFB 

NO Bi, 

$8.2 
$576.1 

Charnpia 
PNID 

. NoBi 

$0.7 
$156.0 

Champic 
2 STA 

$0.3 
8132.C 

Champic 
PLE 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

$3.33 
$99.90 

CSI 
0233 

$2.65 
$397.50 

CSI 
13003 

$0.53 
$144.16 

cst 
1300416 

$2.40 
$744.00 

CSI 
13027 

$2.04 
$632.40 

CSI 
1346 

$3.60 
$496.80 

CSI 
21067 

No Bid 

No Bid 

paned: January 4,2005 

3c Recreational Sports Equipment 

796-05 AWlam 

No Bid 

$1.50 
$225.00 
Col Pac 

INFHAND 

$0.88 
$239.36 
Col Pac 

INFNEDlP 

$3.60 
$1,116.00 

Col Pac 
WHPL 

$3.00 
$930.00 
Col Pac 
WHLN 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

Item Descrlptlon 
14 130 Tubes-Badminton shuttlecocks 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

150 Each-Inflator, hand held 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

272 Packs-Inflating needles 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

310 Packs-Whistles. black plastic 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

310 Sets-Lanyards. nylon. black 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
138 Sets-Balls. plastic, baseball size 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

150 Kits-Playground kits 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

150 Packs-Field Day M iv i t y  Pack 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

BS Worldwide IGregg United Sports, IBSN Sports ]Anaconda Sports. In( 

Lake Katrine. I FL 33497 1!?%09 I NY 12449 
h a  Raton. olchester. 

T 06415 

$3.81 No Bi 
$114.30 

BSN 
BS MSBIRDNY 

$1.57 No Bi 
$235.50 

GamecrafVBSN 
BS MSHNINFSY 

$0.49 No Bi 
$133.28 

BSN 
BSMSBEDPACB 

$2.12 No Bi 
$6 5 7.2 0 

BSN 
BS 3059XXXXDZ 

$2.12 No Bi 
$657.20 

BSN 
BS MSLNYDBKDZ 

No B 

No B 

No Bid No B 

aden Sports. Inc. 

41142151 AveS. 

ederal Way, 
JA 98003 

No B 

No B 

No 8 

No B 

No B 

No E 

No E 

No E 

annon Sports ICollegiate Pacilic IDVF Sporting Goods 

Williamsburp. I VA 23187 
urbank. 
A 91510 

No Bic 

$2.4f 
$372.M 

Champioi 
li 

50.5: 
$144.1( 

DVI 
If 

$2.7: 
$846.3( 

Champioi 
60 

32.7: 
$846.3( 

Champiol 
L' 

No Bic 

NO Bim 

No Bi 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

i8S Woddwda 

5 Mill St. 

:olchester, 
:T 06415 

$2.394.60 SpectNm $9.21 

W821 4001 

)penad: January 4,2005 

Or. Recreational Sports Equipment 

,796-05 AWlam 

Grepg United Sports. BSN Sports 
Inc. 

PO Box 970008 PO Box 7726 

Boca Raton. Dallas, 
FL 33497 TX 75209 

$6.9; 
$2,142.4 C h 6 z ; r  MacGrego $1.79921 

SB102 BS-MCX6001 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

-ake Katrine. 
VY 12449 

~~ 

Item Descrlpllon 
1260 Balls-Basketballs, size 7 

Federal Way, 
WA 98003 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

162 Balls-Basketballs. size 6 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

162 Balls-Footballs. full siza 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

162 Balls-Volleyballs. official size 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Each-Parachutes, 24 fl. 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

400 Paddles-Ping Pong. sirmlaled. sand face 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

$8.15 
$2,119.00 

Anaconda Sports 
MG-41006 

$8.15 
$1,320.30 

Anaconda Sports 
MG-41256 

No Bid 

]Terms 
Istlmaled Annual Award 
Prices have bean adjusted for corrparison purposes only. 

No Bid: Varsity Spirit Fashions 

$6.9 
$1,801.8 

Bade 
BEQ 

$6.9 
$1.1 19.4 

Bade 
BEQ 

$10.9 
$1.767.4 

Bade 

$1 1.35 
$2,951 .OO 

Col Pac 
BBlSR 

$11.35 
$1,838.70 

Col Pac 
BBllN 

$11.35 
11.838.70 

Col Pac 
FBCPPRO 

$15.24 
$2.468.88 

Col Pac 
VBCPN 

$59.95 
$8.393.00 

Col Pac 
CANOPY24 

$0.98 
$392.00 
Col Pac 
GTPN2 

$8.61 $ 8 . 4  $6.81 
$1,399.68 $1,310.5 $1.1 14.51 
SpeCtN Chanpio MacGregc 

W8214002 SB103 BS-MCX6285: 

Net 30 

No Bit 

$4.4! 
$727.31 

MacGregc 
BS MCVL20X: 

$49.9 
$6.987.41 
US Game 

BS- 1 04002 

$0.9. 
$376.01 

Gamecra 
BS-NASlXXX 

Nat 3 Net 301 Net 301 Net 31 
531.879.321 58,530.841 54,843.4 

Item 8-Deleted. No corrpetitive pricing received-Dapt. will purchase on as needed basis 
Item 13-Deleted. No bids received 

FC50 

$5.3 
$873.1 

Bade 
BVSL 1 

No Bi 

No Bi 

Net 3 

:annon Sports 

0 Box 11 179 

urbank, 
:A 91510 

$7.8: 
$2,033.2( 

cs 
049! 

$6.91 
$1.130.7L 

cs 
04041 

$1 1.8: 
$1.926.11 

Spaldint 
20141 

$5.3: 
$869.9~ 

CS 
6113: 

$76.6: 
$10,728.21 

CS 
21131 

$1.0; 
$408.01 

C I  
542 

Ne1 31 

2ollegiata Pacific IDVF Sporting Goods 

Williamsburp. I VA 23187 
lallas. 
rx 75234 

$26 2 
$6.819 81 

Spaldin 
TFlOO 

$26 2 
$6.819 81 

Spaldin 
TFl 000 28 

No B 

$11 1 
$1,803 01 
Tachikar 

v1 

$56 7 
$7.942 2 
Champio 

NP2 

$0 9 
$388 a 

Champio 
PN 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

iramid School 
oducts 

i10 Noah 54th SI. 

impa. 
. 33610 

$1.09 
$21 8.00 

Champion 
PG6RED 

$1.39 
$278.00 

Chanpioo 
PG8.5Green 

$1.82 
$364.00 

Champion 
PGlORED 

$9.48 
$1,185.00 

pened: January 4,2005 

)r: Recreational Sports Equipment 

796-05 AWlarw 

RiddellNUl American 

6846 Alarm Dorms 
Parkway 

San Antonio. 
TX 78238 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

18  

1 c  

2 

3 

4A 

48 

5 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
200 Each-Playground balls, green 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
200 Each-Playground balls, blue 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

125 Each-Jump ropes, colored plastic 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

88 Each-Basketballs 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

5 Sets. Adult scrimmage vest. red 

Pnce Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

5 Sets. Adult s c r i m g e  vest. yellow 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
50 Each-Flag lootball belt, red 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 

BSN 
1610 

$3.19 
$280.72 

Charrpion 
RBB4 

$27.84 
$139.20 
Gopher 

GD29903 

$27.84 
$139.20 
Gopher 

GD29902 

$0.70 
$35.00 

Champion 
FFBl Red IModel 

No Bi 

No I3 

No B 

No B 

1sco 

I1 Janesville Ave. 

)rl Atkinson, 
I 53538 

$1.0( 
$200.0( 

Champioi 
PE00230l 

$1.11 
$236.0( 

Champioi 
PE003911 

- $2.1: 
$426.01 

Champio 
PE002321 

$8.2; 
$1,035.01 
Champio 
PE00408I 

$4.01 
$3 5 7.2, 

Wilso 
PE02620 

No Bi 

No Bi 

$8.5 

Champic 
PE00364 

$428.0 

bort Master 

1 Box 5000 

nsburgh. 
4 15206 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No BI 

$23.4 
62.925.C 
Champic 

JR! 

No B 

No B 

No E 

No E 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/14/2005 Page 5 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

$0.70 
$35.00 

Champion 
FFBlYellow 

$2.99 
$209.30 

Champion 
RBB2 

$6.59 
$461.30 

Champion 
PN105 

No Bid 

$0.54 
0108.00 

Champion 
1 Star 

$0.28 
$112.00 

Champion 
PLBB 

m e d :  January 4, 2005 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

70 Each-Basketball, junior Size 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

Deleted 

70 Each-Ping pong nets 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

100 Sets.Wooden eggs and spoon sets 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

200 Boxes-Ping pong balls, deluxe 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

400 Each-Wiffle balls, baseball size 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

Deleted 

IC Recreational Sports Equipment 

'96-05 AWlaru 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

13 

Description item 
50 Each-Flag lootball bell, yellow 

3 x 0  

11 Janesville Ave. 

i r t  Alkinson. 
'I 53538 

$8.51 
$428.01 

Champio 
PE01650 

$4.0 
$284.2 
Spaldin 

PE00045 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No B 

No B 

>ducts 

Parkway 

San Antonio. 
33610 TX 78238 

No Bi 

No B 

No B 

No B 

No e 

SO. 
$252. 

Ride 
SW 

nrt Master 

3 Box 5000 

llsburgh. 
4 15206 

No B 

No B 

No E 

No E 

No E 

No f 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

lasco Pyramid School 
Products 

d 

RiddelltAll American 'pen&: January 4,2005 

OC Recreational Sports Equipment 

796-05 AWtarw 

6510 North 54th SI. 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

6846 A l a m  Downs 
Parkway 

Item Descrlptlon 

Price Each 
Total Pnce 
Brand 
Model 

150 Each-Inflator. hand held 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

272 Packs-Inflating needles 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model ~ 

310 Packs-Whistles. black plastic 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

310 Sets-Lanyards, nylon. black 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
138 Sets-Balls. plastic. baseball size 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

150 Kits-Playground kits 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

150 Packs-Field Day Aclivity Pack 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

01 Janesville Ave. 

art Atkinson. Tampa. San Antonio. 

$1 .08 
$32.40 

Champion 
SHPlO 

$1.89 
$283.50 

Champion 
IP 

$0.54 
$146.88 

Champion 
IN6 

$2.76 
$855.60 

Champion 
60 1 

$2.29 
$709.90 

BSN 
MSLNYD 

$1.66 
$229.08 

BSN 
931 91 1 

$79.95 
$1 1.992.50 

SBS 
RMB-W6038 

No Bid 

No t3 

No Bi 

$1.0 
$288.3 

BS 
MSNEDPA 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No B 

No B 

pod Master 

'0 Box 5000 

insburgh. 
A 15206 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No 81 

No B 

No B 

No B 

No B 

No B 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/14/2005 Page 7 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

sco Pyramid School 
Products 

1 Janesville Ave. 6510 North 54th SI. 

rl Atkinson. Tampa. 
I 53538 FL 33610 

ened: January 4,2005 RiddelllAl American lSporl Masler 

6846 Alamo Downs PO Box 5000 
Parkway 

San Antonio. Pinsburgh. 
TX 78238 PA 15206 

r: Recrealional Sporls Equipment 

Item 

96-05 AWlarw 

Descripllon 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

$9.39 
$2,441.40 
Champion 

SB1020 

$9.35 
$1.514.70 
Champion 

SB1030 

$7.99 
$1.29438 
Champion 

CFlOO 

$5.99 
$970.38 

Champion 
VB5 

$51.89 
$7.264.60 
Champion 

NP24 

$0.86 
$344.00 

Champion 
PN2 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

15.63 
$4,063.80 

Wilson 
PE00817E 

$15.63 
$2.532.06 

Wilson 
PE00818E 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$61.24 
$8,573.60 

Nasco 
PE01683E 

$0.86 
$344.00 

Champion 
PE00448E 

sllmaled Annual Award 
Wces have been adjusted for companson purposes Only. 

No Bid: Varsity Spirit Fashions 
Item 8-Deleted, No competitive prlclng received-Dept. will purchase on as nc 
Item 13-Deleted. No bids received 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

162 Balls-Basketballs, size 6 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

162 Balls-Footballs. full size 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model : 

162 Balls-Volleyballs, official size 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

140 Each-Parachutes. 24 fl. 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

400 Paddles-Ping Pong, simulated. sand face 

Plice Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

T e r n  

No Bi 

NO Bi 

No 5 

No B 

$61 .: 
$8,580.1 
Champi' 

NP- 

No E 

Net 301 Net 30 1Sb.10 Net 

I I 1 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

?arning Zone 

1531 Gulfdale 

an Antonio. 
K 78216 

pned: January 4,2005 

)r: Arts 8 Crafts Supplies 

797-05 AWlarw 

Oriental Trading Pyramid School Prcducls 
Campany. Iw. 

5455 S. 9Olh Street 6510 NoN 54th Street 

Omaha. Tanpa. 
NE 68127 FL 33610 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

a s Worldwide Sax Arts & Cralls Discounl School Supplies Nasco 

okhesler. 
T 06415 

Model 

New Berlin. Monterey. Fort Atkinson. 
WI 53151 CA 93940 WI 53538 

Item 

5 Mill St 

Description 

~P0B0x5i07i0 /suite 2 Lower 125 Ragsdale. 1POB:xgoi 901 Janesville Avenue 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

420 Each-Supervisors 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

188 Each-Sponge Sheets 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
52 Packs-Scratch Art Scratchsheets 

Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

175 Botlles-Faster Plaster Bottles 

Price per Eottle 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

100 Buckets-Bucket of Beads 
Price per Bwket 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

160 Packs-Flying colors nylon l i n e  pack 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

Deleted 
320 Each-Split ring, 1’ 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

140 Sets-Sponge Shapes 
Price Per Set 
Tolal Price 
Brand 

$6.17 
$1,727.60 

GPiO58 

$10.90 
$4,578.00 

sas 

sas 

GP457 

$9.00 
$1,692.00 

S&S 
C050 

N A S  
$11.00 

$572.00 
S&S 

PE1497 

$8.99 
$2.517.20 

SR9GP458 
sas 

$17.99 
$7.555 80 

GP457 
sas 

$7.99 
$1.502.1 74 

$16.89 
$878.28 

Scratch Art 
SAPMC5O 

$4 99 
$873.25 

PL699 
sas 

$6.99 
$699.00 

BE435 
sas 

$19.99 
$3.198.40 

SBS 
JE3E5 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$1,327.2 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bid 

No EM 

No Bid 

N A S  
$7.04 

$366.08 
Hands On Fun 

57/61 70 

No Bid 

$18.86 
51.886.00 

Hands On Fun 
57/90020 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$1,327.2 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bi 

No Bi 

$3.99 
$399.00 

BE435 
sas 

NO 

NO 

No 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

SAPMC5 

No Bid No 

No Bid Na 

N A S  
$7.05 NO 

$987.00 

No Bi 

ScratcP 

NO 

I Discount School Supptd 

DC84 1 STAMPITI 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/3/2005 

NO Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

NO Bi 

No Bi 

NO B 

No B 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

& S Worldwde sax ~ r t s  a Crafts 

Mill S1. PO Box 510710 

ikhesler. New Berlin, 
r m i 5  WI 53151 

pened: January 4,2005 

3r. Arls & CranS Supplies 

797-05 AWlarw 

Discount School Supplies Nasco 

2 Lower Ragsdale. 
Suite 125 PO Box 901 

901 Janesville Avenue 

. .  
Monlerey, Fort Atkinson. 
CA 93940 WI 53538 

Item 
11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

Descriptlon 

1050 Each-Railroad Board. while 
Price Each 
Total Pice 
Brand 
Model 
167 Sets-Wonder Foam 
Price Per Set 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
280 Packs-fluff Feathers 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
54 Packs-Construction paper, 1Tx1 8'. blue 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
54 Packs-Construction paper. 1Tx18'. green 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
54 Packs-Construction paper, 1Tx18'. yellow 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
I54  Packs-Construction paper, 1Yx18'. white 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
54 Packs-Construction paper, 1Tx18'. black 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
54 Packs-Construction paper, 1Tx18'. orange 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
54 Packs-Construction paper, 1Tx18'. pink 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

I 

$252 $205.8 
No Bid 

Discount School Sup 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/3/2005 

No Bk 

$2.6: 
$437.5 
Chenill, 

971 3921 

No Bii 

No Bii 

No Bii 

No Bi4 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

marning Zone 

1531 Gulfdale 

m Antonio, 
( 78216 

No 

NO 

No 

No 

No 

No 

No 

No 

NC 

NC 

'riental Trading 
m y .  IW. 

455 S. 901h Street 

'rnha. 
E 68127 

. .  
No Bi4 

$2.0 
$349.0 

Hands on Fu 
5 7 m  

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

NO Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No B 

No 6 

(ramid School Prcdmts 

;IO North 54th Streel 

- 33610 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$1 .% 
$105.84 

Rives'& 
03624 

Page 2 



Ipened: January 4.2005 

or. Ads & Crafls Supplies 

797-05 AWlarw 

Pyramid School Producls kienlal Trading 
:many.  1%. 

455 S. 90th Slreel 6510 North 54lh Slreel 

haha. Tampa. 
IE 68127 FL 33610 

. .  
No Bid $1.96 

$105.84 
Riverside 
03627 

No Bid $1.96 
$105.84 

Riverside 
03629 

No Bid $1.96 
$105.84 

Rivers.de 
03614 

No Bid $4.00 
$464.00 
Glinerex 

lGSR 

No Bid $4.00 
$464.00 
Glinerex 

lGBL 

NO Bid 54.00 
$464.00 
Glitterex 

lGGD 

No Bid $4.00 
$464.00 
Gliltorox 

16GN 

No Bid 54.00 
5464.00 
Glinerex 

16RD 

a S Worldwide 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

27 

28 

29 

30 

Sax Arts B Crafts Discounl School Suppl 

Dlchesler. 
r 06415 

IModel 

* 

New Berlin. Monlerey. 
WI 53151 CA 93940 

,' 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Item Description 

i Mill SI. 

Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
54 Packs-Construction paper, lYx18'. b r m  
Price per Pack 
Tolal Price 
Brand 
Model 
54 Packs-Conslruclion paper. 1Yx18'. red 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
11 6 Each-Non tarnishing glitter. 1 602.. silver 
Price Each 
Tolal Price 
Brand 
Model 
11 6 Each-Non tarnishing gliller. 1602.. blue 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
116 Each-Non larnishing gliner, 160z., gold 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
116 Each-Non tarnishing glitter, 16 02.. green 
Price Each 
T o l l  Price 
Brand 
Model 
116 Each-Non larnishing glitter. 16 02.. red 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
1044 Packs-Conslruclion paper, 9' x 12'. black 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
1044 Packs-Conslruclion paper, 9' x 12'. blue 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 

POEox510710 2 Lower Ragsdale. 
Suile 125 

No Bid 

NO Bid 

NO Bid 

$3.53 
$409.48 

Sulyn 
0501 17tU 

$3.53 
$409.48 

SUlyTl 
0501 178C 

$3.53 
$409.48 

SUlyn 
0501 178F 

$3 53 
$409.48 

SUlyn 
0501178K 

$3.53 
$409.48 

WyTl 
0501 1788 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$3 19 
$370 04 

SBS 
XM283C 

$3 19 
$370 04 

S&S 
XM2831 

$3 19 
$370 04 

SBS 
XM28232 

$3 19 
$370 04 

S&S 
XM2834 

SO 57 
$595 08 
Roselle 

PE113B 

$1 
$81 

12c 

$61.5 

I 

$61.5 

PE114B 
Rosell 

Rosell 
PEll4R 

$3.91 
$453.56 

School Smart 
004361 6 

$3.91 
$453.56 

School Smart 
0043646 

$3.91 
$453.56 

School Sman 
0043681 

$3.91 
$453.56 

School Smart 
0043606 

$0.59 
$61 5 96 

Riverside 
03607 

$1.1 5 $1 
$62.10 $a 

Riverside Discount School Su 
03629 12Cf 

$1.28 s' 
$69.12 $b 

Riverside Discounl School Su 
03614 12CI 

$1 
$82. 

Discount School Su 
9c  

$595 0 
Rosell 

PEI 138 

NO 

$1 

$574.2 $82 $ 0 ' 5 : r 4  Discounl School SL 
9c  

NO 

No 

No 

NO 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/3/2005 

Learning Zone 

0 Box 901 

011 Alkinson. San Antonio. 
/I 53538 TX 78216 

No 

No 

No 

NO 

No 

Na 

NC 

Na 

NC 

NC 

No Bid 

No Bid 
$1 ,O23.12 

Page 3 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

sax A& & Crafts Discounl School Supplies NascO L S Worldwide ened: Januaty 4.2005 

r: A m  &Crafts Supplies 

97-05 AWIarw 

Learning Zone 

PO Box510710 Mill St. 

32 

33 

34 

35 

36 

37 

38 
39 

40 

2 Lower Ragsdale. 901 Janesville Avenue 10531 Gulldale 
Suite 125 PO Box 901 . .  

New Berlin. 
WI 53151 

dchester. 
. 06415 

Monterey. Fort Atkinson. San Antonio, 
CA 93940 WI 53538 TX 78216 

Item Descriptlon 

$824.76 
Discount School Supply 

9CPGR 

$824.76 
Discount School Supply 

9CPOR 

$824.76 
Discount School Supply 

9CPWH 

$824.76 
Discount School Supply 

9CPYE 

Price per Pack 
Toral Price 
Brand 
Model 
1044 Packs-Constmction paper, 9’ x 12‘. orange 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
1044 Packs-Construction paper. 9‘ x 12‘. red 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
1044 Packs-Construction paper, 9’ x 12‘. while 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
1044 PacksConslmlion paper. 9’ x 12’. yelloa 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
1044 Packs-Conslruclion paper. 9’ x 12’. pink 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
1044 Packs-Consttuclion paper, 9’ x IT, violel 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
MOdel 
Deleled 
50 Packs-Conslruchon paper. 9’ x 12’. assortei 
Price per Pack 
Tolal Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Bucmels-Cran hnons. assorted 
Price per Bucket 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$0 79 

Rase11 Riversid Discount School Supply 
$595.0 “1 $ 5 3 1  $82476 

PEI13P 9CPPl 

$0.5 $0.79 
$595. $574.2 $824.76 
Rase11 Riversid Discount School Supply 

PEll3V1 0360’ 9CPVI 

No Bim 

No Bi 

No Bid 

, 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

$0.67 $0.79 
$33.5 $39.50 

Riverside Discount School Supply 
03637 9CPAS 

$207.2 $193.2 $728. 
Discount School Sup; 

BE980C 03-209 BAGBTN 

$5.2 

No Bid No t 

$1.55 No I 
$217.00 

Stanislaus 
9703840 

No 6 

No 6 

No 6 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/3/2005 

‘iental Trading 
X l F m Y .  In€. 

155 S. 901h Slreet 

m a  
E 68127 

No EL 

No Bit 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No 6 

NO E 

No E 

No t 

ranid School PrOduCtS 

10 North 54th Slreet 

Impa. 
. 33610 

Riversi 
035 

Riversi 

Page 4 



pened: January 4.2005 

)I: Arts R Crafts Supplies 

797-05 AWIarw 

Item Descriplion 
42 1 1 4 ~ ~  acks-nCrylic yarn, assorted 

43 

44 

45 

46 

47 

48 

49 
50 
51 

52 

Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
assorted 
Price Per Set 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
120 Each-Guildcraft liquid tempra. 16 02. Mack 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
120 Each-GuildcraH liquid lempra. 16 02. red 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
120 EachGuildcraH liquid tempra. 16 02. yellow 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
120 EachGuildcraft liquid tempra. 16 02. Mue 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
120 Each-GuildcraH liquid tempra. 16 02. white 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
Deleted 
Deleted 
370 Packs-Tissue paper. assorted. 20' x 30' 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

25 Packs-Chalk, chunb. 8 ColOrS 

53 Deleted 

& S Worldwide Sax Arts 8 Crafts Discount School Supplies Nasco Learning Zone 

5 Mill St. POBox510710 2 Lower Ragsdale. 901 Janesville Avenue 10531 Gulfdale 
Suile 125 

olchester, New Berfin. Monterey. 
T 06415 IWI 53151 CA 93940 

PO Box 901 . .  
Fort Atkinson, 
WI 53538 

San Antonio. 
TX 78216 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$1.16 
$139 20 

Colorations 
STBK 

$1.16 
$139.20 

Colorations 
STRE 

$1.16 
$139.20 

Colorations 
STYE 

$1.16 
$139.20 

Colorations 
STBL 

$1.16 
$139.20 

Colorations 
STWH 

$3.55 
$1,313.50 

Colorations 
BBLTIS 

$3.56 
$89.00 

Chubby First 
CFCH 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$1.22 
$146.40 

Nasco 
9703627G 

$1.22 

Nasco 
$146.40 

9703627A 

$1.22 
$146.40 

Nasco 
9703627C 

$1.22 
$146.40 

Nasco 
9703627E 

$1.22 
$146.40 

Nasco 
9703627H 

$25.05 
$9.268.50 

Pacon 
4100599 

No Bid 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

riental Trading 
m n y .  Iw. 

t55 S. 90(h Street 

m a .  
E 68127 

No B 

No B 

No B 

No B 

NO 8 

No 8 

No B 

No B 

$2.! 
$64.: 

Hands on h 
5w551 

5510 Norvl541h Street 

=L 33610 

No Bi 

$6.640. 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/3/2005 Page 5 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

ipened: January 4.2005 

or: Arts 8 Crafts Supplies 

797-05 Awlam, 

Item Description 
'ets-wafercolor pami set. n pants 54 11'0's 

55 

56 

57 

58 

59 

60 

61 

62 

Price Per Set 
Told Price 
Brand 
Model 
250 Packs-Laycut Pencil 
Price per Pack 
Total Pice 
Brand 
Model 
580 Reams-Drawng paper. 12' x 18' 

Price per Ream 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
27 sets-Paint bNSheS 

Price Per Set 
Tolal Price 
Brand 
Model 

50 Packs-Wooden Styluses 
Price per Pack 
Tolal Price 
Brand 
Model 
10 Sets-Stick Cray-Pas Oil Pastels 

Price Per Set 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
30 Sets-Modeling clay, nonliring 
Price Per Set 
Tolal Price 
Brand 
Model 
345 Each-Hole punch, hand held 

Price Each 
TOW Price 
Brand 
Model 
25 Each-Pasle. gallon size 
Price Each 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

& S Worldwide Sax Arts & Crafts Discwnt School Supplies N~SCO Learning Zone Oriental Trading Pyramid School Products 
company. IX. 

i Mill SI. PO Box 51 071 0 

I San Antonio, 
TX 78216 I Folt Atkinson. I WI 53151 I CA 93940 I WI 53538 

Monlerey. New Berlin. lchester, 
r 06115 

$2.133.75 $1.25 $1,16076 $0.68 $1.041.27 $0 61 $1.007.1 $ 0 . 5 / r 1  $716.9 $2,389.80 4 
No Bid $3 60 

8 Best Value Sargent Rim Hands on Fu 
58424 BVWC 8100251 Not Give 5W1301 I $0.72 

$1,229 W 
Sargent School Sma 
PT108X 

Desig 
970105 

Crayol 

$279. 

AS21 

$6.5$===== 
$162.5 

$27.17 
$271.70 

XEP-C432 

59.48'60.79 
$284.40 

School Sma 

$0.47 
$1 62.1 5 

School Smart 
039423 

Discount School Suppl 

No Bid 

$6 2 
$1690 

Best Valu 
FULLSE 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bid No Bid 

$124.2 
No Bi 

$157.25 $6.291 No 

No Bid 

$10.70 
$6,206.00 

Pacon 
4712 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$5.33 
$143.91 

Hands on Fun 
5m605 

No Bid 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

NO Bid 

$900.00 
Ebony 
6x25 

$11.98 
$6.948.40 
Riieside 

07166 

No B i  

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$0.50 
$172.50 
Leonard 

9ooo1 

$8.40 
$210.00 

E l m s  



, -  

llem 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Description 

P 

Price per Roll 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
391 Packs-Hot glue skks.  Y16' 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
1wO Packs-Pipe cleaner. 114' thick. assorted 
colors 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
lo00 Packs-Wiggle eyes 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
40 Kits-Metal tile coaster packs 
Price per Kit 
Total Price 
Brand 
M o d e l  
140 Packs-Class cdlage pack 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
280 Kits-Classrm stnngaues kt 

Price per Kit 
Tolal Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Kits-Acliiity Kit 
Price per Kit 
Tolal Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Boxes-Big Box 01 Atl Malerials 
Price per Box 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

pened: January 4.2005 

)C Arts &Crafts Supplies 

797-05 AWIarw 

M 

65 

66 

67 

68 

69 

70 

71 

8 S Worldwide Sax Arts & Crafts 

5 Mill SI. 

okhester. New Berlin. 1. WI 53151 

PO Box 51 071 0 

NO Bi 

No B 

21: 

iscounl School Supplies Nasco 7 
Lower Ragsdale. 901 Janesville Avenue 
uite 125 PO BOX 901 

. .  
ionterey. Fort Atkinson. 
A 93940 wi 53538 

$1 25  No Bi 
$488.75 

Discount School Supply 
CSTIX 

$1.42 50,s 
$1,420.00 a960.c 

Discount School Supply Stanislai 
TPlP 0500592 

$1.79 $1.7 
$1,790.00 $1.720.C 

Discwnl School Supply Chenil 
1 00BA 97148E 

$35.€ 
$5.024.€ 
Not GNf 

No Bi $26S 

SB2784: 

Discount School Suppl 

No B 

$35.: 
$4,933.1 

971 7 6  

No Bid 

No Bid 

NO Bid 

NO Bid 

No Bid 

$31.50 
$4.410.00 

A2026 
Roylco 

$31.50 
$8,820 00 

Roylco 
R2026 

No Bid 

$45.49 
$6.368.60 

Roylcs 
R21 01 I 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/3/2005 Page 7 



p e d :  January 4.2005 & S Worldwide 

5 Mill SI. 

olchesler. 
T 06415 

x Arts B Crafls Supplies 

Sax Arts & Crafts 

POBOx510710 

New Berlin. 
WI 53151 

797-05 AWlarw 

$2.99 
$418.60 

SBS 
PE794 

$3.0 
$420.0 

Scratch A 
SEBIC 

73 

74 

75 

76 

77 

78 

79 

80 

81 

82 
83 

Item Description 

, ,  

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Packs-Paper Bag Puppets 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Kil-Aclivity Kit. Frame decorating 
Price per Kit 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
140 Kits-Aclivily Kil. Valentine's Activily 
Price per Kit 
Total Price 
Brand 

20 Seb-Lace. plastic 
Price Per Sel 
Tolal Price 
Brand 
Model 

Deleted 

140 Packs-Craft Sticks 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
380 Packs-Paper Plates 
Price per Pack 

Model 

342.MYs21 .oO 
$5.880 00 

sas 
AP123 

$27.50 
$3.850.00 

SL1529 
sas 

No Bi 

No Bi 

N A S  

$1.30 
$182.00 
Forster 
CS425 

*$6.50/53.2 
s91o.c 

Waddle We Dc 
707E 

iscount School Supplies 

Lower Ragsdale. 
uite 125 

onterey. 
A 93940 

No BL 

No Ei, 

$26 8 
$3.7632 

Discount School Suppl 
FD 

No Bi 

'$143.00/$5.7 
$2.860 0 

Rexlac 
RXRYG 

$3.9 
$553.0 

Discount School Supg 
500 

No Ei 

No Bi 

No BI 

asco 

11 Janesville Avenue 
3 BOX 901 

)I1 Atkinson. 
'I 53538 

$2.5: 
$3542 

Scratch AI 
971 664' 

$16.2; 
$2.277.8( 

Roylci 
972232 

No Bic 

No Bii 

No Bii 

No Bii 

$1 .a: 
$695.41 

Not Give 
9703842. 

$4.21 
$210.0 

Pink Pea 
9701 03 

No Bi 

earning Zone 

13531 Guifdale 

an Antonio. 
X 78216 

$4.8 
$684.6 

Scratch A 
SBBIO 

$209 
$2.938.6 

Roylc 
R202 

No Bi 

$27.9 
$3.918.6 

99c 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Ei 

No Bi 

NO B 

riental Trading Pyramid School Products 
olrpany. Inc. 

E 68127 FL 33610 

¶ 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/3/2005 Page 8 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

r h d  Schcd Products 

10 Narth 54th Street 

mpa. 
. 33610 

$1.20 
$12.00 

Learard 
6.5420 

$1 .20 
$12.00 

Leonard 
65450 

& S Worldwide 

84 

85 

86 

67 

88 

89 

90 

91 

92 

Sax A~IS 8 Crafts Discount School Supplies Nasco 

Item Descrlpllon 

Model 

Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
10 PacksChenile Craft Stems, brown 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

10 Packs-Chenile Craft Stems. dark blue 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
10 Packs-Chenile Craft Stems. green 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 

10 Packs-Chenile Craft Stems. red 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
10 PackssChenile Craft Stems. yellow 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
4 Packs-Tissue Paper, apple green 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
4 Packs-Tissue Paper, holly green 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
4 Packs-Tissue Paper. turquoise 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 

No Bid 

NO Bid 

NO Bid 

5 Mill SI. PO Box51071O 2 Lower Ragsdale. 901 Janesville Avenue 
Suite 125 PO BOX 901 

:&hester. New Berlin. Monlerey. Fort Atkinson. 
:T c 06415 WI 53151 CA 93940 WI 53538 

N A S  
*$4.32/$2.16 No Bid No Bi 

$8.64 
spectra 

Nof Gwen 
N A S  

*$4.32/$2.16 No Bid No Bi 
$8.64 

Spectra 
00591 17 

N A S  
'$4,3262.1 6 No Bid No Bi 

$8.64 
Spectra 

0059107 

taming Zone 

1531 Gulfdale 

an Antonio. 
< 78216 

No 

NO 

No 

NO 

N O  

No 

NO 

N O  

NO 

sriental Trading 
ompany. Im. 

455 S. 90th Streel 

inaha. 
IE 68127 

No Bi 

NO Bi 

NO Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

No Bi 

NO Bi 

NO B 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/3/2005 Page 9 
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I '  

sax A- & Crafts & S Worldwide Discount School Supplies 

dchester. 
r 06415 

Terms 
rtirnaled Annual Award 

'Piice has been adjusted lor compar is~ w w e s  

New Berlin. Monterey, 
WI 53151 CA 93940 

. '  

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Item Dercriptlon 

PO Box 51 071 0 2 Lower Ragsdale. 
Suile 125 I I i Mill SI. 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

N A S  
'$4.3262.16 

$6.64 
Spectra 

0059347 

*$4.32/$2.16 
$8.64 

Spectra 
0059397 

'$4.3262.16 
$6.64 

Spectra 
0059407 

N A S  

N A S  

Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
4 Packs-Tissue Paper, tight blue 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
4 Packs-Tissue Paper, parade blue 
Price per Pack 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model 
I O  Rem-Sulphite Drawing Paper 
Price per Ream 
Total Price 
Brand 
Model PElOl 

Net 30 
$33,193.85 

$41.4 

70505392 

Net 30 Net 3 
$11,201.20 $8.767.901 $676 

No Bii 

No Bij 

No Bi 

No Bi 

sco 

11 Janesville Avenue 
I BOX 901 

)It Atkinson, 
I 53538 

NO 

NO 

NO 

No 

NF 

Item 4-0rienl Trading did not bid MI Scratch Sheets: SbS Worldwide did not bid MI correct package Size. 
Item1 &Specs for Wpk. Vendor bid BEpk. 
Item 51 -Specs for 48 sheewpk. Vendor bid 100 sheeWplc 
Item 7SSpecs lor 100 spwlslsel. Vendor bid 4 spwlslset. 
Item 78SbS Worlm.de bid incorrect size for craft sticks. 
I tem 90.95-Spccs for 50 sheewpk. Vendor bid 24 sheeWpk. 

!arninQ Zone 

E31 Gulldale 

an Antonio. 
K 76216 

No Bis 

NO Bi 

No Bi 

No B 

Fyrarid Schod Products ienlal Trading 
xnpany. Ix. 

E 68127 FL 33610 

. .  

59% 

2%-I 
$5.420.72 $71 6.94 I $123.( 

Net 301 Net : 

Prepared by Purchasing 3/3/2005 Page 10 

http://Worlm.de


I 
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

TC 

ist.Annual 
Qty 

MSWN MLWN MSWN MSSN FSWN MLWN 
Opened: February 8.2005 

B i d # A  
Central Poly All American Poly Alternative Cleaning Boritex, Inc. Coleman Dyna Pak Corp. lnterboro Packaging 
Corp Technology Enterprises Corp. 
18 Donaldson 40 Turner Place 4734 Broom St PO Box 171088 PO Box 460032 112 Helton Dr. 114 Bracken Road 
Place 

Linden, Piscataway, San Antonio, Arlington. San Antonio, Lawrenceburg. Montgomery, 
NJ 07036 NJ 08854 TX 7821 7 TX 76003 TX 78246 TN 38464 NY 12549 

For: Plastic Bags 

A934b05 

Item Description 

1 

I I  

Bag, Plastic, 2 Mil, LLD, 38" X 58" or 38" X 60". FlaffGusseted 

Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Number Per Case 
Brand Name 
Number 

I ITerms 

$34.87 
$87.175.00 

100 
Fortune Plastics 
Custom 38 x 58 

FSWN 

No Bid No Bid 

Net 30 

2500 

$20.26 
$48.000.00 $50,650.00 

1 oo 

3858A 

No Bid $23.84 
$59,600.00 

100 
INT 

INT-3858-Super Ex-Hvy 

Net 30 Net 30 I 1%-101  1/10%-301 Net 30 I Net 3C 

TERMS: Upon Award - September 30.2005 with one (1) extension - Expires 2006 
CONTRACT AMOUNT $48,000.00 for one year; $96.000.00 for two years. 
END USER: Primarily Bldg Maintenance, Aviation, and Library. 
SCOPE: Contract will provide the City facilities with plastic bag products. 

Total Increase from previous contract - $5.625.00; 
increase due to instability within the oil industry. 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Bid # B Bid # C Bid ## D 
iterboro Packaging lnterboro Packaging lnterboro Packaging Mayfield Paper Office Depot SanivadDavis 
:orp. Corp. Corp. Company 
14 Bracken Road 114 Bracken Road 114 Bracken Road 5902 Business Park 911 Central 1023 Morales 

lontgomery, Montgomery, Montgomery, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, 
IY 12549 NY 12549 NY 12549 TX 78218 TX 78232 TX 78207 

Drive Parkway North 
u , r^ 

NAS 

$22.48 $19.98 $17.84 $16.99 No Bid $26.76 
$66.900.00 

100 
INT INT INT Pitt Plastics Flexsol 

INT-3858-Super XXH INT-3858-Super XH INT-3858-Super Exh TM-65-T AD-3858 BLK 

$56,200.00 $49,950.00 $44,600.00 $84.950.00 * 
100 100 100 50 

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2% - 10 

Unisource 
Worldwide 
4151 Woodcock 
Dr. 

Jacksonville, 
FL 32207 

No Bic 

Net 3( 

TC 

Ist. Annual 

Qty 

2500 

Item 

1 

I 

IEstimated Total Award 
rotals have been adjusted to reflect variances in packaging. 

Description 

Bag, Plastic, 2 Mil. LLD, 38" X 58" or 38" X 60". FlatlGusseted 

Price Per Case 
Price Total 
Number Per Case 
Brand Name 
Number 

Terms 

NAS: 
lnterboro (Bid # D) Item 1 Non-Recycled & Recycled -d id  not meet minimum density 

requirement. 
0 

TERMS: Upon Award -September 30.2005 with one (1) extension - Expires 2006 
CONTRACT AMOUNT $48.000.00 for one year; $96.000.00 for two years. 
END USER: Primarily Bldg Maintenance, Aviation, and Library. 
SCOPE: Contract will provide the C i  facilities with plastic bag products. 

Total Increase from previous contract - $5,625.00; 
increase due to instability within the oil industry. 
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