CITY OF SAN ANTONIO
PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPA‘RZ;M,ENT\ '

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA MEMORANDEM - " |, /ﬂ\’ .5__; : Sy
TO: Mayor and City Council ; i:' ? ;;; f i
FROM: Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services
SUBJECT: Light Duty Trucks
DATE: June 16, 2005

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION

This ordinance authorizes the Purchasing & General Services Department to accept the bids from
Gunn Dodge, Rogers Dodge of Alvin, Gunn Chevrolet, Caldwell Country Chevrolet c/o Baby
Jack I Automotive, Columbus Country Ford c/o Baby Jack II Ford Automotive, LTD, Philpott
Motors, Tom Benson Grande Truck Center and Northside Ford to purchase light duty trucks for
various City of San Antonio departments for a total of $3,319,801.95. Staff recommends
approval of this ordinance.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION

A request for sealed bids was issued to purchase 185 light duty trucks for various City of San
Antonio Departments. A total of fourteen bids were received. The low responsive bids were
submitted by Gunn Dodge, item 1A, 1B, 3A, 3B, 3C, 3F, 3H, 31, 4D, and 4E; Rogers Dodge of
Alvin, items 3D & 3G; Gunn Chevrolet, item 2A, 3E, 4A, 5B, 5C, and 6; Caldwell Country
Chevrolet c/o Baby Jack II Automotive, item 2C; Columbus Country Ford c/o Baby Jack II Ford
Automotive, LTD., items 2D, 2F, 2G, 5A, 5D, 7D and 10; Philpott Motors, items 2E, 4C, 4F,
4G, 4H, 4], 7A, 7B, and 7C; Tom Benson, (Bid #1), item 2H; Grande Truck Center, item 8; and
Northside Ford, items 4B & 9. This bid was advertised in the Daily Commercial Recorder, La
Prensa, and The San Antonio Observer. This office also advertises bids on Public Access
Channel 21, the Purchasing Website and utilizes the services of Demandstar.com to notify
registered vendors of City bids.

This purchase will provide replacements for 172 existing fleet vehicles and 13 new vehicles
approved by City Council in the FY 2004-2005 Budget. Vehicles which have acquired 84,000
miles or are 10 years old become eligible for replacement. In continuation of the City’s
commitment to a cleaner environment, all diesel engine vehicles purchased under this contract
are certified to be low emission.

POLICY ANALYSIS

This contract will provide 185 light duty trucks in various configurations to include pickup
trucks, sport utility vehicles which will be utilized by various departments including Aviation,
Parks and Recreation, Development Services, Health, Fire, Police, Public Works, Purchasing and
Environmental Services for routine administrative and field work.
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FINANCIAL IMPACT

The total cost of this contract is $3,319,801.95 which will be paid through General Fund
($236,670.00), Homeland Security Grant ($49,876.00), Airport Fund ($83,875.00), Solid Waste
Fund ($30,414.00), Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund ($2,918,966.95). All
expenditures will be in accordance with the FY04-05 Budget approved by City Council.

The estimated salvage value for selling the replaced vehicles at auction is approximately
$500,000. This amount will offset the purchase price of the replacement vehicles.

COORDINATION

This ordinance has been coordinated with the City of San Antonio Parks and Recreation,
Development Services, Health, Fire, Police, Public Works, Purchasing and Environmental
Services Departments.

SUPPLEMENTAL INFORMATION

The City of San Antonio Purchasing Department advertises bids in the Daily Commercial
Recorder, La Prensa, The San Antonio Observer, and the San Antonio Express-News. This
office also advertises bids on Public Access Channel 21, the Purchasing Website and utilizes the
services of Demandstar.com to notify registered vendors of City bids.

This contract was developed utilizing the formal competitive bid process; therefore, an Ethics
Disclosure Form is not required.

"
J/z/m,fe B. Cantu, C.P.M., Director

Rufrchasing & General Services

N
Erik J. Walsh
Assistant to the City Manager




BID # 05-063 LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY DEPARTMENT REQUIRED FOR
1A | Compact Pick up Trucks — Extended Cab 8 Development Services | Building inspections
1B | Compact Pick up Trucks — Extended Cab, Four 3* Development Services | Construction inspections
Wheel Drive
2A | Y2 Ton Trucks — Long Wheel Base 8 Parks and Recreation Maintain City parks
6 Public Works Maintain City streets
1 Police Transport equipment used at emergency
sites
1 Fire Road call vehicle
1 Environmental Services | Route supervisor
2C | % TonTrucks—-4x4 1 Public Works Support street sweepers
1 Environmental Services | Land fill support
1 Development Services | Construction inspections
2% Developmental Construction inspections
Services
2D | Y2 Ton Trucks — Extended Cab, Short Bed 2 Police K-9 units
2E | %2 Ton Trucks — Extended Cab, Long Bed 1 Public Works Support street repair and construction
3 Environmental Services | Route supervisor
1 Police K-9 detail
2F | % Ton Trucks — Extended Cab, 4 x 4 1 Police K-9 detail
2G | % Ton Trucks — Extended Cab, Rear Seat 2 Police Special operations
2H | % Ton Trucks - Short Bed, Colors to be 3 Police Surveillance
Selected
3A | % Ton Trucks — Extended Cab, Long 2 Public Works Support road repairs and construction
Wheelbase
1* Aviation Use by carpenters for airport repair projects
3B | % Ton Trucks — Regular Cab, Long Bed 6 Public Works Support river maintenance
3 Purchasing & Gen Serv | Road call trucks
2 Health Animal control
6 Environmental Services | Support refuse pick up
2* Environmental Services | Support refuse pick up
3C | % Ton Trucks — Crew Cab, Long Bed 1 Environmental Services | Transport work crews
1 Parks and Recreation Transport work crews
2% Parks and Recreation Transport work crews
1 Public Works Transport work crews
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3D | % Ton Trucks — Crew Cab, Four Wheel Drive 2 Environmental Services | Support the land fill and transport
employees
3E | % Ton Trucks — Cab & Chassis, 56” Cab to 9 Parks and Recreation Mount utility bodies that are then used to
Axle maintain parks and buildings
10 Public Works Mount utility bodies that are then used to
maintain buildings
4 Health Mount a flat bed and then used as live
animals trucks with cages
3F | % Ton Trucks — Regular Cab, 4 x 4 1 Public Works Support River Maintenance
1* Parks and Recreation Use by mobile support crew for park
projects
3G | % Ton Trucks — Crew Cab, 1,500 1b. Lift gate 2% Parks and Recreation Graffiti clean-up
3H | % Ton Trucks — Extended Cab, Four Wheel 1* Aviation Road calls on airport equipment
Drive, 1,500 Ib. Lift gate
31 | % Ton Trucks — Extended Cab, Four Wheel 3 Parks and Recreation Maintain City parks
Drive
4A | 1 Ton Trucks — Cab & Chassis, 84” Cab to 6 Public Works Mount a flat bed bodies and then carry
Axle materials to work sites
4B | 1 Ton Trucks — Cab & Chassis, 56” Cab to 1 Public Works Mount utility body and then support Tunnel
Axle Maintenance
4C 1 Ton Trucks — Cab & Chassis, 60” Cab to 4 Asset Management Mount utility bodies and then used for
Axle building maintenance and repair
1 Public Works Mount flat beds and then to carry supplies to
work sites
4 Parks and Recreation Mount flat beds and then to carry supplies to
work sites
4D | 1 Ton Trucks — Crew Cab, Four Door 2 Public Works Carry crews and supplies to work sites
4E | 1 Ton Trucks — Crew Cab, Four Door, Long 2 Public Works Carry crews and supplies to work sites
Bed
1 Parks and Recreation Carry crews and supplies to work sites
4F 1 Ton Trucks — Crew Cab, Four Door, Single 6 Public Works Carry crews and supplies to work sites
Rear Wheels
4G | 1 Ton Trucks — Crew Cab, Four Door, Trailer 1 Police SWAT operations
Towing Package
4H | 1 Ton Trucks — Crew Cab, Four Door, 4 x 4 1 Fire EMS operations
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4) 1 Ton Trucks — Truck, 15° Stake Bed, 1,600 Ib. 1 Purchasing & Gen As road call truck for tire changes on large
Lift gate Services vehicles
S5A | Sport Utility Type Vehicles — Four Door, 12 Police As evidence collection vehicles
Steering Column Shift Lever
5B | Sport Utility Type Vehicles — Four Door, Two 1 Health Transport supplies and personnel
Wheel Drive
4 Public Works Transport road and traffic control equipment
1 Code Compliance Enforce codes in accessible areas
5C | Sport Utility Type Vehicles — Four Door, Four 3 Environmental Services | Off road environmental issues
Wheel Drive
Code Compliance Construction areas and off road issues
Parks and Recreation Park Police
5D | Sport Utility Type Vehicles — Four Door, Four 2% Aviation Airport Police for patrol of off road areas at
Wheel Drive, Steering Column Shift Lever the Airport
2 Parks and Recreation Used by Park Police for off road patrol in
park areas
6 Suburban Type Wagons 3 Fire First responder units
7A | Van Type Trucks ~ 15 Passenger 4 Community Initiatives | Transport the elderly
1 Purchasing & Gen V.LP. Transport
Services
7B | Van Type Trucks — 12 Passenger 2 Police Transport personnel
7C | Van Type Trucks — 2 Passenger 1 Public Works Transport supplies and materials
3 Police Transport prisoners
7D | Van Type Trucks — 5 Passenger 1 Fire Respond to emergency situations
8 Vans, Mini, 2 Passenger, Cargo 1 Public Works Transport supplies and materials
1 Police Under cover operations
9 Step Vans, 14’ 2 Library Transfer books and supplies
2 Parks and Recreation Transport plants and tools
10 Cab & Chassis, 17,900 GVWR, with Service 1* Police SWAT operations

Body

All vehicles being purchased are replacing existing fleet units except those designated with an asterisk (*).
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Bid #2 Bid #1
Opened: April 19, 2005 Gunn Dodge Rogers Dodge of |Gunn Chevrolet |Caldwell Country |Columbus CountryjPhilpott Motors | Tom Benson Northside Ford Grande Truck Center,
Alvin Chevrolet Ford LTD
clo Baby Jack it {c/o Baby Jack
Automotive, LTD {Ford
[Automotive, LTD
For: Light Duty Trucks 12540 IH 35 North|2616 N. Bypass |12602 IH 35 North|PO Box 27 PO Box 550 PO Box 876 9400 San Pedro [12300 San Pedro [4562 iH 10 East
35
05-063 San Antonio Alvin San Antonio Caldwell Columbus Port Neches San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio
TX 78233 TX 77511 TX 78233 TX 77836 TX 78934 TX 77651 TX 78216 TX 78216 TX 78219
item Descripti
1 |Compact Pick Up Trucks
A |8 Each - Extended Cab
Price Each $13,029.00 $14,359.00) $13,152.00 $13,086.00% $13,226.001 $13,776.00] $13,183.45 $13,624.00] $14,468.00]
Price Total $104,232.00] $114,872.00 $105,216.00 $104,688.00 $105,808.00 $110,208.00 $105,467.60 $108,992.00 $115,744.00
Make Dodge Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Mode! Dakotal Dakota Colorado CS15653 Ranger Ranger €S15653 Ranger Ranger
B {3 Each - Extended Cab, Four Wheel Drive
Price Each $15,621.00 $16,504.004 $15,980.004 $15,754.00] $15,784.00] $16,428.00 No Bid] $16,832.00) $16,128.00
Price Total $46,863.00} $49,512.00 $47,940.00 $47,262.00 $47,352.00 $49,284.00 $50,496.00 $48,384.00
Make Dodge Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Ford Ford
Model Dakotal Dakota Colorado CT15653 Ranger Ranger Ranger Ranger
2 |142 Ton Trucks
A 17 Each - Long Wheel Base
Price Each $13,570.00 $15,185.00] 679, $11,743.00 $12,483.00 $13,009.00 $11.857.40 $12,873.00 $14,512.00
Price Total $230,690.00 $258,145.00) $198,543.00] $199,631.00 $212,211.00 $221,153.00 $201,575.80 $218,841.00 $246,704.00
Make Dodge Dodge| Chevrolet] Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model 1500 1500] CC15903] CC15903 F150 F150 CC15903 F150 F150
B |Deleted
S5Each-4X4 ]
Price Each $18,303.00 $19,398.00 $18,307.00 ,896. $19,142.00 $19,308.00 $18,095.90, $19,425.00 $20,860.00
Price Total $91,515.00 $96,990.00 $91,535.00; $89,980. $95,710.00 $96,540.00 $90,479.50 $97,125.00 $104,300.00
Make Dodge Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet] Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model 1500 1500 CK15895 F150y F150) CK15753] F1504 F150
D j2 Each - Extended Cab, Short Bed
Price Each $15,174.00 $16,956.00) $15,333.00 $15,182.00] $73,550.00) $14,869.00 $15,156.64] $14,819.00 $16,715.00
Price Total $30,348.004 $33.912.004 $30,666.004 $30,364.04 $27.980.00 $29,738.00 $30,31 3.ZBi $29,638.00) $33,430.00
Make Dodge Dodae; Chevrolet] Chevrolet Ford Ford] Chevrolet] Ford| Ford|
Model 15008 15008 CC15753] CC157 £150 F1504 CC15753 F150} F150
E |5 Each - Extended Cab, Long Bed
Price Each $16,188.00} $17,151.00 $15,921.00 $15,663.004 $15,947. $14,909] $15.610.81 $16,446.00 $18,186.00]
Price Total $80,940.00 $85,755.00 $79,605.00 $78,315.00 $79,735.00] $74,545.00 $78,054.05 $82,230.00 $90,930.00
Make Dodge Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford| Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model 1500 1500 1500 CC15953 F150] F 150 CC15953 F150 F150
F |1 Each - Extended Cab, 4 X4
Price Total $18,303.004 $19,523.00 $18.402.00{ $18,213. $17,067.00 $17.447.00) $18,062.46] $20,985.00 $20.€98.00
Make Dodge Dodge; Chevrolet Chevrole Ford Ford] Chevrolef] Ford Ford]
Mode! 1500, 1500 CK15753] CK157 F15Q F150] CK15753 F150 F150
G |2 Each - Extended Cab, Rear Seat
Price Each $15,174.004 $16.956.004 $16,333.004 $15,182.00 $13,978.0q $14,663.00 $15,031.64) $14,552.008 $16.271.00
Price Total $30,348.00) $33,912.004 $30,666.00 $30,364.00 $27,956.04 $29,326.00 $29,104.00] $32,542.00
Make Dodge Dodge; Chevrolet Chevrolef Ford Ford Ford] Ford
Model 15008 15008 CC15753 CC157 £l F150) F1504 F150)
H {3 Each - Short Bed, Colors to be Selected
Price Each $13,453.00, $15,325.00 $12,091.00 $15.182.00) $13,978.00 $12,951.00 $13,129.004 $14,549.00,
Price Total $40,359.00) $45,975.00 $36,273.00 $45,546.00 $41,934.004 $38,853.00 $39,387.00 $43.647.00
Make Dodqe] Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Ford Ford]
IModeI 1500 1500 CC15703] CC15753 F150 F15Q F150 F150]
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Bid #2 Bid #1
Opened: April 19, 2005 Gunn Dodge Rogers Dodge of |Gunn Chevrolet [Caldwell Country |[Cotumbus Country|Philpott Motors Tom Benson Northside Ford Grande Truck Center|
Alvin Chevrolet Ford LTD
c/o Baby Jack I |c/o Baby Jack
Automotive, LTD |Ford
Automotive, LTD
For: Light Duty Trucks 12540 IH 35 North| 2616 N. Bypass  [12602 IH 35 North|PO Box 27 PO Box 550 PO Box 876 9400 San Pedro  |12300 San Pedro j4562 IH 10 East
35
05-063 DG San Antonic Alvin San Antonio Caldwell Columbus Port Neches San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio
TX 78233 TX 77511 TX 78233 TX 77836 TX 78934 TX 77651 TX 78216 TX 78216 TX 78219
item Description
3 }3/4 Ton Trucks
A |3 Each - Extended Cab, Long Wheelbase
Price Each 317.526@ $18.534.00) $18,354.00 $18.370.00 $18.196.00) $17.713.00 $18,037.59 $18.285.00§ $19,228.00)
Price Total $52,578.00 $55.602.00 $55,062.00) $55,110.004 $54,588.00) $53,139.00) $54,112.77| $54,855.00% $57,684.00)
Make Dodge Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet] Ford] Ford| Chevroled] Ford| Ford
Model 2504 25008 CC25953 CC25953] F250 F250, CC25953] F250| F250]
B |19 Each - Regular Cab, Long Bed
Price Each $15,207.00; $16,349.00 $15,560.00 $15,487.00 $16,240.00 $15,633.00 $15,268.53 $16,199.00 $17,139.00
Price Total $288,933.00) $310.631.001 $295,640.00 $294,253.00 $308,560.00 $297,027.00 $290,102.07 $307,781.00 $325,641.00
Make Dodge] Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model 2500 2500 CC25903 €C25903 F250 F250 CC25903 F250 F250
C |5 Each - Crew Cab, Long Bed
Price Each $17,212.00 $18,534.00 $19,913.00 $19,962.00 $19,486.00 $19,005.00 $19,578.03; $19,845.00 $20,285.00
Price Total $86,060.00; $92,670.00 $99,565.00 $99,810.00 $97,430.00 $95,025.00 $97,890.15 $99,225.00 $101,425.00
Make Dodge| Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model 2500 25001 €C25943] C€C25943; F250 F250) €C25943 F250) F250)
D {2 Each - Crew Cab, Four Whee! Drive
Price Each $19.923.00 $18.577.04 $22,516.00 $22,538.004 $22,058.00¢ $21.612.00¢ $22,155.28] $22.451.004 $23.096.00
Price Tota! $39.846.00 $37.154.0d $45,032.00] $45,076.00) $44,116.00§ $43.224.004 $44,310.56) $44,902.00; $46,192.00;
Make Dodge| Dodge! Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Mode! 2500 2500 CK25943 CK25943 F250 F250 CK25943 F250 F250
E ]23 Each - Cab & Chassis, 56" Cab to Axle
Price Each $14,807.00 $15,774.00 ,/38.1 $14,966.00 $15,690.00 $15,186.00 $14,655.1 $15,753.00 $16,695.00
Price Total $340,561.004 $362,802.00 $338,974. $344,678.00% $360,870.00] $348,278.00 $337,068. $362,319.00) $383,985.00
Make Dodge Dodge] Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model 2500 2500] CC25903| CC25903 F250 F250 CC25903 F250 F250
F ]2 Each - Regular Cab, 4 x4
Price Each $17,458.00 $18,341.00 $17,993.00 $17,991.00 $16,721.00 $18,117.00 $17,676.78 $18,756.00 $25,488.00
Price Total $34,936.00} $36,662.00 $35,986.00 $35,982.00 $37,442.00 $36,234.00 $35,353.56 $37,512.00 $50,976.00
Make Dodge| Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model 2500 2500 CK25903 CK25903 F250 F250 CK25903 F250 F250
G |2 Each - Crew Cab, 1,500 Lb. Liftgate
Price Each $21.718.00 $21 .077.& $24,340.00) $24,452.004 $23,984.00 $23,783.00 No Bid $24,351.00 $24,973.00
Price Total $43,436.00 $42,154.04 $48,680.00 $48,904.00 $47,968.00 $47,566.00 $48,702.00 $49,946.00
Make Dodge| Dodge| Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Ford Ford
PModel 25004 2500‘ CK25943 CK25943 F250 F250 F250 F250
H {1 Each - Extended Cab, Four Wheel Drive, 1,500 Lb. Liftgate
Price Total $21,823.00] No Bid $22,335.00 No Bid $22,667.00 $22,306.00 No Bidj No Bid $23,788.00
Make Dodge| Chevrolet Ford Ford Ford
Model! 25001 CK25953 F250 F250 F250
1 |3 Each - Extended Cab, Four Wheel Drive
Price Each $19,923.00] No Bid $20,510.00 No Bid $20,861.00 $20,134.00 No Bid No Bid $21,976.00
Price Total $59,769.00] $61,530.00 $62,583.00 $60,402.00 $65,928.00
Dodge Chevrolet Ford Ford Ford
Model 2500 CK25953 F250 F250 F250
4 |0ne Ton Trucks
A 16 Each - Cab & Chassis, 84" Cab to Axie
Price Each No Bid] No Bid $21,646.00 $21,682.004 $22,230.00, $21,589.00 $22,234.90 $22,287.008 $23,368.00)
Price Total $129,876.00| $130,092.00 $133,380.00 $129,534.00 $133,408.40 $133,722.00 $140,208.00
Make Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model CC36403 CC36403 F350 F350 CC36403 F350 F350
B |1 Each - Cab & Chassis, 56" Cab to Axle
Price Total No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid $20,687.00 $20,236.00 NoBid  S20.650.00) $23,273.00
Make Ford Ford Ford Ford
Mode! F350 F350 F350 F350
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Bid #2 Bid #1
Opened:  April 19, 2005 Gunn Dodge Rogers Dodge of |Gunn Chevrolet ICaldwell Country [Columbus CountrylPhilpott Motors  [Tom Benson Northside Ford  [Grande Truck Center
Alvin Chevrolet Ford LTD
c/o Baby Jack Il |c/o Baby Jack
[Automotive, LTD [Ford
Automotive, L TD
For: Light Duty Trucks 12540 IH 35 North [2616 N. Bypass | 12602 iH 35 North|PO Box 27 PO Box 550 PO Box 876 9400 San Pedro  [12300 San Pedro |4562 IH 10 East
35
05-063 San Antonio Alvin San Antonio Caldwell Columbus Port Neches San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio
TX 78233 TX 77511 TX 78233 TX 77836 TX 78934 TX 77651 TX 78216 TX 78216 TX 78219
item Description
C |9 Each - Cab & Chassis, 60" Cab to Axle
Price Each No Bid] No Bid| $21,582.00) $21,644.00 $22,136.00 $21,419.00 $22,171.53] $21,619.00) $22,589.00)
Price Total $194,238.00 $194,796.00 $199,224.00 $192,771.09) $199,543.77] $184,571.00 $203,301.00
Make Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model CC36003 CC36003 F F350 CC36003 F350 F350
D |2 Each - Crew Cab, Four Door
Price Each $25,702.00 $27,974.00 $27,668.00§ $27,542.00¢ $27,337.00) $26,317.004 $28,855.43 $27,658.00 $28,099.00)
Price Total $51,404.00] $55,948.00 $55,336.00 $56,084.00 $54 674.00 $52,634.00 $57,710.86 $55,316.00 $56,198.00
Make Dodge Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Mode! 35004 3500 CK35943 CK35943 F350 F350 CK35943 £350 F350
E |3 Each - Crew Cab, Four Door, Long Bed
Price Each $23,239.04 $25,146.00 $25,806.00) No Bid| $24,491.00 $23,651.00% $26,220.33 $25,050.00 $25,246.00
Price Total $69,717.00] $75,438.00 $77,418.00 $73,473.00 $70,953.00 $78,660.99 $75,150.00 $75,738.00
Make Dodge| Dodge Chevrolet Ford Ford Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model 3500 3500 CK35943 F350 F350 CC35943 F350 F350
F |6 Each - Crew Cab, Four Door, Single Rear Wheels
Price Each No Bid No Bid| No 8Bid No Bid] $27,136.00 ,110. No Bid| $27,725.00 $28,218.00
Price Total $162,816.00; $156,660.00; $166,350.00 $169,308.00
Make Ford Ford| Ford Ford
Model F350 F350 F350 F350
G |1 Each - Crew Cab, Four Door, Trailer Towing Package
Price Total No Bid No Bid| No Bid $32,442.00) $28,746.00 $27,561.00] No Bid} $29,284.00 $29,498.00
Make Chevrolet Ford Ford Ford Ford
Model CC4E042 F450 F450] F450 F450
H |1 Each - Crew Cab, Four Door, 4 x 4
Price Total No Bid $27,874.00 $27,977.00 $29,840.00 $29,587.00, $26,817.00} $32,481.52 $30,111.00 $30,088.00
Make Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford| Ford| Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model 3500 CK35943 CK35943 F350 F350 CK35943 F350 350
1 |Deleted
J {1 Each - Truck, 15' Stake Bed, 1,600 Lb. Liftgate
Price Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid} $32,176.00| $30,704.00] No Bid $32,491.00 $33,781.00
Make Ford Ford| Ford Ford
Model F450 F450 F550 F450
5§ |Sport Utility Type Vehicles
A |12 Each - Four Door, Steering Column Shift Lever
Price Each No Bid $20,882.00 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid| No Bid $22,463.00
Price Total $250,584.00 $269,556.00
Make Dodge Ford
Model Durango Explorer]
B |6 Each - Four Door, Two Wheel Drive
Price Each $19,783.00) $20.882.00 $18.268.0 $18,337.00 $19.160.00) No Bid] No Bid] No Bidk $21,076.00
Price Total $118,698.00) $125,282.00 $109,728.04 $110.022.00 $114,960.00 $126.456.00
Make Dodge Dodge Chevrolet Chevrolet] Ford; Ford
|Model Durango Durangg CS155068 CS15506 Explorer] Explorer]
C |5 Each - Four Door, Four Wheel Drive
Price Each $22,346.00 $23,420.0 $20,334.00 $20,281.00% $21,240.004 No Bid] No Bid] No Bid] $22,938.00
Price Total $111,730.00 $117,100.00] $101,670.00| $101,405.00 $106,200.00 $114,690.00
Make Dodge Dodge; Chevrolet| Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model Durango Durango] CT15506) CT15506 Explorer| Explorer
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Bid #2 Bid #1
Opened: April 19, 2005 Gunn Dodge ﬁogers Dodge of {Gunn Chevrolet [Caldwell Country {Columbus Country]Philpott Motors | Tom Benson [Northside Ford Grande Truck Center
Alvin Chevrolet Ford LTD
c/o Baby Jack Il |c/o Baby Jack
Automotive, LTD |Ford
Automotive, LTD
For: Light Duty Trucks 12540 IH 35 North{2616 N. Bypass  [12602 IH 35 North[PO Box 27 PO Box 550 PO Box 876 9400 San Pedro 112300 San Pedro {4562 IH 10 East
35
105-063 San Antonio Alvin San Antonio Caldwell Columbus Port Neches San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio
TX 78233 TX 77511 TX 78233 TX 77836 TX 78934 TX 77651 TX 78216 TX 78216 TX 78219
Item Description
D {4 Each - Four Door, Four Wheel Drive, Steering Column Shift Lever
Price Each No Bid $23,420.00 No Bid No Bid| $22,263.00| No Bid No Bid| No Bid $22,938.00
Price Total $93,680.00 $89,052. $91,752.00
Make Dodge Ford Ford
Model Ourango Explore: Explorer
6 }3 Each - Suburban Type Wagons
Price Each No Bid| No Bid $26.748.00 $26,937.00 $28,499.00 No Bid} $26.941. No Bid} No Bid
Price Total $80.244.00 $80,811.00) $85,497.00) $80.824.1
Make Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford] Chevrolef
Model £C15904 CC25906 Excursion CC15!
7 |Van Type Trucks
A |5 Each - 15 Passenger %
Price Each No Bid] No Bid $20.650.00 $20.649.004 $19,131.00 $17.768. $20,510.64] $18.976.001 $19.791.00
Price Total $103,250.004 $103,245.00 $95,655.00 $88,840.00 $102,553.20) $94,880.00( $98.955.00)
Make Chevrolet| Chevrolet] Ford Ford Chevrolet] Ford| Ford]
Model CG3370q CG33706] E35q E35( CG33706f Essq Econoline]
B8 |2 Each - 12 Passenger
Price Each No 8id| No Bid] $20,492.00 $20,232.00§ $18,263.00 $16.792.00 $19,522.30) $18,126.004 $19,673.00
Price Total $40,984.00 $40,464.00 $36,526.00] $33,584.00] $39,044.60 $36,252.00 $39,346.00
Make Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford| Chevrolet Ford Ford
[Model CG33706 CG33406 E350] E350] CG33406 E350 Econoline
C |4 Each - 2 Passenger
Price Each No Bid] No Bid| $19.084.00) No Bid] $17.961.00 $16,722.00 No Bid] $17,822.00¢ $18.699.00]
Price Total $76,376.00) $71.844.0Q $66.888.04 $71,288.00 $74.796.00
Make Chevrolet Ford| Ford| Ford Ford
[Model CG33406 E350 E350) E350 Econoline
D |1 Each - § Passenger
Price Total No Bid] No Bid] $19,094.00| $19,890.04 $18,218. No Bid] No Bid] No Bid] $19,926.00
Make Chevrolet Chevrolet Ford Ford
Model CG33406 CG33406) £350) Econoline
8 |2 Each - Vans, Mini, 2 Passenger, Cargo ‘
Price Each $14,866.00 $15,280.00 No Bid $17,387.00 $17.486.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid|
Price Total $29,732.00 $30,560.00 $34,774.00 $34,972.00
Make Dodge Chevrolet Ford
Model Caravan Caravan CuU12216 Freestar,
9 |4 Each - Step Vans, 14’
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33,887.00 $31,680.00 No Bid ,{48. $32,429.00
Price Total $135,548.00 $126,720.00 $122,992.00 $129,716.00
Make Ford Ford Ford Ford
Model EA450 €450 E450] €49l
10 |1 Each - Cab & Chassis, 17,900 GVWR, with Service Body
Price Total No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid] ,876. $53,363.00 No Bid] No Bid $54,385.00
Make F Ford Ford
Model £ F550 F550
 Total Awarded $816,315.00 $79,308.00 $959,035.00 $89,980.00 $469,177.00 $698,370.00 $35,500.95 $143,680.00 $28,436.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Bid #1 Bid #2
Opened: April 19, 2005 Ancira-Winton Columbus Country Dodge|Lone Star Chevrolet |Rogers Dodge of {Tom Benson
Chevrolet c/o Baby Jack Chrysler Alvin
Automotive, LTD
For: Light Duty Trucks 6111 Bandera Rd. |PO Box 550 18900 NW Freeway {2616 N. Bypass |9400 San Pedro
35
05-063 San Antonio Columbus Houston Alvin San Antonio
TX 78238 TX 78934 TX 77065 TX 77511 TX 78216
Item Description
1 |Compact Pick Up Trucks
A |8 Each - Extended Cab
Price Each $13,147.00) $13,134.00] No Bid] $14,359.00) $13,351.35
Price Total $105,176.00 $105,072.00 $114,872.00 $106,810.80
Make Chevrolet Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Model CS15653 Dakota Dakota 815653
8 |3 Each - Extended Cab, Four Wheel Drive
Price Each $15,756.00 No Bid} $16,504.00) No Bidj No Bid
Price Total $47,268.00 $49,512.00
Make Dodge Dodge
Model Dakota Dakota
2 |1/2 Ton Trucks
A {17 Each - Long Wheel Base
Price Each $11,773.00 $14,073.00 No Bidi $15,185.00 $12,042.30;
Price Total $200,141.00 $239,241.00 $258,145.00 $204,718.10
Make Chevrolet: Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Model CC15903 1500 1500 CC15903
B |Deleted
C |S5Each-4X4
Price Each $18,084.00 $18,287.00 No Bid] $19,523.00 $18,393.00
Price Total $90,420.00 $91,435.00 $97,615.00 $91,965.00
Make Chevrotet Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Mode! CK15953 1500 15008 CK15753
D |2 Each - Extended Cab, Short Bed
Price Each $15,118.00 $15,894.00 No Bidi $16,959.00 $15,396.5!
Price Total $30,236.00) $31.788.00 $33,918.00 $30,793.1
Make Chevrolet Dodge] Dodge| Chevrolet}
{Model CC15753 1500 1500] CC15753
E |5 Each - Extended Cab, Long Bed
Price Each $15,721.00) $16,081.00] No Bid| $17,151.00 $15.877.21
Price Total $78,605.00 $80,405.00 $85,755.00 $79,386.05
Make Chevrolet Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Model CC15953 1500 1500 CC15953
F {1 Each - Extended Cab, 4 X 4
Price Total $18,370.00} $18.330.00% No Bid| $19,523.00 $18,347.56}
Make Chevrolet] Dodgae; Dodge; Chevrolet
Model CK15753] 1500 1500, CK15753
G |2 Each - Extended Cab, Rear Seat
Price Each $15.194.00 $15,865.00 No Bid] $16,959.00) $15.271.5
Price Total $30,388.00 $31,730.00] $33,918.004 $30.543.1
Make Chevrolet] Dodge; Dodgey Chevrolet
Model CC15753) 1500 1500, CC15753
H |3 Each - Short Bed, Colors to be Selected
Price Each $11,841.00 $15.865.00) No Bidi $15,325.00 $12.015.55
Price Total $35,823.00 $47,595.00) $45,975.00} $36,046.65]
Make Chevrolet] Dodge Dodge Chevroled]
lModeI ccis5703 1500 1500 ccis5709]
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Bid #1 Bid #2
Opened: April 19, 2005 Ancira-Winton Columbus Country Dodge|i.one Star Chevrolet |Rogers Dodge of [Tom Benson
Chevrolet c/o Baby Jack Chrysler Alvin
Automotive, LTD
For: Light Duty Trucks 6111 Bandera Rd. PO Box 5§50 18900 NW Freeway |2616 N. Bypass  |9400 San Pedro
35
05-063 San Antonio Columbus Houston Alvin San Antonio
TX 78238 TX 78934 TX 77065 TX 77511 TX 78216
tem Description
3 |3/4 Ton Trucks
A |3 Each - Extended Cab, Long Wheelbase
Price Each $18,424.00 $17,984.00) No Bid| $18,534.00, $18.311.64}
Price Total $55,272.00) $53,952.001 $55.602.00] $54,934.92,
Make Chevrolet Dodge; Dodge] Chevrolet]
Modet C€C25953 2500, 2500 CC25953
B |19 Each - Regular Cab, Long Bed
Price Each $15,540.00 $15,383.00 No Bid| $16,349.00 $15,512.58
Price Total . $295,260.00 $292,277.00 $310,631.00 $294,739.02
Make Chevrolet Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Mode! CC25903 2500 2500 CC25903
C |5 Each - Crew Cab, Long Bed
Price Each $19,955.00 $17,683.00 No Bid]| $18,534.00 $19.873.08
Price Tota! $99,775.00 $88,415.00 $92,670.00 $99,365.40
Make Chevrolet Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Model CC25943 25008 2500 CC25943]
D |2 Each - Crew Cab, Four Whesl Drive
Price Each $22,728.00) $20,387.00) No Bid| $21.645.00 $22.480.83
Price Total $45,456.00 $40,774.00} $43,290.00, $44,961.66)
Make Chevrolet Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Model CK25943 2500 2500 CK25943
€ }23 Each - Cab & Chassis, 56" Cab to Axle
Price Each $15,050.00 $14,821.00 No Bid] $15,674.00 $14.899.21
Price Total $346,150.00 $340,883.00) $360,502.00, $342,681.83)
Make Chevrolet Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Model CC25903 25001 2500 CC25903
F 12 Each - Regular Cab, 4 x 4
Price Each $18,204.00 $17,996.00 No Bid] $18,341.00 $17,949.33
Price Total $36,408.00 $35,992.00 $36,682.00 $35,898.66
Make Chevrolet Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Model CK25903 25004 2500 CK25903
G ]2 Each - Crew Cab, 1,500 Lb. Liftgate
Price Each $24,602.00 $22,439.00 No Bid| $24,445.00 No Bid|
Price Total $49,204.00 $44,878.00 $48,890.00
Make Chevrolet Dodge Dodge
Model CK25943 25008 2500
H |1 Each - Extended Cab, Four Whee! Drive, 1,500 Lb. Liftgate
Price Total No Bid $22,442.00 No Bid] $24,445.00 No Bid]
Make Dodge Dodge
Model 2500, 2500
| |3 Each - Extended Cab, Four Wheel Drive
Price Each No Bid $20,486.00 No Bid] $21,645.00 No Bid
Price Total $61,458.00 $64,935.00
Make Dodge Dodge
Model 25008 2500
4 JjOne Ton Trucks
A |6 Each - Cab & Chassis, 84" Cab to Axle
Price Each $21,937.00 No Bid| No Bid] No Bid $22,487.70)
Price Total $131,622.00 $134,926.20
Make Chevrolet Chevrolet
Model CC36403 CC36403
B |1 Each - Cab & Chassis, 56" Cab to Axle
Price Total $23,246.00 No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Make Chevrolet
{Model CK35903
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Bid #1 Bid #2
Opened: April 19, 2005 Ancira-Winton Columbus Country DodgelLone Star Chevrolet |Rogers Dodge of [Tom Benson
Chevrolet c/o Baby Jack Chrysler Alvin
Automotive, LTD
For: Light Duty Trucks 6111 Bandera Rd. {PO Box 550 18900 NW Freeway |2616 N. Bypass {9400 San Pedro
35
05-063 DG San Antonio Columbus Houston Alvin San Antonio
TX 78238 TX 78934 TX 77065 TX 77511 TX 78216
item Descripti
C |9 Each - Cab & Chassis, 60" Cab to Axie
Price Each $21,878.00) No Bid| No Bid| No Bid] 522.423.581
Price Total $196,902.00 $201,812.22
Make Chevrolet Chevrolet
Modet CC36003 CC36003
D |2 Each - Crew Cab, Four Door
Price Each $27,791.00 $26,347.00) No Bid] $27,974.004 $29,204.
Price Total $55,582.00 $52,694.00 $55,948.00 $58,408.96
Make Chevrolet Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Model CK35943 3500 3500 CK35943
E |3 Each - Crew Cab, Four Door, Long Bed
Price Each No Bid] $23,983.00) No Bid] $25,146.00 326,527498£
Price Total $71,949.00 $75,438.00 $79,583.94
Make Dodge Dodge Chevrolet
Model 3500 3500 CC35943
F |6 Each - Crew Cab, Four Door, Single Rear Wheels
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid] No Bid No Bid|
Price Total
Make
Mode!
G |1 Each - Crew Cab, Four Door, Trailer Towing Package
Price Total No Bid No Bid No 8id] No Bid No Bid}
Make
Model
H |1 Each - Crew Cab, Four Door, 4 x 4
Price Total No Bid No Bid No Bid] $27,974.00 $32.842.07]
Make Dodge Chevrolet
Model 3500 CK35943
t ]Deleted
J |1 Each - Truck, 15 Stake Bed, 1,600 Lb. Liftgate
Price Total No Bid No Bid No Bid] No Bid No Bid}
Make
Model
5 |Sport Utility Type Vehicles
A |12 Each - Four Door, Steering Column Shift Lever
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid| $20,882.00, No Bid|
Price Total $250,584.00
Make Dodge
Model Durangoy
B |6 Each - Four Door, Two Wheet Drive
Price Each No Bid $18.439.00 No Bid $20,882.00 No Bid§
Price Total $110.634.00} $125,292.004
Make Jeep Grand Cherokee; Dodge}
Model WKTH74] Ourangol
C |5 Each - Four Door, Four Wheel Drive
Price Each No Bid] $20,557.00; No Bid] $23,420.00, No Bid|
Price Total $102,785.00 $117,100.00
Make Jeep Grand Cherokee
{Model WKJIH74 Durango
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Bid #1 Bid #2
Opened: April 19, 2005 Ancira-Winton Columbus Country Dodge|Lone Star Chevrolet |Rogers Dodge of [Tom Benson
Chevrolet c/o Baby Jack Chrysler Alvin
Automotive, LTD
For: Light Duty Trucks 6111 Bandera Rd. {PO Box 550 18900 NW Freeway {2616 N. Bypass 9400 San Pedro
35
05-063 DG San Antonio Columbus Houston Alvin San Antonio
TX 78238 TX 78934 TX 77065 TX 77511 TX 768216
item Description
D |4 Each - Four Door, Four Wheel Drive, Steering Column Shift Lever
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid| $23,420.00 No Bid
Price Total $93,680.00
Make Dodge
Model Durango
6 |3 Each - Suburban Type Wagons
Price Each No Bid] No Bid] No Bidj No Bid No Bid
Price Total
Make
Model
7 |van Type Trucks
A |5 Each - 15 Passenger .
Price Each $20,696.00] No Bid} No Bid} No Bid] $20.818.834
Price Total $103.480.00; $104,094.15
Make Chevrolet] Chevrol
Model CG33706) CG337
B ]2 Bach - 12 Passenger
Price Each $20,344.00) No Bid| No Bid No Bid $19.820.7
Price Total $40,688.00 $39,641.58
Make Chevrolet Chevrolet
Model CG33406 CG33406
C |4 Each - 2 Passenger
Price Each $18,602.00) No Bid] No Bid| No Bid| No Bid]
Price Total $74,408.00]
Make Chevrolet
Mode! CG33405
D |1 Each - § Passenger
Price Total $19,143.007 No Bid! No Bid} No Binﬂ No Bid‘
Make Chevrolet
Model CG33406
8 |2 Each - Vans, Mini, 2 Passenger, Cargo
Price Each No Bid $17,447.00 No Bid| $15,280.00 No Bid}
Price Total $34,894.00 $30,560.00
Make
Model Caravan Caravan
9 |4 Each - Step Vans, 14'
Price Each $42,202.00 No Bid No Bidj No Bid No Bid|
Price Total $168,808.00
Make Workhorse
Model P31442
10 |1 Each - Cab & Chassis, 17,900 GVWR, with Service Body
Price Total No B8id No Bid No Bid} No Bid No Bid]
Make
Model
Total Awarded
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