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CITY OF SAN ANTONIO H-L-x Lk ? o
PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA MEMORANDUM

TO: Mayor and City Council

FROM: Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services
SUBJECT: Annual Contracts for Fiscal Year 2005-2006

DATE: July 14, 2005

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION

|

| The attached tabulations of bids is hereby submitted for council consideration and action. Annually at

| this time, bids are requested for various materials, parts and services. This ordinance includes contracts
for passenger vehicle replacement tires; potting soil for use by Parks & Recreation at various parks;
Bomag confined area compaction equipment parts and service used for paving City streets; S & S trailer
parts and service; and electrical parts and service.

Many bids are on a firm, non-escalating basis, while others such as petroleum related items and certain
other commodities require escalation of prices during the contract period. Generally, bids reflect small
increases over recent prior years, but in many cases reflect decreases.

It is recommended these contracts be approved.

SECTION I The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to the
lowest bidder. (6 contracts)

SECTIONII:  The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to
bidders other than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s
specifications. (5 contracts)

POLICY ANALYSIS

Annual contracts are an efficient method of securing the best prices through volume purchasing and by
reducing large amounts of work related to the bid process. This group of contracts represents a portion of
approximately 250 annual contracts that will be brought before City Council throughout the remainder of
the fiscal year.
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Annual Contracts

FINANCIAL IMPACT

Funds are not expended by this ordinance. All expenditures will be in accordance with the FY 2005-2006
budget to be approved by City Council. The combined total estimated amount for contracts listed on this
ordinance is approximately $819,619.

Janje vavntu, C.P.M.: Director
Purchasing & General Services

/Wals
Assistant to




SECTIONI
COUNCIL, JULY 14, 2005
LOW BIDS
SECTIONI: LOW BIDS

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to the lowest bidder.

COMMODITY

Passenger Tires

A207-06-RA

10-1-05 through 12-31-06
with one-year option to extend

This contract will provide the City of San
Antonio with replacement passenger vehicle
tires for the City’s fleet.

Potting Soil

A374-06-JM¢-

10-1-05 throdgh 9-30-06

with two one-year options to extend

This contract will provide the City of San
Antonio Parks & Recreation with potting soil
mix to be used at City parks.

Bomag Confined Area Compaction
Equipment Parts and Service
A544-06-TC

10-1-05 through 12-31-06

with one-year option to extend

This contract will provide the City of San
Antonio Fleet Operations and Public Works
Streets Division with parts and repair service
for compaction equipment used for paving
City streets.

WBE/
MBE

S & S Trailer Parts and Service
A633-06-TC

10-1-05 through 12-31-06

with one-year option to extend

This contract will provide the City of San
Antonio Fleet Operations, Public Works and
Environmental Services with parts and repair
services for trailers.

MBE

VENDOR

Ato Z Tire
Items 3,4, 7, 8
Est Amount $20,480 annually

Goodyear Wholesale Tire
Items 1,2,10, 11
Est Amount $15,937 annually

Grays Wholesale Tire
Items 5,6,9, 12
Est Amount $26,652 annually

BWI Schulenburg
Entire Bid
Est Amount $16,590 annually

Waukesha-Pearce Industries
Entire Bid
Est Amount $15,000 annually

Texas Equipment Company
Entire Bid
Est Amount $15,000 annually




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 20, 2005

For: Annual Contract for Passenger Tires
MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
Ato Z Tire Goodyear Wholesale Tire |Grays Wholesale Tire T & W Tire
A207-06-RA MkR P.O. Box 9138 4514 Tejasco Drive P. O. Box 2561 5834 I. H. 10 East
item Description Estimated [Amarilio, San Antonio, Fort Worth, San Antonio,
Annual Qty |[TX 79105 TX 78218 TX 761113 TX 78219
1 P205/65R15, Steel, Highway Rib 200
Brand National Goodyea Firestone| Goodyear|
Product Code 709074 402-406-477| 067-857| 771163118
Price Each $39.00 $36.89 $37.00] $37.69
Extended Price $7,800.00 $7,370.00 $7,400.00 $7,538.00
2 P205/70R 15, Steel, Highway Rib, Black Wall 30
Brand National Goodyea Firestone Goodyean
Product Code 705382 402-117-434 098-035) 40211 743g|
Price Each $38.00 $37.14 $38.00 $37.1
Extended Price $1,140.00 $1,114.20 $1,140.00 $1,115.70
3 [P205/75R15, Steel, Highway Rib 80
Brand National Goodyear] Firestone; Goodyear]
Product Code 180120 402-705-436/ 098-051 402117431
Price Each $35.00 $35.88| $37.00 $37.1
Extended Price $2,800.00 $2,870.40 $2,960.00 $2,975.20
4 P215,60R15, Steel, Highway Rib 200
Brand Sigmal Goodyear] Firestone| Goodyear
Product Code 020038, 100-430-200 107-549; 1004302001
Price Each $44.00 $51.18 $49.50) $51.23
Extended Price $8.800.00f . :, : $10,236.00 $9,900.00 $10,246.00
5 |P215/65R15, Steel, Highway Rib 10
Brand Sigma Goodyear Firestonel Goodyear
Product Code 020037 187-008-014 093-6451 116099499
Price Each $40.00 $48.34 $40.00 $42.14
Extended Price $400.00 $483.40 $400.00 $421.40
6  |P215/60R16, Steel, Highway Rib 500
Brand National Goodyear] Firestone Goodyear]
Product Code 705404 187-009-01§ 067-869 187009016
Price Each $45.00 $53.57] $39.00 $53.62]
Extended Price $22,500.00 $26,785.00 $19,500.00 $26,810.00
7 P215/75R15, Steel, Highway Rib, Black Wall 30
Brand National Goodyear Firestone| Goodyear]
Product Code 180124 402-391-436) 098-329| 4023914364
Price Each $36.00 $37.14] . $42.25) $37.19
Extended Price $1,080.00, $1,114.20 $1,267.50 $1,115.70
8 P235/75R15, Steel, Highway Rib 200
Brand Nationalf Goodyear] Firestone| Goodyear|
Product Code 180130 187-019-026 098-361 187019026
Price Each $39.00 $50.31 $47.00 $50.36]
Extended Price $7.800.00! $10,062.00 $9,400.00 $10,072.00
9 1455R12, Steel, Highway Rib 100
Brand Vanderbilt No Bid Herculeq No Bid
Product Code 280219 44560TDWM
Price Each $32.00 $25.60
Extended Price $3,200.00 $2,560.00

Prepared by Purchasing 6/24/2005
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 20, 2005

For: Annual Contract for Passenger Tires
MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
Ato Z Tire Goodyear Wholesale Tire |Grays Wholesale Tire T & W Tire
A207-06-RA MkR P. 0. Box 9138 4514 Tejasco Drive P. 0. Box 2561 5834 |. H. 10 East
Item Description Estimated |Amarillo, San Antonio, Fort Worth, San Antonio,
Annuat Qty JTX 79105 TX 78218 TX 761113 TX 78219
10 [P235/70R186, Steel, Highway Rib 100 J
Brand Nationa! * Goodyea Firestone| Goodyea
Product Code 707925 402-027-477| 123-889) 402027477
Price Each $60.00 $42.26 $53.50 $42.31
Extended Price $6,000.00 $4,226.00 $5,350.00 $4,231.00
11 P235/70R15, Steel, Highway Rib 75
Brand Nationa! Goodyea Firestone Goodyear|
Product Code 707026 116-969-011 118-656) 116969011
Price Each $51.00 $43.03 $53.50 $43.08
Extended Price $3,825.00] $3,227.25] $4,012.50 $3,231.00
12 IP255/70R16, Steet, Highway Rib 75
Brand National Goodyea Firestone] Goodyear]
Product Code 707927 137-840-039 147-033 132840072
Price Each $65.00 $75.63 $55.94 $73.64
Extended Price $4,875.00 $5,672.25) $4,192.50 $5,523.00
Warranty (Workmanship and Materials) Sixty months or life of tire During the first 25% offy  Standard manufacturer's| During the first 25% of]
usable treadwear, or] warranty] usable treadwear, or]
twelve months twelve months
Delivery 3 Days 1 Day 3 Days 3 Days
Terms Net 30 Net 30} 1%-10] Net 301
Total Esti d Award $20,480.00 $15,937.45( $26,652.50

Prepared by Purchasing 6/24/2005
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 27,2005

For: Annual Contract for Potting Soil
BWI Schulenburg

A374-06 JM/dc P.O. Box 459

Description Estimated Schulenburg,

Quantity TX 78956
Potting Soil 840 Bales
Price per cubic foot $5.198*
Price per bale $19.75
Total Price $16,590.00
Packed 3.8 cu. ft. bale
Mfr. & No. Sunshine # 4 WPOA4
Terms Net 30
Total Estimated Award $16,590.00
N ‘{\

Prepared by Purchasing 6/27/2005
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 31, 2005

For: Annual Contract for Bomag Confined Area
Compaction Equipment Parts & Service
Waukesha-Pearce Anderson Machinery
Industries San Antonio, Inc.
A544-06-TC TC 3740 SE Loop 410 PO Box 200380
. San Antonio, San Antonio,
item Description TX 78222 TX 78220
1 Bomag Confined Area Compaction Equipment Parts
Percent of Discount Offered 0% 16%
Product identification BMG BO
Type Price Schedule Dealer Dealer
Price Schedule Number 5305 050706
Date of Price Schedule 5/3/05 5/2/05
Price Schedule Column on which discount is based List Distributor
2 Labor and Service

Labor Rate per Hour $80.00 $75.00
Mileage Charge per Mile $1.95 $2.00
Parts Delivery 14 Days A 7 Days
Terms Net 30| rNet 30
Estimated Annual Total $15,000.00

Prepare@y Purchasing 6/29/2005
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 17, 2005
For: Annual Contract for S & S Trailer Parts & Service
Texas Equipment Company
A633-06-TC TC 7490 FM 1560
Item Description San Antonio,
TX 78254
1 S & S Trailer Parts
Percent of Discount Offered - Net / Net / Net / Net
Product Identification Dexter / Buyers / Parker / TEC
Type Price Schedule Dealer / Dealer / Dealer / Dealer
Price Schedule Number LIT-300-01 / M0404 / PL4400 / TECBA040S5
Date of Price Schedule 6/1/02 / 5/1/04 / 5/3/04 / 5/1/05]
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based Retail / List / List / List
2 Labor and Service
Labor Rate per Hour $50.00
Mileage Charge per Mile $2.00
Delivery 1 - 5 Days|
Terms Net 20
Estimated Annual Total . $15,000.00]
Prepared by Purchasing 6/29/2005 Page 1
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SECTION II
COUNCIL, JULY 14, 2005
LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS

SECTION II: LOW BIDS

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to bidders other than the
lowest bidders because the lowest bids failed to meet City’s specifications.

COMMODITY , MBE VENDOR
1. Electrical Parts & Service American Light

A391-06-RA Items 59, 60, 62-65, 67, 69-79, 80,

10-1-05 through 12-31-06 83-85, 87, 88

with two one-year options to extend Est Amount $135,000 annually

This contract will provide the City of San CED

Antonio Park Operations, Asset Mgt. Items 3A1-A6, B1-B6, C1-C6, D1-

Building Maintenance, Convention Facilities D6, E1-E6, F1-F6, G1-G6, H1-H6,

and other City departments with electrical 4A1-A6, B1-B6, C1-C6, D1-D6, El1-
‘ parts and fixtures for repair and maintenance E6, F1-F6, G1-G6, H1-H6, 10A-F,
y of City facilities. 11A-F, 13A1-A6, B1-B6, C1-C6,
r D1-D6, E1-E6, F1-F6, 17, 18, 22, 27,

42,43, 45, 46

Est Amount $152,480 annually

Dealers Electrical Supply

Items 6A-F, 7A-F, 8A-F, 12A-F, 41,
48, 49, 57, 66, 68, 81, 82C1-C6

Est Amount $135,000 annually

Graybar

Items 2A1-A6, B1-B6, C1-C6, D1-
D6, E1-E6, F1-F6, G1-G6, H1-H6,
9A-F, 15, 16, 19-21, 23-26, 28-32,
33-40, 44, 50-52, 54-56, 58, 82A1-
A6, 89

Est Amount $152,480 annually

Summit Electrical Supply

Items 1A1-A16, B1-B6, C1-C6, D1-
D6, E1-E6, F1-F6, G1-G6, H1-H6,
82B1-B6, 86

Est Amount $135,000 annually




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened. April 1, 2005
Faor Annual Contract for Electnest Pans & Fixtures MSWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
Amencan Ligtit CED Dealers Electncal Supply Graybar Summit Electnc Supply
A391-06 MkR 10615 Sentinel Dr. 102 €. Josephine 2510 Bitters Rd. 1223 N. Hackberry 2401 Brockton Drive
N Unit of San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ttem Description Measure |TX 78217 TX 78215 TX 78063 TX 78202 X 78217
1 Cutler Hammer
A Circuit Breakers, one & two pole, 120/240V AC,20-100 Amp, Plug-On EA ]
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bict 10%)
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Eaton (Cutier Hammer
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Price & Availability Diges
4 Pnce schedule number 1
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 1115/04
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List
(i.e., distnbutor, net, wholesale)
B. Circuit Breakers, one & two pole, 120/240V AC,20-100 Amp, bolt-on EA . -
1 Percent of discount offered No 8id ‘ » No Bid No Bid, No Bid 10%|
2 Product identification {Mfr.) Eaton (Cutler Hammer
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) g Price & Availability Diges
4 Pnce scheduie number 1
5 Dale ot price schedute (latest) 111504
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List
(i.e., aistributor, net, wholesale)
C. Circuit Breakers, three pole, 240/600V AC, 15-100 Amp, Plug-On EA
1 Percent ot discount offered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 10%|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Eaton (Cutler Hammer
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Price & Availability Diges!
4 Pnce schedule number 1
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 11/15/04)
6 Prce schedule column on which discount is based List|
(1.e., distnbutor, net, wholesale)
D Circuit Breakers, three pole, 240/600V AC, 15-100 Amp, bolt-on EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid 10%!|
2 Product identitication (Mfr.) Eaton (Cutler Hammer
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Price & Availability Diges'
4 Pnce schedule number 1
5 Date of pnce schedule (latest) 11/15/04]
6 Price scheduie column on which discount is based List
(i e, distnbutor, net, wholesale)
E. Loadcenters with breakers EA
1 Percent of discount oftered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| 10%|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Eaton (Cutier Hammer,
3 {Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Price & Availability Diges|
4 Pnce schedule number 1
5 Date of price schedute (latest) 1NS04
6 Pnce schedule column on which discount is based List
(i.e., distnbutor, net, wholesale)
F. Panelboards with breakers €A
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid No 8id| No Bid No Bid 10%)
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Eaton (Cutier Hammer
3 Type pnce schedule(dealer, jobber, etc.} Price & Avaliability Diges
4 Price schedule number 1
5 Date of pnee schedulo {datest) 1115/04
6 Price schedule colutn on winch discount is based List
(1.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
G. |Switches EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid No Bid| No Bid No Bid{ 10%)
2 Product identification (Mir.) Eaton (Cutier Hammer
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Price & Availability Diges|
4 |Price schedule number ' 1
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 1115/04}
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List
(i.e., distnibutor, net, wholesale)
H.  [Motor Control EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| No Bidi No 8id| No Bid] 10%)|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Eaton (Cutler Hammer
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Price & Availability Diges
4 Price schedule number 1
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 1115/04
6 Prce schedule column on which discount is based List

(i ., distributor, net, wholesale)

Prepared by Purchasing 6/28/2005



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened Apnl 1, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Electrical Parts & Fixtures MSWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
American Light CED Dealers Electrical Supply Graybar Summit Electric Supply
A391-06 MkR 10615 Sentinel Dr. 102 E. Josephine 2510 Bitters Rd. 1223 N. Hackberry 2401 Brockton Drive
Unit of San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description M X 78217 TX 78215 X 78063 TX 76202 TX 78217
2 Square 0" Co
A Circuit Breakers, one & two pole, 1207240V AC, 20-100 Amg Plug-On EA
1 Percent of discount otfered No 8id| No Bid 65%) 58.76% (line item ¥ 00130 No Bid|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) . Square D) Square D QG
3 Type prce schedule (dealer, jobber, elc.) Dealer| U.S. Communitieq]
4 Price schedule number 173 ED4/ICS (H
5 Date of price schedule (latest) October 2004 February 2004
6 Prce schedule column on which discount is based List DE A/DE2H
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
B. Circuit Breaker, one & two pole, 120/240V AC,20-100 Amp, bolt-on EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| No Bid, 43% 58.77% (# 00132 No 8id|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Square [} Square D QOH}
K] Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer] U.S. Communitieq
4 Price schedule number 173] ED4/ICS(H
5 Date of price schedule ({atest) . October 2003 February 2004
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based ‘«-C»—« - List DE2 / DE2A / DE3A
(i.e., distnbutor, net, wholesale)
C. Circuit Breakers, three pole, 240/600V AC, 15-100 Amp, plug-on EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| / No Bid| 53%)| 58.76% (#00130 No Bid
2 Product identification (Mfr.) b ( et Square Dy Square D QQ
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Deale U.S. Communitie:
4 Price schedule number 173 ED4/1CS (Hl
5 Date of price schedule (latest) October 2003 February 200!
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List] DE A/ DE2H
(i.e., distnbutor, net, wholesale)
D.  [Circuit Breakers, three pole, 240/600V AC, 15-100 Amp, bolt-on EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| No Bid| 53%) 58.77%| No Bid|
2 |Product identification (Mfr.) Square D} Square D QOH]
3 Type price schedule (deater, jobber, etc.) Dealer| U.S. Communitiey]
4 Price schedule number 173 ED4/I1CS (H
5 Date of pnce schedule (latest) October 2003 February 2004
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List] DE2/DE2A / DE3A
(i e, distnbutor, net, wholesate)
E. Loadcenters with breakers EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| No Bid 55% 66.39% (#00128)/ 66.65% (#00133 No Bid
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Square O} Square D QO HOM
3 Type pnce scheduie (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer| U.S. Communitieq
4 Price schedule number 173 ED4/ICS (H
5 Date of price schedule (latest) Octaber 2004 February 2004
6 Pnce schedule column on which discount is based List] DE3/DE3A/ DE3C/DE3(Q
{i.e. distributor, net, wholesale)
F. Panelboards with breakers EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid No Bid| 55%) 67.77% (#00129) / 67.79% (#0013H No Bid
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Square DY SQD QMB 7 SQD NH
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer] u.s. Co ities / U.S. Ci it
4 Price schedule number 173 ED4/1CS (H
5 Date of price schedule (latest) October 2003 Feb 2005 / Feb 2004
6 Pnce schedule column on which discount is based List PEIA]
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
G Switches EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| No Bid! 46%) 62.96% (#00131) / 63.20% (#00136} No Bid|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Square O SQD /san|
3 Type price schedule {dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer| u.s Co ities / U.S. C: it
4 Price schedute number 173 ED4/ICS (H
5 Date of price schedule {latest) , October 2004 Feb 2005 / Feb 200
6 Pnce schedule column on which discount is based List DE1/DE1A
(t e., distnbutor, net, wholesale)
Prepared by Purchasing 6/28/2005 2




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 1, 2005
For: Annuat Contract for Electncal Parts & Fixtures MSWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
Amencan Light CED Dealers Electrical Supply Graybar Summit Electric Supply
A391-06 MkR 10615 Sentinel Dr. 102 E. Josephine 2510 Bitters Ra 1223 N. Hackbenry 2401 Brockton Drive
tem Description Unit of San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Measure |TX 78217 X 78215 TX 78063 TX 78202 X 78217
H.  |Motor Controt EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| No Bid! 30% 38.63% (#00141) 7 17.59% (#00142) 1 23.43% No Bid|
(#00143) 1 18.59% (#00144) / 19.31% (#00145)
. 45.78% (00146) / 19.28% (#00147) / 21.12%|
(¥00149) / 28.91% (#00150) / 19.20% (#00151)
23.55% (#00152) / 23.08% (#00153) 1 29.02%
(#00154) / 14.73% (#00155;
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Square O SQD|
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer] U.S. Communities]|
4 Price schedule number 173 ED4/1ICS (H
5 Date of price schedule (latest) October 200 February 2004 )
6 Price schedute column on which discount is based List CP1/CP2/CPd
(i.e., distnbutor, net, wholesale)
3 General Electnc Co. -
A Circuit Breakers, one & two pole, 120/240V AC,20-100 Amp, plug-on EA
1 Percent of discount oftered No Bid| 40% No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2 Product identification (Mfr.) GEDE
3 Type price schedule {dealer, jobber, etc.) Buy Loy
4 Price schedule number GEP-1100Q
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 2005
6 Price schedute columin on which discount is based List]
(i.e., distributor, net, whoiesale)
B. Circuit Breakers, one & two pole, 120/240V AC,20-100 Amp, bolt-on EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Product identification (Mfr.) GEDE|
3 Type price schedule {dealer, jobber, etc.) Buy Log
4 Price scheduie number GEP-1100Q
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 2005
6 Pnce schedule column on which discount is based List
(i e., distnbutor, nel, wholesaie)
C Circuit Breakers, three pole, 240/600V AC, 15-100 Amp, plug-on EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| 30%| No Bid No Bid No 8id
2 Product identification{ Mfr.) GEDE|
3 Type pnce schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Buy Loyl
4 Pnce schedule number GEP-1100Qy
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 2005
8 Price schedule column on which discount is based List]
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
D. Circuit Breakers, three pole, 240/600V AC, 15-100 Amp, bolt-on EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bidi Lt 20%) No Bid No Bid No Bid|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) ' GEDE]
3 Type price schedule {dealer, jobber, etc.) » "Bly tog
4 Pnce schedule number GEP-1100Qy
5 Date of pnce schedule (latest) 20054
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List|
{i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
E Loadcenters wilth broakers EA
1 Purcent of discount otlerod No Bic 40% No Bid No Bid| No Bid|
2 Product identiication (Mir.) . GEDE
3 Type price scheduie (dealer, jobber, etc.) Buy Loy
4 Pnce schedule number GEP-1100Q
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 2005
6 Prce schedute column on which discount is based List
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
F. Panelboards with breakers EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid 25%)| No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Product identification {(Mfr.) GEDE]
3 Type price schedule {dealer, jobber, etc.) Buy Log
4 Pnce schedule number GEP-1100Q
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 2005
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)

Prepared by Purchasing 6/28/2005




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened April 1, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Electrical Parts & Fixtures MSWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
Amencan Light CED Dealers Elecwricat Supply Graybar Summit Electric Supply
A391-06 MkR 10615 Sentinel Dr. 102 E. Josephine 2510 Bitters Rd. 1223 N. Hackberry 2401 Brockton Drive
item Description Unit of San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Measure 1TX 78217 TX 78215 TX 78063 TX 78202 TX 78217
G.  [Switches EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| 50%)| No Bid| No Bid No Bid|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) GEDE]
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc) Buy Lol
4 Price schedule number GEP-1100Q
5 Date of price schedule (latest)} 200
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
H Motor Control EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| 10% No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2 Product identification (Mfr.) GEDE]
3 Type price schedule {dealer, jobber, eic.) Buy Log
4 Pnce schedule number GEP-1260N
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 2003
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based
{i.e., distributor, net, wholesate)
4 ITE/Siemens
A. [Circuit Breakers, one & two pole, 120/240V AC,20-100 Amp plug-on EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid] 40%) No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Siemens / ITH]
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Deale:
4 Pnce schedule number Alphanumeric - PDAN-ALPO3
5 Date ot pnce schedule (tatest) 2005
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List
(i e , distnbutor, net, whoiesale)
B Circuil Breakers, one & two pole, 120/240V AC,20-100 Amp, bolt-on EA
1 Percent ot discount oftered No Bid| 20% No 8id| No Bid No Bid
2 Product identification (Mtr.} Siemens / iTH]
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, elc.) Dealer
4 Pnce schedule number Alphanumeric - PDAN-ALPO!
5 Date of pnce schedule (latest) 2005
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List
(1.e.. distributor, net, wholesale)
Cc Circuil Breakers, three pole, 240/600V AC, 15-100 Amp, plug-on EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid] 30%| No Bid No Bid No Bid|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Siemens /{TH]
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer]
4 Price schedule number Alphanumeric - PDAN-ALPO
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 2005
6 Pnce schedule column on which discount is based List
{i.e., distrbutor, net, wholesale)
D. Circuit Breakers, three pole, 240/600V AC, 15-100 Amp, bolt-on EA
1 Percent ot discount offered No Bid| 20%)| No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2 |Product identification (Mfr.) . ens / 1TH
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) ; Dealer|
4 Price schedule number Atphanumeric - PDAN-ALPO4
5 Date of price schedule {latest) , 2005
6 Poce schedute column on which discount is basod ‘ List,
(1.e., disbributor, net, wholesale) ST 25PN
E. Loadcenters with breakers EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| 40% No Bid| No Bid No Bid|
2 Product identification (Mfr.} Siemens / ITH
3 Typu price schedule (dealur, jobber, eic)) Dualer
4 Price schedule number Alphanumeric - PDAN-ALPOS
5 Date ol price schedule (latest) 2005
6 ace schedule column on which discount is basod List
(1 v, distributor, not, wholosatu)
F. Panelboards with breakers EA
1 Percent of discount ottered No Bid 25% No Bid| No Bid No Bid
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Siemens / T
3 Type price schedute (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer
4 Price schedule number Alphanumeric - PDAN-ALPOS
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 2005
6 Prce schedule column on which discount is based List
(i.e., distnbutor, net, wholesale)
Prepared by Purchasing 6/28/2005 4




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened Aprit 1, 2005
For. Annuat Contract for Electricat Parts & Fixtures MSWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
American Light CED Dealers Electrical Supply Graybar Summit Electnc Supply
A391.06 MKR 10615 Sentinel Dr. 102 E. Josephine 2510 Bitters Rd. 1223 N. Hackbermry 2401 Brockton Drive
. Unit of San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description M TX 78217 TX 78215 TX 78063 TX 76202 TX 78217
G Switches EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| 50% No Bid| No Bid No Bid|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Siemens / ITH
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer|
4 Price schedule number Alphanumeric - PDAN-ALPO4
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 2005
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
H Motor Control EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bidk 10% No Bid| No Bid No Bid|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) Siemens / ITE]
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Controt Productd
4 Price schedule number CPPC - 0600Q
5 Date of pnce schedule (latest) Dec 2000
6 Price schedule column on which discount is based List|
{i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
5 Deleted
6 Electrical Metallic Tubing And Elbows (1/2"-4%) EA
A Percent of discount otfered No Bid Conduit 40% / Fittings 65% 50% / 60% 15% (line item # 00010 No Big|
8 Product identfication (Mfr.) LTV Republic / NEC Maverick LTV 7 Robroy Allied Wheatland
[ Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dist. List / List] Distnbutor List Trade
D.  |Price schedule number Card #157 / June 04 2/16/04 / F164 U.S. Communities]
E. Date of price schedule (latest) 2/16/04 / June 04 2/10/04 / 2110/04 2/1/03
F Pnce schedule column on which discount is based List/ List, List / List Trade|
(i.e, distnbutor, net, wholesate) :
7 Gailvanized Rigid Conduit, Nipples, Couplings & Elbows (1/2"-4") EA
A Percent of discount offered No Bid Conduit 40% / Fittings 65Y 50% / 60%) 15% (# 00010 No Bid
B Product identification (Mfr.) LTV Repubtic / NEC Maverick LTV / Robro Allied Wheatland
C Type pnce schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dist. List / LisY] Distributor Lis Trade
D Price schedule number Card #131 / Not Giver 2/16/04 / F164 U S. Communities}
E Date of price schedute (latest) 2/16/04 1 June 04 2/10/04 1 2/10/04 211103
F. Pnce scheduie column on which discount is based List/ Lisy| List/ List] Trade
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
8 Rigid Non-Metallic Conduit, Etbows, Couplings & Adapters EA
A Percent of discount offered No Bid| Conduit 40% / Fittings 65% 67%j 20% (page 1), No Bid
B8 Product identification (Mfr.) Cantex / Cantex Cadon Carlon
C. Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) List / List Price Guide] Trade
O Price schedule number Sch 40 conduit / PVC Fititng 173172004 U.S. Communities|
E. Date of pnce schedule (latest) 12/1/03 / 2/1/04 1/3172005 2/1/03
F Price schedule column on which discount is based Net / Net List Trade
{i.e., distnbutor, net, wholesale)
9 Wiring Devices (Leviton, Hubble, P&S or Equal) EA
A Percent of discount offered No Bid| 30% 45%[| 40% (line item # 00047} / 45% (line item # 00057 10%
B Product identification (Mfr.) Cooper| Leviton)| Leviton / Hubbel Pass & Seymour]
C.  |Type price scheduie (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dist. Price List| Trade Price] Trade / Trad Trade Price & index
D Pnice schedule number CWD -020705 Dist| 6T U.s. Col ities / U.S. Col it Not Given
E Date of price schedule (latest) 217105 9727104 210 6/14/04
F. Pnce schedule column on which discount is based Std Pkg Qtyf Phg Qiy Trade] P1
(i e, distnbutor, net, wholesale)
10 |Steel Switch Boxes, Qutiet Boxes & Covers (Raco, Steel City or Equal) EA
A Purcent of discount offered No Bic 76% 67% 60% (# 00077)/65% (¥ 00083 No Bid
B Product idontification (Mfr) T & B Applolon Raco / Sleel City]
C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Trade Pricy Distrbutor] Trade / Trade
O. Price schedule number Electrical Products| DC-1104 U.S. Communities / U.S. Communitieq
E Date ot pnce schedule {latest) 11212002 11/1/04 21103 1 211103
F. Price schedule column on which discount is based Std Pkg Co Price Trade / Trade|
(i e, distnbutor, net, wholesale)
11" Weatherprool Boxes & Covers (Perfuct-Line, Square ,. Raco or Equal) EA
A Percent of discount otlered No Bid| T76%]| 57% 35% (# 00041)/ 40% (Bell Page 2, No Bid|
8 Product identification (Mir.) T&B Appleton; Perfectline / Raco Bel
(o1 Type pnce schedule (dealer, jobber, etc ) Trade Pricey Distributor! Trade / Trade
D Prce schedule number Electrical Producty DC-1104 U.S. Col ities / U.S. C
E Date of price schedule (latest) 1/2/2004 11/1/04 2/1/03 1 211103
F. Price schedule column on which discount is based Std Pkg Co Price Trade / Trade
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesate)

Prepared by Purchasing 6/28/20
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: Aprl 1, 2005
For. Annual Contract for Elecincal Parts & Fixtures MSWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MUWN
American Light CED Dealers Electrical Supply Graybar Summit Electric Supply
A391.06 MkR 10615 Sentinet Dr. 102 E. Josephine 2510 Bitters Rd. 1223 N. Hackbermry 2401 Brockion Drive
ltem Description Unit of San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Measure |TX 78217 TX 78215 TX 78063 TX 78202 X 78217
12 [Steel EMT Compression Connectors & Couplings (Midewest or Equal) EA
A. Percent of discount offered No Bid| 50%)| 75%) 55% (#00070) / 35% (Page 1 No Bid|
8. Product identification (Mfr.) T & 8 Appleton Steel City / Midwest
C. Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Trade Price] Distributon Trade / Trade]
D.  [Pnce schedule number Electricai Producty DC-1104 us.c ities / U.S. C itieg
E. Date of price schedule (latest) 17212002 11/1/04] 2111031 211103
F. Price schedule column on which discount is based Std Pkg Col Price] Trade / Trade!
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
13 |Terminals, Connectors. Cable Ties (Panduit or Equal) €A
A Ring Terminals, vinyl insulated
1 Percent of discount offered No Bidi 50%) 30% N 42% (#00051 No Bid
2 Product identfication (Mfr.) T&B M Panduit
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Trade Pricey Trade Trade
4 Price schedule number Efectrical Producty Not Given| U.S. Communities]
5 Date of price schedule (latest} 1/2/2002 12/1/04 2/1/03|
6 Pnce schedule column on which discount is based Sid Pkg Col 3iList Trade
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
B. |Fork Teminals, vinyl insulated EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| 50% 30% 42% (#00051 No 8id!
2 Product identification (Mfr.) T&B M Panduit
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Trade Pricey Trade Trade
4 Pnce schedule number Electrical Producty Not Given U.S. Communities|
5 Date of price schedule {latest) 11212002 12/1/04] 2/1103
Pnce schedule column on which discount is based Std Pkg Co! 3ist Trade
6 (i.e., distnbutor, net, whotesale)
C Locking Fork Termunals, vinyl insulated EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bidj 50% 30% 42% (#00051 No Bid
2 Product identification (Mfr.) ‘T&B M Panduit
3 Type price schedule {dealer, jobber, etc.) Trade Pricef Trade Trade
4 Pnce schedule number Electricat Product Not Given| U.S. Communities]
5 Date of price schedule {latest) 1/212002 12/1/04] 211103
Price schedule column on which discount is based Std Pkg Col IList Trade
6 (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
D P-Conn Screw-on Connectors, nut style EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| 50% 30% 42% (#00051 No Big|
2 Product identitication (Mfr.) T&B M Panduit
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Trade Price Trade Trade
4 Price schedute number Electrical Products Not Given| U.S. Communities]
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 1/212002 12/1/04 21103
Pace schedule column on which discount is based Std Pkg Col 3List Trade
6 (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
E. [Cable Ties-Marker Type EA
1 Percent of discount offered No Bid| 50% 30%: 12% (Page 3 No Bid
2 Product identitication (Mfr.) T&B Ideal Panduit]
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Trade Price] Trade Price shee Trade|
q Price schedule number Electrical Producty P358) U.S. Communities]
5 Date of pnce schedule (latest) 17212002 1/26/05| 2/1/03]
Pnce schedule column on which discount is based Std Pkg Col Trade Trade
6 (1 e, distnbutur, net, wholesale)
F. Cable Ties-Self Locking Type EA
1 Percent of discount oftered No 8id| 50%i 30% 12% (Page 3 No Bid|
2 Product identification (Mfr.) T & B Ideal Panduit
3 Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Trade Price] Trade Price Shee Trade
4 Pnce schedule number Electrical Producty P358 U.S. Communities
5 Date of price schedule (latest) 17212002 1/26/09| 2/1/03)
Pnce schedule column on which discount is based : Std Pkg Col Trade Trade
6 {i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)
14 1/2" Steet fiexible conduit-greenfield, 100ft. Coit CIFT
Brand Name of Hem Offered No Bid AFC| AFC; AFC & ALL ALFLEX]
Fan Number for Brand Name Otiered Flex RWS-1/2 GRF 050 Flexsteel 1/2 100t Cod 1/2 Fiex $
Net Prce e N > AL $24.50] e $23 13 $27.90
1 Wirg, copper, sold, THHN-THWN, #12, 600 voll, all colors MIFT
Brand Name of itein Olfered No 8id| AlW Encorel Southwire {Ine item # 00031 Southwire
Part Number for Brand Name Offered 12 SO Not Giver: THHN 12 SOL (Color) 5009 12 SOL|
Net Pace $52.50) $54.00) $45.22 $54.41
Prepared by Purchasing 6/28/2005 6




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: Apnl 1, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Electrical Parts & Fixtures MSWN mewy 4 MLWN MLWN MLWN
American Light CED ‘ ; Dealers Electrical Supply Graybar Summit Electric Supply
A391-06 MkR 10615 Sentinel Dr. 102 E. Josephine 2510 Bitters Rd. 1223 N. Hackberry 2401 Brockton Drive
Unit of San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description Measure |TX 78217 TX 78215 TX 78063 TX 78202 TX 78217
16 Wire, copper, stranded, THHN-THWN, #12, 600 volt, all colors. M/FT
Brand Name of llem Offered No Bid| Alw Encorej Southwire (#00031 Southwire
Part Number for Brand Name Offered 12 STR| Not Give THHN 12 STR (Color) 500 12STR
Net Pnce $59.60) $61.70, $51.3 $64.47
17 Wire, copper, stranded, THHN-THWN, #8, 600 volt, biack, M/FT gT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid| AW Encore Southwire (#00031 Southwire)|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THHN 8 Not Given THHN 8 STR BLK 5004 8 STR|
Net Price $161.00 $166.65 $162.22 $174.00]
18 Wire, copper, stranded, THHN-THWN, #2, 600 volt, black. MFT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid| AlW| Encore| Southwire (#00031 Southwire|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THHN 2] Not Given THHN 2 STR BLK 5004 2STR|
Net Price $581.00f $601.45) $585.47] $631.00{
19 Wire, copper, solid, Romex, #12-2 w/g Romex, 600 voit. M/FT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid| AlW Encore| Southwire (#00028 Southwire}
Pan Number for Brand Name Offered NM 12-2 W/9| Not Givery NM WG 1272 250 CTN 1212 WG|
Net Price $135.00) * $160.52 $132.62 $145.00]
20 Wire, copper, stranded, THHN-THWN, #10, 600 volt, all cotors. M/IFT
Brand Name of item Offered No Bid AlW Encore Southwire (#00031 Southwire
Part Number for Brand Name Offered 10 STR Not Giveny THHN 10 STR (Color) 500* 10 STR|
Net Pnce $89 54 $92 64| $77.1 $97.30}
21 Wwire, copper, solid, THHN-THWN, #10, 600 voit, all cotors. MFT
Brand Name ot ltem Oftered No Bid| AlW Encore Southwire (#00031 Southwire}
Part Number for Brand Name Offered 10 SOL Not Giver) THHN 10 SOL (Color) 5004 10 SOL
Net Price $79.20] $82.05 $68.2 $86.14]
22 Wire, copper, stranded, THHN-THWN, #6, 600 volt, all coiors. MFT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid| Al Encore| Southwire (#0003 1 Southwire
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THHN 6 Not Given THHN 6 STR BLK 1004 6 STR
Net Price $239.55 $247.97 $241.39, $260.00}
23 Wire, copper, stranded, UF, #6, 600 vott. M/FT
Brand Name of item Offered No Bid| No Bid! Encore] Southwire (Sheet 279C No Bid|
Part Number tor Brand Name Offered Not Givenl XHHW 6 STR BLK 1000R
Net Price $602.3¢ $280.86
24 Wire, copper, stranded, THHN-THWN, #4, 600 volt, black. MIFT
Brand Name of Item Offered . No Bid AlwW Encore| Southwire (#00031 Southwire
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THNN 4 Not Giveny THHN 4 STR BLK 100( 4 STR
Net Price $369.19; $382.19 $372.02 $401.00|
25 Wire, copper, standed, UF, #4, 600 volt. M/FT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid No Bid| No Bid{ Southwire (Sheet 279C No Bid|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered XHHW 4 STR BLK 1000R
Net Pnce $430.39
26 Wire, copper, stranded, THHN-THWN, 2/0, 600 volt, black. M/FT
Brand Name of item Otfered No Bid: AW Encore| Southwire (#00031 Southwire|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THHN 2/0 Not Given| THHN 2/0 STR BLK 100 2/0 STR
Net Pnce $957.65) $991.3 $916.79 $1,040.00]
27 Wire, copper, stranded, THHN-THWN, 1/0, 600 volt, black MIFT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid] AW Encore Southwire (#00031 Southwire
Pan Number for Brand Name Offered THNN 1/0) Not Given, THHN 1/0 STR BLK 1004 110 STR,
Net Price $816.0 $844.82 $856 82| $886.00)
28 Wire, copper, stranded, UF, 2/0, 600 volt, black M/FT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid, No Bid No Bid| Southwire (Sheet 279C No Bid|
Pan Number for Brand Name Offered XHHW 2/0 STR BLK 100(
Net Pnce $1,084.700
29 {Deleted
30 Wire, copper, stranded, THHN-THWN, 4/0, 600 volt, black. MIFT
Brand Name of ltem Offered . No Bid AW Encore] Southwire (#00031 Southwire|
Part Number tor Brand Name Offered THHN 4/0 Not Given, THHN 4/0 STR BLK 100( 4/0 STR|
Net Price $1,513.00 $1,567.22 $1.304.3¢9 $1,645.00]
k3] Wire, copper, stranded, UF, 3/0, 600 voit, black. MIFT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid No Big No Bidf Southwire {(Sheet 279C No Bid
Part Number for Brand Name Offered XHHW 3/0 STR BLK 100
Net Price $1,340.74
32 Wire, copper, THHN, 250,000 MCM, black. M/FT
Brand Name of item Offered No Bid: Alw Encore] Southwire (#00031 Southwire]
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THHN 250 Not Given| THHN 250 STR 8LK 1004 250 STR
Net Price $1,804.00) $1,866.57| i} $1 ,550,5§ $1,959.00]
Prepared by Purchasing 6/268/2005 7 '



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:. Aprit 1, 2005
For Annuat Contract for Electncal Parts & Fixtures MSWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
American Light CED Dealers Elecincal Supply Graybar Sumaut Etectnic Supply
A391-06 MkR 10615 Sentinel Dr. 102 E. Josephine 2510 Bitters Rd. 1223 N. Hackberry 2401 Brockton Drive
Unit of San Antonio, San Antonia, s San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description M TX 78217 X 78215 ¢ TX 78063 TX 78202 TX 76217
33 Wire, copper, THHN, 350,000, MCM, black. M/FT !
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid| . { bews- AW Encore Southwire (#00031 Southwire!
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THHN 350, Not Give THHN 350 STR BLK 100 350 STR;
Net Price $2,515.00] $2,604.13 $2,140.31 $2,733.008
kKX Wire, copper, THHN, 500,000 MCM, black. M/FT
Brand Name of item Offered No Bid AW Encore| Southwire (#00031 Southwire]
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THHN 500 Not Givenf THHN 500 STR BLK 100( 500 STR
Net Price $3,558.00| $3,683.89 $3,066.01 $3,867.00(
a5 Wire, copper, solid, # 4, bare. M/FT
Brand Name of item Offered No Bid| No Bid Encore Southwirs No Bid|
Pant Number for Brand Name Offered Bare Solid ‘BARE CU SD 4 SOL 200
Net Price $390.72 $354.37]
36 Wire, copper, solid, # 6, bare. M/FT
Brand Name of item Offered No 8id| No Bid Not Given| Southwire| No Bid
Pan Number for Brand Name Offered Not Giver BARE CU SD 6 SOL 3154
Net Price $237.24 $173.86]
37 Wire, copper, solid, THW, # 4, black. M/FT
Brand Name of item Offered No Bid| No Bid No Bid| Southwirel No Bid
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THW 4 STR BLK 1004
Net Pnce $261.94
38 Wire, copper, solid, THW, # 6, black. M/FT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid| No Bid No Bid] Southwirel No Bid
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THW 6 STR BLK 1004
Net Price $232.26)
39 Rod, Ground 5/8" x 8', Blackbum EA
8rand Name of Item Offered No Bid Blackbum Erico Enitech| No Bid|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered CC6258 Not Given 615680
Net Price $7.50| $8.25] $7.
40 |Clamp, Ground Rod 5/8", Bumdy EA
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid Not Given| Enco Blackbui No Bid
Part Number for Brand Name Offered JABS8H Not Given GS|
Net Price $0.99 $1.17] $0.3
41 Hub, removable, 1/4*. EA
Brand Name of ltem Offered No Bid No Bid| Remek TNB No Bid|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered t1/4 H125T8
Net Pnce $2.87 $3.888
42 |Bellends, PVC, 4" EA
Brand Name of {tem Offered No Bid| Cantex Carlon Carlon PVC] Picoma
Part Number for Brand Name Offered Bellend - 41 Not Given| Bell End 4 4 PVC 8EL
Net Price $3.40] $4.15 $2.865) $4.45)
43  [Cap, PVC, 4" EA
Brand Name of ltem Offered No Bid| Cantex] Carlon| Cantex PVQ] Picomal|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered Cap - 41 Not Given| Cap 4| 4 PVC CAP
Net Price $8.62] $10.35) $9.77 $12.20
44 {Pedestal Electric Service EA
Brand Name of ltem Oftered No Bid| No Bid No Bid| EPI MilbanK No Bid
Parnt Number for Brand Name Offered B6660NIR
Net Price $104.00|
45 Connectror, Grounding, Bumdy 14-4T, PN KS20 EA
Brand Name of ltem Olfered No Bid| Blackbum| Bumdy| Panduit / Bumdy ILSCO|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered 4H Not Given| SBC 48-C/KS20y IK4!
Net Price $1.20 $1.38] $1.53/7%1.53 $1.60|
46 Connectror, Grounding, Burndy 14-1/0T, PN KS25DB EA
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid| Bumdy| Bumdy| Panduit / Bumdyf No Bid
Part Number for Brand Name Offered s KS25D! Not Given| SBC 1/0 L / KS2508
Net Price $2.7 $3.65] $3.36/ $5.29
47 Deleted
48  {Glue, PVC PT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid| Cantex{ Carlon| PVC Oatey] Rectorseal|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered Cement Pinv Pint 30346% PVC Clear PT|
Net Pnce $3.39 $2.80| $3.12 $4.99|
49 Lubncant, Wire Pulling Qr
Beand Namw of lteen Offored No Bid! aMm| PullyWater| Ideal Ideal
Part Number for Brand Name Offered Qrwul Quart| 31.358 31-358
Net Price $4.75| $3.75) $5.08, $6.54)
Prepared by Purchasing 6/28/2005 8




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: Apnl 1, 2005 -
For: Annual Contract for Electrical Parts & Fixtures MSWN MUWN MULWN MLWN MLWN
American Light CED Dealers Electrical Supply Graybar Summit Electnc Supply
A391-06 MKkR 10615 Sentinel Or. 102 E. Josephine 2510 Bitters Rd. 1223 N. Hackberry 2401 Brockton Drive
. Unitof  {San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
ftem Description Measure |TX 78217 TX 78215 TX 78063 TX 78202 X 78217
50 Lug, Ground, Blackbum EA
Brand Name of item Offered No Bid| Na Bid No Bi Blackburry No Bid!|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered JIR
Net Price s $1.3724
51 Cord, neoprene jacket, stranded copper, SJO, #16/3, 300 voit. M/FT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid, Coleman Coleman Southwire (line item # 00087 Trangle,
Part Number for Brand Name Offered 5JO 16-3 SJO 16-3 SJOOW 16-3 BLK 250 CTN 163SJ0]
Net Price $229.00, $202.35 $172.41 $229.00]
52 Cord, neoprene jacket, stranded copper, SJO, #14/3, 300 volt. M/FT
Brand Name of ltem Offered No Bid Coleman| Coteman Southwire (#00087 Triangle
Part Number for Brand Name Offered SJO 1473 SJO 14-3 SJOOW 14-3 BLK 250 CTN 143840
Net Pnce $350.00 $282.3 $265.20) $375.00
53 Deleted
54 |Wire, aluminum, tnplex, #6 FT
Brand Name of ltem Oftered No Bid Alcan Alcan| Southwirel No Bid|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered ACSR 6/3] Not Givery VOLUTA XLP 500° Coly
Net Price $0.59 $368.94 $0.425)
55  {Wue, aluminum, triplex, #2, FT
Brand Name of Item Offered No Bid Alcan Alcan| Southwirel No Bid
Part Number for Brand Name Offered ACSR 273 Not Giver CONCH XLP 500° Coil:
Net Price $0.95] $741.17| $0.712]
56 Wire, aluminum, tnplex, #1/0 FT
Brand Name of ltem Otfered No Bid T Alcan Alcan| Southwire{ No Bid
Part Nuinber for Brand Name Offered -%.—b« 1/0-3) Not Givery NERITINA XLP 500 Coil
Net Pnce 4 $1.79] $1,12941 $0.881
57 Fixture, fluorescent, 48" strip, 2 lamp, 120 volt, Lithonia C-240-120, or eqy EA
Brand Name of ltem Offered Lithonia Lithonia| Columbial Lithonia (#00047) / Lithonia (¥00047 Daybrite)
Part Number for Brand Name Offered C 232 120 GEB| C232 120GEH CS 4-240LE12(] C232 120GEB 101S / C240-120 £4 T240-120]
Net Price $24.79 $26.00| $19.30] $2672/519 64 $20.25]
58 |Fixture, fluorescent, 96 strip, 2 jamp, 120 volt, Lithonia C-240-120, or eay EA
Brand Name ot ltem Offered Lithonia Lithonial Cotumbiail Lithonia (¥00047 Daybuite]
Part Number for Brand Name Offered TC 232 120 1/4] TC-232-120 -GEH| CS 8-296LE12( C296-120€ 7296120
Net Pnce $38.77 $40.00 $32.70 $31.81) $33.00
59 Floodlight, 250W, high pressure sodium, wide beam, quad tap, ballast w EA
lamp, siplitter mounting, Hubbell MYK Series or equal.
Brand Name of item Offered Lithonia| Lithonia| Hubbell Lithonia Daybrite]
Part Number for Brand Name Offered TFL 250S RA2 TH TFL-250S-RA2-TH| MH5K-2505468 TFL 250S TATB LAP FTSY FLM2508MT-1SH
Net Price $133.00 $139.00] $176.00] $166.00 $245.00
60 Floodlight, 400W, high pressure sodium, wide beam, quad tap, ballast wi EA
lamp, stipfitter mounting, Hubbell MYK Series or equal
Brand Name of ltem Ottered Lithonial Lithonia; Hubbeli Lithonia Daybrite]
Part Number for Brand Name Offered TFL 400S RA TH TFL-400S-RA2-T| MH5K-40054681 TFL 400$ RA2 T8 LAP FTSY FLM400SMT-1SH
Net Price $136.50 $141.00) $178.40] $170.00| $249.00]
61 Deleted.
62 Fioodlight, 1000W, high pressure sodium, wide beam, quad tap, ballast EA
wi lamp, sfipfitter mounting, Hubbell MYK Series or equal.
Brand Name of item Offered Lithonia} Lithonia Hubbell| Lithonia, Daybrite]
Part Number tor Brand Name Offered TFL 1000S TA2 Tt TFL-1000S-TA-TH] MVL-1000S-168-WK TFA 10008 TATB LAP FTSY FLM1OXSMT-ISH
Net Price $267 8¢ $279.00, $301.13] $313.00] $369.00|
63 Floodiight, 250W, metal halide, wide beam, quad tap, baflast w/ famp, EA
shipfitter mounting, Hubbell MYK Series or equal.
Brand Name of ttem Otfered Lithonia| Lithonia Hubbell, Lithonia; Daybxite)
Pant Number for Brand Name Offered TFL 250M RA2 TH TFL-250M-RA2-TH) MHSK-250H-4681) TFL 250M RA2 TB LAP FISY FLM250MMT-1SH
Net Price $122.8 $127.50 $169.30 $154.00 $236.00)
64 Floodhight, 400W, metal halide, wide beam, quad tap, ballast w/ lamp, EA
shphitter mounting, Hubbell MYK Series or equal
Brand Name of item Offered Lithonial Lithonia| Hubbeli Lithonia Daybrite]
Part Number tor Brand Name Offered TFL 400M RA2 TH TFL-400M-RA2-TH MHSK-400H-4681) TFL 400M RA2 TB LALP FTSY FLM400MMT-ISH
Nel Price $120.19 $126.50] $180.65] $154.00] $238.00]
65 |Floodhght, 1000W, metal halide, wide beam, quad tap, ballast w/ tamp, EA
slipfitter mounting, Hubbell MYK Senes or equal.
Brand Name of ltem Offered Lithonig] Lithonia, Hubbell Lithonia| Daybrnite|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered TFM 1000M TA2 TH TFM-1000M-TA2-T MVK-1000H-264 TA 1000M TA TB LALP FTS! FLM10XMMT-ISH
Net Price $214.24 $222.50] $278.40] $254.00) $329.00]
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: Apnl 1, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Electrical Parts & Fixtures MSWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
Amerncan Ligtt CED Dealers Efectncal Supply Graybar Summit Elecinc Supply
A391-06 MkR 10615 Sentinel Dr, 102 E. Josephine 2510 Bitters Rd. 1223 N. Hackberry 2401 Brockton Drive
ltem Description Unit of San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
M. e (TX 78217 TX 78215 TX 78063 TX 78202 TX 78217 .
66 Fixture, standard gnd wroffer, 2' x 4', four lamp, 277 volt, style 2-GT, EA NAS
Lithonta 440-A12-277, or equal.
Brand Name of ttem Offered Lithonia Lithonia] Columbial Lithonia| Daybrite]
Part Number for Brand Name Offered 2GT8 432 A12 MV 1/4GEB101§ 2GT8-432-A12-MV (2 Ballast] J24-4406-FSA12-277\ 2GT8 432 A12 MVOLT GEB10IS (2 Baltast) 2TGA440-01-2771
Net Price $35.00 $41.75 $40.00) $50.40 $44.00
67 Fixture, standard grid troffer, 2* x 4', four tamp, 120 volt, style 2-GT, EA
Lithonia 440-A12-120, or equal.
Brand Name of ttem Offered Lithonia Lithonia Columbia Lithonia| Daybrite|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered 2GT8 432 A12 MV1 I4GEBIOI§ 2GT8-432-A12-MV (1 Ballast J24-4406-FSA12-120M  2GT8 432 A12 MVOLT 1/4 GEB1OIS (1 Battasy) 2TG440-01-120
Net Pnce $35.00] $36.95, $38.85 $38.10) $42.00,
68  [Fixture, surface low profile wraparound, 48°, four lamp, 120 volt, Style EA
L 8., Lithonia 440-A-120, or equal.
Brand Name of item Offered Lithonia Lithonia] Columbia Lithonia Daybite|
Part Number tor Brand Name Offered LB 432 MV GEB1Q LB-432-MVOLT| AWO4-440-LE12 L8432 MVOLT 1/4 GEB10IS (1 Ballast) SWW440-120;
Net Price . $57.30 $71.5 $49.82 $62.00] $79.00]
63 {Low & tugh bay hixtures wireflector, high pressure sodiuin, 250 watt. EA
Brand Name of ltem Otfered Lithonia / Lithoni Lithonia / LithonixA Hubbell / Hubbel Lithonia / Lithonix Daybrite|
Part Number for Brang Name Offered TXC 250S A15 7 THC 250S At TXC 250S A123T8 / THC 250S A1578 BL250S8WHB 1 / BL250SBWHLE TXC 2508 A23 TB / THC 2508 A15 TH EHL/EH02505MT]
Net Price $114.23 (H)/$8576 (L $118.00 (H)/ $89.00 (L $85.25 (H)/ $107.95 (L $124.39 (H) 7 $93.38 (L $136.00)
70 |Low & high bay fixtures wireflector, high pressure sodium, 400 walt. EA
Brand Name of ltlem Offered L Lithonia / Lithonig Lithonia / Lithonix Hubbell / Hubbell Lithonia / Lithoniy Daybrite)
Part Number for Brand Name Offered XC 4005 A23 TB/ THC 400S A15 Tl  TXC-4005-A23-TB / THC-400S-A15-Tg BL40OSBWHB1 / BL400SBWHLEB TXC 4008 A23 TB / THC 400$ A15 Td EHL/EHO40$M
Net Price $116.90 (H)/ $88.68 (L $122.00 (H)/ $92.50 (L $101.00 (H)/$141.00(L}. $128.61 (H)/ $97.56 (L $143.00;
7 Low & high bay fixtures w/reflector, high pressure sodium, 1000 watt. EA
Brand Name of tem Qtfered Lithonia) Lithonia Hubbell / Hubbel; Lithonia Daybrite]
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THP 1000S A22 TH THP 10008 A22 TH CH10S8MOU6G0 / CH10SBMEU6( THP 10008 A22 T§ HBO10XSMT]
Net Pnce $168.64 . $177.00] $181.80 (H)/ $204.54 (L $185.90] $242 00
72 Low & high bay fixtures wireflector, metat halide, 250 watt. EA .
Brand Name of tem Offered Lithonia / Lithonid Lxlt 1ua / Lithonial Hubbell / Hubbei Lithonia / Lithonia Daybrite]
Part Number tor Brand Name Offered TXC 250M A23 1 THS 250M A1 TXC-250M-A23-TB / THS-250M-A16Gl BL250HBWHB 1 / BL250HBWHLB TXC 250M A23 T8 / THS 250M A16GL T4 EHU/EHO250MM 1
Net Pnce $99.19 (H) / $96 06 (L $1l)4()lu!( SIS0 (L $67.00 (H) 7 $96 59 (L $109.10 (H)/ $105.66 (L $129 00f
73 Hygh bay ixtores whetiector, metal hatde, 400 wan EA
Brand Name of ltem Ottered Lithonia / Lithoni tithonia / Lithonizy Hubbetl / Hubbell Lithonia / Lithonia Daybrite
Part Number tor Brand Name Otfered TXC 400M A23 TB / THC 400M PA 1  TXC-400M-A23-TB / THC 400M A23-TH BLAOOHBWHB 1 / BL4OOHBWHLB TXC 400M A23 TB / THC 400MP A15 T§ EHL/RHO400MMT]
Net Price $97.90 (H) / $65.65 (L $102.50 (H)/ $72.00 (L $76.15 (H)/ $125.00 (L $107.77 (H)/$72.22 (L. $138.00]
74 [High bay hixtures wireflector metal halide, 1000 watt. EA 1
Brand Name of Item Otfered Lithonia| Lithonia Hubbel! / Hubbell Lithonia Daybrite|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered THP 1000M A22 TH THP-1000M-A22-TH CH10HBMOUG0 / CH10HBMEUG THP 1000M A22 Ti HBO10XMMT]
Net Price $122.67| $128 00 $159 00 (H) 7 $181 80 (L $134 9; $191.00]
75 Wall mount lummaire, high pressure sodum, multi-tap ballast, 35 watt, EA
Lahova of equal.
Brand Name of Item Offered Lithoniaf Lithonia No Bid Lithonia Daybrite
Part Number for Brand Name Offered TWS 355 120 L P4 Pd TWS 355 120 LP TWS$ 358 120 LP1 Pé WL1035$IN-LA]
Net Price 541.761 $43.75) $45.95) $104.00]
76 Wall mount luminaire, high pressure sodium, multi-lap ballast, 70 watt, EA
Lithonia or equai
8rand Name of Item Offered Lithoniaj Lithonia Hubbell| Lithonia Daybrite
Pant Number tor Brand Name Oftered TWS 70S 120 L.P P TWS-70S5-120 LPY PVLOT0S 12t TWS$ 708 120 LPI PH WLPOTOSMT-L
Net Pnce $41.74) $43.75 $119.32] $45.95 $161 oa
17 Wall mount luminaice, high pressure sodwm, imulti-tap baltast, 100 watt, €A
Lithonia or equal
Brand Name of Item Offered Lithoniaf Lithonial Hubbell Lithonia Daybrite]
Part Number for Brand Name Offered TWA 100S T8 ULHA TWA 100S TB| PVL100S 12 TWA 100$ T8 LALA WLP100SMT-LP|
Net Price $88.38 $92.25| $110.22] $97.22 $169.001
78  |wall mount luminaire, high pressure sodium, multi-tap ballast, 150 watt, EA
Lithonia or equal. ,
B8rand Name of tem Offered Lithonial Lithonia| Hubbeti Lithonia, Daybrite]
Pan Number for Brand Name Offered TWP 150S T8 LA TWP-150S-TB PVL150S128 TWP 1508 T8 L/L WLP150SMT-LP}
Net Price $98.28) $103.00 $102.25] $108.12 $169.00]
79 Wall mount luminaire, high pressure sodium, multi-tap ballast, 175 watt, EA
Lithonia or equat
Brand Name of em Offered Lithonia| Lithonia No Bid Lithonia| No 8id|
Part Number for Brand Name Offered TWP 175M 1B LA TWP-175M-TB TWP 175M T8 LLP|
Net Price $79.69 $83.25 $87.67
Psepared by Purchasing 6/28/2005 10




Opened

For:

A391-06

April 1, 2005

Annual Contract for Electricat Parts & Fixtures

MkR

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

MSWN

MLWN

MLWN

MLWN

MLWN

item

Description

Unit of

American Light
10615 Sentinel Dr.

San Antonio,

TX 78217

CED
102 E. Josephine

San Antonio,
TX 78215

Dealers Electrical Supply

2510 Bitters Rd

San Antonio,
TX 78063

Graybar
1223 N. Hackberry

San Antonio,
TX 78202

Summit Electric Supply
2401 Brockton Drive

San Antonio,
TX 78217

80

81

[}
~

AN aa® OV RWN AP

- ST SR NN ¢

*Q

84

85

86

87

Wall mount luminaire, high pressure sodium, multi-tap ballast, 250 watt,
Lithonia or equal.

Brand Name of item Offered

Part Number for Brand Name Offered

Net Pnce

Walt mount luminaire, high pressure sodium, multi-tap batlast, 400 watt,
Lithonia or equal.

Brand Name of Item Offered

Part Number for Brand Name Offered

Net Pnce

Lamps - incanaescent, riuorescent, Luanz, rign INtensity Lxscnarge ana
Energy Saving.

General Electric

Percent of discount offered

Product identification {Mfr.}

Type pnce scheduie (dealer, jobber, etc.)

Pnce schedule number

Date of price schedule (latest)

Pnce schedule column on which discount is based

(i e., distributor, net, wholesale)

Osram/Sylvania

Percent of discount offered

Product identification (Mfr.)

Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)

Pnce schedule number

Date of pnce schedule (latest)

Pnce schedule column on which discount is based

(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale)

Marathon

Percent of discount offered

Product identification (Mfr.)

Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)

Pnice scheduie number

Date of price schedule (latest)

Price schedule column on which discount is based

{1.e, distributor, net, wholesale)

Deleted

Twister BC-EL /7 Twist 20 EL / Twist- Bulb type, 75 watt, Decoralive
Shape, Marathon

Brand Name of ltem Offered

Part Number lor Brand Name Offered

Net Price

Twister BC-EL / Twist 23 EL / Twist- Bulb type, 90 walt, Decorative
Shape, Marathon

Brand Name of ltem Otfered

Part Number for Brand Name Offered

Net Price

Twister BC-EL / Twist 15 EL / Twist- Bulb type, 60 watt, Decorative
Shape, Marathon

Brand Name ot item OHered

Pan Number for Brand Name Offered

Net Price

Metal Halide, 400 watt, ANSI: M59, Osram/Sytvania (M400/U/ET18)
Brand Name of llem Oftfered

Part Number tor Brand Name Offered

Net Price

Metal Hatide, 250 walt, ANSE M59, Venture (M400W/Hor/T15)
Brand Namo of Hlem Oflerod

Part Number tor Brand Name Olfered

Net Price

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

€A

EA

Lithoniaf
TWH 250S T8 (AA
$114.1

Lithonia|
TWH 400S TB LLP|
$123.78]

70. 5"‘/:J
General Elect

Distributor,

9200-D|

August 30, 2004
Warehouse Delivery (DSC

No Bid

No Bid,

TCP|
1892
$3 68

TCP|
18923
$3.68

TCP
18915
$3.6!

CEW
MX400UET1B
$2526

Philips|
MH300T 15
$34.73

Lithonial
TWH 250S 18
$119°00)

Hubbell
SWP250SDBHT]

$123.86;

Lithoniaj
TWH 2508 T8 LALF]
$125.60

Lithonia]
TWH 4005 T§|
$129.5

Hubbel
SWP400SDBH
$123.8

Lithonia
TWH 400$ T8 LALF|
136.17

65%

GE Lamp]
Dists. 92000,
92000
2727103
Distributor]

No Bid

No Bio‘

72% (line item # 00089
GE
Trade]
U. S. Communutie
210
Trade|

Daybrite|
WLR250SMT-LF
$206.00}

Daytite}
WLRA00SMT-LPY
$209.00

No Bid

No Bid|

70%)
Philips}
Distributor]
PS100-O1
9/1/04
Stock

No Bid

30%

Sytvania

t.arge User Suggested Ne;
04-1-U8

9/1/04]

List|

GE tamp
Not Gwen|
$3 95

GE Lamp
Not Given|
$3.95

GE Lamp)|
Not Given|
+ $3.95

_6"140 Bid)

No Bid

Not Given
EL/MDT20]
$4.00

Not Given
ELMDT27
$4.20,

Not Given
EL/MDT15]
$3.79

No Bid

No Biy

No Bid|

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Syivaniaj
CF20€L/TwisY
$6.30

Syivania
CF23EUTwist
$6.30

Sytvanla)
CF23EL/ Twist
$6.30

No Bid

Sytvania)
MA00/ETIH
$21.0

No Bid

No Bid|
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 1, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Electncal Parts & Fixtures MSWN MLWN MLWN MLWN MLWN
American Light CED Dealers Electncal Supply Graybar Summit Electnic Supply
A391-06 MkR 10615 Sentinel Dr. 102 E. Josephine 2510 Bitters Rd. 1223 N. Hackberry 2401 Brockton Drive
i Descripti Unit of San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Anlonio, San Antonio,
em scription Measure |TX 78217 TX 76215 TX 78063 TX 78202 X 78217
88 Metal Halide, 250 wait, ANSI: M58, Venture (M250W/Hor/T15) EA
Brand Name of ltem Offered Venturs No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Part Number for Brand Name Offered MH250T1
Net Price 18.8
89  |Floor Box for Concrete Floors, 12.25" x 5.5" x 2 7/8", Hubbeil, HPW3SFBY EA
Brand Name of item Offered No 8id| No Bid No Bidi Hubbeill No Bid
Part Number for Brand Name Offered HPW3$FBS
Net Price $75.21
Delivery 1 Day| 3 - 5 Days| 2-10 Days 1 Day| 5 Days;
Terms Net 30 2%-10 2%-30 Net 30 Net 30

Prepared by Purchasing 6/28/2005

ad

12



