CITY OF SAN ANTONIO B
PURCHASING & GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT: " ;| |
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA MEMORANDUM
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TO: Mayor and City Council
FROM: Janie B. Cantu, Director of Purchasing & General Services
SUBJECT: Annual Contracts for Fiscal Year 2005-2006

DATE: January 26, 2006

SUMMARY & RECOMMENDATION

The attached tabulation of bids is hereby submitted for council consideration and action. Annually at this
time, bids are requested for various materials, parts and services. This ordinance includes contracts for
truck body accessory parts and service; motor fuel tankwagon loads; maintenance of the reverse 0SMOsis
system at the Botanical Center; and erosion control materials and accessories.

Many bids are on a firm, non-escalating basis, while others such as petroleum related items and certain
other commodities require escalation of prices during the contract period. Generally, bids reflect small
increases over recent prior years, but in many cases reflect decreases.

It is recommended these contracts be approved.

SECTION I: The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to the
lowest bidder. (3 contracts)

SECTION II:  The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to

bidders other than the lowest bidders because the lowest bids did not meet City
specifications. (2 contracts)

POLICY ANALYSIS

Annual contracts are an efficient method of securing the best prices through volume purchasing and by
reducing large amounts of work related to the bid process. This group of contracts represents a portion of
approximately 250 annual contracts that will be brought before City Council throughout the remainder of
the fiscal year.
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FINANCIAL IMPACT

Funds are not expended by this ordinance. All expenditures will be in accordance with the FY 2005-2006
budget approved by City Council. The combined total estimated amount for contracts listed on this
ordinance is approximately $192,501.

Qmé@ww

e/Cantu, C.P.M., Director
P asing & General Sefvices

Assistant City Manager/Chief Information Officer

Sheryl Scull ey v
City Manager




City of San Antonio Date 1-26-06
Contract Summary Sheet Agenda ltem:

Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda):

An ordinance accepting the bids of various companies to provide the City with various
types of commodities and services on an annual contract basis for fiscal year 2005-2006
for an estimated combined annual cost of $5,087,917.00 including: truck body accessory
parts and service; vaccines; motor fuel tankwagon loads; maintenance of the reverse
osmosis system at the Botanical Center; and erosion control materials and accessories.
[Presented by Janie B. Cantu, Director, Purchasing & General Services; Michael
Armstrong, Assistant City Manager/Chief Information Officer]

Description of Item(s) and Use:

This contract will provide the parts and service for the various brands of truck bodies, winches and hitches
still in use in the City’s fleet. Many of the brands in this contract have long useful lives and need to be
maintained in order to extend their uses.

Estimated Total $39,000 annually

Bid Number and Title A108-06-RA Truck Body Accessory Parts and Service

Contract Period Upon Award through 12-31-06 with three one year options to extend
Method of Procurement Competitively Bid

Price Trend 10% increase for parts. $5.00/hour decrease for labor.

Contract Info: __Formal _X Annual _ _Support/Maintenance __Lease

Contractor(s): | UTEC — West, 5860 Pfeil Rd., Schertz, Texas 78154

Previous Related Council Action(s):

Date:

Agenda ltem #:

Action:

Date

Agenda ltem

Action

Date:

Agenda ltem #:

Action:

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions:

Comments:

Previous contract was terminated by awarded vendor citing inability to perform at agreed pricing.

Using Fleet Operations
Department:




City of San Antonio Date 1-26-06
Contract Summary Sheet Agenda ltem:

Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda):

An ordinance accepting the bids of various companies to provide the City with various
types of commodities and services on an annual contract basis for fiscal year 2005-2006
for an estimated combined annual cost of $5,087,917.00 including: truck body accessory
parts and service; vaccines; motor fuel tankwagon loads; maintenance of the reverse
osmosis system at the Botanical Center; and erosion control materials and accessories.
[Presented by Janie B. Cantu, Director, Purchasing & General Services; Michael
Armstrong, Assistant City Manager/Chief Information Officer]

Description of Item(s) and Use:

This contract will provide unleaded fuel and diesel fuel in support of the tanks under 40,000 gallons for fueling
small equipment located at the golf courses.

Estimated Total $92,001 annually

Bid Number and Titie A332-06-DG Motor Fuel Tankwagon Loads

Contract Period Upon Award through 12-31-06 with one year option to extend
Method of Procurement Competitively Bid

Price Trend 139.4% Increase

Contract Info: __Formal _X Annual _ _Support/Maintenance __Lease

Contractor(s): | Royce Groff Qil Co., P O Box 639, Castroville, Texas 78009 — Entire Bid

Previous Related Council Action(s):

Date: 12-18-03

Agenda ltem#. |7

Action: | Ord No. 98618 accepting the bid from Royce Groff to provide motor fuel
tankwagons for a total of $39,181 annually

Date

Agenda ltem

Action

Date:

Agenda ltem #:

Action:

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions:

Comments:

Using Parks Department
Department:




City of San Antonio Date 1-26-06
Contract Summary Sheet Agenda ltem:

Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda):

An ordinance accepting the bids of various companies to provide the City with various
types of commodities and services on an annual contract basis for fiscal year 2005-2006
for an estimated combined annual cost of $5,087,917.00 including: truck body accessory
parts and service; vaccines; motor fuel tankwagon loads; maintenance of the reverse
osmosis system at the Botanical Center; and erosion control materials and accessories.
[Presented by Janie B. Cantu, Director, Purchasing & General Services; Michael
Armstrong, Assistant City Manager/Chief Information Officer]

Description of Iltem(s) and Use:

This contract will provide the Parks Department with bi-monthly service on (5) reverse osmosis systems used
to maintain humidity levels at the greenhouses.

Estimated Total $11,500 annually

Bid Number and Title A886-06-RA Maintenance of Reverse Osmosis System at Botanical Center
Contract Period Upon Award through 3-31-07 with three one year options to extend

Method of Procurement Competitively Bid

Price Trend Decrease. Savings of 11.2%

Contract Info: __Formal _X Annual _ _Support/Maintenance __Lease

Contractor(s): | Purity Water Company, 1119 Paulson, San Antonio, Texas 78219 — Entire Bid

Previous Related Council Action(s):

Date:

Agenda ltem #:

Action:

Date

Agenda ltem

Action

Date:

Agenda ltem #:

Action:

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions:

Comments:

Using Parks Department
Department:




City of San Antonio Date 1-26-06
Contract Summary Sheet Agenda Item:

Name/Title (Caption as shown on agenda):

An ordinance accepting the bids of various companies to provide the City with various
types of commodities and services on an annual contract basis for fiscal year 2005-2006
for an estimated combined annual cost of $5,087,917.00 including: truck body accessory
parts and service; vaccines; motor fuel tankwagon loads; maintenance of the reverse
osmosis system at the Botanical Center; and erosion control materials and accessories.
[Presented by Janie B. Cantu, Director, Purchasing & General Services, Michael
Armstrong, Assistant City Manager/Chief Information Officer]

Description of Item(s) and Use:

This contract will provide the City of San Antonio Public Works Department with erosion control materials and
accessories for various drainage projects planned and managed by Storm Water.

Estimated Total $50,000 annually

Bid Number and Title A924-06-RA Erosion Control Materiais and Accessories

Contract Period Upon Award through 3-31-07 with two one year options to extend
Method of Procurement Competitively Bid

Price Trend This is the first time this contract has been out with this many items.
Contract info: __Formal _X Annual _ _Support/Maintenance __Lease

Contractor(s): | Lone Star Products, 4101 South Industrial Dr., Ste. 100, Austin, TX 78744
United Equipment Rentals Gulf, LP, 12017 North Loop Rd., San Antonio, TX 78216

Previous Related Council Action(s):

Date:

Agenda item #:

Action:

Date

Agenda ltem

Action

Date:

Agenda ltem #:

Action:

Anticipated Future Requirements and Actions:

Comments:

Using Public Works Department
Department:




SECTION I
COUNCIL, JANUARY 26, 2006
LOW BIDS
SECTION I LOW BIDS

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to the lowest bidder.

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR
1. Truck Body Accessory Parts & Service MBE UTEC — West
A108-06-RA Entire Bid
Upon Award through 12-31-06 Est Amount $39,000 annually

With three one year options to extend

This contract will provide the Fleet
Maintenance and Operations Division with
replacement parts and service for vehicle
bodies for specialized trucks utilized by
Public Works Streets Division.

2.  Motor Fuel Tankwagon Loads Royce Groff Oil Co.
A332-06-DG Entire Bid
Upon Award through 12-31-06 Est Amount $92,001 annually

With one year option to extend

This contract will provide the City of San
Antonio Parks & Recreation Department
with unleaded and diesel fuel for fueling
small equipment located at the golf courses.

3. Maintenance of the Reverse Osmosis System WBE  Purity Water Company
at the Botanical Center Entire Bid
A886-06-RA Est Amount $11,500 annually
Upon Award through 3-31-07
With three one year options to extend

This contract will provide the City of San
Antonio Parks Department Botanical
Gardens with reverse osmosis systems used
to maintain the humidity levels at the various
theme greenhouses.




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 13, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Truck Body Accessory Parts & Service MSSN MLWN MSSY
UTEC-West Reliance Truck & Equipment |TVIB
Ltd.
5860 Pfeil Road 7200 South W. W. White P. O. Box 65086
A108-06-RA MkR Road
Item Description Schertz, San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX. 78154 TX. 78222 TX. 78265
1 HEIL TRUCK BODY PARTS INCOMPLETE
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20%) Costs + 20% 10%
Product identification {Mfr.) Heil Heil NBC Truck Equipment
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) tnvoice Cost, Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at invoice Date| N/A 9/1/05
2 RKI PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20%) Cost+20% 10%
Product identification (Mfr.) RKI Rawson-Koenig CCT
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor Dealer
Date of price scheduls Current at Invoice Date N/A 06/15/06
3 CADET PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20%! Cost+20% 10%
Product identification (Mfr.) Cadet Cadet Cadet
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,stc..) Invoice Cost| Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at invoice Date| N/A 06/01/05
4 STAHL PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% 10%
Product identification {Mfr.) Stahl Stahl CcCT
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cosf| Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date| N/A 05/01/05
5 KNAPHEID PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20%, Cost+20% Not Given
Product identification (Mfr.) Knapheid|| Knapheid Knapheid
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date| N/A 06/01/05
6 GALION PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20%, Cost+20% 10%
Product identification (Mfr.) Galion Galion Galion
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost| Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date| N/A 06/01/05
7 HARSH PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% Not Given
Product identification (Mfr.) Harsh Harsh NBC
Type price schedute {dealer, jobber,etc..) invoice Cost Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date| N/A 05/01/05
8 AMA PARTS
Percent of discount -offered Costs + 20%, Cost+20% Not Given
Product identification (Mfr.) Market Availability or Equal| AMA NBC
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at invoice Date N/A 05/01/05
9 BEDELL TRUCK BODY PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20%, Cost+20% 15%
Product identification {Mfr.) Market Availability or Equal Bedell CCT
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at invoice Date| N/A 05/01/05
10 DAVIS WATER TRUCK PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% No Bid
Product identification (MFfr.) Market Availabitity or Equal| Davis
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date N/A
1 TRUCK ENGINEERING (PERFECTION) PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% Net
Product identification (Mfr.) Truck Engineering| Perfection Dealers
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date N/A 05/01/05
12 DRAW-TITE HITCH PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20%, Cost+20% 20%
Product identification (Mfr.) Draw-Tilej Draw-Tite Hidden Hitch
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost, Distributor Jobber
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date N/A 06/01/05
13 HOLLAND HITCH PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% 20%
Product identification {Mfr.) Holland Holland Hidden Hitch
Type price schedule {dealer, jobber,etc..) invoice Cost| Distributor Jobber
Date of price scheduie Current at Invoice Date N/A 06/01/05
14 REESE HITCH PARTS
"{Percent of discount offered Costs + 20%) Cost+20% 20%
Product identification (Mfr.) Reese| Reese Hidden Hitch
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,elc..) Invoice Cost| Distributor Jobber
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Datel N/A 06/01/05
Prepared by1’urchasing 1/6/2006 Page 1




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:  September 13, 2005

For: Annual Contract for Truck Body Accessory Paris & Service

MSSN MLWN MSSY
UTEC-West Reliance Truck & Equipment [TVIB
Ltd.
5860 Pfeil Road 7200 South W. W. White P. O. Box 65086
A108-06-RA MkR Road
Item Description Schertz, San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX. 78154 TX. 78222 TX. 78265
15 TULSA WINCH PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% No Bid
Product identification (Mfr.) Tulsa| Tulsa
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost| Distributor
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date| N/A
16 BRADEN WINCH PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% Cost+20%
Product identification (Mfr.) Braden Braden Braden
Type price schedule (dealer, jobberetc..) invoice Cost Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedute Current at Invoice Date| N/A 5/1/05
17 RAMSEY WINCH PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% 10%
Product identification (Mfr.) Ramsey| Ramsey Ramsey
Type price schedule {(dealer, jobber,etc..} Invoice Cost| Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at invoice Date| N/A 02/01/05
18 MUNCIE TRACTOR WET KIT PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% Net
Product identification (Mfr.} Muncie| Muncie Muncie
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber.etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor Deater
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date| N/A 05/01/05
19 TRACTOR WET KIT PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% Net
Product identification (Mfr.) Market Availability or Equall Tractor (Misc.) Muncie
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber.etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedules Current at Invoice Date N/A 05/01/05
20 SILENT DRIVE LIFT TYPE SUSPENSION PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% Net
Product identification (Mfr.) Silent Drive Silent Drive Silent Drive
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date| N/A 05/01/05
21 NEWAY LIFT TYPE SUSPENSION PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% No Bid
Product identification (Mfr.) Neway) Neway
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date| N/A
22 MABAR PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% No Bid
Product identification (Mfr.) Mabar Mabar
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) invoice Cost Distributor
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date| N/A
23 TEC 2000 WATER TRUCK PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% No Bid
Product identification (Mfr.) Market Availability or Equal| TEC 2000
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost| Distributor
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date N/A
24 DU-TEC FLAT BODY PARTS
Percent of discount offered Costs + 20% Cost+20% 10%
Product identification (Mfr.) Du-Tec Du-Tec Du-Tec
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber,etc..) Invoice Cost Distributor Dealer
Date of price schedule Current at Invoice Date| N/A 05/01/05
25 LABOR AND SERVICE
Labor rate for service $45.00) $55.00 $45.00
Mileage charge {if applicable) $1.25 No Charge $1.20
Deliveries for normal wear and specified items 1 Day 1 Day 1 Day
Deliveries for other than normal wear and specified items 6 Days| 1 -5 Days 5 Days
Parts available for pick up 5 Days| 1-5 Days 5 Days
Terms Net 30 Net 30 2% - 10 Days

Prepare(ﬁ)y Purchasing 1/6/2006
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 16, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Motor Fue! Tankwagon Loads MLWN
Royce Groff Qil Co.
A332-06 DG P.O. Box 639
Item Description Estimated Castroville,
Gallons TX 78009
1 Regular Unleaded 32,000
Upcharge per Gallon $0.1000
OPIS Average for 12-19-05 $2.12450,
Effective Price for 12-19-05 $2.22450
Brand Names Exxon, Fiint Hills, Valero
Citgo
2 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel 9,000
N Discount/Upcharge per Gallon $0.1500
OPIS Average for 12-19-05 2.12450
Delivery/Tax Differential 0.0385
Effective Price for 12-19-05 $2.3130
Brand Names Valero
3 Transportation Charge
Price per mile None
Terms Net 30}
Total $92,001.00]

Prepared by Purchasing 1/4/2006 Page 1




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2005 FSWN MSWN
For: Annual Contract for Maintenance of the Reverse
Osmosis System at the Botanical Center
Purity Water Company Muelier Water Conditioning, inc.
AB886-06-RA MkR (1119 Paulson 12139 Jones Maltsberger
Item Description San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78219 TX 78247
Monthly Service for All Five (5) Units $476.41 $595.00
Terms Net 30 Net 30

Page 1

Prepared by Purchasing 1/5/2006




SECTION II
COUNCIL, JANUARY 26, 2006
LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS

SECTIONII: LOW RESPONSIVE BIDS

The bids in this section are low responsive bids in which award is recommended to bidders other than the
lowest bidders because the lowest bids did not meet City specifications

COMMODITY MBE VENDOR
1. Erosion Control Materials and Accessories Lone Star Products, Inc.
A924-06-RA Items 1,2,6~19
Upon Award through 3-31-07 Est Amount $40,000 annually

With two one year options to extend
United Equipment Rentals Gulf, LP

This contract will provide the City of San Items 3,4, 5
Antonio Public Works Department Storm Est Amount $10,000 annually
Water Division with erosion control

materials and accessories for various
drainage projects planned and managed by
Storm Water.




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 2005
For, Annual Contract for Erosion Conlrol Materials and Accessories Lone Star Products, Inc. United Equipment Rentals
Guif, L. P.
4101 South Industrial Dr., Suile 100 12017 North L.oop Road
A924-06-RA MkR
Item D inti Auslin, San Anionio,
escription TX 78744 TX 78216
1 Type 1A Ultra Shorl-Term Erosion Control Blanket - (< 60 days)
Name of Manufacturer North American Green Carthage Mills
item Number DS-75 Landlok S1-RD
Price per Roll $29.60 $44.00
Price per square yard $0.37 $0.44
Square yards per roll 80 100
2 Type 1A Short-Term Erosion Control Blanket - (up to 12 months)
Name of Manufacturer North American Green Carthage Mills
Item Number S-75 Landiok S1
Price per Rolt $29.60 $38.00
Price per square yard $0.37 $0.38
Square yards per roll 80 100
3 Type 2A Extended-Term Erosion Control Blanket - (> 12 months and < 24 months)
Name of Manufacturer North American Greenjt . Carthage Milis
Item Number SC-150 Landiok CS2
Price per Roll $62.40 $62.00
Price per square yard $0.78 $0.62
Square yards per roll 80 100
4 Type 3A Extended-Term Erosion Contro! Blanket - (> 24 months and < 36 months)
Name of Manufacturer North American Green Carthage Mills|
Item Number C-125 Landiok C2
Price per Rolt $79.20 $76.00
Price per square yard $0.99 $0.76
Square yards per roll 80 100
5 Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs)
5A.  |Type 1B Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs) NAS
Name of Manufacturer North American Green| Carthage Mills|
ltem Number SC-250 Landiok 435
Price per Roll $91.60 $354.00
Price per square yard $2.29 $3.54
Square yards per roll 40 100
5B. |Type 2B Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats (TRMs) NAS
Name of Manufacturer North American Green Carthage Milis|
tem Number SC-250 Landlok 450
Price per Roll $91.60 $389.00
Price per square yard $2.29 $3.89
Square yards per roll 40 100
5C. |Deleled
6 Accessories Needed for Installation of Temporary Erosion Control
Blankels and Permanent Turf Reinforcement Mats
6.A.1. {Wire Staple - Bulk _
Name of Manufacturer North American Green Carthage Milis
ltlem Number 6111 Carthage Mills
Price per 500 $10.560 No Bid
Price per 1,000 $19.99 $38.00
6.A.2 {Wire Staple - Cartridges )
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
ltem Number 6111CS
Price per 100 $22.65
Price per 500 $41.26
Peanarerd Pﬂ/ Purchasinn 11612006 Page 1




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 2005

For: Annual Conlract for Erosion Control Materials and Accessories Lone Slar Products, Inc. United Equipmenl Rentais
Gulf, L. P.
4101 South Industrial Dr., Suite 100 {12017 North Loop Road
A924-06-RA MkR
Jtem Description Austin, San Antonio,
TX 78744 X 78216

6.B.1. |Biodegradable Stakes - 4 inch
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
Item Number / Name Bio-Stake
Price per Bundle $51.60
Number of Stakes per Bundle 560,

6.B.2 |Biodegradable Stakes - 6 inch
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
ltem Number / Name Bio-Stake
Price per Bundie $57.85
Number of Stakes per Bundie 576

6.C.1 [Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes - 6 inch
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
ltem Number / Name Eco-Stake
Price per Bundle $87.50,
Number of Stakes per Bundle 1,000

6.C.2 |Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes - 12 inch
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
ltem Number / Name Eco-Stake
Price per Bundle $87.50
Number of Stakes per Bundie 500

6.C.3 [Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes, Tapered - 18 inch
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
liem Number / Name Eco-Stake
Price per Bundle $110.00
Number of Stakes per Bundle 500

6.C.4 |Biodegradable Hardwood Stakes, Tapered - 24 inch
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
Item Number / Name Eco-Stake
Price per Bundie $200.00
Number of Stakes per Bundie 1,000

6.0.1 |Cartridge Staple Guns - Pneumatic
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
ltem Number / Name F300PS
Price per Each $1,416.65

6.D.2 {Cartridge Staple Guns - Manua!
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
Item Number / Name F300S
Price per Each $875.42

6.E.1 |Cartridge Stake Guns - Pneumatic
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
item Number / Name F300PB
Price per Each $1,416.65

6.£.2 |Cartridge Stake Guns - Manual
Name of Manufacturer North American Green No Bid
ltem Number / Name F300B8
Price per Each $875.42

7 Temporay Sediment Control Fence w/ Stakes - 36" x 100’
Name of Manufacturer Lone Star Products No Bid
flem Number / Name 14ga Pre-Fab w/ 4' Posts
Price per Roll $42.00
8 Biodegradeable Sediment Filtration System

Name of Manufacturer Norih American Green No Bid

ltem Number / Name
Price per Roll

Price per square yard
Square yards per roll

Sediment Siop 6.67' x 50°

$54.47
$1.47

37.05

Dranarad Hb Durchacinn 1/5/200R
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Erosion Conlrol Materials and Accessories Lone Star Products, Inc. United Equipment Rentals
Guif, L. P.
4101 South industrial Dr., Suite 100 12017 North LLoop Road
A924-06-RA MkR
. Austin, San Antonio,
ftem Description TX 78744 TX 78216
9 Gabion, Galvanized {(Woven Wire Mesh)
9.A. |6 length x 3’ width x 3" height x 2 cells
Name of Manufaciurer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G6x3x3|
Price per Each $45.00
9.B. |9 length x 3' width x 3' height x 3 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name G9I9x3x3J|
Price per Each $63.75
9.C. {12 length x 3' width x 3' height x 4 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name G12x3x3|
Price per Each $75.00!
9.D. [6'length x 3' width x 1.5" height x 2 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name G6x3x1.5
Price per Each $30.00
9.E. [9'length x 3' width x 1.5' height x 3 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G9x3x1.56
Price per Each $43.75
9.F. |12'iength x 3' width x 1.5' height x 4 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name G12x3x1.5
Price per Each $52.50
9.G. |6'iength x 3' width x 1" height x 2 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G6x3x1
Price per Each $28.75
9.H. |9 length x 3' width x 1" height x 3 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G9x3x1
Price per Each $41.25
9.l. 112 length x 3'width x 1" height x 4 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G12x3x1
Price per Each $45.00
10 |Gabion, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh - PVC-Coated)
10.A. |6'length x 3' width x 3' height x 2 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name P6x3x3
Price per Each $50.50
10.B. {9 length x 3' width x 3' height x 3 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P9x3x3
Price per Each $72.60
10.C. |12 length x 3' width x 3' height x 4 cells ‘
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P12x3x3
Price per Each $87.00

Prenaredibv Purchasina 1/5/2006
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Erosion Conlrol Materials and Accessories Lone Star Products, inc. United Equipment Rentals
: Gulf, L. P.
4101 South Industrial Dr., Suite 100 [12017 North Loop Road
A924-06-RA MkR
ltem Descrintion Austin, San Anlonio,
P TX 78744 TX 78216
10.0. |6'length x 3' width x 1.5' heighl x 2 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name PB6x3x1.5
Price per Each $36.00
10.E. |9 fength x 3' width % 1.5 height x 3 cells
Name of Manufaclurer Maccaferri Mo Bid
ltem Number / Name PO9x3x1.5
Price per Each . $47.00
10.F. |12 length x 3' width x 1.5" height x 4 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P12x3x1.5
Price per Each $63.00
10.G. |6'length x 3' width x 1" height x 2 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name PBx3x1
Price per Each $31.75
10.H. |9'1ength x 3' width x 1" height x 3 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P9x3x1
i Price per Each $44.70
| 10.1.  |12'length x 3' width x 1" height x 4 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P12x3x1
Price per Each $56.00
1 Reno Mattress, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh)
11.A. {9 length x ©' width x 6" height x 3 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
tem Number / Name G9x6x6"
Price per Each $47.50
11.B. |12'length x &' width x 6" height x 4 celis
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name G12x6x86"
Price per Each $78.75
11.C. |9'length x 6' width x 9" height x 3 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
llem Number / Name G9x6x9"
Price per Each $54.00,
11.D. |12 length x 6' width x 9" height x 4 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G12x6x9"
Price per Each $70.45 |
|
11.E. [12'length x 6' width x 12" height x 3 cells ) }
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid |
ltem Number / Name G12x6x12" |
Price per Each $72.00 |
11.F. |12'length x &' width x 9" height x 4 cells .
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name G12x6x12"
Price per Each $73.75
11.G. |15'length x 3' width x 6" height x 5 cells )
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name G15x3x6"
Price per Each $40.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 2005

For: Annual Contracl for Erosion Contro! Materials and Accessories Lone Star Products, inc. United Equipment Rentals
Guif, L. P.
4101 South industrial Dr., Suite 100 [12017 North Loop Road
A924-06-RA MKR
tem Description Auslin, San Antonio,
p TX 78744 TX 78216

11.H. |15 tength x 3' width x 9" height x 5 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G15x3x9"
Price per Each $43.35

11.1. |15'fength x 3' width x 12" height x 5 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G156x3x12"
Price per Each $47.00

11.J. [15'length x 6' width x 6" height x & celis
Name of Manufaclurer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G15x6x6"
Price per Each $80.00

11.K. [15'length x 6' width x 9" height x 5 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G15x6x8"
Price per Each $86.85

11.L. |15'length x 6' width x 12" height x 5 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G15x6x12"
Price per Each $91.35

11.M. {18'length x 3' widlh x 6" height x 6 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name G18x3x6"
Price per Each $48.00

11.N. |18'length x 3' width x 9" height x 6 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G18x3x9"
Price per Each $52.00]

11.0. |18'iength x 3' width x 12" height x 6 ceills
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
llem Number / Name G18x3x12"
Price per Each $54.70

11.P. {18 length x 6' width x 6" height x 6 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name G18x6x%6"
Price per Each $96.00

11.Q. |18 length x 6' width x 9" height x 6 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G18x6x9"
Price per Each $104.00

11.R. |18 length x B' width x 12" height x 6 cells .
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name G18x6x12"
Price per Each $110.00

11.8. |21 length x 3' width x 6" height x 7 cells '
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
llem Number / Name G21x3x6"
Price per Each $56.00

11.T. |21'length x 3' width x 9" height x 7 cells . '
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G21x3x9"
Price per Each $60.75

Prenarerd by Reirchasing 1/5/2006
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- City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened; November 28, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Erosion Control Materials and Accessories Lone Star Products, Inc. United Equipment Rentals
Gulf, L. P.
4101 South Industrial Dr., Suite 100  |12017 North Loop Road
A924-06-RA MkR
ftem Description Austin, San Antonio,
p TX 76744 TX 78216
11.U. j21'length x 3' width x 12" height x 7 celis
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
{tem Number / Name G21x6x12"
Price per Each $112.00
11.V. |21'length x 6' width x 6" height x 7 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G21x6x6"
Price per Each $121.40
11.W. [21'lenglh x 6' width x 9" height x 7 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G21x6x9"
Price per Each : $128.50
11.X. {21'length x &' width x 12" height x 7 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G21x6x12",
Price per Each $64.00
11.Y. [24'length x 3' width x 6" height x 8 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
j Iltem Number / Name G24x3x6"
| Price per Each $64.00
11.Z. |24' length x 3' width x 9" height x 8 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name G24x3x9"
Price per Each $69.50
11.AA. [24'length x 3' width x 12" height x 8 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G24x3x12"
Price per Each $73.42
11.AB. [24'length x &' width x 6" height x 8 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccalferri No Bid
Item Number / Name G24x6x6"
Price per Each $128.00
11.AC. |24'length x 6 width x 9" height x 8 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G24x6x9"
Price per Each $138.70
11.AD. 124'length x 6' width x 12" height x 8 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name G24x6x12"
Price per Each $147.35
11.AE. [27' length x 3' width x 6" height x 9 cells )
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
llem Number / Name G27x3x6"
Price per Each $72.00
11.AF. |27 lenglh x 3' width x 9" height x 9 cells . '
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G27x3x9"
Price per Each $78.00
11.AG. |27 fength x 3’ width x 12" heighl x 8 cells ) '
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G27x3x12"
Price per Each $82.70
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 2005
For: Annuat Contract for Erasion Control Materials and Accessories Lone Star Products, Inc. United Equipment Rentals
Gulf, L. P.
4101 South Industrial Dr., Suite 100 {12017 North Loop Road
A924-06-RA MkR
Item Description Austin, San Antonio,
P TX 78744 TX 78216
11.AH. |27 length x 6' widlh x 6" height x 9 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G27x6x6"
Price per Each $144.00
11.Al. |27' length x 6' width x 9" height x 9 celis
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name G27x6x9"
Price per Each $156.00
11.AJ. |27'length x 6' width x 12" height x 9 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G27x6x12"
Price per Each $166.00
11.AK. |30’ length x 3' width x 6" height x 10 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name G30x3x6"
Price per Each $80.00
11.AL. 130" iength x 3' width x 9" height x 10 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
liem Number / Name G30x3x9"
Price per Each $87.00
11.AM. |30' length x 3' width x 12" height x 10 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
tem Number / Name G30x3x12"
Price per Each $92.00]
11.AN. |30' length x 6' width x 6" height x 10 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name G30x6x6"
Price per Each $160.00
11.A0. [30 length x 6’ width x 9" height x 10 celis
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name G30x6x9"
Price per Each $173.50
11.AP. |30' length x 6' width x 12" height x 10 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name G30x6x12"
Price per Each $185.00
12 |Reno Matiress, Galvanized (Woven Wire Mesh - PVC Coated)
12.A. |9'length x &' width x 6" height x 3 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P9x6x6"
Price per Each $75.00
12.B. |12'length x 6' width x 6" heighl x 4 cells .
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
item Number / Name P12x6x6"
Price per Each $90.50
12.C. 19'length x 6 width x 9" height x 3 cells . ‘
Name of Manufacturer Maccalerri No Bid
Item Number / Name POx6x9"
Price per Each $83.50
12.D. {12'length x &' width x 9" heighl x 4 cells ) .
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name P12x6x9"
Price per Each $104.70
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 2005

For: Annual Contract for Erosion Control Materials and Accessories Lone Star Products, Inc. United Equipment Rentals
Gulf, L. P.
4101 Soulh Industrial Dr., Suite 100 |12017 North Loop Road
A924-06-RA MKR
ltem Descrintion Auslin, San Antonio,
' TX 78744 TX 78216

12.E. 19" lenglh x €' width x 12" height x 3 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
liem Number / Name P9x6x12"
Price per Each $91.00

12.F. 112" length x 6' width x 12" height x 4 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
item Number / Name P12x6x12"
Price per Each $73.75

12.G. |15 fength x 3' width x 6" height x 5 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaierri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P15x3x6"
Price per Each $50.00

12.H. |15'length x 3' width x 9" height x 5 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P15x3x9"
Price per Each $54.70

12.1. |15 length x 3' width x 12" height x 5 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P15x3x12"
Price per Each $68.95

12.J. |15'length x 6' width x 6" height x 5 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P15x6x6"
Price per Each $100.00

12.K. 115" length x 6' width x 9" height x 5 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P15x6x9"
Price per Each $108.75

12.L. |15' length x 6’ width x 12" height x 5 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P15x6x12"
Price per Each $114.20

12.M. [18 length x 3' width x 6" height x 6 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P18x3x6"
Price per Each $60.00

12.N. 118 length x 3' width x 9" height x 6 cells
Name of Manufaclurer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P18x3x9"
Price per Each $65.40

12.0. [18'length x 3' width x 12" height x 6 cells .
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P18x3x12"
Price per Each $69.00

12.P. {18 iength x &' width x 6" height x 6 celis . .
Name of Manufaclurer Maccaferri No Bid
item Number / Name P18x6x6"
Price per Each $120.00

12:Q. |18'length x 6' width x 9" height x 6 celis | )
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P18x6x9"
Price per Each $130.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 2005
For: Annual Contract for Erosion Control Malerials and Accessories Lone Star Products, Inc. United Equipment Renlals
Gulf, L. P.
4101 South Industrial Dr., Suite 100 [12017 North Loop Road
A924-06-RA MkR
ltem Description Austin, San Antonio,
P TX 78744 TX 78216
12.R. {18 lenglh x 6' width x 12" height x 6 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
llem Number / Name P18x6x12"
Price per Each $138.00
12.8. [21'length x 3' width x 6" height x 7 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P21x3x6"
Price per Each $70.00
12.7. |21' length x 3' width x 9" height x 7 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltern Number / Name P21x3%x9"
Price per Each $76.00]
12.U. |27 length x 3" width x 12" height x 7 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Itern Number / Name P21x6x12"
Price per Each $80.00
12.V. |21 ienglh x 6' widlh x 6" height x 7 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P21x6x6"
Price per Each $140.00
12.W. [21'length x 6' width x 9" height x 7 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name ’ P21x6x9"
Price per Each $152.00
12.X. |21' length x 6" width x 12" height x 7 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P21x6x12"
Price per Each ’ $290.00
12.Y. [24'length x 3' width x 6" height x 8 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name . P24x3x6"
| Price per Each $80.00
§ 12.Z. |24’ length x 3' width x 9" height x 8 cells
| Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
| Item Number / Name P24x3x9"
Price per Each $86.70
12.AA. [24' lengih x 3' width x 12" heighl x 8 celis
Name of Manufacturer Maccaterri No Bid
item Number / Name P24x3x12"
Price per Each $92.00
12.AB. |24' length x 6' widlh x 6" height x 8 celis
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Jterm Number / Name . P24x6x6"
Price per Each $160.00
12.AC. |24' length x &' width x 9" height x 8 cells .
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri , No Bid
ltem Number / Name P24x6x9"
Price per Each $174.00
12.AD. |24'length x 6' width x 12" height x 8 cells ' .
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P24x6x12"
Price per Each $184.60}
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 20056

For: Annual Contract for Erosion Conlrol Materials and Accessories Lone Star Products, inc. United Equipment Rentals
Gulf, L. P.
A924-06-RA MKR 4101 South Industiial Dr., Suite 100 {12017 North Loop Road
- Austin San Antonio
it ' '
em Description TX 78744 TX 78216
12.AE. |27 length x 3' width x 6" height x 9 cells
Name of Manufaclurer Maccaferri No Bid
llem Number / Name P27x3x6"
Price per Each $90.00,
12.AF. |27 length x 3' width x 9" height x 9 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P27x3x9"
Price per Each $98.00
12.AG. (27 fength x 3' width x 12" height x 9 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P27x3x12",
Price per Each $103.40
12.AH. [27'iength x 6' width x 6" height x 9 celis
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ftem Number / Name P27x6x6"
Price per Each $180.00
12.Al. |27 length x 6' width x 9" height x 9 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name P27x6x9"
Price per Each $195.35
12.AJ. |27 tength x 6' width x 12" height x 9 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name P27x6x12"
Price per Each $208.00
12.AK. |30' length x 3' width x 6" height x 10 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Iltem Number / Name P30x3x6"
Price per Each $100.00
12.AL. |30 length x 3' width x 9" height x 10 celis
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P30x3x9"
Price per Each $108.75
12.AM. |30 length x 3' width x 12" height x 10 cells
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Item Number / Name P30x3x12"
Price per Each $115.35
12.AN. 130' iength x 6' width x 6" height x 10 cells
Name of Manufaciurer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name P30x6x6"
Price per Each $200.00
12.A0. |30 length x €' width x 9" height x 10 cells .
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
Hem Number / Name P30x6x9"
Price per Each $216.85
12.AP. |30'length x &' width x 12" height x 10 cells ' .
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
llem Number / Name P30x6x12"
Price per Each $231.50
13 [Rock Filter Dams
13.A. |20 ga Galvanized Wire - 6' x 150" rolls (for use with Types 1, 2, & 3) _
Name of Manufacturer Deacero No Bid
item Number / Name 20ga Berm Wire
Price per Roft $68.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 20056

For: Annual Contracl for Erosion Control Materials and Accessories Lone Star Products, Inc. United Equipment Rentals
Guif, L. P.
4101 South Industrial Dr., Suite 100 {12017 North Loop Road
A924-06-RA MkR
ltem Austin, San Antlonio,
TX 78744 TX 78216

13.B. |Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 2' width x 3' length
Name of Manufacturer Maccalerri No Bid
tem Number / Name Sack 2x 3
Price per Roll $16.00

13.C. |Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 2' width x 6' iength
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
{tem Number / Name Sack 2 x 6
Price per Roll $30.00

13.D. |Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 2’ width x 9' length
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name Sack 2x9
Price per Roll $37.50

13.E. |Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 3' width x 3' length
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name Sack 3 x 3
Price per Roll $24.75

13.F. |Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinforced) - 3’ width x 6' length
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
liem Number / Name Sack 3x 6
Price per Roll $47.50

13.G. |Type 4 Sack Gabions (Reinlforced) - 3' width x 9' length
Name of Manufacturer Maccaferri No Bid
ltem Number / Name Sack 3x9
Price per Roll $60.00

14 [Curb, Gutter, and Median Inlet Protection

14.A. |Curb Bag
Name of Manufacturer Mirafi No Bid
{tem Number / Name Dandy Curb Bag
Price per Pack (5) $574.00

14.B. |Curb Block
Name of Manufacturer Mirafi No Bid
Item Number / Name Dandy Curb Block
Price per Pack (5) $512.00

14.C. |Curb Sack )
Name of Manufacturer Mirafi No Bid
Ilem Number / Name Dandy Curb Sack
Price per Pack {5) $500.65

15 Flat Grate and Mountable Curb inlet Protection

15.A. [Bag o _
Name of Manufacturer Mirafi No Bid
lem Number / Name Dandy Bag
Price per Pack (5) $342.00

15.8. {Sack o )
Name of Manufaclurer Mirafi No Bid
item Number / Name Dandy Sack
Price per Pack (5) $500.65

16.C. |Pop Up o )
Name of Manufacturer Mirafi No Bid
item Number / Name Dandy Pop 50
Price per Pack (5) $1,390.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 20056

For: Annual Conlract for Erosion Control Materials and Accessories l.one Star Products, Inc. United Equipment Rentals
Gull, L. P.
4101 South Industrial Dr., Suite 100 |12017 North Loop Road
A924-06-RA MkR
ltem Descrintion Auslin, San Antonio,
P TX 78744 TX 78216
16 W arning Barrier Fence
16.A. [4' width x 100’ length (4.5" x 2.0 aperature size)
Name of Manufacturer Mutual Industries| No Bid
llem Number / Name Warning Barrier Fence - 14933
Price per Roll $19.00
16.B. |4 width x 100" length (3.5" x 1.3 aperature size)
Name of Manufacturer Mutual Industries| No Bid
llem Number / Name H-D Warning Barrier Fence - 14973
Price per Roll $22.00
17 T-Post
17.A. [Lightweight - 6'
Name of Manufacturer W. Silver| No Bid
Iltem Number / Name 6' Lite Painled
Price per 100 $350.00
Price per 500 $1,750.00
17.A. |Heavyweight - 6’
Name of Manufacturer W. Silver| No Bid
ltem Number / Name 6' Heavy Painted
Price per 100 $380.00
Price per 500 $1,850.00
18 Non-Woven Geotextiles
Name of Manufacturer Mirafi Carthage Mills
liem Number 160N FX 65 HS
Price per Roll $405.00 $415.00
Price per square yard $0.81 $0.83
Square yards per roll 500 500
19 |Hydraulic Mulches
19.A. |Wood Fiber / Cellulose Fiber Blend
Name of Manufacturer Southwest Environmental No Bid
ltem Number / Name Enviro-Mix
Pounds per Bag 50
Price per Bag $8.28
19.B. {Wood Fiber
Name of Manufacturer Profile No Bid
Iltem Number / Name Terra-Mulch
Pounds per Bag 50
Price per Bag $13.65
Prepared by‘burchasing 1/5/2006 Page 12




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 28, 2005

For: Annual Contract for Erosion Contro! Malerials and Accessories Lone Star Products, Inc.

A924-06-RA

4101 South Industrial Dr., Suite 100
MkR

Item

Austin,

Description TX 78744

19.C. [Cellulose Fiber

United Equipment Rentals
Gulf, L. P.

12017 Norlh Loop Road

San Antonio,
TX 78216

Name of Manufacturer Southwesl Environmental No Bid
Iltem Number / Name Enviro-Gro
Pounds per Bag 50
Price per Bag $7.58
20 Deieted
Terms 2%, 10 Net 30
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